
Vulcan Inc., 
dba Vulcan 

Signs, Vulcan 
Aluminum

Nippon 
Carbide 

Industries 
(USA) Inc.

Custom Products 
Corporation

PathMark 
Traffic 

Products of 
Texas, Inc.

Line Description UOM QTY Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
1 Section I: Prefabricated Signs: S.D.H.P.T., 30 in. x 30 in. each 1 $22.13 No Bid $22.64 $41.56

2 Section I: Prefabricated Signs: S.D.H.P.T., 28 in. x 48 in. each 1 $33.03 No Bid $35.22 $53.20

Notes: Standard MUTCD 
and TX MUTCD 
signs are either 

30" x 48" - quoting 
18x48 @35.22 ea; 
if standard 30x48 

price ea. Is 
$35.85 

3 Section I: Prefabricated Signs: S.D.H.P.T., 18 in. x 24 in. each 1 $10.62 No Bid $11.24 $19.95

4 Section I: Prefabricated Signs: S.D.H.P.T., 18 in. x 24 in. each 320 $3,398.40 No Bid $3,596.80 $6,384.00

5 Section I:  Prefabricated Signs: Octagonal 30 in. x 30 in. each 1 $22.05 No Bid $21.94 $41.56

6 Section I:  Prefabricated Signs: MHP; S.D.H.P.T., 18 in. x 
18 in., W13-1

each 225 $1,966.50 No Bid $2,011.50 $3,366.00

7 Section I: Prefabricated Signs: S.D.H.P.T., 36 in. x 36 in. each 1 $31.86 No Bid $32.26 $59.85

8 Section I: Prefabricated Signs: S.D.H.P.T., 48 in. x 30 in. each 1 $35.40 No Bid $35.85 $66.50

9 Section I: Prefabricated Signs: S.D.H.P.T., 24 in. x 36 in. each 1 $21.24 No Bid $21.67 $39.90

10 Section I: Prefabricated Signs: S.D.H.P.T., 24 in. x 42 in. each 1 $24.78 No Bid $25.37 $46.55

11 Section I: Prefabricated Signs: S.D.H.P.T., 60 in. x 30 in. each 1 $44.25 No Bid $44.70 $83.13
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Vulcan Inc., 
dba Vulcan 

Signs, Vulcan 
Aluminum

Nippon 
Carbide 

Industries 
(USA) Inc.

Custom Products 
Corporation

PathMark 
Traffic 

Products of 
Texas, Inc.

Line Description UOM QTY Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
12 Section I: Prefabricated Signs: S.D.H.P.T., 12 in. x 18 in. each 1 $5.85 No Bid $5.70 $9.98

13 Section I: Prefabricated Signs: S.D.H.P.T., 12 in. x 18 in. each 1 $5.85 No Bid $5.70 $9.98

14 Section I: Prefabricated Signs: S.D.H.P.T., 18 in. x 18 in. each 1 $8.74 No Bid $8.94 $14.97

15 Section I: Prefabricated Signs; S.D.H.P.T., 12 in. x 12 in. 
HANDICAPPED SYMBOL

each 1 $3.96 No Bid $4.89 $8.31

16 Section I: Prefabricated Signs: S.D.H.P.T., 12 in. x 6 in. each 1 $2.31 No Bid $2.51 $4.84
17 Section I: Prefabricated Signs: BUSES ONLY, 18 in. x 24 in. each 1 $13.16 No Bid $11.47 $19.95

18 Section I: Prefabricated Signs: ENTRANCE ONLY, 24 in. x 
24 in.

each 1 $17.54 No Bid $14.97 $26.60

19 Section I: Prefabricated Signs: S.D.H.P.T., 36 in. x 36 in. each 1 $31.86 No Bid $32.26 $59.85

20 Section I: Prefabricated Signs: S.D.H.P.T., 24 in. x 12 in. each 1 $7.72 No Bid $7.60 $13.30

21 Section I: Prefabricated Signs: S.D.H.P.T., 30 in. x 24 in. each 1 $17.70 No Bid $19.00 $33.25

22 Percentage off on any items required by Collin County not 
specifically addressed in Section I

1 0% No Bid 3% 10%

Notes: 3% discount off 
catalog items; Sec 

1 pricing for 
standard TX 
MUTCD and 

MUTCD signs 1 
color (e.g. black 
on yellow)signs.  
Add 10% per ea. 
Addition standard 

traffic color



Vulcan Inc., 
dba Vulcan 

Signs, Vulcan 
Aluminum

Nippon 
Carbide 

Industries 
(USA) Inc.

Custom Products 
Corporation

PathMark 
Traffic 

Products of 
Texas, Inc.

Line Description UOM QTY Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
SECTION I TOTAL AS BID (ONLY WITH ONE (1) AS 
QUANTITY - PER BID)

$379.41 No Bid $383.89 $667.14 

SECTION I TOTAL WITH 2016 QUANTITIES $5,724.95 No Bid $5,972.01 $10,402.23

23 Section II: Special Signs: NO DUMPING - BY ORDER OF 
COMMISSIONERS' COURT, 18 in. x 24 in.

each 1 $13.30 No Bid $11.56 $19.95

24 Section II: Special Signs: COLLIN COUNTY 
MAINTENANCE SIGNS - 30 in. x 24 in.

each 1 $22.17 No Bid $19.18 $33.25

25 Section II: Special Signs: HANDICAPPED PARKING 
SIGNS, 12 in. x 18 in.

each 1 $7.58 No Bid $6.12 $12.47

26 Section II: Special Signs: HANDICAPPED PARKING 
SIGNS, 18 in. x 24 in.

each 1 $13.30 No Bid $11.56 $24.94

27 Percentage off on any items required by Collin County not 
specifically addressed in Section II

1 0% No Bid 3% 10%

SECTION II TOTAL AS BID (ONLY WITH ONE (1) AS 
QUANTITY PER BID)

$56.35 No Bid $48.42 $90.61

SECTION II TOTAL WITH 2016 QUANTITIES $56.35 No Bid $48.42 $90.61

28 Section III: Sign Faces: S.D.H.P.T., 30 in. x 30 in. each 1 $9.81 No Bid $10.36 $29.87
29 Section III: Sign Faces: S.D.H.P.T., 24 in. x 48 in. each 1 $12.56 No Bid $13.29 $38.24
30 Section III: Sign Faces: S.D.H.P.T., 18 in. x 24 in. each 550 $2,590.50 No Bid $2,711.50 $7,887.00
31 Section III: Sign Faces: S.D.H.P.T., 18 in. x 18 in. each 150 $529.50 No Bid $609.00 $1,614.00
32 Section III: Sign Faces: BLACK BORDER, 30 in. x 30 in. 

(Blank Face)
each 400 $5,886.00 No Bid $6,216.00 $16,686.00

33 Section III: Sign Faces: ENGINEER GRADE SIGN FACES, 
30 in. x 30 in.

each 1 $6.16 No Bid $6.43 $26.13

34 Section III: Sign Faces: ENGINEER GRADE SIGN FACES 
EQUAL, 24 in. x 30 in.

each 1 $4.92 No Bid $5.10 $20.90

35 Percentage off on any items required by Collin County not 
specifically addressed in Section III

1 0% No Bid 3% 10%



Vulcan Inc., 
dba Vulcan 

Signs, Vulcan 
Aluminum

Nippon 
Carbide 

Industries 
(USA) Inc.

Custom Products 
Corporation

PathMark 
Traffic 

Products of 
Texas, Inc.

Line Description UOM QTY Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
SECTION III TOTAL AS BID (ONLY WITH ONE (1) AS 
QUANTITY - PER BID)

$51.50 No Bid $54.52 $168.05

SECTION III TOTAL WITH 2016 QUANTITITES $9,039.45 No Bid $9,571.68 $26,302.14

36 Section IV: Anodized Aluminum Blanks: 18 in. x 18 in. each 60 $272.40 No Bid $304.88 $384.60
37 Section IV: Anodized Aluminum Blanks: 24 in. x 24 in. each 1 $8.00 No Bid $8.81 $11.36
38 Section IV: Anodized Aluminum Blanks: 30 in. x 30 in. each 300 $3,843.00 No Bid $4,140.00 $5,325.00
39 Section IV: Anodized Aluminum Blanks: 12 in. x 18 in. each 1 $3.03 No Bid $3.40 $4.26
40 Section IV: Anodized Aluminum Blanks: 18 in. x 24 in. each 200 $1,214.00 No Bid $1,310.00 $1,704.00
41 Section IV: Anodized Aluminum Blanks: 24 in. x 30 in. each 70 $699.30 No Bid $765.10 $994.00
42 Section IV: Anodized Aluminum Blanks: 24 in. x 36 in. each 1 $11.92 No Bid $13.12 $17.00
43 Section IV: Anodized Aluminum Blanks: 24 in. x 48 in. each 1 $16.44 No Bid $17.68 $22.72
44 Section IV: Anodized Aluminum Blanks: 30 in. x 36 in. each 1 $15.68 No Bid $16.57 $21.30
45 Section IV: Anodized Aluminum Blanks: 30 in. x 48 in. each 1 $20.49 No Bid $21.34 $28.40
46 Section IV: Anodized Aluminum Blanks: 36" x 36" each 1 $18.83 No Bid $19.28 $25.56
47 Section IV: Anodized Aluminum Blanks: EXTRUDED 

BLANKS, 9" x 30"
each 400 $2,384.00 No Bid $3,112.00 $4,136.00

48 Section IV: Anodized Aluminum Blanks: EXTRUDED 
BLANKS, 9" x 36"

each 50 $356.50 No Bid $466.50 $619.00

49 Percentage off on any items required by Collin County not 
specifically addressed in Section IV

1 0% No Bid 5% 10%

SECTION IV TOTAL AS BID (ONLY WITH ONE (1) AS 
QUANTITY - PER BID)

$140.69 No Bid $153.97 $200.20

SECTION IV TOTAL WITH 2016 QUANTITIES $8,863.59 No Bid $10,198.98 $13,293.20

50 Section V: Vertical Road markers, CARSONITE Markers or 
approved equal

each 500 $5,375.00 No Bid $6,925.00 $11,975.00



Vulcan Inc., 
dba Vulcan 

Signs, Vulcan 
Aluminum

Nippon 
Carbide 

Industries 
(USA) Inc.

Custom Products 
Corporation

PathMark 
Traffic 

Products of 
Texas, Inc.

Line Description UOM QTY Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
Notes: Vulcan DRV 

Marker
Quoting equal to 

Carsonite 
Glassform brand 

(see attached 
documentation). 

Quoting with 
03x12 sheeting on 

one side.  If 
county needs 

sheeting on both 
sides price ea is 
$15.05 minimum 
order box of 20

51 Percentage off on any items required by Collin County not 
specifically addressed in Section V

1 0% No Bid 3% 10%

SECTION V TOTAL AS BID (ONLY WITH ONE (1) AS 
QUANTITY - PER BID)

$10.75 No Bid $13.85 $13.95

SECTION V TOTAL WITH 2016 QUANTITIES $5,375.00 No Bid $6,925.00 $11,975.00

52 Section VI: Vertical Recreational Markers/Signs: 
RECREATIONAL MARKER

each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $27.54

53 Section VI: Vertical Recreational Markers/Signs: 
CARSONITE SIGN POSTS or Approved Equal

each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $27.54

54 Section VI: Vertical Recreational Markers/Signs: CUSTOM 
SIGNS, 8 in. x 8 in.

each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

55 Section VI: Vertical Recreational Markers/Signs: CUSTOM 
SIGN, 18 in. x 24 in.

each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

56 Section VI: Vertical Recreational Markers /Signs: CUSTOM 
SIGN, 12 in. x 18 inc.

each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

57 Section VI: Vertical Recreational Markers/Signs: FEDERAL 
RECREATIONAL SYMBOL SIGN, 8 in. x 8 in.

each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



Vulcan Inc., 
dba Vulcan 

Signs, Vulcan 
Aluminum

Nippon 
Carbide 

Industries 
(USA) Inc.

Custom Products 
Corporation

PathMark 
Traffic 

Products of 
Texas, Inc.

Line Description UOM QTY Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
58 Section VI: Vertical Recreational Markers/Signs: CUSTOM 

SIGN with  7 ft. Post 8 in. x 8 in.
each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

59 Section VI: Vertical Recreational Markers/Signs: CUSTOM 
SIGN with 7ft Post; 12 in. x 18 in.

each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

60 Section VI: Vertical Recreational Markers/Signs: CUSTOM 
SIGN with 7 ft. Post, 18 in. x 24 in.

each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

61 Section VI: Vertical Recreational Markers: Signs: FEDERAL 
RECREATION SYMBOL sign with 7 ft Post 8 in. x 8 in.

each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

62 Section VI: Vertical Recreational Markers/Signs: FEDERAL 
RECREATION SYMBOL DECAL

each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

63 Section VI: Vertical Recreational Markers/Signs: 
INDIVIDUAL LETTERS AND NUMBERS

each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

64 Percentage off on any items required by Collin County not 
specifically addressed in Section VI

1 No Bid No Bid 5% 10%

SECTION VI TOTAL AS BID (ONLY WITH ONE (1) AS 
QUANTITY - PER BID)

No Bid No Bid No Bid $55.08

SECTION VI TOTAL WITH 2016 QUANTITIES No Bid No Bid No Bid $55.08

65 Section VII: Flexible Delineators: Signs: LONG WHITE 
FLEXIBLE DELINEATOR POSTS, 3 in. wide x 48 in. long

each 1 $25.69 No Bid No Bid $29.95

Notes: Safe-Hit 
SH248GP3

66 Percentage off on any items required by Collin County not 
specifically addressed in Section VII

1 0% No Bid No Bid 10%

SECTION VII TOTAL AS BID (ONLY WITH ONE (1) AS 
QUANTITY - PER BID)

$25.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid



Vulcan Inc., 
dba Vulcan 

Signs, Vulcan 
Aluminum

Nippon 
Carbide 

Industries 
(USA) Inc.

Custom Products 
Corporation

PathMark 
Traffic 

Products of 
Texas, Inc.

Line Description UOM QTY Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
SECTION VII TOTAL WITH 2016 QUANTITIES $25.69 No Bid No Bid $29.95

67 Section VIII: Reflective 9x30 County Road Sign Faces;   
COLLIN COUNTY ROAD SIGN FACES, 9 in. x 30 in.

each 570 $3,705.00 No Bid $3,391.50 $25,450.50

Notes: Must order min. 
30 to be valid 

pricing
68 Section VIII: Reflective 9x30 County Road Signs Faces: 

COLLIN COUNTY ROAD SIGN FACES, 9 in. x 36 in.
each 1 $7.50 No Bid $7.12 $53.44

Notes: Must order min. 
30 to be valid 

pricing
69 Percentage off on any items required by Collin County not 

specifically addressed in Section VIII
1 0% No Bid 3% 10%

SECTION VIII TOTAL AS BID (ONLY WITH ONE (1) AS 
QUANTITY - PER BID)

$14.00 No Bid $13.07 $53.44

SECTION VIII TOTAL WITH 2016 QUANTITIES $3,712.50 No Bid $3,398.62 $25,503.94

70 Section IX: Barricades/Barricade Sheeting/Roll Stock: 
SIGNS,
ROLLS of 8 in. x 50 in. yds of SUPER ENGINEERING 
GRADE

each 1 No Bid $95.00 $185.00 $147.00

Notes: Quoting 3M HIP 
336 with 6" stripe 

left or right



Vulcan Inc., 
dba Vulcan 

Signs, Vulcan 
Aluminum

Nippon 
Carbide 

Industries 
(USA) Inc.

Custom Products 
Corporation

PathMark 
Traffic 

Products of 
Texas, Inc.

Line Description UOM QTY Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
71 Section IX: Barricades/Barricade Sheeting/Roll Stock: 

SIGNS, FOLDING BARRICADES, SUPER ENGINEERING 
GRADE SHEETING, 37 in. x 36 in.

each 1 No Bid No Bid $44.87 $17.64

Notes: Quoting 
Combocade Metal 
legs plastic panels 
type II (HIP grade 
sheeting top and 
bottome panel 

8"x24" - top panel 
and 8"x24" bottom 

panel) see 
attached. 

Minimum order 
qty 60 for bid 

prices cpc part 
#RSPB1PMPC2

WHH0808

72 Section IX: Barricades/Barricade Sheeting/Roll Stock: 
SIGNS, BARRICADE SHEETING, Rolls of 8 in. x 8 in. of 
SUPER ENGINEERING GRADE

each 1 No Bid $95.00 No Bid No Bid

Notes: 8 in. x 50 yds
73 Section IX: Barricades/Barricade Sheeting/Roll Stock: 

SIGNS, BARRICADE SHEETING: Rolls of 30 in. x 50 in. 
Yds of SUPER ENGINEERING GRADE

each 1 No Bid $356.25 $557.18 $413.60



Vulcan Inc., 
dba Vulcan 

Signs, Vulcan 
Aluminum

Nippon 
Carbide 

Industries 
(USA) Inc.

Custom Products 
Corporation

PathMark 
Traffic 

Products of 
Texas, Inc.

Line Description UOM QTY Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
Notes: Quoting 3M HIP 

336 with 6" stripe 
left or right size 
24" x 50 yeds 

(largest size that 
is manufactured 

for barricade 
sheeting 

applications

30 in. x 50 yds.

74 Section IX: Barricades/Barricade Sheeting/Roll Stock: 
SIGNS, BARRICADE SHEETING: Rolls of 6 in. x 50 in. yds 
of SUPER ENGINEERING GRADE

each 1 No Bid $71.25 $121.98 $115.00

Notes: Quoting 3M HIP 
336 with 6" stripe 

left or right

6 in. x 50 yds

75 Section IX: Barricades/Barricade Sheeting/Roll Stock: 
SIGNS, BARRICADE SHEETING: Rolls of 6 in. x 50 in. yds 
of SUPER ENGINEERING GRADE

each 1 No Bid $72.25 $121.98 $119.00

Notes: Quoting 3M HIP 
336 with 6" stripe 

left or right

6 in. x 50 yds

76 Percentage off on any items required by Collin County not 
specifically addressed in Section IX

1 No Bid No Bid 3% 10%

SECTION IX TOTAL AS BID (ONLY WITH ONE (1) AS 
QUANTITY - PER BID)

No Bid $689.75 $1,031.01 $812.24

SECTION IX TOTAL WITH 2016 QUANTITIES No Bid $689.75 $1,031.01 $812.24

77 Section X: Sign Installation Tools, Hardware and Posts: 
SIGNS, ALLEN WRENCH WITH HANDLE, #73 3/16

each 1 No Bid No Bid $29.35 No Bid



Vulcan Inc., 
dba Vulcan 

Signs, Vulcan 
Aluminum

Nippon 
Carbide 

Industries 
(USA) Inc.

Custom Products 
Corporation

PathMark 
Traffic 

Products of 
Texas, Inc.

Line Description UOM QTY Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
78 Section X: Sign Installation Tools, Hardware and Posts: 

SIGNS, VANDAL PROOF BOLT TOOLS, #43
each 1 No Bid No Bid $12.05 No Bid

Notes: Quoting T43 Tool
79 Section X: Sign Installation Tools, Hardware and Posts: 

SIGNS, TOOL for 3/6 Hole and 5/16 Diameter SET SCREW 
#BH4

each 1 No Bid No Bid $32.08 $12.50

Notes: Quoting BH4 Tool

80 Section X: Sign Installation Tools, Hardware and Posts: 
SIGNS, DRIVE CAP FOR CHANNEL POSTS

each 1 No Bid No Bid $148.99 $178.00

Notes: Big Boyd Drive 
Cap 17lb.

81 Section X: Sign Installation Tools, Hardware and Posts: 
SIGNS, ALUMINUM POSTS

each 1 No Bid No Bid $18.08 No Bid

Notes: Quoting 10 ft 2# 
galvanized pots

82 Section X: Sign Installation Tools, Hardware and Posts: 
SIGNS, ALUMINUM ALLOY TAMPER PROOF NUTS 2011-
T3

each 1 No Bid No Bid $0.32 $0.32

Notes: RHN516FLUTED
A Nut Fluted 

Tamper Resistant 
5/16" - 18 

Aluminum stock 
item (F)

83 Section X: Sign Installation Tools, Hardware and Posts: 
SIGNS, HEX HED FLANGED BOLTS, 5/16 Diameter x 1 
3/4

each 1 No Bid No Bid $0.35 $0.67

Notes: RHB516175HFLG 
Bold Hex Head 
Flanged 5/16"-

18x1 3/4" Zinc NC 
(Grade 2)



Vulcan Inc., 
dba Vulcan 

Signs, Vulcan 
Aluminum

Nippon 
Carbide 

Industries 
(USA) Inc.

Custom Products 
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PathMark 
Traffic 

Products of 
Texas, Inc.

Line Description UOM QTY Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
84 Section X: Sign Installation Tools, Hardware and Posts: 

SIGNS, I.D. HEX HEAD FLANGED NUTS, 5/16 Diameter
each 1 No Bid No Bid $0.08 $0.18

Notes: RHN516FLANGE 
Nut Hex Flanged 

5/16"-18 ZINC NC 
(Grade 2)

85 Section X: Sign Installation Tools, Hardware and Posts: 
SIGNS, LOCK WASHERS, 5/16 Diameter I.D.

each 1 No Bid No Bid $0.05 $0.15

Notes: RHW516LOC 
Washer Lock 

5/16" Zinc Stock 
Item

86 Section X: Sign Installation Tools, Hardware and Posts: 
SIGNS, U-CHANNEL TUFNUT, 5/16 I.D.

each 1 No Bid No Bid $0.72 $0.87

Notes: RHTN31
87 Section X: Sign Installation Tools, Hardware and Posts: 

SIGNS, TUFBOLT, 5/16 I.D., 2 1/2 Long
each 1 No Bid No Bid $0.30 $1.10

Notes: RHTB25
88 Section X: Sign Installation Tools, Hardware and Posts: 

SIGNS, TUFBOLT, 5/16 O.D., 3 Long
each 1 No Bid No Bid $0.35 $1.23

Notes: RHTB3
89 Section X: Sign Installation Tools, Hardware and Posts: 

SIGNS, TUFBOLT, 5/16 I.D. Nylon
each 1 No Bid No Bid $0.22 $0.48

Notes: Tufbolt Nytown 
washer TBW31 

5/16
90 Section X: Sign Installation Tools, Hardware and Posts: 

SIGNS, GALVANIZED BOLTS
each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

91 Section X: Sign Installation Tools, Hardware and Posts: 
SIGNS, SIGN POST W/BASE POST

each 1 No Bid No Bid $25.48 No Bid
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Nippon 
Carbide 

Industries 
(USA) Inc.
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Line Description UOM QTY Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
Notes: 10 ft 2 # 

Galvanized U 
channel with 3.5 ft 

3# Galvanized 
base per 

attachment
92 Section X: Sign Installation Tools, Hardware and Posts; 

SIGNS, SIGN POST W/BASE
each 1 No Bid No Bid $25.48 No Bid

Notes: 10 ft 2 # 
Galvanized U 

channel with 3.5 ft 
3# Galvanized 

base per 
attachment

93 Section X: Sign Installation Tools, Hardware and Posts; 
SIGN BRACKETS

each 1 No Bid No Bid $2.96 $5.47

Notes: 5.5" slot U 
channel cap for 
extruded blades

5 1/4 extruded 
brackets

94 Section X: Sign Installation Tools, Hardware and Posts; 
OPPOSITE SLOT BRACKETS

each 1 No Bid No Bid $2.96 $5.47

Notes: 5.5" slot U 
channel cap for 
extruded blades

95 Section X: Sign Installation Tools, Hardware and Posts; 
SIGN CROSS BRACKETS

each 1 No Bid No Bid $2.96 $5.47

Notes: Crosspiece



Vulcan Inc., 
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Signs, Vulcan 
Aluminum

Nippon 
Carbide 

Industries 
(USA) Inc.
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Corporation
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Products of 
Texas, Inc.

Line Description UOM QTY Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
96 Section X: Sign Installation Tools, Hardware and Posts; 

SIGN POST BREAKOUT COUPLERS
each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

97 Section X: Sign Installation Tools, Hardware and Posts; 2 in. 
SIGN POST- 2 in. SQUARE 14 GAUGE PRE-
GALVANIZED

each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

98 Section X: Sign Installation Tools, Hardware and Posts; 
OPTIONAL SLEEVE- 2 1/2 in. SQUARE 12 GAUGE x 18 in. 
PRE-GALVANIZED

each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

99 Section X: Sign Installation Tools, Hardware and Posts; 
HARDWARE, CORNER BOLT

each 1 No Bid No Bid $0.50 $0.98

100 Section X: Sign Installation Tools, Hardware and Posts; 
HARDWARE, VANDAL RESISTANT DRIVE RIVET

each 1 No Bid No Bid $0.40 No Bid



Vulcan Inc., 
dba Vulcan 

Signs, Vulcan 
Aluminum

Nippon 
Carbide 

Industries 
(USA) Inc.

Custom Products 
Corporation

PathMark 
Traffic 

Products of 
Texas, Inc.

Line Description UOM QTY Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
Notes: RHRDRIVEA38E

125NS sq post 
drive rivet alum 
3/4" head x 125-
250 range no 
washer (1000) (f) 
grip range of .125" 
- 250; shipping wt 
for 1000 qty is 
11.3 lbs; fits 3/8" 
hole diameter; 
5/8" length shank; 
3/4" head 
diameter;-------
3/8" diameter 
drive rivet is 
designed 
specifically for the 
sign to square 
post application 
and 12 ga or 14 
ga post to single 
12 ga anchor; 
installs with just a 
hammer; 
universal head 
makes it dificult 
for vandals to 
remove; not 
recommended in 
double anchor 
applications; 3/4" 

101 Section X: Sign Installation Tools, Hardware and Posts; 
HARDWARE, MATE RIVETS

each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



Vulcan Inc., 
dba Vulcan 

Signs, Vulcan 
Aluminum

Nippon 
Carbide 

Industries 
(USA) Inc.

Custom Products 
Corporation

PathMark 
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Products of 
Texas, Inc.

Line Description UOM QTY Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
102 Section X: Sign Installation Tools, Hardware and Posts: 

TRAFFIC CONE, 28 in.
each 1 No Bid No Bid $9.29 $12.85

Notes: RSPCC2807WON 
Traffice Cone 28" 

7# wide body 
orange stock item - 

quoting without 
reflective collars.  

If you want 
reflective collars 

RSPCC2807WOR
46 Traffic Cone 

28" 7# wide body 
orange reflective 
4" & 6" HIP stock 

$15.49

78", 10 lb.

103 Percentage off on any items required by Collin County not 
specifically addressed in Section X

1 No Bid No Bid 3% 10%

SECTION X TOTAL AS BID (ONLY WITH ONE (1) AS 
QUANTITY - PER BID)

No Bid No Bid $312.97 $225.74

SECTION X TOTAL WITH 2016 QUANTITIES No Bid No Bid $312.97 $225.74

104 Section XI: Polyethylene Signs: DANGER WORK AREA 
PROTECTION #13872 4 in. x 6 in.

each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

105 Section XI: Polyethylene Signs; DANGER HIGH VOLTAGE 
WORK AREA PROTECTION #13551 10 in. x 14 in.

each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

106 Percentage off on any items required by Collin County not 
specifically addressed in Section XI

1 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10%



Vulcan Inc., 
dba Vulcan 

Signs, Vulcan 
Aluminum

Nippon 
Carbide 

Industries 
(USA) Inc.

Custom Products 
Corporation

PathMark 
Traffic 

Products of 
Texas, Inc.

Line Description UOM QTY Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
SECTION XI TOTAL AS BID (ONLY WITH ONE (1) AS 
QUANTITY - PER BID)

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

SECTION XI TOTAL WITH 2016 QUANTITIES No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

107 Section XII: Pavement Markers: Signs: REFLECTIVE 
PAVEMENT MARKERS, ONE WAY AMBER

each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.74

108 Section XII: Pavement Markers: REFLECTIVE PAVEMENT 
MARKERS, ONE WAY CLEAR

each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.74

109 Section XII: Pavement Markers: Signs: REFLECTIVE 
PAVEMENT MARKERS, TWO WAY AMBER

each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.98

110 Section XII: Pavement Markers: Signs: REFLECTIVE 
PAVEMENT MARKERS, RED AND CLEAR

each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.98

111 Section XII: Pavement Markers: Signs: REFLECTIVE 
PAVEMENT MARKERS, TWO WAY BLUE

each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.98

112 Section XII: Pavement Markers: Signs: NON-REFLECTIVE 
CERAMIC PAVEMENT MARKERS, YELLOW

each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.78

113 Section XII: Pavement Markers: Signs: NON-REFLECTIVE 
CERAMIC PAVEMENT MARKERS, WHITE

each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.78

114 Section XII: Pavement Markers: Signs: ONE WAY 
REFLECTIVE CERAMIC PAVEMENT MARKERS, 
YELLOW

each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.65

115 Section XII: Pavement Markers: Signs: ONE WAY 
REFLECTIVE CERAMIC PAVEMENT MARKERS, WHITE

each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.65

116 Section XII: Pavement Markers: Signs; DIMENSIONS of 6 
in. SQUARE by 3/4 HEIGHT (JIGGLE BAR) YELLOW

each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.78

117 Section XII: Pavement Markers: Signs: EPOXY BASE 
REISEN, PAVEMENT MARKER ADHESIVE, ONE 
GALLON CONTAINERS

each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $54.00



Vulcan Inc., 
dba Vulcan 

Signs, Vulcan 
Aluminum

Nippon 
Carbide 

Industries 
(USA) Inc.

Custom Products 
Corporation

PathMark 
Traffic 

Products of 
Texas, Inc.

Line Description UOM QTY Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
Notes: Per Gallon

118 Section XII: Pavement Markers: Signs: 
ACTIVATOR/CURLING AGENT. PAVEMENT MARKER 
ADHESIVE, ONE GALLON CONTAINERS

each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $54.00

Notes: Per Gallon
Notes: 600 cc 

cartridge, dual 
cartridge - both 

parts

120 Section XII: Pavement Markers: Signs: 
ACTIVATORY/CURLING AGENT, 11 oz CARTRIDGE

each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $27.00

Notes: 600 cc 
cartridge, 

121 Percentage off on any items required by Collin County not 
specifically addressed in Section XII

1 No Bid No Bid 5% 10%

SECTION XII TOTAL AS BID (ONLY WITH ONE (1) AS 
QUANTITY - PER BID)

No Bid No Bid No Bid $162.06

SECTION XII TOTAL WITH 2016 QUANTITIES No Bid No Bid No Bid $162.06

122 Section XIII: Mail Box Posts and Mounting Hardware:  
SINGLE MOUNTED MAIL BOXES, MAILBOX POSTS AND 
MOUNTING HARDWARE

each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

123 Section XIII: Mail Box Posts and Mounting Hardware:  
DOUBLE MOUNTED MAILBOXES, MAILBOX POSTS AND 
MOUNTING HARDWARE

each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

124 Section XIII: Mailbox Posts and Mounting Hardware:  
MULTIPLE MOUNTED MAILBOXES, MAILBOX POSTS 
AND MOUNTING HARDWARE

each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



Vulcan Inc., 
dba Vulcan 

Signs, Vulcan 
Aluminum

Nippon 
Carbide 

Industries 
(USA) Inc.

Custom Products 
Corporation

PathMark 
Traffic 

Products of 
Texas, Inc.

Line Description UOM QTY Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
125 Percentage off on any items required by Collin County not 

specifically addressed in Section XIII
1 No Bid No Bid 3% 10%

SECTION XIII TOTAL AS BID (ONLY WITH ONE (1) AS 
QUANTITY - PER BID)

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

SECTION XIII TOTAL WITH 2016 QUANTITIES No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

126 Percentage off any items required by Collin County that are 
not specifically addressed in any of the Sections within this 
bid.

1 No Bid No Bid 3% 10%

DELIVERY 30 days ARO 15-60 days orders under 150 
lbs ships UPS 
Ground; others 

over 150 lbs ship 
LTL Box Truck - 
delivery 21-30 

calendar days or 
sooner

10-14 days

EXCEPTIONS No None Yes None

TOTAL AWARD TO EACH VENDOR $29,028.68 $689.75 $3,760.01 $217.14


