
IFB 2016-119
Replacement of Vehicle Lifts at Service Center

Line# Description Quantity Each Extended Each Extended Each Extended
1 Heavy Duty Platform Lift 2 61,664.71 123,329.42 75,285.26 150,570.52 129,600.00 259,200.00

2
Labor: Remove 1 
Existing/Install 1 New HD Lift 2 32,407.41 64,814.82 35,158.38 70,316.76 18,005.00 36,010.00

3 Light Duty In-Ground Lift 3 9,226.34 27,679.02 10,511.29 31,533.87 22,600.00 67,800.00

4
Labor: Remove 1 
Existing/Install 1 New LD Lift 3 9,259.26 27,777.78 9,056.07 27,168.21 10,000.00 30,000.00

5 High Lift Wheel Dolly 1 6,587.00 6,587.00 9,450.29 9,450.29 2,700.00 2,700.00
Total  250,188.04 289,039.65 395,710.00

6 Option 1: Rolling Oil Pan 2 0.01 0.02 621.23 1,242.46 1,790.00 3,580.00

7
Option 2: Trade in Value for 
Existing Lifts 1 Lot (3,500.00) (3,500.00) No Bid No Bid (5,000.00) (5,000.00)

8
Option 3: Automatic Recessed 
Pit Cover Plate for HD Lifts 2 10,592.00 21,184.00 No Bid No Bid 9,500.00 19,000.00

Total all lines 267,872.06 290,282.11 413,290.00

Reeder Distributors Rotary Lift Gene's Construction


