From: Kirkpatrick,Tray (DSHS)

To: Joann Gilbride

Cc: Kathy Nagel

Subject: RE: Collin County Immunization
Date: Monday, August 8, 2016 3:47:22 PM
Attachments: image2016-08-05-101741.pdf

Good afternoon,

The best way to explain what is happening for the FY17 IMM/LOCALS Contract Term is to see it in
three separate points.

1. We are now following the Grant Cycle dating back to FY13 and treating them as
amendments, including the total allocation of all grants.

2. We are amending the current contract through 8/31/17 in order to continue the
amendment stream until the end of the Grant Cycle.

3. And we have added the FY17 allocation that will cover the contract from 9/01/16-8/31/17.

Please let me know if this helps. Thank you

Tray Kirkpatrick, CTCM

Contract Manager

DCPS/RLHS Contract Management Unit
Texas Department of State Health Services
P.O. Box 149347

Austin, TX 78714-Mail Code 1990

Phone: 512-776-3448
Fax: 512-776-7391

From: Joann Gilbride [mailto:jgillbride@co.collin.tx.us]

Sent: Monday, August 08, 2016 3:17 PM

To: Kirkpatrick,Tray (DSHS) <Tray.Kirkpatrick@dshs.state.tx.us>
Cc: Kathy Nagel <knagel@co.collin.tx.us>

Subject: FW: Collin County Immunization

Ly
Thank you,

Joann L. Gilbride

Healthcare Coordinator

Collin County Health Care Services
825 N. McDonald #130

McKinney, TX 75069
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DEPARTMENT OF STATE HEALTH SERVICES

AMENDMENT #: 07

The Department of State Health Services (DSHS) and Collin County (Contractor) agree to amend Contract
No. 2013-041110-004 (Contract), which was effective on September 1, 2012. This Contract has been
amended 6 times prior to this Amendment. The Contract as amended is denominated Contract No.
2016-001266-02.

I. The Parties agree to amend Section 2 of this Contract to increase the total amount of Contract to ONE

MILLION SEVEN HUNDRED SEVENTY THOUSAND THREE HUNDRED TEN DOLLARS ($1,770,310.00).

The total payment to Contractor for the period from September 1, 2016 through August 31, 2017, will not
exceed THREE HUNDRED FIFTY-FOUR THOUSAND SIXTY-TWO DOLLARS ($354,062.00).

Il. The Parties agree to amend Section 4 of this Contract to extend the end of the Contract term to August
31, 2017.

Ill. The Parties agree to amend Section 7 of this Contract to add the following:

Contractor shall inform and educate the public about vaccines and vaccine-preventable diseases, as
described in the DSHS Immunization Contractors Guide for Local Health Departments (located at
http://www.dshs.state.tx.us/immunize/docs/contractor/E11-13985_FY2017_ContractorsGuide.pdf).

For Contracts of $100,000 or more, Contractors should monitor expenditures to ensure that cumulative
budget transfers among direct cost categories, with the exception of the Equipment category, do not
exceed 25% of the Contract total budget. Transfers to or from the Equipment category require prior
approval from DSHS unless the transfers are done in accordance with the guidelines in the CFPM. Costs
that result in cumulative budget transfers among direct cost categories that exceed 25% of the total
Contract budget are subject to being disallowed unless prior approval is obtained from DSHS.
Contractors are not required to obtain approval from DSHS for cumulative budget transfers that exceed
25% among direct cost categories, other than the equipment category, for Program Attachments of less
than $100,000, provided that the total budget amount is unchanged.

Contractor shall send at least one representative to Immunization Branch mandatory
meetings held in Austin, including the 1) Immunization Branch local health department held
in the fall of every year and the 2) TVFC Annual Training held in January/February of every
year. Additional mandatory meetings may be required during the contract term.

Contractor shall submit out of state travel requests to the Immunization Branch for approval
when utilizing contract funds or program income.

IV. The Parties agree to amend Section 7 of this Contract to revise the following:

Contractor shall be responsible for conducting outreach regarding vaccinations for children (19 through 35
months of age in the Contractor’s jurisdiction) included on the list distributed to Contractor by the ImmTrac
Group at DSHS. Lists are distributed through ImmTrac at the start of each quarterly reporting period.

Contractor shall be responsible for conducting outreach to 17-year-olds included on the lists distributed to
the Contractor by the ImmTrac Group at DSHS to explain the lifetime registry and obtain their consent to
remain in ImmTrac as an adult. Lists are distributed on October 1st; December 1st; February 1st; April
1st; June 1st; and August 1st.
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P: 972-548-5503
F: 972-548-4441

From: Kathy Nagel

Sent: Monday, August 08, 2016 2:57 PM
To: Joann Gilbride

Subject: FW: Collin County Immunization

From: Kathy Nagel

Sent: Friday, August 5, 2016 10:42 AM
To: 'Kirkpatrick,Tray (DSHS)'

Subject: RE: Collin County Immunization

Good morning Tray,

I need some clarification please on the 2017 Immunization contract. Why are we amending a 2013
contract (amendment 7) for the FY17 funding, instead of amending the FY16 contract?

Thank you,

Kathy Nagel
Collin County Auditor’s Office
972-548-4646

From: Kirkpatrick,Tray (DSHS) [mailto:Tray.Kirkpatrick@dshs.state.tx.us]
Sent: Tuesday, May 24, 2016 7:55 AM

To: Joann Gilbride; Clark,Sandy (DSHS); Sharp,Kathy (DSHS); Medina,Elma (DSHS)
Cc: Eileen Prentice; Candy Blair; Kathy Nagel
Subject: RE: Collin County Immunization

Joann,

Good morning. The FY16 funding for the Immunizations Contract will not carry over to the FY17
Contract.
Basically the FY17 fundingis not added to the FY16 Budget.

Please let me know if you have any further questions.
Thank you

Tray Kirkpatrick, CTCM
Contract Manager
DCPS/RLHS Contract Management Unit


mailto:Tray.Kirkpatrick@dshs.state.tx.us

Texas Department of State Health Services
P.O. Box 149347
Austin, TX 78714-Mail Code 1990

Phone: 512-776-3448
Fax: 512-776-7391

From: Joann Gilbride [mailto:jgillbride@co.collin.tx.us]
Sent: Monday, May 23, 2016 6:16 PM

To: Clark,Sandy (DSHS) <Sandy.Clark@dshs.state.tx.us>; Sharp,Kathy (DSHS)
<Kathy.Sharp@dshs.state.tx.us>; Kirkpatrick,Tray (DSHS) <Tray.Kirkpatrick@dshs.state.tx.us>;
Medina,Elma (DSHS) <Elma.Medina@dshs.state.tx.us>

Cc: Eileen Prentice <eprentice@co.collin.tx.us>; Candy Blair <cblair@co.collin.tx.us>; Kathy Nagel

<knagel@co.collin.tx.us>
Subject: Collin County LPHS, Immunizations, Federal TB, State TB, Foodborne (IDCU SUR, IDCU SUR

EB) Contracts Question
Hello DSHS Contract Group,
As it appears that DSHS is moving to two year contracts, and several of our contracts are being
amended to extend through 2017 with level funding for the additional year, | was hoping for some
guidance regarding the allocated funding. In certain cases, such as our Immunizations contract and
RLSS/LPHS contract, we tend to exhaust all funds well before the end of the 1 year contract term.
However, now that some of our contracts will carry over through 2017 as two year contracts, could
you confirm if we were to have any unused funds from the first year, if they will simply roll over into
the second year of the contract, or if each year’s budget is separate and must be spent prior to end
of FY2016 contract end date? For reference, please see our contracts below :

e Immunizations-- (Contract Number: 2016-001266-00)

e RLSS/LPHS—(Contract Number: 2016-001289-00)

e IDCU SUR (Foodborne)—(Contract Number: 2016-003785-00)

e |IDCU SUR EB-- (Contract Number: 2016-003819-00)

o TB Federal— (Contract Number 2016-001388-00)

e TB State— (Contract Number: 2016-001394-00)

| realize there may be differences between contracts, so please let me know if there is a general rule
or if specific contract(s) dictate how the funding is spent. Thank you for your assistance. Please let
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me know if you wish to discuss.

Thank you,

Joann L. Gilbride

Healthcare Coordinator

Collin County Health Care Services

825 N. McDonald #130

McKinney, TX 75069

P: 972-548-5503

F:972-548-4441

CONFIDENTIAL DISCLAIMER-In accordance with the HIPAA (Health Insurance Portability and
Accountability Act), this email/attachment contains protected health information and is for the
sole use of the intended recipient(s). Any unauthorized use, disclosure, dissemination, or
copying of this information is prohibited. If you receive this in error, please notify the sender
immediately (or call 972-548-4707) and delete the information from your computer.

(U) Warning: This document contains FOR OFFICIAL USE ONLY information. It contains
information that may be exempt from public release under the Freedom of Information Act (5
U.S.C 552). It is to be controlled, stored, handled, transmitted, distributed, and disposed of in a
manner that will not result in the release of the information to the public, the media, or other
personnel who do not have a valid need-to-know.
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