Grounds Maintenance Equipment
IFB No. 2016-336

Mower Medic & Power

Richardson Saw &
Lawnmower Company

McKinney Outdoor Power

Mavich Il IRRIGATORS SUPPLY INC
(Woodvest, LLC) avich flc (Richardson Saw & (Thirteen Partners Inc)
Lawnmower Company, Inc.)
Line # Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY | UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Stihl FS 240 Tri With Bike Handl d : e
1 [ 5 rimmer With Blke Fandie an stihl  |Fs240 1 |each| $467.74 $467.74 | Did Not Meet Specifications | $469.75 $469.75 $454.00 $454.00 $472.00 $472.00
Brush Knife Blade, or Collin County Approved
Item Quoted Stihl FS240 Stihl FS240 Stihl FS240 Stihl FS240
Vendor Notes
, 2 year manufacturer defective
Manufacturer's Warranty 2 year warranty 2 YEARS 2 YEAR WARRANTY material
Delivery Time ARO| 72 hours after acceptance 48 HOURS 10 DAYS 2 days
Stihl FS 240 R Tri With L Handle, . . o
I rimmer WIth Loop Handle, of Aol |Fs240R 3 |each| $473.00 $1,419.00 | Did Not Meet Specifications | $455.29 $1,365.87 $432.00 $1,296.00 $435.00 $1,305.00
Collin County Approved Equal
Item Quoted Stihl FS240R Stihl FS240R Stihl FS240R Stihl FS240R
Vendor Notes
, 2 year manufacturer defective
Manufacturer's Warranty| 2 year warranty 2 YEARS 2 YEAR WARRANTY material
Delivery Time ARO[ 72 hours after acceptance 48 HOURS 10 DAYS 2 days
Stihl FS 110 R Tri , or Collin Count .
g M TS, I LD ey stihl  |Fs110R 2 each| $281.94 $563.88 $406.24 $812.48 $283.48 $566.96 $272.50 $545.00 $272.00 $544.00
Approved Equal
Item Quoted Stihl FS110R ECHO SRM-280T Stihl FS110R Stihl FS110R Stihl FS110R
Vet Wtk SPARE AUTO-CUT HEAD IS
INCLUDED IN BID PRICE
For one year from date of
TSR I AT AT ) 2 year manufacturer defective
Manufacturer's Warranty| 2 year warranty is determined to be defective 2 YEARS 2 YEAR WARRANTY ¥ material
can be returned to will be
repaired or replaced
Delivery Time ARO[ 72 hours after acceptance 20 DAYS 48 HOURS 10 DAYS 2 days
Stihl FS 110 Tri ith Bike Handle, or Colli . . .
4 rimmer with Bike Handle, or Lol sini [rs110 1 |each| $303.99 $303.99 No Bid No Bid $305.16 $305.16 $292.50 $292.50 $291.00 $291.00
County Approved Equal
Item Quoted Stihl FS110 Stihl FS110 Stihl FS110 Stihl FS110
Vendor Notes SPARE AUTO-CUT HEAD IS
INCLUDED IN BID PRICE
Manufacturer's Warranty 2 year warranty 2 YEARS 2 YEAR WARRANTY 2 year manufactl{rer defective
material
Delivery Time ARO[ 72 hours after acceptance 48 HOURS 10 DAYS 2 days
Stihl FS 130 R Tri , or Collin Count .
5 A;prove p Equa?mmer or toflin Lounty stihl  |Fs130R 9 |each| $303.99 $2,735.91 $676.69 $6,090.21 $305.16 $2,746.44 $292.50 $2,632.50 $291.00 $2,619.00
Item Quoted Stihl FS130R Makita EN7350SH Stihl FS130R Stihl FS130R Stihl FS130R
Ve Wi SPARE AUTO-CUT HEAD IS
INCLUDED IN BID PRICE
For one year from the date of
purchase, any Product which 2 year manufacturer defective
Manufacturer's Warranty 2 year warranty is determined to be defective 2 YEARS 2 YEAR WARRANTY Y material
can be returned to will be
repaired or
Delivery Time ARO[ 72 hours after acceptance 20 DAYS 48 HOURS 10 DAYS 2 days




IFB No. 2016-336

Mower Medic & Power

Richardson Saw &
Lawnmower Company

McKinney Outdoor Power

Mavich Il IRRIGATORS SUPPLY INC
(Woodvest, LLC) avich fic (Richardson Saw & (Thirteen Partners Inc)
Lawnmower Company, Inc.)
Line # Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY| UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
g[Sl FS 130 Trimmer with Bike Handle, or Collin |5 |y 35 1 |each| $336.04 $336.04 No Bid No Bid $326.84 $326.84 $313.50 $313.50 $300.50 $300.50
County Approved Equal
Item Quoted Stihl FS130 Stihl FS130 Stihl FS130 Stihl FS130
Vendor Notes SPARE AUTO-CUT HEAD IS
INCLUDED IN BID PRICE
2 fact defecti
Manufacturer's Warranty 2 year warranty 2 YEARS 2 YEAR WARRANTY Y man;::e:;fr S
Delivery Time ARO[ 72 hours after acceptance 48 HOURS 10 DAYS 2 days
Echo B Cat WT190T Wheeled Tri B: . Pt
7 |conorearta eeied Trimmer, or - 5ear|\vr1g07 3 [each| NoBid No Bid Did Not Meet Specifications | $544.00 $1,632.00 $492.92 $1,478.76
Collin County Approved Equal Cat
Item Quoted Bear Cat WT190T Bear Cat WT190T
Vendor Notes|
2 year manufacturer defective
Manufacturer's Warranty| 1 YEAR WARRANTY material on engine and 1 year
on Trimmer
g [StihIHS 82T Hedge Trimmer with 30" Blade, or |, | c05r 4 |each| $399.84 $1,599.36 $522.68 $2,090.72 $383.02 $1,532.08 $363.00 $1,452.00 $366.00 $1,464.00
Collin County Approved Equal
Item Quoted Stihl HS32T Echo HCS-3020 Stihl HS32T Stihl HS32T Stihl HS32T
Vendor Notes
For one year from date of
purchase, any Product which 2 year manufacturer defective
Manufacturer's Warranty 2 year warranty is determined to be defective 2 YEARS 2 YEAR WARRANTY ¥ material :
can be returned to will be
repaired or replaced
Delivery Time ARO| 72 hours after acceptance 20 DAYS 48 HOURS 10 DAYS 2 days
Stihl FC 110 Ed Collin C ty A d
9 quual ger, or Loflin Lounty ApProved: Isyini |rc110 1 |each| $37349 $373.49 No Bid $376.19 $376.19 $361.00 $361.00 $416.00 $416.00
Item Quoted FC110 FC110 FC110 FC110
Vendor Notes|
2 fact defecti
Manufacturer's Warranty 2 year warranty 2 YEARS 2 YEAR WARRANTY VL manrl;:tce:;r e
Delivery Time ARO[ 72 hours after acceptance 48 HOURS 10 DAYS 2 days




IFB No. 2016-336

Mower Medic & Power

Richardson Saw &
Lawnmower Company

McKinney Outdoor Power

Mavich Il IRRIGATORS SUPPLY INC
(Woodvest, LLC) avich fic (Richardson Saw & (Thirteen Partners Inc)
Lawnmower Company, Inc.)
Line # Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY| UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Billy Goat TKV650SPH Leaf Vacuum Self- Bill
10 |[Propelled Chipper, 187cc Honda Engine, or GoZt TKV650SPH 1 | each No Bid $1,439.76 $1,439.76 No Bid $1,344.00 $1,344.00 $1,519.18 $1,519.18
Collin County Approved Equal
Item Quoted Billy Goat TKV650SPH Billy Goat TKV650SPH Billy Goat TKV650SPH
Vendor Notes
For one year from date of
purchase, any Product which 2 year manufacturer defective
Manufacturer's Warranty is determined to be defective 1 YEAR WARRANTY material on engine and 1 year
can be returned to will be on Vacuum
repaired or replaced
Delivery Time ARO 30 DAYS 10 DAYS 5 Days
11 [Pt MS 461 Chainsaw with 16" Bar, or Collin ¢ 1yope) 1 |each| s813.89 $813.89 | Did Not Meet Specifications | $836.39 $836.39 $844.00 $844.00 $830.80 $830.80
County Approved Equal
Item Quoted Stihl MS461 Stihl MS461 Stihl MS461 Stihl MS461
Vendor Notes 2 EXTRA CHAINS INCLUDED IN
BID PRICE
3 months manufacturer
Manufacturer's Warranty| 90 day warranty 90 DAYS 90 DAYS=3 MONTHS X
defective
Delivery Time ARO[ 72 hours after acceptance 48 HOURS 10 DAYS 2 days
1p [StIMS 461 Chainsaw with 18" Bar, or Collin ¢ yopey 4 |each| $853.89 $3,415.56 | Did Not Meet Specifications | $838.05 $3,352.20 $846.00 $3,384.00 $832.40 $3,329.60
County Approved Equal
Item Quoted Stihl MS461 Stihl MS461 Stihl MS461 Stihl MS461
Vendor Notes 2 EXTRA CHAINS INCLUDED IN
BID PRICE
, 3 months manufacturer
Manufacturer's Warranty 90 day warranty 90 DAYS 90 DAYS=3 MONTHS X
defective
Delivery Time ARO[ 72 hours after acceptance 48 HOURS 10 DAYS 2 days
Stihl MS 461 Chai ith 20" B Colli . o
13 [ ainsaw wi an ortOlinetinl [ Ms4s1 1 |each| $853.89 $853.89 | Did Not Meet Specifications | $841.37 $841.37 $847.00 $847.00 $833.50 $833.50
County Approved Equal
Item Quoted Stihl MS461 Stihl MS461 Stihl MS461 Stihl MS461
Vendor Notes 2 EXTRA CHAINS INCLUDED IN
BID PRICE
. 3 months manufacturer
Manufacturer's Warranty| 90 day warranty 90 days 90 DAYS=3 MONTHS X
defective
Delivery Time ARO[ 72 hours after acceptance 48 HOURS 10 DAYS 2 days




IFB No. 2016-336

Mower Medic & Power

Richardson Saw &
Lawnmower Company

McKinney Outdoor Power

Mavich Il IRRIGATORS SUPPLY INC
(Woodvest, LLC) avicn fle (Richardson Saw & (Thirteen Partners Inc)
Lawnmower Company, Inc.)
Line # Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY| UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
14 [SURIMS 461 Chainsaw with 22" Bar, or Collin ¢ yopey 1 |each| NoBid No Bid $842.21 $842.21 No Bid $840.99 $840.99
County Approved Equal
Item Quoted Stihl MS461 Stihl MS461
2 EXTRA CHAINS INCLUDED IN
BID PRICE. NOTE MODEL
NUMBER IS FOR A 20IN BAR.
THE BAR AND CHAIN WILL
HAVE TO BE CHANGED TO 22”
Vendor Notes|
AND SPECIFIED WHEN
ORDERING DUR TO THIS
PARTICULAR UNIT NOT
AVAILABLE FROM FACTORY
WITH 22IN BAR
Manufacturer's Warranty 90 days 3 montns mar?uracturer
defective
Delivery Time ARO 48 HOURS 2 days
15 [Pt MS 461 Chainsaw with 25" Bar, or Collin ¢ 1yope) 3 |each| $841.59 $2,524.77 No Bid $853.97 $2,561.91 $821.00 $2,463.00 $844.89 $2,534.67
County Approved Equal
Item Quoted Stihl MS461 Stihl MS461 Stihl MS461 Stihl MS461
Vendor Notes 2 EXTRA CHAINS INCLUDED IN
BID PRICE
, 3 months manufacturer
Manufacturer's Warranty| 90 day warranty 90 days 90 DAYS=3 MONTHS X
defective
Delivery Time ARO[ 72 hours after acceptance 48 HOURS 10 DAYS 2 days
Stihl MS 362 C-M Chai ith 16" B
16 [0 ainsawwi aLOT lstihl [Ms362cM | 1 |each | $607.49 $607.49 No Bid $594.12 $594.12 $611.00 $611.00 $598.20 $598.20
Collin County Approved Equal
Item Quoted Stihl MS362CM Stihl MS362CM Stihl MS362CM Stihl MS362CM

Vendor Notes

Manufacturer's Warranty|

Delivery Time ARO

2 EXTRA CHAINS INCLUDED IN

BID PRICE
3 months manufacturer
90 day warranty 90 DAYS 90 DAYS=3 MONTHS .
defective
72 hours after acceptance 48 HOURS 10 DAYS 2 days




IFB No. 2016-336

Mower Medic & Power

Richardson Saw &
Lawnmower Company

McKinney Outdoor Power

Mavich Il IRRIGATORS SUPPLY INC
(Woodvest, LLC) avich fic (Richardson Saw & (Thirteen Partners Inc)
Lawnmower Company, Inc.)
Line # Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY| UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
17 [SURIMS 362 C-M Chainsaw with 18" Bar, or ¢ |yicscoem | 2 | each | $607.49 $1,214.98 No Bid $583.75 $1,167.50 $613.00 $1,226.00 $599.65 $1,199.30
Collin County Approved Equal
Item Quoted Stihl MS362CM Stihl MS362CM Stihl MS362CM Stihl MS362CM
Vendor Notes 2 EXTRA CHAINS INCLUDED IN
BID PRICE
, 3 months manufacturer
Manufacturer's Warranty| 90 day warranty 90 DAYS 90 DAYS=3 MONTHS X
defective
Delivery Time ARO[ 72 hours after acceptance 48 HOURS 10 DAYS 2 days
Stihl MS 362 C-M Chai ith 20" B . -
18 [0 ainsaw i aLOT lstihl [Ms362cM | 1 |each | $607.49 $607.49 | Did Not Meet Specifications | $597.44 $597.44 $615.00 $615.00 $601.05 $601.05
Collin County Approved Equal
Item Quoted Stihl MS362CM Stihl MS362CM Stihl MS362CM Stihl MS362CM
Vendor Notes 2 EXTRA CHAINS INCLUDED IN
BID PRICE
. 3 months manufacturer
Manufacturer's Warranty| 90 day warranty 90 DAYS 90 DAYS=3 MONTHS .
defective
Delivery Time ARO[ 72 hours after acceptance 48 HOURS 10 DAYS 2 days
19 [SURIMS 362 C-M Chainsaw with 22" Bar, or ¢ |yicseoem | 1 | each |  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $607.99 $607.99
Collin County Approved Equal
Item Quoted Stihl MS362CM

Vendor Notes

Manufacturer's Warranty|

3 months manufacturer
defective

Delivery Time ARO

2 days




IFB No. 2016-336

Mower Medic & Power

Richardson Saw &
Lawnmower Company

McKinney Outdoor Power

(Woodvest, LLC) Mavich llc IRRIGATORS SUPPLY INC (Richardson Saw & (Thirteen Partners Inc)
Lawnmower Company, Inc.)
Line # Description Mfgr  Mfgno QTY| UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
g0 [SHIMS 362 C-M Chainsaw with 25" Bar, or o) |\icagoem | 1 | each| $618.29 $618.29 No Bid No Bid $647.32 $647.32 $588.00 $588.00 $611.87 $611.87
Collin County Approved Equal
Item Quoted Stihl MS362CM Stihl MS362CM Stihl MS362CM Stihl MS362CM
Vendor Notes
Manufacturer's Warranty 90 day warranty 90 DAYS 90 DAYS=3 MONTHS 3 months mar_\ufacturer
defective
Delivery Time ARO[ 72 hours after acceptance 48 hours 10 days 2 days
g1 |Honda HRC2163HXA 21" Self-Propelled Lawn |\ [HRC2163HX | ) | 1 o gy No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $899.00 $899.00 $977.35 $977.35
Mower, or Collin County Approved Equal A
Item Quoted Honda HRC2163HXA Honda HRC2163HXA
Accessories: Side Discharge Chute $32.98 $32.98 $34.99 $34.99
Vendor Notes
1 YEAR WARRANT ON 2 year manufacturer defective
Manufacturer's Warranty MOWER; 2 YEAR WARRANTY [material on engine and 1 year
ON HONDA ENGINE on mower
Delivery Time ARO 10 days 2 days
Honda HRS216K5PKA 21" Push Lawn Mower HRS216KSPK
22 |With Side Discharge Chute (no bag), or Collin Honda A 4 | each No Bid No Bid $590.12 $2,360.48 No Bid No Bid $282.00 $1,128.00 $315.00 $1,260.00
County Approved Equal
Item Quoted Ariens 911170 Honda HRC216K5PKA HONDA HRC216K5PKA
Vendor Notes
For one year from the date of . . .
K This unit is not a commercial
purchase, any Product which unit an Honda only gives a
Manufacturer's Warranty is determined to be defective 90 DAYS=3 MONTHS .
X three month for commercial
can be returned to will be
repaired or replaced use
Delivery Time ARO 20 DAYS 10 DAYS 5 DAYS
Toro 22295 21" Heavy Duty Zone Start Self-
23 |Propelled Lawn Mower with Rear Bagging Toro 22295 4 | each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,004.66 $4,018.64 $890.00 $3,560.00 $983.15 $3,932.60
System, or Collin County Approved Equal
Item Quoted Toro 22295 Toro 22295 Toro 22295
T TATRADAT WITHUUT
Vendor Notes FRAME IS INCLUDED IN BID
DRICE
1 YEAR WARRANTY ON 2 year manufacturer defective
Manufacturer's Warranty 2 YEARS UNIT WARRANTY. MOWER. material on engine and 1 year
3 YEARS ENGINE. 2 YEAR WARRANTY ON on mower
HONDA ENGINE.
Delivery Time ARO 48 HOURS 10 DAYS 2 days




IFB No. 2016-336

Mower Medic & Power

Richardson Saw &
Lawnmower Company

McKinney Outdoor Power

(Woodvest, LLC) Mavich llc IRRIGATORS SUPPLY INC (Richardson Saw & (Thirteen Partners Inc)
Lawnmower Company, Inc.)
Line # Description Mfgr  Mfgno QTY| UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Toro 22295 21" Heavy Duty Zone Start Self-
24 |Propelled Lawn Mower with Side Discharge, or |Toro 22295 1 | each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $905.00 $905.00 $999.40 $999.40
Collin County Approved Equal
Item Quoted Toro 22295 Toro 22295
Part number 130-9734 is a
Rear Discharge Kit that you
Vendor Notes| can get that the chute will
come out the back an curve to|
the side
1 YEAR WARRANTY ON .
IEWER 2 year.manufact‘urer defective|
Manufacturer's Warranty P VAR AT @I material on engine and 1 year
HONDA ENGINE. on mower
Delivery Time ARO 10 DAYS 2 days for mowerand 5 days
on kit
Scag SWZT52-18FSE 52" Electric Start Walk- SWZT52-
25 [Behind Lawn Mower, or Collin County Approved |Scag P 1 | each No Bid No Bid $6,989.69 $6,989.69 $5,758.10 $5,758.10 $4,799.00 $4,799.00 $5,939.00 $5,939.00
Equal
25 o
AL Toro Midsize Toro 30489 1 | each $5,939.00
Item Quoted Scag SWZT52-18FSE Toro 30489 Scag SWZT52-18FSE Toro 30489
Vendor Notes|
2 YEAR UNIT WARRANTY 3 UNIT COVERAGE: 2yr; 1 yr
For one year from the date of| YEAR ENGINE WARRANTY Battery- 90 days parts &
purchase, any Product which -BATTERY 90 DAYS PARTS labor, 91-365 days parts only;
Manufacturer's Warranty is determined to be defective| AND LABOR, 1 YEAR PARTS 2 YEAR WARRANTY 1 yr Attachhment; 90 Day
can be returned to will be ONLY Belts & Tires; ENGINE
repaired or replaced -BELTS AND TIRES 90 DAYS COVERAGE through Engine
-ATTACHMENTS 1 YEAR Mfg
Delivery Time ARO 20 DAYS 2 WEEKS 10 DAYS 5 DAYS
26 |>cag SWZTS2-18FS 527 Recoil Start Walk-Behind |+ |SWZT52- 1 |each| NoBid No Bid $6,61570  $6,615.70 No Bid No Bid $4,610.00  $4,610.00 No Bid No Bid
Lawn Mower, or Collin County Approved Equal 18FS
Item Quoted Scag SWZT52-18FS Scag SWZT52-18FS

Vendor Notes

Manufacturer's Warranty

Delivery Time ARO
Dept./Purchasing Notes

For one year from the date of
purchase, any Product which

is determined to be defective 2 YEAR WARRANTY
can be returned to will be
repaired or replaced
20 DAYS 10 DAYS




IFB No. 2016-336

Mower Medic & Power

Richardson Saw &
Lawnmower Company

McKinney Outdoor Power

Mavich Il IRRIGATORS SUPPLY INC
(Woodvest, LLC) avich fic (Richardson Saw & (Thirteen Partners Inc)
Lawnmower Company, Inc.)
Line # Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY| UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
27 |Billy Goat HWGS1HSP 24" High Weed Bl lhwesinse | 2 |each| NosBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,396.00  $2,792.00
Commercial Mower, or Collin County Approved [Goat
Item Quoted
Vendor Notes
2 year manufacturer defective
Manufacturer's Warranty material on engine and 1 year
on mower
Delivery Time ARO! 5 DAYS
28 [5Ca STTI-S2V-26CH-EFI 52" Turf Tiger Il Riding |+ |STI-52V- 1 |each| NoBid No Bid Did Not Meet Specifications | Did Not Meet Specifications | $9,099.00  $9,099.00 | Did Not Meet Specifications
Lawn Mower, or Collin County Approved Equal 26CH-EFI
28
ALT1 Toro Z Master Toro 74906 1 | each
Item Quoted Scag STT1152V-26CHEFI
Vendor Notes|
Manufacturer's Warranty 2 YEAR WARRANTY
Delivery Time ARO 10 DAYS
29[St HT 131 Telescoping Pole Pruner, or Collin g, | p1 5y 3 |each| $487.74 $1,463.22 No Bid No Bid $483.85 $1,451.55 $462.00 $1,386.00 $460.49 $1,381.47
County Approved Equal
Item Quoted HT131 HT131 HT131 HT131
Accessories: HT Carrier System Harness|  $129.99 $129.99 $112.00 $112.00 $112.00 $112.00 $130.00 $130.00
Vet Wi 2 EXTRA CHAINS INCLUDED IN
BID PRICE
, 2 year manufacturer defective
Manufacturer's Warranty| 90 day warranty 2 YEAR 2 YEAR WARRANTY material
Delivery Time ARO[ 72 hours after acceptance 48 HOURS 10 DAYS 2 DAYS
Dept./Purchasing Notes
30 itgzlrgx'je?sqzjkp“k Blower, or Collin County 1. IgRa30 1 |each| $297.99 $297.99 $536.99 $536.99 $304.91 $304.91 286.50 $286.50 $291.30 $291.30
Item Quoted Stihl BR430 Makita BBX7600N Stihl BR430 Stihl BR430 Stihl BR430
Vendor Notes
For one year from the date of
purchase, any Product which
\ A . ) 2 YEAR MANUFACTURER
Manufacturer's Warranty| 2 year warranty is determined to be defectlve 2 YEARS 2 YEAR WARRANTY DEFECTIVE MATERIAL
can be returned to will be
repaired or replaced
Delivery Time ARO[ 72 hours after acceptance 2 DAYS 48 HOURS 10 DAYS 2 DAYS




IFB No.

2016-336

Richardson Saw &
Mower Medic & Power . Lawnmower Company McKinney Outdoor Power
M h il IRRIGATORS SUPPLY INC
(Woodvest, LLC) avich fic (Richardson Saw & (Thirteen Partners Inc)
Lawnmower Company, Inc.)
Line # Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY| uom Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
31 Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for Stihl Products Not Listed Herein 21% No Bid 23% 25.20% $0.24
32 Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for Scag Products Not Listed Herein 0% 20 No Bid 20.20% 0
33 Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for Honda Products Not Listed 0% No Bid No Bid 12% to 25% 13%
EU1000, All 2000 series
generators, All HRR Mowers,
" o .
v a———— FG110 Tiller 12% off list.All
other mowers, tillers,
trimmers, generators, water
pumps 25% off list.
34 Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for Toro Products Not Listed Herein 0% No Bid 29% 28% 30%
Vendor Notes On LCE (La‘ndscape Contractor
Equipment) only.
=% Percgnt Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for Billy Goat Products Not Listed 0% 20% No Bid 23% $0.11
Herein

36 Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for Products Not Listed Herein $0.00 $0.20 21% $0.10 $0.10




