EVALUATION SPREADSHEET | |
BID NO. # 2017-074
SUPPLIES: VETERINARY AND ANIMAL CARE Merck Midwest MWI NAO Global Health LLC DOT Scientific C. Specialties Pro Pest and Lawn Store Boxes 4 U, Inc. Infinity Supply and Services, Inc.
Description Quantity[UOM Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price
Section I: Medications and Vaccines
1 [Canine Intransal Bordatella 3700 |Dose|l $ 3.2200 | $11,914.0000 | $ 5.3500 19,795.0000 No Bid No Bid $ 8.1700 30,229.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 |Rabies Vaccine 3700 |Dose| $ 0.9000 | $ 3,330.0000 | $ 2.3000 8,510.0000 No Bid No Bid $ 2.7600 10,212.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 |Revolution for dogs 5-10 Ibs 1280 [Each] No Bid No Bid $ 10.6000| $ 13,568.0000 No Bid No Bid $ 14.9500 19,136.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 |Revolution for dogs 11-20 Ibs 300 Each] No Bid No Bid $ 10.9300| $ 3,279.0000 No Bid No Bid $ 14.9000 4,470.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 |Revolution for dogs 21-40 Ibs 1700 |[Each| No Bid No Bid $ 11.5000| $ 19,550.0000 No Bid No Bid $ 15.6800 26,656.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 |Revolution for dogs 41-85 Ibs 25 Each| No Bid No Bid $ 11.5500 288.7500 No Bid No Bid $ 15.7500 393.7500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 |Revolution for dogs 86-130 Ibs 25 Each] No Bid No Bid $ 15.0300| $ 375.7500 No Bid No Bid $ 20.5000| $ 512.5000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 |Equi-Phar Pro Tal 25 Oz. No Bid No Bid $ 0.4500( $ 11.2500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 |Paste Wormer 25 ml. No Bid No Bid $ 0.3300| $ 8.2500 No Bid No Bid $ 0.3900| $ 9.7500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Non
10 [Canine Dewormer 25 ml. No Bid No Bid $ 0.1072| $ 2.6808 No Bid No Bid Responsive No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11 |Feline Tab 5 Each] No Bid No Bid $ 3.4900| $ 17.4500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 |Line Deleted - Addendum #4
13 |Virbantel-Canine small 30 mg 100 |Each] No Bid No Bid $ 2.7798| $ 277.9800 27798 | $ 277.9800 | $ 3.3300( $ 333.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 |Virbantel-Canine med-large 114 mg 20 Each] No Bid No Bid $ 7.1000| $ 142.0000 7.1000 | $  142.0000 | $ 8.5100( $ 170.2000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
15 |Fatal Plus 20 ml. No Bid No Bid $ 0.3000 6.0000 0.3100 6.2000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
16 |Xylazine-Canine and Feline 4 ml. No Bid No Bid $ 0.3200 $ 1.2800 | $ 0.4300 | $ 1.7200 | $ 0.5300( $ 2.1200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
17 |Ketamine Injection 4 cc. No Bid No Bid $ 0.6200( $ 2.4800 | $ 0.4800 | $ 1.9200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
18 |AcePromazine Injectable 24 cc. No Bid No Bid $ 0.3200 $ 7.6800 | $ 0.3000 | $ 7.2000 | $ 0.4000( $ 9.6000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
19 [Uniprim Powder for Horses 10 gm.| No Bid No Bid $ 0.6800| $ 6.8000 No Bid No Bid $ 0.0900| $ 0.9000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
20 |Sodium Cloride 0.9% 30 ml. No Bid No Bid $ 0.0300| $ 0.9000 No Bid No Bid $ 0.0500| $ 1.5000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
21 |AcePromazine Tablets 10 Each] No Bid No Bid $ 0.4000| $ 4.0000 | $ 0.2600 | $ 2.6000 | $ 0.5000| $ 5.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
22 |Line Deleted - Addendum #4
23 |Cephalexin Capsules 10 Each] No Bid No Bid $ 0.0460 | $ 0.4600 | $ 0.0490 | $ 0.4900 | $ 1.0400| $ 10.4000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
24 |Albon Oral Suspension 10 Oz. No Bid No Bid $ 3.9100( $ 39.1000 No Bid No Bid Non Responsive No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
25 |Bute Paste-Equine 10 Each] No Bid No Bid $ 18.6200 | $ 186.2000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
26 |Clavamox 10 Each] No Bid No Bid $ 1.1900( $ 11.9000 No Bid No Bid $ 1.4700| $ 14.7000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
27 |Clavamox Drops 20 ml. No Bid No Bid $ 0.9000( $ 18.0000 No Bid No Bid $ 1.1200| $ 22.4000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
28 |Enisyl-f Oral Paste Feline 20 ml. No Bid No Bid $ 0.2100| $ 4.2000 No Bid No Bid $ 0.3500( $ 7.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
30 |Penicillin Injectable 10 ml. No Bid No Bid $ 0.3900( $ 3.9000 No Bid No Bid $ 0.4000( $ 4.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
31 |Triple Antibotic Ointment 10 Oz. No Bid No Bid $ 2.1300( $ 21.3000 No Bid No Bid $ 3.3500( $ 33.5000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
32 |Isopropyl Alchol 10 Oz. No Bid No Bid $ 0.1900| $ 1.9000 | $ 0.1000 | $ 1.0000 | $ 0.0800( $ 0.8000 | $ 1.5000 8.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
33 |Gentamicin Sulfate Solution 1 ml. No Bid No Bid Non Responsive No Bid $ 0.1600 | $ 0.1600 | $ 0.2200( $ 0.2200 | $ 0.2300 0.2200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
34 |Hydrogen Peroxide 10 Oz. No Bid No Bid $ 0.3400| $ 3.4000 | $ 0.2700 | $ 2.7000 | $ 0.3300( $ 3.3000 ] $ 0.4700 33.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Non
35 |Farnam Swat 5 Oz. No Bid No Bid Non Responsive No Bid $ 1.2500 | $ 6.2500 Responsive No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
36 |lIsoflurane 10 ml. No Bid No Bid $ 0.1000| $ 1.0000 | $ 0.0850 | $ 0.8500 | $ 0.1200{ $ 1.2000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
37 |Ketofen Sterile Solution 20 ml. No Bid No Bid $ 1.5600( $ 31.2000 No Bid No Bid $ 1.8700| $ 37.4000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
38 |Atipamezole Hydrocholride - Sterile 10 ml. No Bid No Bid $ 16.1700 | $ 161.7000 No Bid No Bid $ 20.1800| $ 201.8000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
40 |Aurocine Ear Cleanser with Aloe 10 Oz. No Bid No Bid $ 0.8450| $ 8.4500 | $ 0.3700 | $ 3.7000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
41 |Dex SP Injectable 10 ml. No Bid No Bid $ 0.0422| $ 0.4220 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
42 |Convenia - Canine and Feline 10 ml. No Bid No Bid $ 26.8200| $ 268.2000 No Bid No Bid $ 37.6700( $ 376.7000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
43 |B-12 Injection 40 cc. No Bid No Bid $ 0.0228| $ 09112 $ 0.0206 | $ 0.8256 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
44 |Neo Poly Dex Eye Drops 10 ml. No Bid No Bid $ 1.1100| $ 11.1000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
45 |Chlorex Solution 50 gal. No Bid No Bid $ 6.3100| $ 315.5000 | $ 6.7600 [ $  338.0000 | $ 7.5400( $ 377.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
46 |Polyflex 10 gm.| No Bid No Bid $ 1.6700( $ 16.7000 No Bid No Bid $ 2.0100| $ 20.1000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Feline-Rhinotrachetis-Calici-Panleukopenia-Chlamydia Non Non
170|Psittaci 80 dose| $ 3.2200 | $ 257.6000 | $ 4.9500| $ 396.0000 No Bid No Bid Responsive Responsive No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Canine Distemper-Adenovirus Type 2-Parainfluenza- Non Non
171|Parvovirus 80 dose|] $ 3.3500 | $ 268.0000 | $ 5.1500( $ 412.0000 No Bid No Bid Responsive Responsive No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
172|Drontal Plus 1 tablef§ No Bid No Bid $ 13.8800( $ 13.8800 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
47 |Section I: Discount Off Catalog Price 5 Each] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Section II: Testing Supplies
48 |Feline Snap Antibody/FELV Antigen Combo Test 20 Each] No Bid No Bid $ 10.6900 | $ 213.8000 No Bid No Bid $ 460.2200( $ 9,204.4000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
52 |Line Deleted - Addendum #4
53 |Dry Flotation Medium, Zinc Sulfate 2 Gal No Bid No Bid $ 6.9000( $ 13.8000 | $ 8.0100 | $ 16.0200 | $ 14.2100( $ 28.4200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
54 |Fecasol Solution 10 Gal No Bid No Bid $ 24.6300| $ 246.3000 No Bid No Bid $ 40.1400| $ 401.4000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Section II: Testing Supplies - Discount off Catalog
55 |Price List 10 Each] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Section Ill: Flea Control
56 |Canine Frontline Plus 5-22 |bs 20 Each] No Bid No Bid $ 10.5200( $ 210.4000 No Bid No Bid $ 12.6200| $ 252.4000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.0000 [ $ 460.0000 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
57 |Canine Frontline Plus 23-44 Ibs 10 Each] No Bid No Bid $ 10.7700( $ 107.7000 No Bid No Bid $ 12.9200| $ 129.2000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.0000 [ $ 230.0000 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
58 |Canine Frontline Plus 45-88 Ibs 10 Each] No Bid No Bid $ 11.0300( $ 110.3000 No Bid No Bid $ 13.2400| $ 132.4000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.0000 [ $ 230.0000 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
59 |Canine Frontline Plus 89-132 Ibs 10 Each] No Bid No Bid $ 11.2800( $ 112.8000 No Bid No Bid $ 13.5400| $ 135.4000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.0000 [ $ 230.0000 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
60 |Feline Front Line Plus 10 Each] No Bid No Bid $ 10.3000( $ 103.0000 No Bid No Bid $ 12.3600| $ 123.6000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.0000 [ $ 230.0000 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
61 Capstar - Canine and Feline 10 Each] No Bid No Bid $ 3.1800( $ 31.8000 No Bid No Bid $ 4.0800| $ 40.8000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 4.9900 | $ 49.9000 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
62 |Capstar - Canine 10 Each] No Bid No Bid $ 3.3800( $ 33.8000 No Bid No Bid $ 4.2400| $ 42.4000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 5.2500 | $ 52.5000 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
63 |Section Ill: Flea Control Discount off Catalog Price List 1 Each] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$ N
Section IV: Lab Supplies $ -
64 | Tourniquet 20 Each| No Bid No Bid $ 9.8800| $ 197.6000 | $ 9.4300 [ $  188.6000 | $ 12.6700| $ 253.4000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
65 |Sharps Container, Quart 2 Each] No Bid No Bid $ 2.2000( $ 4.4000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
66 |Sharps Container, Gallon 2 Gal No Bid No Bid $ 2.6700( $ 5.3400 No Bid No Bid $ 3.6100( $ 7.2200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
67 |Sharps Container, 2 Gallon 2 Gal No Bid No Bid $ 2.0200( $ 4.0400 No Bid No Bid $ 2.0000( $ 4.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
68 |Cadaver Bags 38 x 48 10 No Bid No Bid $ 1.2700( $ 12.7000 | $ 0.7300 | $ 7.3000 | $ 1.0800| $ 10.8000 No Bid No Bid 1.0510 10.5100 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
69 |Cadaver Bags 24 x 30 10 No Bid No Bid $ 0.3500| $ 3.5000 | $ 0.4500 | $ 4.5000 | $ 0.5400( $ 5.4000 No Bid No Bid 0.5100 5.1000 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
71 |Zip Bags, Reclosable 10 No Bid No Bid $ 0.0700| $ 0.7000 No Bid No Bid $ 0.2600( $ 2.6000 | $ 0.2200 2.2000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.0790 | $ 0.7900 No Bid No Bid
72 |Alcohol Prep Pads 10 No Bid No Bid $ 0.0104| $ 0.1035 | $ 0.0099 | $ 0.0990 | $ 0.0100{ $ 0.1000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




BID NO. # 2017-074
SUPPLIES: VETERINARY AND ANIMAL CARE Merck Midwest MWI NAO Global Health LLC DOT Scientific C. Specialties Pro Pest and Lawn Store Boxes 4 U, Inc. Infinity Supply and Services, Inc.
Description Quantity[UOM Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price
75 |Gauze Wrap (for Instruments) 10 Each] No Bid No Bid $ 0.0526 | $ 0.5260 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
76 [Tattoo Ink 10 oz. No Bid No Bid $ 2.0200 20.2000 | $ 1.9100 [ $ 19.1000 | $ 2.6900( $ 26.9000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
77 |Clipper Lube 10 0z. No Bid No Bid $ 0.4100| $ 4.1000 0.4400 4.4000 | $ 0.5100( $ 5.1000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
78 |Rapid Stain Differential 10 Each] No Bid No Bid $ 14.2800 142.8000 | $ 12.0800 | $  120.8000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
79 |Cotton Tip Applicator 10 Each] No Bid No Bid $ 0.0034| $ 0.0340 0.0040 0.0400 | $ 0.6800( $ 6.8000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Section IV: Lab Supplies - Discount off Catalog Price
80 |List 10 Each] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Section V: Surgical Supplies
81 |Dissolvable Suture 10 Each] No Bid No Bid $ 6.8500( $ 68.5000 | $ 2.5200 [ $ 25.2000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
82 |Tissue Glue 35 3cc No Bid No Bid $ 13.4100 469.3500 | $ 12.8100 | $  448.3500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
83 |Dissolvable Suture 20 Each] No Bid No Bid $ 4.7600 95.2000 | $ 4.5500 | $ 91.0000 | $ 9.3800 187.6000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
84 |Surgery Drape 20 yd No Bid No Bid $ 0.6000 12.0000 No Bid No Bid $ 0.9300 18.6000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
85 [Allis Forcep 4 No Bid No Bid $ 27.0000 108.0000 | $ 22.7000 [ $ 90.8000 | $ 5.5000( $ 22.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
86 |Surgical Stapler 15 Each] No Bid No Bid $ 10.7600 161.4000 No Bid No Bid $ 14.4800 217.2000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
87 |Drain/Tube 10 Each] No Bid No Bid $ 0.5700 5.7000 | $ 0.5100 | $ 5.1000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
88 |Tissue Staple Remover 10 Each] No Bid No Bid $ 11.7100 117.1000 | $ 47700 | $ 47.7000 | $ 2.0000| $ 20.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
89 |Needle Holder 5 Each] No Bid No Bid $ 85.1000 425.5000 No Bid No Bid $ 58.9700| $ 294.8500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
90 [Gauze Roll 40 Each| No Bid No Bid $ 0.4200 16.8000 | $ 0.4000 | $ 16.0000 | $ 0.1005( $ 4.0200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
91 |Exam Gloves 10 Each] No Bid No Bid Non Responsive| Non Responsive No Bid No Bid $ 12.5600| $ 125.6000 | Non Responsive | Non Responsive | Non Responsive | Non Responsive | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Non Non
92 |[Surgical Face Mask 10 No Bid No Bid $ 0.0868 | $ 0.8680 No Bid No Bid Responsive Responsive No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
93 [Gloves 30 No Bid No Bid $ 2.0800 62.4000 No Bid No Bid $ 1.6770| $ 50.3100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
94 [Gauze Sponge 40 No Bid No Bid $ 0.0142| $ 0.5680 0.0200 0.8000 | $ 0.0320( $ 1.2800 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
95 [Vet Wrap 150 No Bid No Bid $ 1.1000 165.0000 | $ 1.3600 [ $ 204.0000 | $ 76.0000| $ 11,400.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
96 |Surgical Blade, Stainless Steel #10 20 No Bid No Bid Non Responsive | Non Responsive | $ 0.2886 | $ 577201 $ 0.3596 | $ 7.1920 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
97 |Surgical Blade, Stainless Steel #22 20 No Bid No Bid $ 0.6000 12.0000 | $ 0.5700 | $ 11.4000 | $ 0.6500| $ 13.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
98 |Multidose Vial Access Spike 10 No Bid No Bid $ 1.8900 18.9000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
99 |Microclose Multidose Vial Adapter 10 No Bid No Bid $ 2.2000 22.0000 No Bid No Bid $ 2.7700( $ 27.7000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
100|Administration Set 10 No Bid No Bid $ 0.8900| $ 8.9000 No Bid No Bid $ 1.2700| $ 12.7000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Section V: Surgical Supplies - Discount off Catalog
101|Price List 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$ R
Section VI: Needles and Syringes $ -
102|Monoject Luer Syringe/Needle Combo 3cc, 23g x 1 in 10 No Bid No Bid $ 0.1210 1.2100 | $ 0.1160 | $ 1.1600 | $ 0.1320( $ 1.3200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
103|Monoject Luer Syringe/Needle 3cc, 25g x 5/8 in 10 No Bid No Bid $ 0.1214 1.2140 | $ 0.1160 | $ 1.1600 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
104|Syringe/Needle Combo, 1cc, 279 x 1/2in 10 No Bid No Bid $ 0.2156 2.1560 | $ 0.2058 | $ 2.0580 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
105|Syringe/Needle Combo, 1 cc, 25g x 5/8 in 30 No Bid No Bid $ 0.2156 6.4680 | $ 0.1193 | $ 3.5790 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
106{Monoject Luer Syringe, 1cc 30 No Bid No Bid $ 0.3035 9.1050 0.2898 8.6940 | $ 0.1715| $ 5.1450 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
107|Monoject Luer Lock Syringe, 3cc 10 No Bid No Bid $ 0.1061 1.0610 | $ 0.1015 | $ 1.0150 | $ 0.1699 1.6990 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
108|Monoject Luer Lock Syringe, 6cc 10 No Bid No Bid $ 0.1715 1.7150 | $ 0.1698 | $ 1.6980 | $ 0.2499 2.4990 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
109|Monoject Luer Lock Syringe, 12cc 20 No Bid No Bid $ 0.2207 4.4140 | $ 0.2107 | $ 42140] $ 0.4506 9.0120 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
110{Monoject Luer Lock Needle, 14ga x 1 in 5 No Bid No Bid $ 0.1532| $ 0.7660 0.1742 0.8710 ] $ 0.2657 1.3285 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
111|Monoject Luer Lock Needle, 18ga x 1 in 20 No Bid No Bid $ 0.0778 1.5560 | $ 0.0743 | $ 1.4860 | $ 0.1638 3.2760 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
112|Monoject Luer Lock Needle, 18ga x 1.5 in 20 No Bid No Bid $ 0.0778 1.5560 | $ 0.0743 | $ 1.4860 | $ 0.1638 3.2760 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
113|Monoject Luer Lock Needle, 19ga x 1 in 20 No Bid No Bid $ 0.0778| $ 1.5560 0.1073 2.1460 ] $ 0.1638 3.2760 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
114|Monoject Luer Lock Needle, 19 ga x 1.5 in 20 No Bid No Bid $ 0.0778 1.5560 | $ 0.0743 | $ 1.4860 | $ 0.1638 3.2760 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
115|Monoject Luer Lock Needle, 21gax 1in 4 No Bid No Bid $ 0.0778 0.3112 | $ 0.0743 | $ 0.2972 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
116|{Monoject Luer Lock Needle, 22ga x 3/4 in 40 No Bid No Bid $ 0.0778 31120 | $ 0.0743 | $ 297201 $ 0.1770( $ 7.0800 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
117|Monoject Luer Lock Needle, 22ga x 1 in 10 No Bid No Bid $ 0.0778 0.7780 | $ 0.0743 | $ 0.7430 | $ 0.1638| $ 1.6380 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
118|Monoject Luer Lock Needle, 23ga x 1 in 5 No Bid No Bid $ 0.0778 0.3890 | $ 0.0743 | $ 0.3715 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
119|Monoject Luer Lock Needle, 25ga x 5/8 in 5 No Bid No Bid $ 0.0778 0.3890 | $ 0.0743 | $ 03715] $ 0.1638| $ 0.8190 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
120{Monoject Luer Lock Needle, 27ga x 1/2 in 5 No Bid No Bid $ 0.0778 0.3890 | $ 0.0743 | $ 0.3715 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
121 | CatalogPriceList 5 No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- Ne-Bid— Noe-Bid— No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid-
$ B
Section VII: Cleaning Supplies
122|Kennelsol, 5 gal 35 Gal No Bid No Bid $ 30.3760| $ 1,063.1600 | $ 18.1840 | $  636.4400 | $ 31.4280 1,099.9800 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
123|Trifectant, tablets 15 Tab] No Bid No Bid $ 0.5540| $ 8.3100 No Bid No Bid $ 1.0300 15.4500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
124|Disinfectant Virucide 20 Lb No Bid No Bid $ 5.9160| $ 118.3200 | $ 54310 [ $ 108.6200 | $ 7.1690 143.3800 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Section VII: Cleaning Supplies - Discount off Catalog
125|Price List 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 20%
Section VIII: Cage Supplies $ -
126|Litter Pans 10 No Bid No Bid $ 0.8333| $ 8.3330 No Bid No Bid $ 0.4965| $ 4.9650 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 04353 | $ 4.3530
127|Food Trays 5 No Bid No Bid $ 0.0560 | $ 0.2800 | $ 0.0398 | $ 0.1989 | $ 0.0567| $ 0.2837 No Bid No Bid $ 0.0290 | $ 0.0290 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Non Responsive | Non Responsive
Nen- Nen-
128|DogBewlquart 5 No-Bid- No-Bid- -Nen-Responsive| -Non-Respensive] NenResponsive |Non-Respensive] Responsive- Responsive- No-Bid- No-Bid- Non-Respensive | NonRespensive | No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid-
Nen- Nen-
129|Dog-Bowl-8-62 40 No-Big- No-Big- Non-Responsive| NonResponsive] NonRespensive |NonResponsive] Responsive- | Responsive- No-Big- No-Bid- $———1.8500 | $—74.0000 | NeoBid- NoBid- NoBid- NoBid- No-Bid- No-Big-
130|key-Clips 10 No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid-
131|Vinyl Envelope 250 Ea. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.7280| $ 182.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
132|Suction Cup 45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1.8100| $ 81.4500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
133|Cable Ties 24 Ea. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.0182| $ 0.4361 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
134|Prcetist No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- Ne-Bid— Ne-Bid— No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid-
Section IX: Handling and Capture Supplies
135|Pbual-Rek Cateh-PRole 2 No-Bid No-Bid Non RQSBQH-S-UQ Noen RQ-SPQHSIUQ Non RQSBQH-S-UQ Non Respens'”e Nen RQ-SPQHSIUQ Nen RQ-SPQHSIUQ No-Bid No-Bid Noen RQ-SPQHSIUQ Non RQSPGH-S-UQ No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
136|Pbual-Rel Catech-PRole 2 No-Bid No-Bid Non RQSBQH-S-UQ Nen RQ-SPQHSIUQ Non RQSBQH-S-UQ Non Respens'”e Nen RQ-SPQHSIUQ Nen RQ-SPQHSIUQ No-Bid No-Bid Noen RQ-SPQHSIUQ Non RQSPGH-S-UQ No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
137|"Y" Restraint Pole-60" 45 Eachl NoBid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
138|Super Snare 53" 45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 92.8700 4,179.1500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
139|Cat Tongs 28" 45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 68.9300 3,101.8500 No Bid No Bid $ 79.9500 [ $  3,597.7500 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
140|Cat Tongs 38" 45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 75.8100 3,411.4500 No Bid No Bid $ 79.9500 [ $ 3,597.7500 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
141|Bite Stick 40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 64.9300 2,597.2000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
142|Bite Stick 40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 58.4300 2,337.2000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
143|Bite Stick Holster 30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 52.1800 1,565.4000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
144|SnakeFongs 15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
145|Bat/Bird/Mammal Net 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 81.0600 810.6000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
146|Magnum Net 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 210.6000 2,106.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
147|Gaunlet Gloves 10 Pair] No Bid No Bid $ 126.1900| $ 1,261.9000 No Bid No Bid $ 125.9400 1,259.4000 No Bid No Bid $ 149.9500 | $  1,499.5000 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




BID NO. # 2017-074

SUPPLIES: VETERINARY AND ANIMAL CARE Merck Midwest MWI NAO Global Health LLC DOT Scientific C. Specialties Pro Pest and Lawn Store Boxes 4 U, Inc. Infinity Supply and Services, Inc.
Description Quantity[UOM Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price
148|Dog Muzzle 10 Set ] No Bid No Bid $ 476100 $ 476.1000 | $ 44.3500 | $  443.5000 | $ 75.0000( $ 750.0000 No Bid No Bid 59.5000 [ $ 595.0000 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
149|Feral Cat Den 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 97.7700| $ 977.7000 No Bid No Bid 79.5000 [ $ 795.0000 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
150|BenFront-Boor 10 No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid-
151|Universal Trap 10 No Bid No Bid $ 71.4200| $ 714.2000 No Bid No Bid $ 120.8400| $ 1,208.4000 No Bid No Bid 107.9500 1,079.5000 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
152|Cage 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 96.5000 965.0000 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
153|Carrier/Transfer Cage 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 86.2500 | $ 862.5000 No Bid No Bid 64.0000 640.0000 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
154|Field Darts - 4cc 10 No Bid No Bid $ 20.5400 | $ 205.4000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
155|Field Darts - 5¢cc 10 No Bid No Bid $ 20.5400 | $ 205.4000 No Bid No Bid $ 4.7800| $ 47.8000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
156|Field Darts - 6cc 15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 4.7800| $ 71.7000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
157|Field Darts - 7cc 15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 4.7800| $ 71.7000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
158|Field Darts - 8cc 15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 25.3300| $ 379.9500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
159|Pole Syringe - 3ml 2 No Bid No Bid $ 41.6700| $ 83.3400 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Nen-
160|Foldingtarge-Animal- Frap 3 No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- b No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid- No-Bid-
161|Heavy Duty Animal Trap 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 107.9400| $ 107.9400 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Section D Handling-and-Capture-Supplies—Discount
- g Ld FF
162| off Patnlnc Price-List No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Section X: Miscellaneous
163|Dog Leads 250 |Each| No Bid No Bid $ 0.4300 107.5000 0.8500 212.5000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.5300 175.0000 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
164|Dog Leads 80 Each] No Bid No Bid $ 0.6400 51.2000 | $ 0.6300 50.4000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.7000 56.0000 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
165|Cardboard Pet Carrier 80 Each] No Bid No Bid $ 3.5600 284.8000 2.9200 233.6000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.4500 196.0000 | No Bid No Bid $2.3900 [ $ 191.2000 No Bid No Bid
166|Waste bags 400 [Each] No Bid No Bid $ 0.0322 12.8800 No Bid No Bid $ 0.0575( $ 23.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
167|Home Again Microchips 200 |Each| $ 9.9900 | $ 1,998.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
168|Microchip Reader 2 each] $375.0000 [ $ 750.0000 | Non Responsive [ Non Responsive No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Section X: Miscellaneous - Discount off Catalog Price
169|List No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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