Bid No.2016-298

and Control

Target Specialty Products

Specification Responses Pro Pest and Lawn Store Harrells LLC (J.C. Ehrlich Co., Inc.) Winfield SiteOne Landscape Suppl
Line Description uom QTY Unit Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit | Extended Unit
1 |Grass Seed: Fescue Seed, Turf Blend (Fescue Seed, Turf Type Tall Fescue Bl{ bag 1 NoBid | NoBid $64.50 $64.50 $68.30 $68.30 $56.75 | $56.75 $64.04 | $64.04
Item Notes Transition Tall Fesc 50
50 Ib bag Ib bag
2 [Grass Seed: Fescue Seed, Camelot Blend; 50lb Bag bag 1 NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid $81.00 [ $81.00 NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid
tem Notes Triple Crown Blend
(equivalent) Fescue
Seed, 50 bag
3 Grass Seed: Rye Grass Seed, Over Seeding Variety of Perennial Rye Grass; 5! bag 1 NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid $69.40 [ $69.40 $64.00 | $64.00 $63.75 [ $63.75
ltem Notes Item #28-907-33 Allsport
4 Perennial Rye Grass;
50 Ib bag 50 Ib bag
4 Grass Seed: Rye Grass Seed, Over Seeding Two Variety Blend of Perennial R: bag 1 NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid $68.30 | $68.30 NoBid | NoBid $49.28 [ $49.28
Item Notes item # 49-82-401 Pro
Blend Il Rye Grass
50 Ib bag Blend; 50 |b bag
5 Grass Seed: Rye Grass Seed, Over Seeding Three Variety Blend of Perennial bag 1 NoBid | NoBid $59.00 [ $59.00 $64.90 [ $64.90 $64.00 | $64.00 $65.49 $65.49
Item Notes Champion Perennial 3 Overseeding Eagle
way Rye, 50 Ib bag Blend Seed; 50 Ib bag
6 [Grass Seed: Bermuda Grass Seed, Common Hulled; 50lb Bag bag 1 NoBid | NoBid $181.10 | $181.10 $249.00 | $249.00 $260.00 | $260.00 $268.37 | $268.37
Item Notes item # 20-21-050
50 Ib bag Bermuda grass hulled
7 [Grass Seed: Bermuda Grass Seed, Common Unhulled; 50Ib Bag bag 1 NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid $168.90 | $168.90 NoBid | NoBid $171.30 | $171.30
Item Notes item # 20-21-050
Bermuda grass unhulled
50 Ib bag 50lb bag
8 Grass Seed: Winter Wheat bag 1 NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid $30.00 [ $30.00 NoBid | NoBid $19.47 $19.47
Item Notes tem ewhea
Winer Wheat Seed 50 Ib
50 Ib bag bag
9 Grass Seeds: Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price 1 No Bid No Bid 10% 10% 5% 0%
Item Notes Discount does not apply Buyboard pricing 0-60%
to Agency priced items off

to Agency priced items

10 |Fertilizer: 18-24-12 Slow Release; 50Ib Bag bag 1 No Bid No Bid $16.90 $16.90 $14.25 $14.25 No Bid No Bid $19.62 $19.62
Item Notes Brand Bid: Bonus Crop
18-24-12/50% SCU, 50 Ib
Fertilizer: 25-2-5 Pre-Emergent 86%; 50Ib Bag
11 bag 1 No Bid No Bid $17.15 $17.15 $15.00 $15.00 No Bid No Bid $18.58 $18.58
Item Notes Brand Bid: Bonus Crop
25-2-5/30% XCU
12 |[Fertilizer: 0-0-7 Pre-Emergent .86%; 50Ib Bag bag 1 NoBid | NoBid $12.99 | $12.99 $9.46 [ $9.46 $10.95 | $10.95 $11.52 | $11.52
Item Notes 0-0-7 w/.86% Item #702100 Pre-m
P imethalin, 50 Ib bag .86% 0-0-7 Sgn 240 Les
13__|Fertilizer: 26-0-0 Fertilizer; 50Ib Bag bag 1 NoBid | NoBid $1520 | $15.20 NoBid | NoBid $15.00 | $15.00 $1847 | $18.47
Item Notes Brand Bid: Bonus Crop
21-0-0 w/24% Sulfate
Fertilizer: 21-0-0 Fertilizer; 50Ib Bag | | | | |
14 bag 1 No Bid No Bid $10.99 $10.99 $9.72 $9.72 $11.00 $11.00 $8.66 $8.66
Item Notes
Fertilizer: 26-0-0 Liquid Fertilizer; 2.5 Gallon Container 2.5 gallon
15 container 1 No Bid No Bid $35.73 $35.73 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.63 $26.63
Item Notes em Lesco
30-0-0 with Umaxx Green Flo 30-0-0 50-%
Fertilizer: 28-0-0 Liquid Fertilizer; 2.5 Gallon Container 2.5 gallon | | | |
16 container 1 No Bid No Bid $35.73 $35.73 No Bid No Bid $32.38 $32.38 $26.63 $26.63
Item Notes Item #052452 Lesco
30-0-0 with Umaxx Green Flo 30-0-0 50-%
Fertilizer: 14-2-14 Liquid Fertilizer; 2.5 Gallon Container, 2.5 gallon | | | | |
17 container 1 No Bid No Bid $39.81 $39.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 29.43 29.43
Item Notes Item #052447 Lesco
12-2-12 with Umaxx Green Flo 18-3-6 50%
18 |Fertilizers: Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price 1 0% 15% 10% 5% 0%
Item Notes Discount does not apply
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Herbicide: Round Up; 2.5 Gallon Container 2.5 gallon
19 container $48.75 $48.75 $30.75 $30.75 $25.90 $25.90 $42.25 $42.25 $45.07 $45.07
Item Notes Glyphosate 4 plus 2.5 Brand Bid: Ranger Proj Alternate bid $30, item#069299 Lesco
gal Glystar Pro by 2.5 gal Cornerstone Plus Prosecutor Pro 2.5 gal
Herbicide: Triple Threat Broadleaf; 1 Gallon Container 1 gallon
20 container No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $54.15 $54.15 $29.23 $29.23
Item Notes item#10446041 three
way selective 1 gal
Herbicide: Triple Threat Broadleaf; 5 Gallon 5 gallon
21 container No Bid | No Bid $113.24 $113.24 No Bid | No Bid $108.00 $108.00 $129.12 $129.12
gallon $22.65 $21.60 $25.82
Item Notes item#10446041 three
Triplet SF 2.5 gal jug way selective 2.5 gal
$56.62 $64.56
Herbicide: 4 speed Broadleaf; 2.5 Gallon 2.5 gallon | | | | |
22 container No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $175.00 $175.00 $186.00 $186.00 $196.39 $196.39
Item Notes Bid as requested, 4 Speedzone Southern 2.5
Speed XT, 2.5 gal gal
23 [Herbicide: Blindside; 1/2 Pound Net Weight each $108.00 | $108.00 $97.50 [ $97.50 NoBid [ NoBid $91.00 [ $91.00 $98.00 [ $98.00
Item Notes
Herbicide: Weedtrine D Aquatic; 2.5 Gallon Container 2.5 gallon | | | | |
24 container No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $164.35 $164.35
Item Notes Brand Bid: Diquat SPC item#10224225 Diquat
2L,2.5gal Tribune, 2.5 gal Spc 2L Nufarm 2.5 gal
Herbicide: Onetime; 1 Gallon 1 gallon
25 container No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $117.00 $117.00 No Bid No Bid $219.50 $219.50
Item Notes Momentum Q 640z price
Bid as requested, quoted of $219.50 is
Onetime one gal 640z x2 =1 gal
26 [Herbicide: Dimension 2EW Specialty; 2.5 Gallon Container each $578.75 | $578.75 $578.75 | $578.75 $525.00 $525.00 $525.00 $525.00 $578.75 $578.75
Item Notes also bid alternate item
Dithiopyr 2L 2 1 gal, Bid as requested,
$215 per gallon = Dimension 2EW
$537.50 for 2.5 gallon iall
Herbicide: Dimension Ultra 40WP; 2:5-Gallon-Coentainer-5 oz packets, gty 8
850z
27 packets/case $120.00 $120.00 No Bid No Bid $114.00 $114.00 $114.00 $114.00 $126.25 $126.25
ltem Notes is not a liquid, no
2.5 gal jugs, comes 8 x Dimension Ultra 40WP. item# 00172853
(4x5 oz) cases, priced However, this Dimension ultra 40 WSP
per 20 oz, $60 for qt 8 4, formulation is not a 50z x 8Price of $126.25
50z packets liquid that is available in is for 50z x8
Herbicide: Tenacity; 1 Gallon Container 1 gallon
28 container $761.00 $761.00 $761.00 $761.00 $761.00 $761.00 $761.00 $761.00 $761.00 $761.00
Item Notes if 8gal or more are
Bid as requested. purchased at one time
Tenacity 1 gal price drops to $683 gal
2.5 gallon
container $71.28 $71.28 $43.20 $43.20 $42.95 $42.95 $56.03 $0.00
Herbicide: Rodeo; 1 Gallon Container 1 gallon
29 container No Bid No Bid $28.51 $28.51 $17.28 $17.28 $17.18 $17.18 $22.41 $22.41
ftem Notes Brand Bid: Roundup
Custom ATU, 2.5 gal Roundup Custom, 2.5 item#100221225
Roundup Custom 2.5 gal (43.25 per 2.5 gal) gal A 2.5 gal
Herbicide: Esplanade EZ; 2.5 Gallon Container 2.5 gallon
30 container $146.50 $146.50 No Bid No Bid $113.94 $113.94 $103.75 $103.75 $155.38 $155.38
1 gallon $58.50 $58.50 $45.58 $45.58 $41.50 $41.50 $62.15 $62.15
Item Notes item#80972768 Specticle
total 144 oz quoted of
Bid as requested, $69.92 is for a 144 oz
Esplanade EZ, 2.5 gal 2.5 gal $103.75 container
31 Herbicide: Aquathol Super K Granular; 10Ib Pail each NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid $206.00 | $206.00 $260.21 | $260.21
Item Notes
32 [Herbicides: Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price 0% 15% 10% 5% 0%

Item Notes

Discount does not apply

to Agency priced items

Buyboard pricing 0-60%

off
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Insecticide: Extinct RTU; 1 Gallon Container 1 gallon
33 container 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.25 $11.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ltem Notes Brand Bid: Viper RTU 1
gal sprayer jug
Insecticide: Extinct RTU; 5 Gallon Container Tgallon
34 container 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.25 $11.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Item Notes Brand Bid: Viper RTU 1
gal sprayer jug
35 [Insecticide: Altosid Mosquito Control Briguets; 100 Per Case case 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $130.00 | $130.00 $145.00 | $145.00 $174.95 | $174.95
Item Notes Bid as requested,
Altosid Briquets,
36 |Insecticide: Deep 6 Wasp and Hornet Spray; 17.5 oz Can can 1 No Bid No Bid $7.92 $7.92 $312 [ $3.12 $6.95 [ $6.95 $434 [ $434
(3 $0.45 $0.45 $0.16 | $0.16 $0.40 | $0.40 $0.31 | $0.31
Item Notes Terro Wasp & Hornet Item #10076057 Lesco
Wasp Freeze, 17.5 oz Spray, 19 oz or Wasp Wasp Freeze Wasp & Hornet Spray 14
Freeze Il, $7.22 17.5 oz oz
Insecticide: Cobalt; 1 Gallon Container 1 gallon
37 container 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.60 $38.60 $55.00 $55.00 No Bid No Bid
2.5 gallon
container $96.50 $96.50 $137.95 $137.95
ltern Notes Brand Bid: Lambatos by| Priced by the gallon.
Drexal, 2.5 gal jug $96.50| Comes in 2.5 gal jug
for 2.5 gallon jug only $137.95
Insecticide: Dupont Prevathon (R); Chlorantraniliprole; 2.5 Gallon Container 2.5 gallon |
38 container 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $374.375 $374.375 No Bid No Bid
Item Notes
Insecticide: Acephate Pro 75 Fire Ant Powder; 16 oz Can |
39 can 1 $10.50 $10.50 $9.85 $9.85 $9.44 $9.44 No Bid No Bid $10.54 $10.54
oz $0.65 $0.65 $0.59 $0.59 $0.66 $0.66
Item Notes Comes in case of 12, Brand Bid: Surrender item #742011 Acephate
case only A 75,16 oz pro 87Up 1lb price
40 |k icide: Chl iFos 2.32% G lar; 50ib B, bag E] NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid
41 |Insecticides: Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price 1 0% 15% 10% 5% 0%
Item Notes Discount does not apply [ Buyboard pricing 0-60%
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42 |Colorant: Green Lawnger; 2.5 Gallon Container 2.5 gallon 1 No Bid No Bid $95.39 $95.39 $118.26 $118.26 $125.85 $125.85 $80.60 $80.60
Item Notes Bid as Requested, Green item#008423 Lesco
Harrels Green Turf Paint Lawnger, 2.5 gal Green 2.5 gal
Colorant: Blue Lake Aqua Mark WSP; 16 Packets Per Case 16 packets
43 per case 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $190.00 $190.00 $269.92 $269.92 $123.44 $123.44
packet 1 $11.88 $11.88 $30.86 $30.86
Item Notes Brand Bid: Aquashadow Item#032670 Lesco Lake
WSP, 16x7.15 oz & Pond Colorant/ 4
44 [Colorants: Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price 1 0% 15% 10% 5% 0%
Item Notes Discount does not apply Buyboard pricing 0-60%
to Agency priced items off
45 Erosion Control: Fiber - 100% Pure Wood Mulch - Red bag 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.97 $15.97
Item Notes item#089791 Mulch
Hydrocover wood
minimum 40
50#bags/pallet; price
quoted is per bag.
Erosion Control: Fiber - Hydraulic Mulch - Wood with Tack
46 bag 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.45 $19.45
47 |Erosion Control: Fiber - Hydro Blanket bag 1 NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid $43.03 | $43.03
hydrocover
cover/hydroblanket bfm
50 Ib minimum 40
50#bags/pallet; price
quoted per bag
48 Erosion Control: Fiber - Wood Cellulose Fiber bag 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.31 [ $10.31
hydrocover cellulose 50
Ib minil 40
49 |Erosion Control: Fiber - Guar Tacking Agent case 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $135.66 $135.66
53 |Erosion Control: Erosion Mat - Straw with Double Sided netting each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.72 $31.72
54 |Erosion Control: Erosion Mat - American Excelsior Curlex With Double Sided N each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $59.74 $59.74
55 |Erosion Control: Erosion Mat - 12 oz Permanent Turf Reinforcement Mats (TR each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $255.68 $255.68
item#trm10 turf
reinforcement matting
56 Erosion Control: Sediment Control Logs; Straw; 9" Diameter each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $42.14 | $42.14
item SW925 Straw wattle
9"x25'
57 Erosion Control: Sediment Control Logs- American Excelsior; 9" Diameter each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $42.14 | $4214
item SW925 Straw wattle
9"x25'
58 Erosion Control: Sediment Control Logs; Straw; 12" Diameter each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $40.57 $40.57
item SW925 Straw wattle
12"x20' srw
59 Erosion Control: Sediment Control Logs- American Excelsior; 12" Diameter each 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $40.57 | $40.57
60 |Erosion Control: 24" Wood Stakes each 1 NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid $0.19 [ $0.19
61 |Erosion Control: 36" Wood Stakes each 1 NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid $0.79 [ $0.79
62 |Erosion Control: 48" Wood Stakes each 1 NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid $1.06 [ $1.06
63 |Erosion Control: Staples - 6 X 1 X 6 Metal Staples (1000 Per Box) box 1 NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid $30.00 [ $30.00
64 |Erosion Control: Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price 1 0% 0% 0% 0% 0%
Buyboard pricing 0-60%
off

Awarded Vendor
Tie Vendor



