
Estimated 
Quantity

Line Items Response Projected Response Projected Response Projected Response Projected Response Projected Response Projected

1
Gasoline Unleaded - Delivered to Storage Tank at Service 
Center or Farmersville via Transport/Tanker 

190,000 -$0.0044 -$836.0000 $0.0166 $3,154.0000 -$0.0210 -$3,990.0000 $0.0375 $7,125.0000 -$0.0120 -$2,280.0000 $0.0018 $342.0000

2
Gasoline Unleaded - Delivered to Storage Tank at Service 
Center or Farmersville via Bobtail/Tank Wagon 

No Bid $0.1791 $0.0000 $0.0450 $0.0000 $0.0648 $0.0000 $0.0420 $0.0000 No Bid

3
Gasoline Unleaded - Delivered to Mobile Tanker at Service 
Center or Farmersville via Transport/Tanker to Service 
Center or Farmersville

No Bid $0.1791 $0.0000 $0.0450 $0.0000 $0.0495 $0.0000 $0.0420 $0.0000 No Bid

4
Gasoline Unleaded - Delivered to Mobile Tanker any 
location within Collin County via Transport/Tanker to Misc. 
Location within Collin County

5,000 No Bid $0.1791 $895.5000 $0.0550 $275.0000 $0.0375 $187.5000 $0.0420 $210.0000 No Bid

5
Gasoline Unleaded - Delivered to Mobile Tanker at Service 
Center or Farmersville via Bobtail/Tank Wagon 

No Bid $0.1791 $0.0000 $0.0450 $0.0000 $0.0748 $0.0000 $0.0420 $0.0000 No Bid

6
Gasoline Unleaded - Delivered to Mobile Tanker any 
location within Collin County via Bobtail/Tank Wagon to 

No Bid $0.1791 $0.0000 $0.0550 $0.0000 $0.0648 $0.0000 $0.0420 $0.0000 No Bid

7
Gasoline Unleaded - Collin County Mobile Tanker takes 
delivery at Vendor's Rack.

No Bid -$0.0124 $0.0000 -$0.0420 $0.0000 $0.0148 $0.0000 $0.0100 $0.0000 No Bid

8
Diesel - Delivered to Storage Tank at Service Center or 
Farmersville via Transport/Tanker

241,000 -$0.0014 -$337.4000 $0.0241 $5,808.1000 -$0.0157 -$3,783.7000 $0.0375 $9,037.5000 -$0.0140 -$3,374.0000 $0.0072 $1,735.2000

9
Diesel - Delivered to Storage Tank at Service Center or 
Farmersville via Bobtail/Tank Wagon

5,000 No Bid $0.1548 $774.0000 $0.0450 $225.0000 $0.0648 $324.0000 $0.0400 $200.0000 No Bid

10
Diesel - Delivered to Mobile Tanker at Service Center or 
Farmersville via Transport/Tanker to Service Center or 
Farmersville

No Bid $0.1548 $0.0000 $0.0450 $0.0000 $0.0495 $0.0000 $0.0400 $0.0000 No Bid

11
Diesel - Delivered to Mobile Tanker at any location within 
Collin County via Transport/Tanker to Misc. Location within 
Collin County

25,000 No Bid $0.1548 $3,870.0000 $0.0550 $1,375.0000 $0.0375 $937.5000 $0.0400 $1,000.0000 No Bid

12
Diesel - Delivered to Mobile Tanker at Service Center or 
Farmersville via Bobtail/Tank Wagon to Service Center or 
Farmersville

No Bid $0.1548 $0.0000 $0.0450 $0.0000 $0.0748 $0.0000 $0.0400 $0.0000 No Bid

13
Diesel - Delivered to Mobile Tanker at any location within 
Collin County via Bobtail/Tank Wagon to Misc. Location 
within Collin County

No Bid $0.1548 $0.0000 $0.0550 $0.0000 $0.0648 $0.0000 $0.0400 $0.0000 No Bid

14
Diesel - Collin County Mobile Tanker takes delivery at 
Vendor's Rack.

No Bid -$0.0164 $0.0000 -$0.0413 $0.0000 $0.0148 $0.0000 $0.0100 $0.0000 No Bid

15
State the quantity in gallons where pricing goes from 
bobtail/tank wagon to transport/tanker rates.

No Bid 7,000 0 8,499 0 4,000 0 0 0 No Bid

16 Split Product Delivery Fees $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000 $50.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000
17 Split Load Fees $75.0000 $0.0000 $50.0000 $0.0000 $50.0000 $0.0000 $50.0000 $0.0000 $50.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000
18 Pump Off Fee for deliveries to above ground storage tank No Bid $50.0000 $0.0000 $50.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000 $50.0000 $0.0000 No Bid
19 Pump Off Fee to Mobile Tanker. No Bid $0.0000 $0.0000 $50.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000 $50.0000 $0.0000 No Bid
20 State cost per gallon of diesel fuel additive offered. No Bid $0.0250 $0.0000 $0.0250 $0.0000 $0.0300 $0.0000 $0.0199 $0.0000 $0.0250 $0.0000

21
State any additional fees - not including LUST Fees, TX 
Delivery Fees or State Taxes.

$0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000 $1.0000 $0.0000 $1.2500 $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000

$2,077.2000

Southern Counties Oil Co. Indigo Energy Partners, LLC Petroleum Traders Corporation Sun Coast Resources, Inc. Martin Eagle Oil Company, Inc. Lykins Energy Solutions

-$1,173.4000 $14,501.6000 -$5,898.7000 $17,611.5000 -$4,244.0000


