2017-244 Equipment Lease: Road construction and Right of Way Maintenance Equipment

Herc Rentals RDO Equipment Co. Holt Texas, LTD

Primary Award
Secondary Award Total Price $27,143.00 Total Price $44,922.50 Total Price $79,750.00

Line # Description QTY|UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1 Pneumatic Compactor 38,000 Ib 1 month [No Bid No Bid $2,565.00 $2,565.00

38,000 Ib. Weight class (can be ballasted), compaction width 68" with
ROPS and minimum of canopy or umbrella. Caterpillar CW14,
Caterpillar PS150C, or Collin County approved equal. Estimated
annual usage is six months.

State Make/Model/Year Cat CW14 or CW16
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 2500

State Maximum Use Per Month 160

State Additional Costs over Max Hours 16

2 Pneumatic Compactor 49,000 Ib 1  month |No Bid $5,397.50 $5,397.50 $4,650.00 $4,650.00

49,000 Ib weight class (can be ballasted), compaction width 84" with
ROPS and minimum canopy or umbrella. Caterpillar CW34, Caterpillar
PS360C or Collin County approved equal. Estimated annual usage is
six months.

State Make/Model/Year Sakai/GW750 or GW751/2015-2017 4590
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 2000 2500
State Maximum Use Per Month 160 hours 160
State Additional Costs over Max Hours $33.73/hour 29

3  Pneumatic Compactor 28,000 lIb 1 month [No Bid No Bid $2,565.00 $2,565.00

28,000 Ib weight class (can be ballasted), compaction width 68" with
ROPS and minimum canopy or umbrella. Caterpillar CW14, Caterpillar
PS300C or Collin County approved equal. Estimated annual usage is
six months.

State Make/Model/Year Cat CW14 or CW16
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 2500

State Maximum Use Per Month 160

State Additional Costs over Max Hours 16

4 Smooth Drum Vibratory Compactor 25,000 Ib 1 month $3,400.00 $3,400.00|No Bid $4,950.00 $4,950.00

28,000 Ib weight class (can be ballasted), compaction width 68" with
ROPS and minimum canopy or umbrella. Caterpillar CW14, Caterpillar
PS300C or Collin County approved equal. Estimated annual usage is
six months.

State Make/Model/Year Volvo SD-100F 2015 Cat CP56B
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 3500 2500
State Maximum Use Per Month 176 160
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State Additional Costs over Max Hours $10 Per Hour Over 31
Smooth Drum Vibratory Compactor 23,000 |b 1 month $3,400.00 $3,400.00 $4,462.50 $4,462.50 $4,600.00 $4,600.00
23,000 Ib weight class, single smooth drum vibratory (can be
ballasted), compaction width 84" with ROPS and minimum canopy or
umbrella, Volvo SD100 or Collin County approved equal. Estimated
annual usage is six months.
State Make/Model/Year Volvo SD-100D 2015 Sakai/SV540D/2015-2017 Cat CP54B
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 3500 2000 2500
State Maximum Use Per Month 176 160 160
State Additional Costs over Max Hours $10 Per Hour Over $27.89/hour 29
Water Truck 4,000 Gallon Minimum 1 month $4,200.00 $4,200.00{No Bid $5,760.00 $5,760.00
4,000 gallon minimum capacity with either a spray bar or a spray
head/fan spray, curbside mounted for spraying of right-of-ways.
Estimated annual usage is six months.
State Make/Model/Year Freightliner M2-106 2015 4000 gallon water truck
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 35,000 Miles 2500
State Maximum Use Per Month 750 Miles 160
State Additional Costs over Max Hours S.50 Per Mile 36
Water Truck 2,000 Gallon Minimum 1 month $2,625.00 $2,625.00(No Bid $3,850.00 $3,850.00
2,000 gallon minimum with a spray bar, or a spray head/fan spray
curbside mounted for spraying right of ways. Estimated annual usage
is six months
State Make/Model/Year Ford F-750 2015 2000 gallon Water Truck
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 35,000 Miles 2500
State Maximum Use Per Month 750 Miles 160
State Additional Costs over Max Hours S$.50 Per Mile 25
Compact Track Loader 3,000 Ib 1 month $1,650.00 $1,650.00 $2,320.50 $2,320.50 $2,850.00 $2,850.00
3,000 Ib operating capacity, 126 inch lift height, 80 HP, with 74 inch
bucket; Bobcat T300 or Collin County approved equal. Estimated
annual usage is three months.
State Make/Model/Year Kubota SVL95-2s 2016 John Deere/329E or 331G/2015-2017 Cat 259D
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 3,000 2000 2000
State Maximum Use Per Month 176 160 160
State Additional Costs over Max Hours S8 Per Hour Over $14.50/hour 18
Skid Steer Loader 2,200 Ibs 1 month $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $1,785.00 $1,785.00 $1,650.00 $1,650.00
2,200 Ib operating capacity, 75 HP with standard bucket; Bobcat S220
or Collin County approved equal. Estimated annual usage is three
months.
State Make/Model/Year Bobcat S630 2016 John Deere/324E/2015-2017 Cat 242D
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 3,000 2000 1500
State Maximum Use Per Month 176 160 160
State Additional Costs over Max Hours S6 Per Hour Over $11.16/hour 12

2017-244 - Page 2



Herc Rentals

RDO Equipment Co.

Holt Texas, LTD

10 Dozer 43,500 Ib Minimum 1  month [No Bid $8,457.50 $8,457.50 $9,900.00 $9,900.00
43,500 Ib (minimum) operating weight, with cab and air conditioning,
ROPS, rear ripper and 6 cubic yard PAT blade, 185 HP; Caterpillar
D6TXW, or Collin County approved equal. Estimated annual usage is
six months.
State Make/Model/Year John Deere/850K/2015-2017 Cat D6T
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 2000 2500
State Maximum Use Per Month 160 160
State Additional Costs over Max Hours $52.86/hours 62
11 Motor Grader 31,000 lb Minimum 1 month [No Bid $8,712.50 $8,712.50 $9,405.00 $9,405.00
31,000 Ib (minimum) operating weight, with cab and air conditioning,
ROPS, rear mounted scarifier with three ripper shanks and seven
scarifier teeth, front mounted push plate, min. 140 HP; Caterpillar
140M, or Collin County approved equal. Estimated annual usage is six
months.
State Make/Model/Year John Deere/772G or 772GP/2015-2017 Cat 140M3
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 2000 2500
State Maximum Use Per Month 160 160
State Additional Costs over Max Hours $54.45/hour 59
12 Wheeled Rubber Tire Asphalt Paver 26,000 |Ib Minimum 1  month |[No Bid No Bid $16,200.00 $16,200.00
Wheeled paver, minimum 26,000 Ibs. operating weight with screed,
paving width range 8ft. to 12ft. minimum, hydraulically adjustable
heated screed, approximate layer depth of 8 in. CAT AP500E, Vogele
Vision 5103-2, or Collin County approved equal. Estimated annual
usage is six months.
State Make/Model/Year Cat AP500
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 2500
State Maximum Use Per Month 160
State Additional Costs over Max Hours 102
13 Asphalt Distributor 2,000 Gallon Tank 1 month [No Bid No Bid No Bid
2,000 gallon tank with in-cab computerized rate control center spray
bar, 12 ft spray width minimum; diesel (preferred) or propane/LPG fired
burners, air conditioned cab, Bearcat, Entyre, or similar Collin County
approved equal. Estimated annual usage is six months.
State Make/Model/Year
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided
State Maximum Use Per Month
State Additional Costs over Max Hours
14 Aggregate Spreader 1  month [No Bid No Bid No Bid

Self-Propelled, front wheel drive(2WD) minimum, variable widths 8' to
16' with computer controlled application rates preferred, 200 HP,
Etnyre Chipspreader, Bearcat, or Collin County approved equal.
Estimated annual usage is six months.

State Make/Model/Year
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State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided
State Maximum Use Per Month
State Additional Costs over Max Hours
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15 Self- Propelled Broom 1 month $1,620.00 $1,620.00(No Bid No Bid
8 ft sweep width with Poly Brush, 80 HP minimum, with min 110 gal
water tank; cab and air, Broce RJ350, or Collin County approved equal.
Estimated annual usage is six months.
State Make/Model/Year Broce RJT 350 2015
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 1,500
State Maximum Use Per Month 176
State Additional Costs over Max Hours S7 Per Hour Over
16 Fork Lift, Diesel 1 month $850.00 $850.00|No Bid No Bid
5,000 Ib lift capacity, min. 50hp, pneumatic tire with ROPS, front wheel
drive, 131" lift height, CAT 2PD5000, or Collin County approval equal.
Estimated annual usage is six months.
State Make/Model/Year Toyota 8FGU25
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 2,000
State Maximum Use Per Month 176
State Additional Costs over Max Hours S5 Per Hour Over
17 Fork Lift, LPG 1 month $850.00 $850.00({No Bid No Bid
5,000 Ib lift capacity, min 50hp, Pneumatic tire with ROPS, front wheel
drive, 131" lift height, CAT 2C5000 or Collin County approved equal.
Estimated annual usage is six months.
State Make/Model/Year Toyota 8FGU25
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 2,000
State Maximum Use Per Month 176
State Additional Costs over Max Hours S5 Per Hour Over
18 Tandem Drum Vibratory (Smooth) Compactor, 26,0001b 1  month [No Bid $5,397.50 $5,397.50 $3,780.00 $3,780.00
Tandem drum vibratory (smooth) compactor, 78" drum width, 26,000
Ib. weight class, dual drum vibratory compactor (can be ballasted) with
ROPS and minimum canopy or umbrella, Caterpillar CB54XW, or
Collin County approved equal. Estimated annual usage is six months.
State Make/Model/Year Sakai/SW990/2015-2017 Cat CB54XW
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 2000 2500
State Maximum Use Per Month 160 160
State Additional Costs over Max Hours $33.73/hour 24
19 Tandem Drum Vibratory Compactor, 3,300 Ib 1 month $1,250.00 $1,250.00(No Bid $2,025.00 $2,025.00
Compactor, Tandem Drum Vibratory, Self Propelled, 22 hp minimum,
drum width 31"-36" acceptable, operating weight approx 3,300 Ibs with
ROPS.; Cat CB14B, or Collin County approved equal.
State Make/Model/Year Wacker RD12A90 2016 Cat CB14B
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 2,500 2500
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State Maximum Use Per Month 176 160
State Additional Costs over Max Hours S6 Per Hour Over 13
20 Walk Behind Concrete Saw, Gasoline, Push Type 1 month $480.00 S480.00|No Bid No Bid
Walk behind concrete saw, gasoline, push type; 6"-8" saw depth; with
multipurpose diamond blade; Husqvarna SF520, Wacker BFS1318A,
or Collin County approved equal.
State Make/Model/Year Husqgvarna FS13 2016
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided NA
State Maximum Use Per Month NA
State Additional Costs over Max Hours NA
21 Handheld Concrete Saw 1 month $428.00 $428.00|No Bid No Bid
Handheld concrete saw, 5"-6" cutting depth; with multipurpose
diamond blade; Stihl TS700, or Collin County approved equal.
State Make/Model/Year Stihl TS800 2016
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided NA
State Maximum Use Per Month NA
State Additional Costs over Max Hours NA
22 Vibratory Plate Compactor 1 month $400.00 $400.00|No Bid No Bid
Vibratory Plate Compactor with water tank, shoe size approximately
19" x 23", centrifugal force approx 3300 Ibs; Multiquip Mikasa
MVC88VTHW, Wacker WP1550AW , or Collin County approved equal.
State Make/Model/Year Wacker WP1550AQ, 2017
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided NA
State Maximum Use Per Month NA
State Additional Costs over Max Hours NA
23 Solar Message Board 1 month $900.00 $900.00|No Bid No Bid
Solar Message Board, trailer mounted, programmable, LED digital
display, approximate display size: 70"H x 120" L ; with 2" ball coupler;
Solar Tech Silent Messenger or Collin County approved equal.
State Make/Model/Year Wanco WTLMB-A 2017
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided NA
State Maximum Use Per Month NA
State Additional Costs over Max Hours NA
24 Padfoot Compactor, Vibratory, Self-Propelled 25,000 Ibs 1  month $3,890.00 $3,890.00 $4,462.50 $4,462.50 $5,000.00 $5,000.00
Padfoot Compactor, Vibratory, Self-Propelled, 84" drum, 25,000 Ibs
approximate operating weight; Volvo SD100F, Case SV212, or Collin
County approved equal.
State Make/Model/Year Volvo SD-100 w/ PadKit Sakai/SV540T/2015-2017 CP56
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 3500 2000 2500
State Maximum Use Per Month 176 160 160
State Additional Costs over Max Hours S10 Per Hour Over $27.89/hour 32
25 Live Bottom Asphalt Trailer 1  month |No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Live bottom asphalt trailer, approximate capacity 25 cu yds, Etnyre, or
Collin County approved equal.

State Make/Model/Year

State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided
State Maximum Use Per Month

State Additional Costs over Max Hours

Herc Rentals

RDO Equipment Co.

Holt Texas, LTD

26

Skid Steer Loader, High Flow, 2,300 lbs with Cold Planer #1

2,300 Ib operating capacity, 85 hp, with cab and ROPS, Caterpillar
256C XPS high flow, or Collin County approved equal. Cold Planer
attachment to have drum width of approximately 24" and have
approximately 60 standard type conical bits suitable for grinding
asphalt/flex base with a maximum cutting depth of 7 inches, Caterpillar
PC206 or Collin County approved equal. Machine and attachment shall
be quoted and supplied as a complete, ready to use unit, with all
hydraulics, etc., necessary for operation. Planer bits on machine
supplied shall not be worn greater than 50% upon delivery.

State Make/Model/Year

State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided
State Maximum Use Per Month

State Additional Costs over Max Hours

month

No Bid

$3,927.00

$3,927.00

John Deere/330G/2016-2017 w/Roadhog or John De

2000
160
$24.54/hour

No Bid

ere 24" Cold Planer

27

Regenerative Air Sweeper with High Lift Dump 10,000 Ibs 1

Must be capable of unloading hopper contents into standar (11-13
cubic yard) dump truck bed. Pick-up head approximately 84", usable
hopper capacity 4.9 cubic yd minimum; lift capacity apporximately
10,000 Ibs; Estimated annual usage: 2-3 mos

State Make/Model/Year

State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided
State Maximum Use Per Month

State Additional Costs over Max Hours

month

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Delivery in calendar days from date of order

Delivery Fee

$85

1-2 or on delivery day
requested

Delivery Fee for Compact
Track Loader and Skid
Steers: $300. Delivery
Fee for Asphalt/Soil
Rollers: $400. Delivery
Fee for Crawler Dozer:
$700.

$400 - Transport for line
item 8 and 9 would be
$115
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Pickup Fee

Miscellaneous Fees

Herc Rentals
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Holt Texas, LTD

$85

Personal Property Tax
Fee - Shows to be an
itempaid to the county
after collection

Pickup Fee for Compact
Track Loader and Skid
Steers: $300. Pickup Fee
for Asphalt/Soil Rollers:
$400. Pickup Fee for
Crawler Dozer: $700.

If Collin County fails to
provide proper General
Liability and Property
Insurance to cover rented

$400 - Transport for line
item 8 and 9 would be
$115

15 - ENVIRONMENTAL
FEE

equipment, a Damage
Waiver Fee of 14% of the
rental rate will be
charged on the rental
invoice.

Contact for Maintenance and Repair Chris Simon 972-313-5537

christopher.simon@holtcat.com

Pat Trotzuk 940-484-5288 Justen Phillips 214-681-7852
jphillips@rdoequipment.com

Metroplex Field Service 844-536-3876

metroplex@rdoequipment.com

Descriptive Literature Included it for one piece of equipment (line 23) Included product comparative booklet Included product booklet

CLARIFICATION

1 | contacted Holt Cat to clarify the following:
Line item 1 — Year of equipment — 2016 or newer
Line item 2 — Make/Year Cat CW34 - 2016 or newer
Line item 3 —Year 2016 or newer
Line item 4 —Year 2016 or newer
Line item 5 —Year 2016 or newer
Line item 6 — Make/Model/Year Cat WT4000 2016 or newer
Line item 7 — Make/Model/Year Cat WT2000 2016 or newer
Line item 8 —Year 2016 or newer
Line item 9 — Year 2016 or newer
Line item 10 - Year 2016 or newer
Line item 11 —Year 2016 or newer
Line item 12 —Year 2016 or newer
Line item 18 — Year 2016 or newer
Line item 19 — Year 2016 or newer
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Line item 24 — Make/Year Cat 2016 or newer
Also, please clarify if the Additional Costs over Max Hours that you’ve entered on your line items is “S per hour”. This is correct, additional hours charge per hour.
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