Melissa Marﬂuez

From: Justo Torres <justo_torres@icloud.com>
Sent: Tuesday, August 22, 2017 9:19 AM
To: Melissa Marquez
Subject: Re: CR 465 J usTo Tovves
Y313 C£ YeS

Okay that is fine so yes | will take compensation please. Thank you so much . =
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Sent from my iPhone 7 6 L{(O /}

On Aug 21, 2017, at 9:20 AM, Melissa Marquez <mmarquez@co.collin.tx.us> wrote:

Good Morning Mr. Torres,

So sorry | didn’t get this to you last week. Here is the amount you will receive, should you wish to go
with the reimbursement. We will not be taking out the pipe fence, just the cattle wire. If you would like
to proceed with the reimbursement, please let me know and we will send out the paperwork for you to
sign.

Thanks,
Melissa

From: Justo Torres [mailto:justo_torres@icloud.com]
Sent: Thursday, August 10, 2017 7:52 AM

To: Melissa Marquez <mmarquez@co.collin.tx.us>
Subject: Re: CR 465

Well | do want the compensation but | want to know if anything changed from last years talk cause the
guys that were flagging the road said they were gonna take my fence in front of the house as well that
last year they said the it was okay let me know about adjustments

Sent from my iPhone

On Aug 7, 2017, at 9:33 AM, Melissa Marquez <mmarquez@co.collin.tx.us> wrote:

Joe is out of the office for the next couple days. | will definitely have him check this as
soon as he gets back.

Thanks,

Melissa

From: Justo Torres [mailto:justo torres@icloud.com]
Sent: Monday, August 7, 2017 9:28 AM

To: Melissa Marquez <mmarquez@co.collin.tx.us>
Subject: Re: CR 465

Please let me know if the Forman on the road project changed anything from last year
talk

Sent from my iPhone



