
Line # 1 2 3 4 5

Description

Production Support and 
Subscription - VMware vCenter 
Server 6 Standard for vSphere 6 

(Per Instance)

Production Support and 
Subscription - VMware vRealize 
Operations 6 Standard (25 VM 

Pack)

Production Support and 
Subscription - VMware vSphere 

6 Enterprise Plus for 1 
processor

Production Support and 
Subscription - VMware vSphere 

6 Enterprise Plus for 1 
Processor- prorated for term of 

11/7/17-10/31/18

Subscription Only - VMware 
vSphere 6 Enterprise Plus for 1 
processor, prorated for term of 

3/26/18-10/31/18

QTY 1 12 96 4 14
UOM each pack each each each
Unit $1,364.09 $710.71 $795.34 $983.66 No Bid

Extended $1,364.09 $8,528.52 $76,352.64 $3,934.64 $90,179.89
Unit $1,390.01 $724.21 $810.45 $1,009.99 No Bid

Extended $1,390.01 $8,690.52 $77,803.20 $4,039.96 $91,923.69
Unit $1,391.79 $725.14 $811.48 $1,029.58 No Bid

Extended $1,391.79 $8,701.68 $77,902.08 $4,118.32 $92,113.87
Unit $1,394.07 $726.33 $812.82 $1,005.27 No Bid

Extended $1,394.07 $8,715.96 $78,030.72 $4,021.08 $92,161.83
Unit $1,405.01 $732.03 $819.20 $1,013.16 No Bid

Extended $1,405.01 $8,784.36 $78,643.20 $4,052.64 $92,885.21
Unit $1,400.00 $750.00 $820.00 $1,050.00 No Bid

Extended $1,400.00 $9,000.00 $78,720.00 $4,200.00 $93,320.00
Unit $234,395.51 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

Extended $234,395.51 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $234,395.51
Unit $1,405.01 $8,784.36 $78,643.20 $4,052.68 No Bid

Extended $1,405.01 $105,412.32 $7,549,747.20 $16,210.72 $7,672,775.25
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