Interboro Packaging Corp.

Mavich llc

Gordon Food

Empire Paper

Infinity Supply & Service, Inc

IFB 2017-241 Jail Kitchen Non-Food Service**
Line # |Description oty |UOM Unit | Qty/pkg | Price Each| Supplier Notes Unit | Qly/pkg| Price Each | Supplier Notes Unit Unit |Qty/pkg| Price Each| Supplier Notes Unit |Qty/pkg| Price Each| Supplier Notes
1 Scouring Pad purple pots and pans abrasive or
Collin County approved equal. 50 box |NoBid $21.80 24 $ 09083 Non-Responsive| $16.73 24 $ 0.6971 3MMMMS59033 | $16.98 24 $ 0.7075
2 Scrub Pad green general purpose or Collin County
approved equal. 40 box |NoBid $1181 20 $ 05905 N $5.02 20 $ 0.2510 3MAFX96MS20 | $15.34 60 $ 0.2557
Scouring Pad soap steel wool pots and pans
3 abrasive SOS type or Collin County approved
equal. box [No Bid $4.37 15 $ 02013 Non-Responsive| $31.17 180  $ 0.1732 Clorox CLO88320 | $25.96 120  $ 0.2163
4 Griddle Pad 4 in. x 5.5 in. or Collin County
approved equal. 10 box [NoBid $15.16 10 $ 15160 Non-Responsive| $65.22 60 $ 1.0870 $11.76 60 $ 0.1960 ACS GP100
5 Grill Screen 4 in. x 5.5 in. or Collin County
approved equal. 20 case [No Bid $7.22 20 $ 03610 Non-Responsive| $68.74 200  $ 0.3437 $56.81 400  $ 0.1420 Royal GS508
Royal
6 Hairnets or Collin County approved equal. 320 box $9.88 144 | $ 0.0686 $11.79 100  $ 0.1179 Non-Responsive| $17.64 144  $ 0.1225 $16.47 144 $ 0.1144 RPH144LTBLK
7 Oven Mitt 16 in. cuff (1 pair ) or Collin County
approved equal. 65 set [NoBid $3.32 1 $ 3.3200 Phoenix TGF-17 Non-Responsive|No Bid $5.25 i $ 5.2500
8 Toothpicks round or Collin County approved Royal Paper
equal. 1 case |No Bid $19.34 19200 $ 0.0010 Non-Responsive| $15.79 19200 = $ 0.0008 RPPR820 $18.18 19200  $ 0.0009
9 Oven Cleaner aerosol spray or Collin County Prime Source
approved equal. 20 case [No Bid Non-Responsive Non-Responsive| $37.05 12 $ 3.0875 $34.10 12 $ 2.8417 CP824
10 Griddle Cleaner liquid Scotch Brite type or Collin
County approved equal.* 10 case |NoBid $68.87 1 $ 688700 N $2532 12 $ 21100 $4917 6 $ 8.1950
1 Paper Bags #12 lunch sized or Collin County
approved equal. 45 case [No Bid $2152 500 | $ 0.0430 Non-Responsive| $14.89 500 $ 0.0298  Duro DSP18412 $1585 500 @ $ 0.0317
1 Snack Plates 6 in. styrofoam white or Collin
County approved equal. 15 case [NoBid $34.66 1000  $ 0.0347 Non-Responsive| $18.07 1000 = $ 0.0181 DartDCC6PWCR | $19.40 1000 = $ 0.0194
13  Dinner Plates white 9 in. divided 3-compartment,
Styrofoam or Collin County approved equal. 25 case [NoBid $22.75 500 | $ 0.0455 Non-Responsive| $26.12° 500  $ 0.0522 $16.46 500 $ 0.0329 Pactiv TH10011
14 Napkin white 1/4 fold 17 in. x 17 in. or Collin
County approved equal. 5 case |No Bid $97.54 2000 $ 0.0488 Non-Responsive| $52.80 4008 = $ 0.0132 $38.07 4000 $ 0.0095 Roses 30107
15 Forks heavy plastic white or Collin County Empress
approved equal. 35 case |NoBid $26.74 1000 ' $ 0.0267 Non-Responsive| $22.42 1000  $ 0.0224 RISE181001 $22.50 1000 @ $ 0.0225
16 Spoons heavy plastic white or Collin County Empress
approved equal. 35 case |NoBid $26.18° 1000 | $ 0.0262 Non-Responsive| $22.42/ 1000  $ 0.0224 RISE181002 $22.50 1000 = $ 0.0225
17 Bowls 16 oz. squat style styrofoam or Collin
County approved equal. 15 case [NoBid $21.54 500 | $ 0.0431 Wincup F16 Non-Responsive| $22.85 500  $ 0.0457 $25.15 500 | $ 0.0503
18 Lids translucent for 16 oz. bowls above or Collin
County approved equal. 15 case [NoBid $10.99 1000 $ 0.0110 Wincup FL8V Ny $1621 500 $ 0.0324 $21.56 1000  $ 0.0216
19 Plate white undivided heavy plastic 9 in. or Collin
Countyapproved equal. 3 case |No Bid $58.42 500 @ $ 0.1168 Non-Responsive| $36.88 500 $ 0.0738  Dart DCCOPWF $59.65 500 @ $ 0.1193
2 Forks plastic heavy duty silver or Collin County
approved equal. 2 case |No Bid $116.70 1000 ' $ 0.1167 Non-Responsive|No Bid $51.70 600 $ 0.0862 WNA 610155
2 Spoons plastic heavy duty silver or Collin County
approved equal. 2 case |No Bid $116.76 1000 $ 0.1168 Non-Responsive|No Bid $51.70 600 $ 0.0862 WNA 620155
2 Knife plastic heavy duty silver or Collin County
approved equal. 2 case |No Bid $117.00 1000 ' $ 0.1170 Non-Responsive|No Bid $51.70 600 $ 0.0862 WNA 630155
2 Cup clear plastic 16 oz. capacity crystal hard or
Collin County approved equal. case |No Bid $116.76 1000  $ 0.1168 Non-Responsive| $55.46 1000 = $ 0.0555 EmpressRISEPET16|$113.95 500 @ $ 0.2279
24 Hinged Container foam 9in. x 9in. x 3 in. 3-
compartment or Collin County approved equal.  |1000 case [No Bid No Bid Non-Responsive| $13.91 200  $ 0.0696 Dart DCCIOHTPF3R| $17.04 200 | $ 0.0852
25 Sandwich Bags fold top 6 1/2 in. x 7 1/2 in. or
Collin County approved equal. 45  case $7.32. 1,000 $ 0.0073 $43.88 1000 $ 0.0439 Non-Responsive| $7.14 2000 $ 0.0036 Elkay ELKDP657 | $14.77 2000 @ $ 0.0074
2% Plastic Wrap 18 in. x 2000 ft. roll or Collin County
approved equal. 40  case |No Bid $39.00 1 $ 39.0000 N $13.70 1 $13.7000 Empress RISEFF182| $15.34. 1 $15.3400
27  Pan Liner ovenable parchment paper 16 in. x 24
in. sheets or Collin County approved equal. 25 case [NoBid Non-Responsive Non-Responsive| $30.26 1000 $ 0.0303 NOVANOVN491 | $31.76 1000 @ $ 0.0318
28 Roll Towels Enmotion 800 ft. roll or Collin County
approved equal. case |No Bid $73.13 6 $ 12.1883 Non-Responsive| $50.10 6 $ 8.3500 $36.64 6 $ 6.1067 Morcon VT106
2 Aluminum Foil heavy weight 18 in. x 500 ft. roll Spring Grove
or Collin County approved equal. 12 case |NoBid $11.70 1 $ 11.7000 405448 Non-Responsive| $21.44 1 $21.4400 $27.22 1 $27.2200
White plate heavy duty; hard plastic material
30 10.25in.3-compartment divided or Collin County
approved equal. 5 case |No Bid Non-Responsive Non-Responsive| $56.30 500 = $ 0.1126 Dart DCCIOCPWF | $84.03 500 | $ 0.1681
a1 Coffee filters 13 in x 5 in or Collin County
approved equal. 20 case [No Bid $1950 500 | $ 0.0390 Non-Responsive| $12.48° 500  $0.02496 Bunn 20100 $1250 500 @ $0.02500
2 Plate heavy clear plastic; 9 in 20/12 ct Finelie
Setting orCollin County approved equal. 5 case |No Bid No Bid N $10678 180  $ 0.5932 $93.75 180  $ 0.5208 WNA CW9180

*No award for line #10
**Gordon Food Service is deemed non-responsive.
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