
2018-036 - Page 1

Total Price $4,350.00 Total Price $8,446.00 Total Price $17,591.10 Total Price $32.00 Total Price $259,141.79
Line # Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1
9MM with night sights, 3-17 round 
magazines Glock or Collin County approved equal Model 17, Ge  207 each $550.00 $113,850.00 $409.00 $84,663.00

1 ALT1 FN 509 with Night Sights and 3 mags FN America 66-100005 207 each $426.00 88,182.00$       

Line Notes
2 Simulator Handgun, Fixed Sights, 5lb Glock or Collin County aproved equal 17T 5 each $454.00 $2,270.00

2 ALT1 FN 509 Sims Gun Simunition 17T 5 each $746.00 3,730.00$         
3 Scar 16S, .223 Black 16" Fabrique Nationale d'Herstal/FN USA or Coll    98531 2 each $1,900.00 $3,800.00 $2,400.00 $4,800.00 $1,924.98 $3,849.96
4 Scar 17S Fabrique Nationale d'Hersal/FN USA or Colli    98571 4 each $2,120.00 $8,480.00 $2,700.00 $10,800.00 $2,149.94 $8,599.76
5 Conversion Kit, Bolt 5.56mm, M4 Force on Force Training or Collin County app  5 each $241.18 $1,205.90

Line Notes

6
Metal Magazines for Scar 16S, 30 round, 
black Nightforce Optics or Collin County approved 4 each $21.00 $84.00 $11.66 $46.64

7 Scar 17 20-round magazines Fabrique Nationale d'Herstal/FN USA or Coll    98892 12 each $28.00 $336.00 $38.00 $456.00 $29.98 $359.76

8
ATACR 4-16x50MM-ZeroStop .1 MilRadian--
Digillum-MIL-R 4 each $1,987.50 $7,950.00 $2,170.00 $8,680.00 $1,997.78 $7,991.12

9 Angle Degree Indicator w/mount RH Action Nightforce Optics or Collin County approved A121 4 each $124.00 $496.00 $167.00 $668.00 $137.62 $550.48

10
Silencer, Omega 300 Suppressor Includes 5 
8x24 ASR Muzzle Brake and ASR Mount Silencerco or Collin County approved equal 4 each $725.00 $2,900.00 $735.00 $2,940.00 $800.00 $3,200.00

11
Silencer, Omega 300 Suppressor, includes 
1/2x28 ASR Muzzle Brake and ASR Mount Silencerco or Collin County approved equal 2 each $725.00 $1,450.00 $735.00 $1,470.00 $800.00 $1,600.00

12
Atlas BT10 Bipod, 1913 Mount 4.75-9" 
Aluminum Black Accu-Shot or Collin County approved equal 6 each $210.00 $1,260.00

13 Anti-Cant Device 34MM Matte Hollands Signature Series or Collin County ap  6 each $77.00 $462.00

14
Super SCAR Trigger, FN SCAR 16/17, Two 
Stage Matte Geissele or Collin County approved equal 6 each $292.50 $1,755.00 $300.00 $1,800.00 $288.88 $1,733.28

15
Viking Tactics Padded Vickers Combat Sling, 
Black Blue Force Gear or Collin County approved e 6 each $43.00 $258.00 $40.63 $243.78

Line Notes
16 1" HK Style Sling Snap Hook Brownell's or Collin County approved equal 6 each $10.95 $65.70 $4.59 $27.54

Line Notes
17 SCAR Rail Extension, Black Midwest Industries or Collin County approve  6 each $149.73 $898.38

17 ALT1 FN Scar Tactical rail extensions FN America 6 each $195.00 1,170.00$         

Line Notes
18 Mag Pouch, 79 open top 2x Safariland or Collin County approved equal 775 154 each $25.00 $3,850.00 $19.89 $3,063.06

Line Notes
19 ALS Holster, Glock 17, Basketweave Safariland or Collin County approved equal 6360 154 each $123.44 $19,009.76

Line Notes

21
Ammunition, 9mm Luger +P 134 gr Flexlock 
Duty Hornady or Collin County approved equal 90225 59 box $467.29 $27,570.11

22
Ammunition, LE Only Brass Case 9mm 135 
gr Hornady or Collin County approved equal 90238 100 box $344.09 $34,409.00

23
Ammunition, .223 55 Gr Practice Ammo 
Lacquered Hornady or Collin County approved equal 9754 EL 50 box $321.59 $16,079.50

24 Ammunition, TAP .223 Rem-62 Gr-Barrier Hornady or Collin County approved equal 83285 22 box $717.06 $15,775.32

25
Ammunition, CCI Gold Dot 9mm +P124 
Grain Speer or Collin County approved equal 53617 30 box $430.21 $12,906.30

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

SAF-6360-83-81 (12)

SAF-775-83-4

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC

Unable to supply specific serial 
numbers requested

FF556BCG

Item description is Part# C543 NIGHTFORCE C543

BIDDING BFG, NOT VIKING 
TACTICS (VCAS-200-0A-BK)

MI-S1617

BLUE FORCE GEAR P-HK-100
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Line # Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

GT DISTRIBUTORS, INCSilencerCo
Nightforce Optics (Lightforce 

USA Inc)
Tk Tactical (Colorado Sunrise 

Holdings LLC)
John Doe Investigations LLC

26 Ammunition, .223 Gold Dot-64 Gr Speer or Collin County approved equal 83285 18 box $313.37 $5,640.66

Line Notes
27 AR-15/M16 Vickers Combat Sling Blue Force Gear or Collin County approved eVCAS125OAB4 each $33.24 $132.96
28 Optics, Weapon Sight Eotech or Collin County approved equal XPS3-0 4 each $570.00 $2,280.00 $575.00 $2,300.00

Line Notes
29 AR-15 Flip-Up Adjustable Rear Sight Troy Industries or Collin County approved eqSSIGFBSR0BT 4 each $100.00 $400.00 $99.94 $399.76
30 AR-15/M16 Gen3 M Folding Stock Adaptor Law Tactical LLC or Collin County approved e99312 4 each $240.00 $960.00
31 AR-15 ACE ARFX-E Skeleton Stock Double Star or Collin County approved equa A110B 4 each
32 Universal Wire Loop, Short Blue Force Gear or Collin County approved eUWL325 14 each $18.47 $258.58

33
Ammunition, Training: 9mm FX Marking 
Catridges,Red Simunition or Collin County approved equal SIM5320761 20 case $252.11 $5,042.20

Line Notes

34
Ammunition, Training:  9mm FX Marking 
Catridges, Blue Simunition or Collin County approved equal SIM5320762 20 case $252.11 $5,042.20
Line Notes

35
Ammunition, Training: 5.56mm FX Red 
Clipped Toxfree for M4/M16 Simunition or Collin County approved equal SIM5359101 50 case $294.12 $14,706.00
Line Notes

36
Ammunition, Training:  5.56mm Blue 
Clipped Toxfree for M4/M16 Simunition or Collin County approved equal SIM5359102 50 case $294.12 $14,706.00
Line Notes

37 Magazines, AR-15, 30 rounds, Translucent ETS Group or Collin County approved equal 33 each

38
Magazines, Glock 17, 9mm, 17 rounds, 
Smoke ETS Group or Collin County approved equal Glk-17 10 each

39
Magazines, AR-15 PMAG-D-60 223/5.56 
60RD Polymer, Black Magpul or Collin County approved equal MAG576 2 each $120.00 $240.00 $110.00 $220.00 $93.85 $187.70

40
Magazines, AR-15 PMAG GEN M3 223/5.56 
30RD Polymer, Black Magpul or Collin County approved equal MAG557 300 each $11.78 $3,534.00 $11.50 $3,450.00 $10.80 $3,240.00

41 Magazines, PMAG 17GL9, 3 Pack (Glock 17) Magpul or Collin County approved equal 7 each $13.10 $91.70 $34.57 $241.99

Line Notes
42 Ammunition, Training: 9mm Yellow Precision Gun Specialities or Collin County ap  ST9YELLOW 3 box $14.12 $42.36

43
Ammunition, Training:  Markarov Orange 
9mm Precision Gun Specialties or Collin County ap  3 box $14.12 $42.36
Line Notes

44 Pistol Ammunition Boxes, Blue 9mm-3800 MTM Caseguard or Collin County approved eP100924 6 each $3.71 $22.26
45 Magnetic Barrel Rest Lockdown or approved equal 223375 2 each

46
HD XR Night Sight Set, Glock 17, 19, 22, 26, 
32, 37 orange frnt Trijicon or approved equal GL601C600833 each $130.00 $390.00 $113.33 $339.99

47 Aluminum Backplate Anodized Zev Technologies or approved equal BKPLATEAL 2 each $16.00 $32.00
48 Electronic Trigger Pull Gauge Lymanor or approved equal 7832248 2 each
49 Precision Rifle Data Book 2.0 Magpul or approved equal DYN036 6 each $22.20 $133.20
50 Urban Sniper Bag 5.11 or approved equal 56224 6 each $117.49 $704.94

51 Scope Mount, Quick Detach 34MM LaRue Tactical LT111-34 6 each

52
Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List 
Price for manufacturer bid on line 1 for 
items not Listed Herein 1

Price is for 3 pack
Price is per each, 3 pack price 

is $39.30
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56224 DISCONTINUED. SUB: 
56225 URBAN SNIPER 50”
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GT DISTRIBUTORS, INCSilencerCo
Nightforce Optics (Lightforce 

USA Inc)
Tk Tactical (Colorado Sunrise 

Holdings LLC)
John Doe Investigations LLC

53
Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List 
Price for manufacturer bid on line 3, 4, and 
7 for items Not Listed Herein 1

54
Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List 
Price for manufacturer bid on line 8 and 9 
for items Not Listed Herein 1

55
Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List 
Price for manufacturer bid on lines 10 and 
11 for items Not Listed Herein 1

56
Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List 
Price for manufacturer bid on line 12 for 
items Not Listed Herein 1

57
Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List 
Price for manufacturer bid on line 14 Not 
Listed Herein 1

58
Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List 
Price for manufacturer bid on lines 18 and 
19 Not Listed Herein 1

59
Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List 
Price for manufacturer bid on lines 21, 22, 
23, or 24 for item Not Listed Herein 1

60
Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List 
Price for manufacturer bid on lines 5, 27, 32 
for items not Listed Herein 1

61
Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List 
Price for manufacturer bid on line 28 Not 
Listed Herein 1

62
Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List 
Price for manufacturer bid on line 29 Not 
Listed Herein 1

63
Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List 
Price for manufacturer bid on line 30 Not 
Listed Herein 1

64
Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List 
Price for manufacturer bid on line 31 Not 
Listed Herein 1

65
Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List 
Price for manufacturer for lines 33, 34, 35 
and 36 for items Not Listed Herein 1

66
Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List 
Price for manufacturer of line 50 for items 
Not Listed Herein 1

67
Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List 
Price for manufacturer bid on line 51 Not 
Listed Herein 1
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