Microsoft Frisco Insight Public Sector, Inc. GTS Technology Solutions Inc HiEd Inc. SHI
Total Price| $0.00( Total Price| $0.00( Total Price $114,632.00 Total Price| $1,726.40| Total Price $57,880.00
Line# |Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY[UOM Unit | Extended Unit | Extended Unit Extended Unit | Extended Unit Extended
3 Desktop Computer - 3 year Maintenance Dell 175 |each No Bid No Bid $655.04 $114,632.00 No Bid $743.00 $130,025.00
3.1 |Dell OptiPlex 3050 Micro Form Factor XCTO Dell 210-AKHL  [1  |each No Bid No Bid $583.32 No Bid $668.00
3.2 Micro AIO Stand MFS18 CUS KIT Dell 452-BCQC |1 |each No Bid No Bid $71.72 No Bid $75.00
9 External Blu-Ray Drives, 8x External USB 3.0 Quad-Layer Blu-Ray Disc DL 110 |each No Bid No Bid No Bid $52.11 $5,732.10 $23.00 $2,530.00
10 4 port USB hubs 3.0 Hub with Individual Power Switches and LEDs Sabrent 160 |each No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.79 $1,726.40 $13.00 $2,080.00
11 24" monitors Viewsonic  |VA2452SM [450 |each No Bid 5125A73| $56,578.50 No Bid $127.42 $57,339.00 $123.00 $55,350.00
11 ALT1 [Dell 24” monitor Dell VA2452SM  [450 |each $7l.72| S 32,274.00

Cooperative Contract

Cooperative Contract-Website

Non-Responsive: Jet Core International is non-responsive due to not being on a cooperative contract.

No Award: Lines 1,2, 4,5,6,7, 8

price is for AlO stand, line 3.2

Texas DIR Contract DIR-TSO-3373
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Line 1 — Microsoft Surface Pro Bundle — department is restructuring specifications to include a Dell solution (added to IT Standards on 2/26/2018). The revised specifications will go out for quote when ready.
Line 2 — Mobile Data Computers (MDC’s) — did not receive any responses for the Panasonic specified equipment. Department is reviewing specifications with end user department. The revised specifications will go out for quote when ready.

Line 4 — Dell Monitor — awarding line 11 for the monitors.

Lines 5, 6, 7, and 8 — Lenovo Solution (Desktop) — lines 3 and 11 are being awarded for desktop solution.
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