From: Judy Florence

To: Jessica Shaw

Subject: FW: Agenda Item #44767 Farm Museum Donations
Date: Wednesday, April 11, 2018 4:11:28 PM

Jessica,

Please see below.
Thank you,

Juady
Myers Park & Event Center
972-548-4792
7117 County Road 166
McKinney, TX 75071
www.myersinfo.com

From: Jennifer Rogers

Sent: Wednesday, April 11, 2018 4:07 PM

To: Judy Florence <jflorence@co.collin.tx.us>

Subject: RE: Agenda Item #44767 Farm Museum Donations

Hi,
All three donations are in excellent condition. None of Claude Fraizers’s will need repairs, so no cost.

Rick Vencill’s is in prime condition and will need some maintenance parts and fluids. | estimate about
S50 to $100 for some minor repairs.

Sam Ratcliff’s donation will need the most work and we will use parts that we have on hand from a
duplicate to create a whole hay baler, so no major parts to be ordered. However, | estimate $500 to
replace spark plugs, WD-40, sand blasting, paint and other minor parts.

These estimates do not account for continued maintenance down the road such as new tires, just
the initial repairs. This will all come out of our Restoration line item.

Jennifer Rogers, Museum Coordinator
Collin County Farm Museum

@ Myers Park & Event Center

7117 County Road 166

McKinney, TX 75071

972-548-4792

ccfm@collincountytx.gov

From: Judy Florence
Sent: Wednesday, April 11, 2018 3:58 PM
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To: Jennifer Rogers <jrogers@co.collin.tx.us>
Subject: FW: Agenda Item #44767 Farm Museum Donations
Importance: High

Can you please answer and return to me?

From: Jessica Shaw

Sent: Wednesday, April 11, 2018 3:23 PM

To: Judy Florence <jflorence@co.collin.tx.us>

Subject: Agenda Item #44767 Farm Museum Donations

Judy,

Can you please tell me the condition of the items that you are requesting to be added to inventory?
Also, will any of them require repairs and if so how much are you estimating the repairs to be?

Thank you,

Senior Financial Analyst
Collin County Budget & Finance
2300 Bloomdale Rd, Ste 4100
McKinney, TX 75071

(972) 548-4672 Office

(972) 491-4828 Fax
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