
Total Price $0.00 Total Price $5,827.50 Total Price $335,615.79
Line # Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1 Dell 5290 Tablet - I-7, 16GB LPDR3 or better 5 each $1,903.40 $9,517.00 $1,873.30 $9,366.50
1.1 Tablet Dell 5290 1 each $1,706.00 $1,595.00

1.2 Docking Station Dell 452-BCYT 1 each $114.50 $143.00

1.3 Keyboard Cover Dell 580-AGYI 1 each $0.00 $0.00 $94.20

1.4 Stylus/Pen Dell 750-AATY 1 each $17.95 $41.08

1.5 Absolute Control (Professional) Software Lic    Absolute 1 each $49.00 $0.01

1.6 Collin County custom image - Installed 1 each No Bid $15.95 $0.01

2 Microsoft Surface Pro Tablet - I-7, 16GB LPDR   5 each
2.1 Tablet 1 each
2.2 Docking Station Microsoft PD9-00003 1 each
2.3 Keyboard Cover Microsoft FMM-00001 1 each
2.4 Stylus/Pen Microsoft EYU-00009 1 each
2.5 Absolute Control (Professional) Software Lic    Absolute 1 each
2.6 Collin County Custom Image Installed 1 each

3 Dell 5290 Tablet with LTE Option - I-7, 16GB   5 each $1,903.40 $9,517.00 $2,008.55 $10,042.75
3.1 Tablet Dell 1 each $1,706.00 $1,730.25

GTS Technology Solutions Inc

Alternate Product (see specification sheet 
uploaded with bid) - HP Elite x2 1013 G3 Tablet 
(4SA58UT#ABA)Processor:- i7 8550U with Quad 
Core (versus Dual core specified)- 8 threads verus 
4 threads of i7-7600 specified- 6 MB Cache (versus 
4 MB specified)- processor speed up to 4 GHz with 
Intel Turbo Boss LTE included Display is LED-backlit 
touch screen with Corning Gorilla Glass for 
toughness. Mil Spec tested and Certified per 
military-grade 4’ drop testing (MIL-STD 810G) per 
independent testing. (Mil-SPEC is a set of 
standards designed to test durability, ruggedness 
and reliability. These tests cover extreme 
environmental variables including temperature, 
pressure, dust, humidity and vibration 
testing.)Product includes 4 year (warranty plus 3 
year extended) HP Hardware Next Business Day 
Onsite Service versus mail-in hardware support. 
The minimal cost increase for this upgrade in 
support is outweighed by the convenience of on-
site support, avoiding lost time for units during 
service and transit, and the cost of service spares.

Tablet Dock HP USB-C Dock G4 (3FF69AA)

Keyboard Included in price of HP Elite x2 1013 G3 

HP Pen 3RV56AA

HP 3 Year Absolute Data Device Security 
Professional U8UN8EA different version can be 
obtained if this is not exactly what was intended

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No BidNo Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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3.2 Docking Station Dell 452-BCYT 1 each $114.50 $143.00

3.3 Keyboard Cover Dell 580-AGYI 1 each $0.00 $0.00 $94.20

3.4 Stylus/Pen Dell 750-AATY 1 each $17.95 $41.08

3.5 Absolute Control (Professional) Software Lic    Absolute 1 each $49.00 $0.01

3.6 Collin County Custom Image Installed 1 each $15.95 $0.01

Alternate Product (see specification sheet 
uploaded with bid) -HP Elite x2 1013 G3 Tablet 
(4SA58UT#ABA)Processor:- i7 8550U with Quad 
Core (versus Dual core specified)- 8 threads versus 
4 threads of i7-7600 specified- 6 MB Cache (versus 
4 MB specified)- processor speed up to 4 GHz with 
Intel Turbo Boost Display is LED-backlit touch 
screen with Corning Gorilla Glass for toughness. 
Mil Spec tested and Certified per military-grade 4’ 
drop testing (MIL-STD 810G) per independent 
testing. (Mil-SPEC is a set of standards designed to 
test durability, ruggedness and reliability. These 
tests cover extreme environmental variables 
including temperature, pressure, dust, humidity 
and vibration testing.)Product includes 4 year 
(warranty plus 3 year extended) HP Hardware 
Next Business Day Onsite Service versus mail-in 
hardware support. The minimal cost increase for 
this upgrade in support is outweighed by the 
convenience of on-site support, avoiding lost time 
for units during service and transit, and the cost of 

 
Tablet Dock HP USB-C Dock G4 (3FF69AA)

Keyboard Included in price of HP Elite x2 1013 G3 Ta

HP Pen 3RV56AA

HP 3 Year Absolute Data Device Security 
Professional U8UN8EA different version can be 
obtained if this is not exactly what was intended

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Included in price of Tablet.

Included in price of Tablet.
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4 Microsoft Surface Pro Tablet with LTE Option      5 each
4.1 Processor:  i-7-7600 (Dual Core, 2.80 Gz, 4MB                                                     Microsoft 1 each
4.2 Docking Station Microsoft PD9-00003 1 each
4.3 Keyboard Cover Microsoft FMM-00001 1 each
4.4 Stylus/Pen Microsoft EYU-00009 1 each
4.5 Absolute Control (Professional) Software Lic    1 each
4.6 Collin County Custom Image Installed 1 each

5 Dell 5290 Tablet - I-5, 8GB LPDDR3 or better 50 each No Bid $1,573.90 $78,695.00 $1,576.90 $78,845.00
5.1 Tablet 1 each $1,456.00 $1,395.50

5.2 Rugged Case 1 each $35.00 $46.10
5.3 Keyboard cover Dell 580-AGYI 1 each $0.00 $0.00 $94.20

5.4 Stylus/Pen Dell 750-AATY 1 each $17.95 $41.08

5.5 Absolute Control (Professional) Software Lic Absolute 1 each $49.00 $0.01

5.6 Collin County Custom Image Installed 1 each $15.95 $0.01

6 Microsoft Tablet - I-5, 8GB LPDDR3 or better 50 each $1,423.13 $71,156.50

6.1 Tablet 1 each $1,147.07

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

Alternate Product (see specification sheet 
uploaded with bid) -HP Elite x2 1013 G3 Tablet 
(4RH02UT#ABA)Processor:- i5 8250U with Quad 
Core (versus Dual core specified)- 8 threads versus 
4 threads of i5-7500 specified- 6 MB Cache (versus 
4 MB specified)- processor speed up to 3.4 GHz 
with Intel Turbo Boost Display is LED-backlit touch 
screen with Corning Gorilla Glass for toughness. 
Mil Spec tested and Certified per military-grade 4’ 
drop testing (MIL-STD 810G) per independent 
testing. (Mil-SPEC is a set of standards designed to 
test durability, ruggedness and reliability. These 
tests cover extreme environmental variables 
including temperature, pressure, dust, humidity 

      

Keyboard Included in price of HP Elite x2 1013 G3 
Tablet

HP Pen 3RV56AA

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

HP 3 Year Absolute Data Device Security 
Professional U8UN8EA different version can be 
obtained if this is not exactly what was intended

Included in price of Tablet.

Included in price of Tablet.

Price includes an additional 
warranty for a total of 4 years.  
Pricing of $1,147.07 is valid 
through 9/23/18, which 
supersedes the ”Valid 
through” date at the top of 
this quote.  After 9/23/18 a 
$200 MFG rebate expires 
making the new cost $1,229.74

No Bid

No Bid
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6.2 Rugged Case 1 each $66.72
6.3 Keyboard cover Microsoft FMM-00001 1 each $97.31
6.4 Stylus/Pen Micosoft EYU-00009 1 each $74.85
6.5 Absolute Control (Professional) Software Lic Absolute 1 each $24.19
6.6 Collin County Custom Image Installed 1 each $12.99

7 Dell 7390 Laptop 126 each $1,550.95 $195,419.70 $1,883.60 $237,333.60
7.1 Laptop Dell 7390 1 each $1,377.00 $1,699.50

7.2 Docking Station Dell 452-BCYT 1 each $109.00 $143.00

7.3 Stylus/Pen Dell 750-AATY 1 each No Bid $41.08
7.4 Absolute Control (Professional) Software Lic    Absolute 1 each $49.00 $0.01

7.5 Collin County custom image - Installed 1 each $15.95 $0.01

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Included in price of Tablet.

Included in price of Tablet.

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

Alternate Product (see specification sheet 
uploaded with bid) -HP EliteBook 830 G5 
(3PZ03UT#ABA)Processor:- i7 8550U with Quad 
Core (versus Dual core specified)- 8 threads versus 
4 threads of i7-7600 specified- 6 MB Cache (versus 
4 MB specified)- processor speed up to 4 GHz with 
Intel Turbo Boost 512 GB M.2 2280 SSD versus 256 
GB specifiedProduct includes 4 year (warranty plus 
3 year extended) HP Hardware Next Business Day 
Onsite Service versus mail-in hardware support. 
The minimal cost increase for this upgrade in 
support is outweighed by the convenience of on-
site support, avoiding lost time for units during 
service and transit, and the cost of service spares.

HP UltraSlim Docking Station (D9Y32UT#ABA)This 
is a highly regarded docking station option for this 

HP 3 Year Absolute Data Device Security 
Professional U8UN8EA different version can be 
obtained if this is not exactly what was intended

Price after 9/23/18 is 
$1,356.79.  Price includes an 
additional warranty for a total 
of 4 years.

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid



GTS Technology Solutions IncGovConnection, Inc. Zones, Inc.

8 Backpack - Dell Urban Backpack - 15 Dell or Collin   460-BBYL 1 each No Bid No Bid $27.94 $27.94

8 ALT1

HP Prelude ROW backpack (2MW63AA) 
that fits up to 15.6 inch screen. (See 
attached brochure.)Minimum of 10 per 
purchase order. HP 2MW63AA 1 each $19.00

9 Rolling Laptop Case Targus or app  TBR003US 126 each No Bid $46.25 $5,827.50 $51.81 $6,528.06

State the cooperative contract number this quote is offered under. If none, answer N/A.

Qty 1-9 Price $49.25Qty 10-49 Price $48.35Qty 50-
99  Price $47.45Qty 100+  Price is $46.25Price is 
based on the quantity on each Purchase Order.

State the cooperative contract name this quote is offered under. (i.e. TX DIR, TXMAS, 
TCPN, National IPA, Buyboard, TIPS/TAPS, etc.) If none, answer N/A. Texas DIR TSO 2538

Texas DIR TSO 2538
http://dir.texas.gov/View-Search/Contracts-

Detail.aspx?contractnumber=DIR-TSO-

DIR
DIR-TSO-3763-R

http://dir.texas.gov/View-
Search/Contracts-

Please provide the website URL for the cooperative contract this quote is offered under. If 
none, answer N/A.

NIPA Contract
R160202

http://www.nationalipa.org/P
ages/default.aspx
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