Frisco Printing

Safeguard

Alphagraphics| & Graphics | Filex Systems, | Filex Systems, Forms &
VENDORS US 391 Cener Inc. Inc. Jayden GraphicgSystems, Inc.  [cooper's
FY18 UNIT FY19 UNIT
LINE ITEMS |pESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT COST | UNIT COST COST COST UNIT COST | UNIT COST | UNIT COST
Specific Case Binders, Judgement NISI 0.24
#5 Folder (Smead 150c¢) Legal Size 5000 No Bid No Bid 0.26 $ 0.4530 | $ 0.39 No Bid
0.34
1 Attribute 2000 No Bid No Bid N/A $ 0.5% | $ 0.53 No Bid
0.49
2 Attribute 1000 No Bid No Bid N/A $ 0.835|$ 0.66 No Bid
10000 0.23
15000 0.22
20000 0.21
Specifice Case Binders, Misc./Felony 0.16
#6 File Folder (Smead 150c) Legal Size 20000 No Bid No Bid 0.196 $ 0.406 | $ 0.32 No Bid
0.168
1 Attribute 15000 No Bid No Bid 0.20 $ 0.404 | $ 0.34 No Bid
0.172
2 Attribute 10000 No Bid No Bid 0.21 $ 0.448 | $ 0.35 No Bid
5000 0.23




