IFB 2018-173 Road Materials, Asphaltic Concrete

PRIMARY AWARD

SECONDARY AWARD
JLB Contracting, LLC LANE Construction RK Hall LLC Austin Asphalt, Inc TexasBit - Oldcastle Materials
Total Price| Price with | $229,888.00( Total Price| Price with | $2,606,745.04| Total Price| Price with | $1,783,359.10| Total Price| Price with {$2,212,291.44( Total Price| Price with |$2,266,892.72
Line# Description Qry |UOM Unit Mileage Extended Unit Mileage Extended Unit Mileage Extended Unit Mileage Extended Unit Mileage Extended
WEST ZONES - PICK UP with mileage calculated in bid price
4361 North Central Expressway, McKinney, TX 75071
1 PICKUP West Zones: Type B 1 ton No Bid $65.00  $107.51 s107.51] ‘2 B $54.00  $68.93 $68.93  $60.00  $72.64 $72.64
5 PICKUP West Zones: Type B with RAP
and/or RAS 1 ton No Bid $51.50 $94.01 $94.01 $48.00 $86.15 $86.15 $47.00 $61.93 $61.93 $50.00 $62.64 $62.64
5 ALTL :Pick up West Zones: Type With RAP
:and/or RAS 1 ton $50.00 $96.33
. PICKUP West Zones: Type C 1 ton No Bid $71.00 $113.51 $113.51 No Bid $54.00 $68.93 $68.93 $64.00 $76.64 $76.64
4 PICKUP West Zones: Type C with RAP
and/or RAS 1 ton No Bid $61.00 $103.51 $103.51 $50.00 $88.15 $88.15 $47.00 $61.93 $61.93 $52.00 S64.64 $64.64
5 PICKUP West Zones: Type D 500 ton No Bid $74.00 $116.51 $58,255.00 No Bid $54.00 $68.93 $34,465.00 $64.00 $76.64  $38,320.00
6 PICKUP West Zones: Type D with RAP
and/or RAS 4300 ton No Bid $62.00 $104.51 $449,393.00/ $50.00 $88.15  $379,045.00| $47.00 $61.93 $266,299.00 $51.50 S64.14 $275,802.00|
6 ALT1 PICKUP West Zones: Type D with RAP
and/or RAS 4300 ton $52.00 $98.33
7 PICKUP West Zones: Warm Mix 100 ton No Bid $62.00 $104.51 $10,451.00 No Bid $54.00 $68.93 $6,893.00/ $51.50 $64.14 $6,414.00
g PICKUP West Zones: High Performance
Cold Mix 500 ton $100.00 $159.08 $79,540.00|No Bid $100.00 $140.77 $70,385.00| $92.00 $106.93 $53,465.00 $97.00 $109.64 $54,820.00/
TOTAL PICK UP PRICE FOR WEST
ZONES: (Includes No Bid and Alternate
lines) $100.00 $159.08 $79,540.00|$446.50 $744.07 $518,517.54 $350.00 $597.88 $449,604.30| $449.00 $568.44 $361,383.72 $490.00 $591.12 $375,632.56
EAST ZONES - PICK UP with mileage calculated in bid price
1069 North SH 78, Farmersville, TX 75442
9 PICKUP East Zones: Type B 1 ton No Bid $65.00 $124.62 $124.62 No Bid $54.00 $87.80 $87.80| $60.00 $88.45 $88.45
10 PICKUP East Zones: Type B with RAP
and/or RAS 1 ton No Bid $51.50 $111.12 $111.12 $48.00 $69.04 $48.00| $47.00 $80.80 $80.80) $50.00 $78.45 $78.45
11
PICKUP East Zones: Type C 1 ton No Bid $71.00 $130.62 $130.62 No Bid $54.00 $87.80 $87.80| $64.00 $92.45 $92.45
1 PICKUP East Zones: Type C with RAP
and/or RAS 1 ton No Bid $61.00 $120.62 $120.62 $50.00 $71.04 $50.00 $47.00 $80.80 $80.80) $52.00 $80.45 $80.45
= PICKUP East Zones: Type D 500 ton No Bid $74.00 $133.62 $66,810.00 No Bid $54.00 $87.80 $43,900.00 $64.00 $92.45 $46,225.00|
14 PICKUP East Zones: Type D with RAP
and/or RAS 5700 ton No Bid $62.00 $121.62 $693,234.00} $50.00 $71.04 $285,000.00/ $47.00 $80.80 $460,560.00 $51.50 $79.95 $455,715.00|
15 PICKUP East Zones: Warm Mix 200 ton No Bid $62.00 $121.62 $24,324.00 No Bid $54.00 $87.80 $17,560.00 $51.50 $79.95 $15,990.00|
16 PICKUP East Zones: High Performance
Cold Mix 200 ton $100.00 $174.77 $34,954.00|No Bid $100.00 $123.76 $20,000.00/ $92.00 $125.80 $25,160.00| $97.00 $125.45 $25,090.00/
TOTAL PICK UP PRICE FOR EAST
ZONES: (Includes No Bid and Alternate
lines) $100.00 $174.77 $34,954.00|S446.50 $863.84 $784,854.98 $248.00 $334.88 $305,098.00| $449.00 $719.40 $547,517.20| $490.00 $717.60 $543,359.80|
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Plant Location Address for Pick-Up

7151 Randol Mill Rd., Ft. Worth, TX
76124 Approx 108.4 miles roundtrip for
West Zones $59.08 IRS tax rate and
approx 68.6 miles roundtrip for East
Zones $74.77 IRS tax rate

6831 N IH-35, Denton, TX 75065 Approx
78 miles roundtrip for West Zones
$42.51 IRS tax rate and approx 109.4
miles roundtrip for East Zones $59.62
IRS

2200 E County Line Rd, Royse City, TX
75189 (Lines 2, 4, 6, 10, 12, 14) Approx
70 miles roundtrip for West Zones
$38.15 IRS tax rate and 38.6 miles
roundtrip for East Zones $21.04 IRS tax
rate

6630 W FM 120, Denison, TX 75020
(Lines 2 alt & 6 alt) Approx 85 miles
roundtrip for West Zones $46.33 IRS
tax rate

5651 HWY 224, East Greenville, TX
75401 (Lines 8 & 16) Approx 74.8 miles
roundtrip for West Zones $40.77 IRS
tax rate and 43.6 miles roundtrip for
East Zones $23.76 IRS tax rate

11481 County Rd 53, Celina, TX 75009
Approx 27.4 miles roundtrip for West
Zones $14.93 IRS tax rate and approx
62 miles roundtrip for East Zones
$33.80 IRS tax rate

DELIVERY BY ZONE
17 DELIVERED Zone 1: TYPE B 1 ton
DELIVERED Zone 1: TYPE B with RAP
18 and/or RAS 1 ton
18 ALT1:i6630 West FM 120 Denison, TX 75020 1 ton
19  DELIVERED Zone 1: TYPE C 1 ton
DELIVERED Zone 1: TYPE C with RAP
20 and/or RAS 1 ton
21  DELIVERED Zone 1: TYPED 200 ton
DELIVERED Zone 1: TYPE D with RAP
22 and/or RAS 750  ton
22 ALT1:6630 West FM 120 Denison, TX 75020 750  ton
23 DELIVERED Zone 1: Warm Mix 1 ton
DELIVERED Zone 1: Warm Mix with RAP
24 and/or RAS 1 ton
DELIVERED Zone 1: High Performance
25 Cold Mix 1 ton
26 DELIVERED Zone 2: TYPE B 1 ton
DELIVERED Zone 2: TYPE B with RAP
27 and/or RAS 1 ton
28 DELIVERED Zone 2: TYPEC 1 ton
DELIVERED Zone 2: TYPE C with RAP
29 and/or RAS 1 ton
30 DELIVERED Zone 2: TYPE D 200 ton
DELIVERED Zone 2: TYPE D with RAP
31 and/or RAS 750  ton
32 DELIVERED Zone 2: Warm Mix 1 ton
DELIVERED Zone 2: Warm Mix with RAP
33 and/or RAS 1 ton
DELIVERED Zone 2: High Performance
34 Cold Mix 1 ton
35 DELIVERED Zone 3: TYPE B 1 ton
DELIVERED Zone 3: TYPE B with RAP
36 and/or RAS 1 ton
37 DELIVERED Zone 3: TYPE C 1 ton
DELIVERED Zone 3: TYPE C with RAP
38 and/or RAS 1 ton
39 DELIVERED Zone 3: TYPE D 250 ton
DELIVERED Zone 3: TYPE D with RAP
40 and/or RAS 500 ton
41 DELIVERED Zone 3: Warm Mix 1 ton

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$111.00
No Bid

$111.00|
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

$111.00
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

not responsive
not responsive
not responsive

not responsive

not responsive
not responsive

not responsive

not responsive

not responsive

not responsive
not responsive

not responsive
not responsive

not responsive
not responsive

not responsive
not responsive

not responsive

$111.00|No Bid

not responsive

not responsive
not responsive

not responsive
not responsive

not responsive
not responsive

No Bid
$61.75
$60.00

No Bid

$63.75
No Bid

$63.75
$62.00
No Bid
No Bid

$113.75
No Bid

$60.25
No Bid

$62.25
No Bid

$62.25
No Bid

No Bid

$112.25
No Bid

$57.75
No Bid

$59.75
No Bid

$59.75
No Bid

$61.75

$63.75

$47,812.50

$113.75

$60.25

$62.25

$46,687.50

$112.25

$57.75

$59.75

$29,875.00

$58.90 $58.90
$51.90 $51.90
$58.90 $58.90
$51.90 $51.90
$58.90 $11,780.00
$51.90 $38,925.00
$58.90 $58.90
$51.90 $51.90
$96.90 $96.90
$58.90 $58.90
$51.90 $51.90
$58.90 $58.90
$51.90 $51.90
$58.90 $11,780.00
$51.90 $38,925.00
$58.90 $58.90
$51.90 $51.90
$96.90 $96.90
$62.84 $62.84
$55.84 $55.84
$62.84 $62.84
$55.84 $55.84
$62.84 $15,710.00
$55.84 $27,920.00
$62.84 $62.84

14900 SH 121, Frisco, TX 75034 Approx
23.2 miles roundtrip for West Zones
$12.64 IRS tax rate and 52.5 miles
roundtrip for East Zones $28.45 IRS tax
rate
| $67.00 $67.00|
| $57.00 $57.00|
| $71.00 $71.00|
I $59.00 $59.00I
$71.00 $14,200.00
| $58.50 $43,875.00|
| $68.50 $68.50|
| $58.50 $58.50|
$109.50 $109.50I
| $67.50 $67.50
I $57.50 $57.50I
$71.50 $71.50
I $59.50 $59.50I
$71.50 $14,300.00
I $59.00 $44,250.00I
$69.00 $69.00
| $59.00 $59.00|
| $110.00 $110.00I
$69.00 $69.00
$59.00 $59.00|
$73.00 $73.00
$61.00 $61.00|
| $73.00 $18,250.00
| $60.50 $30,250.00
$70.50 $70.50|
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42

43
44
45
46
47
48
49
50
51

52
53
54
55
56
57
58
59
60

61
62
63
64
65
66
67
68
69

70
71
72
73
74
75
76
77
78

DELIVERED Zone 3:

and/or RAS

DELIVERED Zone 3:

Cold Mix

DELIVERED Zone 4:
DELIVERED Zone 4:

and/or RAS

DELIVERED Zone 4:
DELIVERED Zone 4:

and/or RAS

DELIVERED Zone 4:
DELIVERED Zone 4:

and/or RAS

DELIVERED Zone 4:
DELIVERED Zone 4:

and/or RAS

DELIVERED Zone 4:

Cold Mix

DELIVERED Zone 5:
DELIVERED Zone 5:

and/or RAS

DELIVERED Zone 5:
DELIVERED Zone 5:

and/or RAS

DELIVERED Zone 5:
DELIVERED Zone 5:

and/or RAS

DELIVERED Zone 5:
DELIVERED Zone 5:

and/or RAS

DELIVERED Zone 5:

Cold Mix

DELIVERED Zone 6:
DELIVERED Zone 6:

and/or RAS

DELIVERED Zone 6:
DELIVERED Zone 6:

and/or RAS

DELIVERED Zone 6:
DELIVERED Zone 6:

and/or RAS

DELIVERED Zone 6:
DELIVERED Zone 6:

and/or RAS

DELIVERED Zone 6:

Cold Mix

DELIVERED Zone 7:
DELIVERED Zone 7:

and/or RAS

DELIVERED Zone 7:
DELIVERED Zone 7:

and/or RAS

DELIVERED Zone 7:
DELIVERED Zone 7:

and/or RAS

DELIVERED Zone 7:
DELIVERED Zone 7:

and/or RAS

Warm Mix with RAP

High Performance

TYPEB

TYPE B with RAP

TYPEC

TYPE C with RAP

TYPED

TYPE D with RAP

Warm Mix

Warm Mix with RAP

High Performance

TYPE B

TYPE B with RAP

TYPEC

TYPE C with RAP

TYPED

TYPE D with RAP

Warm Mix

Warm Mix with RAP

High Performance

TYPEB

TYPE B with RAP

TYPEC

TYPE C with RAP

TYPED

TYPE D with RAP

Warm Mix

Warm Mix with RAP

High Performance

TYPE B

TYPE B with RAP

TYPEC

TYPE C with RAP

TYPED

TYPE D with RAP

Warm Mix

Warm Mix with RAP

50

100

150

500

200

500
200

500

250

1000

ton

ton
ton

ton
ton

ton
ton

ton
ton

ton

ton
ton

ton
ton

ton
ton

ton
ton

ton

ton
ton

ton
ton

ton
ton

ton
ton

ton

ton
ton

ton
ton

ton
ton

ton
ton

ton

No Bid

$114.00
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

$111.00
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

$114.00
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

$114.00
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

$114.00

$111.00

$114.00

$114.00

not responsive

| not responsive
not responsive

not responsive
not responsive

not responsive
not responsive

not responsive
not responsive

not responsive

INo Bid
not responsive

not responsive
not responsive

not responsive
not responsive

not responsive
not responsive

not responsive

| not responsive
not responsive

not responsive
not responsive

not responsive
not responsive

not responsive
not responsive

not responsive

INo Bid
not responsive

not responsive
not responsive

not responsive
not responsive

not responsive
not responsive

not responsive

No Bid

$109.75
No Bid

$59.50
No Bid

$61.50
No Bid

$61.50
No Bid

No Bid

$111.50
No Bid

$55.25
No Bid

$57.25
No Bid

$57.25
No Bid

No Bid

$107.25
No Bid

$54.00
No Bid

$56.00
No Bid

$56.00
No Bid

No Bid

$106.00
No Bid

$55.00
No Bid

$57.00
No Bid

$57.00
No Bid

No Bid

$109.75

$59.50

$61.50

$6,150.00

$111.50

$55.25

$57.25

$28,625.00

$107.25

$54.00

$56.00

$28,000.00

$106.00

$55.00

$57.00

$57,000.00

$55.84

$100.84
$61.74

$54.74
$61.74

$54.74
$61.74

$54.74
$61.74

$54.74

$99.74
$62.50

$55.50
$62.50

$55.50
$62.50

$55.50
$62.50

$55.50

$100.50
$65.52

$58.52
$65.52

$58.52
$65.52

$58.52
$65.52

$58.52

$103.52
$63.52

$56.52
$63.52

$56.52
$63.52

$56.52
$63.52

$56.52

$55.84

$100.84
$61.74

$54.74
$61.74

$54.74
$3,087.00

$5,474.00
$61.74

$54.74

$99.74
$62.50

$55.50
$62.50

$55.50
$9,375.00

$27,750.00
$62.50

$55.50

$100.50
$65.52

$58.52
$65.52

$58.52
$13,104.00

$29,260.00
$13,104.00

$29,260.00

$103.52
$63.52

$56.52
$63.52

$56.52
$15,880.00

$56,520.00
$63.52

$56.52

$60.50

$112.00
$65.00

$55.00
$69.00

$57.00
$69.00

$56.50
$66.50

$56.50

$107.50
$68.00

$58.00
$72.00

$60.00
$72.00

$59.50
$69.50

$59.50

$110.50
$69.00

$59.00
$73.00

$61.00
$73.00

$60.50
$70.50

$60.50

$112.00
$67.00

$57.00
$71.00

$59.00
$71.00

$58.50
$68.50

$58.50

$60.50|

$112.00I
$65.00

$55.00
$69.00

$57.00
$3,450.00

$5,650.00
$66.50

$56.50|

$107.50|
$68.00

$58.00
$72.00

$60.00
$10,800.00

$29,750.00
$69.50

$59.50]

$110.50I
$69.00

$59.00
$73.00

$61.00
$14,600.00

$30,250.00
$14,100.00

$30,250.00

$112.00I
$67.00

$57.00
$71.00

$59.00
$17,750.00

$58,500.00|
$68.50

$58.50|
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DELIVERED Zone 7: High Performance
2 Cold Mix 1 ton $111.00 $111.00|No Bid $107.00 $107.00f $101.52 $101.52 $109.50 $109.50|
80  DELIVERED Zone 8: TYPE B 1 ton No Bid not responsive No Bid $66.60 $66.60] $69.00 $69.00
DELIVERED Zone 8: TYPE B with RAP
g and/or RAS 1 ton No Bid not responsive $54.00 $54.00| $59.60 $59.60 $59.00 $59.00|
82  DELIVERED Zone 8: TYPE C 1 ton No Bid not responsive No Bid $66.60 $66.60] $73.00 $73.00
DELIVERED Zone 8: TYPE C with RAP
83 and/or RAS 1 ton No Bid not responsive $56.00 $56.00| $59.60 $59.60 $61.00 $61.00|
84  DELIVERED Zone 8: TYPED 200 ton No Bid not responsive No Bid $66.60 $13,320.00/ $73.00 $14,600.00
DELIVERED Zone 8: TYPE D with RAP
= and/or RAS 500 ton No Bid not responsive $56.00 $28,000.00] $59.60 $29,800.00 $60.50 $30,250.00|
86  DELIVERED Zone 8: Warm Mix 1 ton No Bid not responsive No Bid $66.60 $66.60] $70.50 $70.50
DELIVERED Zone 8: Warm Mix with RAP
87 and/or RAS 1 ton No Bid not responsive No Bid $59.60 $59.60 $60.50 $60.50|
DELIVERED Zone 8: High Performance
88 Cold Mix 1 ton $114.00 $114.00|No Bid $106.00 $106.00f S104.60 $104.60 $112.00 $112.00f
TOTAL DELIVERY PRICE: (includes No Bid
and Alternate lines) $900.00 $900.00| $2,400.00 $273,954.50| $4,584.68 $394,489.60| $5,011.00 $428,908.00|
Delivery in calendar days from date of order: 1-2 days 1 day 1 day 2 days
Minimum Number of Tons for Delivery: 22 14 12 24

Lane Construction delivery prices Not Responsive due to pricing error.
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