IFB 2018-174 Road Materials, Flexbase

PRIMARY AWARD
SECONDARY AWARD
Big City Crushed Concrete DFW MATERIALS Martin Marietta Materials Q. Roberts Trucking Green Dream International
Unit Pru.:e with Extended Unit P"fe with Extended Unit Pru.:e with Extended Unit Pru.:e with Extended Unit Pru.:e with Extended
Line# Description QTY | uom Mileage Mileage Mileage Mileage Mileage
PICKUP AT PLANT SITE - Flexible Base
1 (Grade 1, Type A) 25000 ton |No Bid $9.00 $ 105.36  $2,634,000.00 $16.50 $ 31.43 $785,750.00 $7.50 $ 100.80 $2,520,000.00 $18.57 $ 33.50 $837,500.00
1 ALT1 {Recycled Type D Grade 1-2 location 1 25000 ton $9.00 $45.84 S 1,146,000.00
1 ALT1 {Recycled Type D Grade 1-2 location 2 25000 ton $9.00 $36.03 $ 900,750.00
1ALT1 {5/8” Flex Base 25000 ton 51450 $ 2943 $  735,750.00
DELIVERED Zone 1 - Flexible Base (Grade
2 1, Type A) 10000 ton [No Bid $20.34 $203,400.00 $20.00 $200,000.00 $23.00 $230,000.00 $22.28 $222,800.00
2 ALT1 {5/8” Flex Base 10000  ton $18.00 $  180,000.00
3 DELIVERED Zone 2 - Flexible Base (Grade
1, Type A) 15000 ton |No Bid $21.87 $328,050.00 $20.85 $312,750.00 $24.25 $363,750.00 $23.19 $347,850.00
3ALT1 {5/8” Flex Base 15000  ton $18.85 $  282,750.00
DELIVERED Zone 3 - Flexible Base (Grade
4 1, Type A) 15000 ton [No Bid $22.89 $343,350.00 $21.36 $320,400.00 $24.25 $363,750.00 $23.72 $355,800.00
4 ALT1 i5/8” Flex Base 15000 ton $19.36 S 290,400.00
5 DELIVERED Zone 4 - Flexible Base (Grade
1, Type A) 10000 ton |No Bid $20.85 tie $208,500.00 $20.85 tie $208,500.00 $23.00 $230,000.00 $23.19 $231,900.00
5ALT1 {5/8” Flex Base 10000  ton $18.85 $  188,500.00
DELIVERED Zone 5 - Flexible Base (Grade
6 1, Type A) 20000 ton |No Bid $22.38 $447,600.00 $22.85 $457,000.00 $24.25 $485,000.00 $25.31 $506,200.00
6 ALT1 i5/8” Flex Base 20000 ton $20.85 $  417,000.00
. DELIVERED Zone 6 - Flexible Base (Grade
1, Type A) 20000 ton |No Bid $24.25 $485,000.00 $24.15 $483,000.00 $24.95 $499,000.00 $26.68 $533,600.00
7 ALT1 {5/8” Flex Base 20000  ton $22.15 $  443,000.00
DELIVERED Zone 7 - Flexible Base (Grade
8 1, Type A) 10000 ton [No Bid $22.72 $227,200.00 $24.00 $240,000.00 $24.25 $242,500.00 $26.52 $265,200.00
8 ALT1 i5/8” Flex Base 10000  ton $22.00 $ 220,000.00
3 DELIVERED Zone 8 - Flexible Base (Grade
1, Type A) 20000 ton |No Bid $24.08 $481,600.00 $24.15 $483,000.00 $26.85 $537,000.00 $26.68 $533,600.00
9 ALT1 {5/8” Flex Base 20000  ton $22.15 $ 443,000.00
Total: (Includes Alternates bid) $ 18.00 $ 81.87 $2,046,750.00 $188.38 $ 10536 $5,358,700.00 $ 371.42 $ 60.86 $ 6,690,800.00 $ 202.30 $100.80 $ 5,471,000.00 $ 216.14 $ 33.50 $ 3,834,450.00
2 locations for Pick up: 11143 Goodnight 1160 FM 1658 Bridgeport, TX 76426 11481 County Rd 53, Celina, TX 75009 Approx |6030 FM 1810 Chico, TX 76431 Approx 171.2(11481 County Rd 53, Celina, TX 75009 Approx
Lane, Dallas, TX Approx 67.6 miles roundtrip |Approx 176.8 miles roundtrip with IRS tax [27.4 miles roundtrip with IRS tax rate $14.93 |miles roundtrip with IRS tax rate $93.30 27.4 miles roundtrip with IRS tax rate $14.93
with IRS tax rate $36.84 rate $96.36
Plant Location Address for Pick-Up
Line 1 Pricing 1580 Stonewall, Lewisville, TX 75056 Approx
49.6 miles roundtrip with IRS tax rate $27.03
Delivery in calendar days from date of order: N/A x/vi(tehczz ﬁzt‘::ﬁ:ﬁu tona day or more 2 days 1day 7 days
Minimum Number of Tons for Delivery: N/A 25 24 22 100 (line 9 only)
Low prices have been bold/underline, excluding the alternate bid items in orange
Tieonline 5
Bid Notes: Martin Marietta - All delivered prices are based on delivery in an end dump tractor trailer. Minimum freight at 24 tons will be charged regardless of tonnage delivered to the delivery location.

Big City Crushed Concrete - Our Flex Base Type D Grade 1-2 is tested by a third party every 6000 tons of production. Material tests available upon request.
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