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Line#  Description QTY ([UOM Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit
Hourly Rate for Class A
1
Labor
1.1 |Class A Labor-regular |1 hour $75.00 $68.00 $75.00 $80.00 $78.00 $95.00 $90.00
1.2 Class A Labor- overtime |1 hour $115.00 $102.00 $112.50 $120.00 $98.00 $142.50 $135.00
13 Class A Labor- weekend |1 hour $115.00 $102.00 $112.50 $120.00 $98.00 $142.50 $135.00
1.4 |Class A Labor- holiday |1 hour $115.00 $136.00 $150.00 $120.00 $156.00 $142.50 $270.00
Hourly Rate for Class B
2
Labor
2.1 |[Class B Labor-regular |1 hour No Bid $65.00 $75.00 $80.00 $78.00 $85.00 $90.00
2.2 Class B Labor- overtime |1 hour No Bid $97.50 $112.50 $120.00 $98.00 $127.50 $135.00
2.3 Class B Labor- weekend |1 hour No Bid $97.50 $112.50 $120.00 $98.00 $127.50 $135.00
2.4 |[Class B Labor- holiday |1 hour No Bid $130.00 $150.00 $120.00 $156.00 $127.50 $270.00
Hourly Rate for EPA
3 Cert. Type 2 or 3 Labor
Hourly Rate for EPA
3.1 [Cert. Type 2 or 3 Labor-
regular 1 hour $50.00 $68.00 $75.00 $80.00 $78.00 $95.00 $90.00
Hourly Rate for EPA
3.2 |Cert. Type 2 or 3 Labor-
overtime 1 hour $75.00 $102.00 $112.50 $120.00 $98.00 $142.50 $135.00
Hourly Rate for EPA
3.3 [Cert. Type 2 or 3 Labor-
weekend 1 hour $75.00 $102.00 $112.50 $120.00 $98.00 $142.50 $135.00
Hourly Rate for EPA
3.4 |Cert. Type 2 or 3 Labor-
holiday 1 hour $75.00 $136.00 $150.00 $120.00 $156.00 $142.50 $270.00
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4 Hourly Rate for Helper
Hourly Rate for Helper-
4.1 regular hour $50.00 $60.00 $45.00 $58.00 $65.00 $85.00 $90.00
Hourly Rate for Helper-
4.2 overtime hour $75.00 $90.00 $67.50 $87.00 $98.00 $127.50 $135.00
Hourly Rate for Helper-
4.3 weekend hour $75.00 $90.00 $67.50 $87.00 $98.00 $127.50 $135.00
Hourly Rate for Helper-
4.4 holiday hour $75.00 $120.00 $90.00 $87.00 $130.00 $127.50 $270.00
Percent Markup on
> Material Costs percent 20% 22% 30% 45% 30% 30% 25%

Berger Engineering is non-responsive.
Not Bid on Hourly Rate for Class A
Labor which was a required line item.






