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Line # Description Mfgr MfgNo QTY UOM Package
Loads per 
individual 
container

Average 
Loads per 
Container

Unit Price per Load Extended Price Unit Price per Load Extended Price Unit Price per Load Extended Price

1

Heavy duty concentrated SOLID detergent, designed to 
remove oily soil like food and beverage soils. Dispenser should 
control approximately 16 wash formulas and should handle 2 
machines. Dispenser shall have automatic cut off switches 
when product is removed during dispensing. When capsule is 
empty, dispenser shall sound an alarm to alert laundry 
personnel that it is out of product.

Ecolab Solid 
Surge 4-8lb. 

6116309
105 case 4-8 lb. 

capsules
580 368.3333 129.27$  0.2229$                8,619.86$            

1 ALT1 Opticlean V LIQUID Detergent Auto-Chlor 601 105 case 5 gallon pail 160 368.3333 98.00$         0.6125$                23,688.4354$   

1 ALT1

TIDE PRO SC LAUNDRY DETERGENT CLOSED LOOP;  THIS IS A 5 
GALLON LIQUID DETERGENT THAT SAVES UP TO 15% ON 
COTTON FABRICS DUE TO NO HARMFUL CHEMICALS; PH 
NEUTRAL

Procter & 
Gamble 

Professional
105 case 5 gallon pail 365 368.3333 146.80$  0.4022$                15,554.7657$        

2

Super concentrated destainer containing a wetting agent and 
water conditioners, automatically dispensed through an 
electronic dispenser. Shall be able to get white linens clean and 
bright. Dispenser should control approximately 16 wash 
formulas and should handle 2 machines. Dispenser shall have 
automatic cut off switches when product is removed during 
dispensing. When capsule is empty, dispenser shall sound an 
alarm to alert laundry personnel that it is out of product. SOLID

Ecolab Solid 
Stain-A-Way 2-
4lb. 6113649

85 case 2-4 lb. 
capsules

202 200 70.86$    0.3508$                5,963.47$            

2 ALT1 Liquid Destainer - LIQUID Auto-Chlor 685 85 case 5 gallon pail 142 200 33.50$         0.2359$                4,010.5634$     

2 ALT1 P&G PROLINE CLOROX BLEACH LAUNDRY ADDITIVE 
CONCENTRATE; 5 GALLON - LIQUID

Procter & 
Gamble 

Professional
85 case 5 gallon pail 256 200 47.84$    0.1869$                3,176.8750$          

3

Concentrated SOLID fabric softener and neutralizing agent 
designed to leave fabrics with a soft feel. Dispenser should 
control approximately 16 wash formulas and should handle 2 
machines. Dispenser shall have automatic cut off switches 
when product is removed during dispensing. When capsule is 
empty, dispenser shall sound an alarm to alert laundry 
personnel that it is out of product.

Ecolab Solid 
Navisoft 2-6lb. 

6116001
70 case 2-6 lb. 

capsules
363 419.6667 82.50$    0.2273$                6,676.52$            

3 ALT1 Opticlean V Liquid Softener - LIQUID Auto-Chlor 70 case 5 gallon pail 256 419.6667 91.85$         0.3588$                10,540.0275$   

3 ALT1 P&G PROFESSIONAL DOWNY FREE LIQUID SOFTENER; 5 
GALLON

Procter & 
Gamble 

Professional
70 case 5 gallon pail 640 419.6667 108.17$  0.1690$                4,965.1161$          

4

Dishwashing detergent compatible with aluminum ware and 
other soft metal. The dispenser and chemicals must produce 
sufficient strength to appropriately clean dishes, trays, glasses, 
etc. and produce maximum effectiveness in all types of 
operating conditions. Must be able to clean effectively without 
causing skin rashes to persons that come in contact with the 
chemicals. - SOLID

Ecolab Solid 
Powder or 

Collin County 
approved 

equal

125 8098.5 No Bid -$                        

4 ALT1 Auto Kleen - SOLID Auto-Chlor 783 125 4-8 lb. 
capsules

4600 8098.5 91.95$         0.0200$                20,235.2466$   

4 ALT1 Ecolab SOLID Power XL 6100185 4-9LB Ecolab
Solid Power 

XL
125 4-9 lb. 

capsules
11597 8098.5 92.06$    0.0079$                8,036.00$            

5
Dishwashing rinse containing defoamer to give maximum rinse 
protection. The product must provide rapid and spot-free 
drying on all types of wares. - SOLID

Ecolab Solid 
Brilliance 2-

2lb. 6125395
150 2-2.5 lb. 22857 21028.5 No Bid -$                        125.45$  0.0055$                17,312.15$          

5 ALT1 Rinse Aid - LIQUID Auto-Chlor 206 150 5 gallon pail 19200 21028.5 89.95$         0.0047$                14,777.4498$   
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7

Concentrated  LIQUID emulsion laundry break and detergent 
booster containing the strongest built liquid alkali available. 
Product should be dispensed through a microprocessor-
controlled automatic injection system.

Ecolab Item 
#16558 or 

Collin County 
approved 

equal

46 288 No Bid -$                        

7 ALT1 Opticlean V Alkali Laundry Builder - LIQUID Auto-Chlor 603 46 5 gallon pail 320 288 84.00$         0.2625$                3,477.6000$     

7 ALT1 Ecolab Tri-Star Break III Xtra 1-5 Gal 6116558 - LIQUID Ecolab 46 5 gallon pail 256 288 97.23$    0.3798$                5,031.65$            

10

A SOLID non-abrasive cleaning material suitable for cleaning 
the toughest baked on food soils on pots and pans. Product 
shall be suitable to be used as an effective pot and pan 
presoak and shall be designed for use in all water conditions. 
The dispensing unit shall be attached to the sink faucet.

Ecolab Solitaire 
or Collin 
County 

approved 
equal

125 2-5 lb. 213 266.5 No Bid -$                        71.92$    0.3377$                11,248.05$          

10 ALT1 Pan Blaster Professional - LIQUID Auto-Chlor 297 125 5 gallon pail 320 266.5 59.75$         0.1867$                6,220.0684$     

TOTAL: 302.81$  0.7581$                23,696.7568$        549.00$      1.6811$                82,949.3910$   669.29$  1.5318$                62,887.69$         

6 Condensed POWDERED bleach additive to be used daily to 
brighten whites.  (Product put manually into empty washer)

Ecolab Stain 
Blaster Powder 

Pak I 12-
1.20lb. 

6100909

135 12-1.2 lb. 6 10 No Bid -$                   53.55$    8.9250$                12,048.75$          

6 ALT1
P&G PROFESSIONAL TIDE PROTREAT STAIN REMOVAL 
POWDERED; EACH BOX TO BE ADDED TO LAUNDRY LOAD 
WHEN REQUIRED TO REMOVE STAINS

Procter & 
Gamble 

Professional
PGC51046 135 14 box/case 14 10 49.14$    3.5100$                4,738.5000$          

8
Lime remover used to remove and cut residue, film, stains and 
scale on washable surfaces. Product will be used in a spray-
type bottle. No dispenser is required. - LIQUID

Ecolab Lime-A-
Way 6101131 
4-1Gal (New 

Product Code)

200
4-1 gallon; 
dilutes into 

512 gals
512 373.3333 39.55$    0.0772$                5,767.71$            

8 ALT1 PROCTER & GAMBLE PROFESSIONAL TIDE MULTI-PURPOSE 
STAIN REMOVER QT 3PK - LIQUID

Procter & 
Gamble 

Professional
200 3 pak-32 oz 

bottle
96 373.3333 33.00$    0.3438$                25,666.6644$        

8 ALT1 D-Scale - LIQUID Auto-Chlor 200 4-1 gallon RTU 512 373.3333 69.95$         0.1366$                10,201.0408$   

9

Grease cutter capable of removing oils, grease and grease 
build-up from ovens, grills, etc., without damage to surfaces. 
Product will be used in a spray bottle. No dispenser is required. 
- LIQUID

Ecolab 
Greasecutter 

#19513 or 
Collin County 

approved 
equal

225 4-1 gallon 512 5760 34.05$    0.0665$                86,189.06$          

9 ALT1 OVEN & GRILL CLEANER; SPARTAN CHEMICAL - LIQUID
Spartan 

Chemical
225 12-32 oz 

bottles/case
384 5760 38.28$    0.0997$                129,195.0000$      

9 ALT1 D-Grease - LIQUID Auto-Chlor 225
4-1 gallon - 4 
oz to 1 gallon 

water
16384 5760 64.60$         0.0039$                5,109.9609$     

11 Laundry POWDERED special detergent and pre-soak for 
manual application. (Product manually put into empty washer)

Ecolab No. 
Perma Brite 
#10391 or 

Collin County 
approved 

equal

9 45 lb. box 240 242.3333 62.93$    0.2622$                571.88$               

11 ALT1 NICE & CLEAN POWDERED LAUNDRY DETERGENT; 50# BOX Arcot 9 50 lb. box 267 242.3333 27.94$    0.1046$                228.2290$             

11 ALT1 Heavy Duty Built Detergent - LIQUID Auto-Chlor 9 55 lb. box 220 242.3333 95.25$         0.4330$                944.2737$        

TOTAL: 148.36$  4.0581$                159,828.3933$     229.80$      0.5735$                16,255.2754$   190.08$  9.3310$                104,577.40$       

PRODUCTS THAT USE AUTOMATIC DISPENSERS

PRODUCTS THAT DON'T USE AUTOMATIC DISPENSERS
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