IFB 2018-288 Road Materials, Emulsified Asphalt

Primary
Secondary
Wright Asphalt Products
Ergon Asphalt & & P .
] Company (Wright Asphalt
Emulsions, Inc.
Products Company LLC)
Price per Price per
Gallon | $1,650,460.00| Gallon $ 754,827.00
Line#  Description ESTQTY| UOM|  Unit Extended Unit Extended
1 CRS-2TR --- Delivered 15000 gallon No Bid S 2.4385 S 36,577.50
1-ALT-1 CWE-2
1 Please state if there is a minimum number of gallons
for deli f thi duct.
or delivery of this produc Yes
1 If there is a minimum number of gallons, please state
that number. 5400
Please state the cost per gallon for Collin County to pick
1 . .
up this product at your plant location. S 2.15
1 Plant Location Add ) 1505 Custer Road,
ant tocation Address: Brownwood, TX 76801
1 Approximate Distance from McKinney, TX 75071 195 Miles
2 CRS-2 --- Delivered 165000 gallon}] S 2.34 $386,100.00§ S 2.3385 S 385,852.50

2-ALT-1 CWE-2
5 Please state if there is a minimum number of gallons
for delivery of this product.
5 If there is a minimum number of gallons, please state
that number.
5 Please state the cost per gallon for Collin County to pick

up this product at your plant location.

2 Plant Location Address:

INo minimum, although
freight is based on a full
transport load of 5,500
fgallons.

A full transport load is 5,500
Jeallons.

S 220

1600 Minton Road, Saginaw,
Texas 76179 (Rates may
vary from any other

Yes
5400

$ 2.05

1505 Custer Road,
Brownwood, TX 76801

llocations.)
2 Approximate Distance from McKinney, TX 75071 61 miles 195 Miles
3 CRS-2H --- Delivered 400000 gallon] S 2.34 $936,000.00] No Bid

3-ALT-1 CWE-2
3 Please state if there is a minimum number of gallons
for delivery of this product.
3 If there is a minimum number of gallons, please state
that number.
3 Please state the cost per gallon for Collin County to pick

up this product at your plant location.

3 Plant Location Address:

INo minimum, although
freight is based on a full
transport load of 5,500
fgallons.

A full transport load is 5,500
fgallons.

S 2.20

J600 Minton Road, Saginaw,
Texas 76179 (Rates may
vary from any other

flocations.)
3 Approximate Distance from McKinney, TX 75071 61 miles
4 CSS-1H --- Delivered 17000 gallon] $ 2.39 $40,630.000 S 2.6385 S 44,854.50

4-ALT-1 P2 Stabilizer
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Please state if there is a minimum number of gallons
for delivery of this product.

If there is a minimum number of gallons, please state
that number.

Please state the cost per gallon for Collin County to pick
up this product at your plant location.

Plant Location Address:

INo minimum, although
freight is based on a full
transport load of 5,500
fgallons.

A full transport load is 5,500
Jeallons.

S 2.25
J600 Minton Road, Saginaw,

Texas 76179 (Rates may
vary from any other

Yes
5400

$ 2.35

1505 Custer Road,
Brownwood, TX 76801

flocations.)
Approximate Distance from McKinney, TX 75071 61 miles 195 Miles
Dust Control Oil, CSS-1S or Collin County
approved equal --- Delivered 105000 gallonf S 2.41 $253,050.00] No Bid

CSS-1 Dilute (30% CSS-1/70% H20) Diluted
products can not be returned

TR-Fog
P2 Lucky 7

Please state if there is a minimum number of gallons
for delivery of this product.

If there is a minimum number of gallons, please state
that number.

Please state the cost per gallon for Collin County to pick
up this product at your plant location.

Plant Location Address:

Approximate Distance from McKinney, TX 75071

INo minimum, although
freight is based on a full
transport load of 5,500
fgallons.

A full transport load is 5,500
Jeallons.

) 2.25

209 Robert Nance Road,
IMount Pleasant, TX 75455

102 miles

$ 27385 $287,542.50

Yes
5400

$ 2.45

1505 Custer Road,
Brownwood, TX 76801

195 Miles

AE-P --- Delivered

Please state if there is a minimum number of gallons
for delivery of this product.

If there is a minimum number of gallons, please state
that number.

Please state the cost per gallon for Collin County to pick
up this product at your plant location.

Plant Location Address:

Approximate Distance from McKinney, TX 75071

12000 gallon

S 2.89
INo minimum, although
freight is based on a full
transport load of 5,500
Jeallons.

A full transport load is 5,500
fgallons.

S 2.75
J600 Minton Road, Saginaw,
Texas 76179

61 miles

$34,680.00

No Bid

Please state the cost for per hour demurrage
charges beyond the three (3) hours included in
the quoted delivery cost. Please reference
Section 4.8.

$ 80.00 $80.00

$ 150.00 S 150.00




Supplier Notes:

Return freight is one-half of
the outgoing tariff. Pump
and hose charge is $90.00
per load.

Loads cancelled in transit will
be billed at cost. Returned
loads will be billed an
additional one-half outgoing
freight. Diluted loads can not
be returned. Returned
product requires notification
of Wright's Representative.
Pump Charge (if requested):
$150 per Truck per Load.
Layover (if requested): $650
per Truck per Night

Delivery in calendar days from date of order

1 day

1 day

Ergon has clarified that "freight is included in the delivered price per gallon and we have waived any minimum freight

charges as well as the pump charge." Bid price x gallons ordered

Cleveland Asphalt Products, Inc. bid Non responsive
P2 Emulsion Plants, LLC bid Non responsive
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