Tammi Benners
B R B = P S S

Subject: FW: Fw: Fence Reimbursement CR 636
Attachments: Fence Reimbursment -Clinard.pdf

From: kc [mailto:ckbustaO0@yahoo.com]

Sent: Monday, September 24, 2018 10:28 AM
To: Robert Evertson <revertson@co.collin.tx.us>
Subject: Re: Fw: Fence Reimbursement CR 636

Ok,

This is our request for fence reimbursement.
Can you please send to:

Kenneth Clinard

4174 FM 1777

Royse City, TX 75189

Thanks.

On Sep 20, 2018 8:01 PM, keith clinard wrote:

----- Forwarded Message -----

From: Robert Evertson

To: 'keith clinard'

Sent: Thursday, September 20, 2018 8:33 AM
Subject: Fence Reimbursement CR 636

Keith,
Please send an E mail requesting a fence reimbursement for my records .
Thank you,



