
Award - Bid No. 2014-122 Renewal
Supplies: Jail and IPersonal Inmate

ICS Bob Barker Co. Tabb Textiles Victory Supply
Line Item  Title Price UOM Price UOM Price UOM Price UOM Note:

 2014-122--01-01 PILLOW CASES $0.70 each  $1.78 each  $0.63 each  No Bid each  
 2014-122--01-07 TOWELS:BATH TURKISH, LIGHT GRAY, 20" X 40" $1.73 each  $1.06 each   No Bid each  $0.79 each  
 2014-122--01-08 WASH CLOTHS: WHITE, 12" x 12" $0.18 each  $0.16 each  $0.19 each  $0.15 each  
 2014-122--01-09 SUICIDE BLANKET:54" X 80" $73.00 each  $64.42 each   No Bid each  No Bid each  
 2014-122--01-10 BLANKET:BED 62'' x 80'' $5.75 each  $5.98 each  $5.75 each  $5.49 each  
 2014-122--01-11 BLANKET:BED, 66" x 90" $8.50 each  $4.91 each  $5.15 each  $4.69 each  
2014-122-01-13 MATTRESS, SEALED SEAM CLEAR POLY SCRIM, 25" X 75" X 4" $49.50 each  $65.86 each   No Bid each  $58.60 each  

ICS Bob Barker Co. Tabb Textiles Victory Supply
Line Item Price UOM Price UOM Price UOM Price UOM Note:

 2014-122--02-01 DETENTION SUIT - :GREEN, ORANGE, RED,  or WHITE SHORT SLEEVE, S-XL $12.60 each  $11.12 each  No Bid each   No Bid each  

 2014-122--02-02 DETENTION SUIT:GREEN, ,ORANGE, RED,  or WHITE SHORT SLEEVE, XXL $14.08 each  $11.12 each  No Bid each   No Bid each  

 2014-122--02-03 DETENTION SUIT:GREEN, ORANGE, RED,  or WHITE SHORT SLEEVE, XXXL $15.30 each  $11.12 each  No Bid each   No Bid each  

 2014-122--02-04 DETENTION SUIT:GREEN, ORANGE, RED,  or WHITE SHORT SLEEVE, 4X $19.80 each  $11.97 each  No Bid each   No Bid each  

 2014-122--02-05 DETENTION SUIT;GREEN, ORANGE, RED,  or WHITE SHORT SLEEVE, 5X $18.90 each  $11.97 each  No Bid each   No Bid each  

 2014-122--02-06 DETENTION SUIT:GREEN, ORANGE, RED,  or WHITE SHORT SLEEVE, 6X $19.80 each  $12.05 each  No Bid each   No Bid each  

 2014-122--02-07 DETENTION SUIT:GREEN, ORANGE, RED,  or WHITE SHORT SLEEVE, 7X $20.70 each  $12.57 each  No Bid each   No Bid each  

 2014-122--02-08 DETENTION SUIT, GREEN, ORANGE, RED,  or WHITE SHORT SLEEVE, 8X $21.60 each  $13.08 each  No Bid each   No Bid each  

 2014-122--02-27 DETENTION SUIT PANT:BLUE OR YELLOW ELASTIC WAIST, S-XL $7.65 each  $9.15 each  No Bid each  $4.62 each  

 2014-122--02-28 DETENTION SUIT PANT:BLUE OR YELLOW ELASTIC WAIST, XXL $7.65 each  $9.15 each  No Bid each  $4.62 each  

 2014-122--02-29 DETENTION SUIT PANT:BLUE OR YELLOW ELASTIC WAIST, XXXL $7.65 each  $10.37 each  No Bid each  $4.94 each  

 2014-122--02-30 DETENTION SUIT PANT:BLUE, OR YELLOW ELASTIC WAIST, 4X $11.25 each  $10.37 each  No Bid each  $5.28 each  

 2014-122--02-31 DETENTION SUIT PANT:BLUE OR YELLOW ELASTIC WAIST, 5X $12.15 each  $10.37 each  No Bid each  $5.58 each  

 2014-122--02-32 DETENTION SUIT PANT:BLUE OR YELLOW ELASTIC WAIST, 6X $13.05 each  $10.37 each  No Bid each  $5.98 each  

 2014-122--02-33 DETENTION SUIT PANT:BLUE OR YELLOW ELASTIC WAIST, 7X $13.95 each  $13.42 each  No Bid each  $5.98 each  

 2014-122--02-34 DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE OR YELLOW V-NECK, S-XL $6.98 each  $7.01 each  No Bid each  $4.98 each  

 2014-122--02-35 DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUEOR YELLOW V-NECK, XXL $6.98 each  $7.35 each  No Bid each  $4.98 each  

 2014-122--02-36 DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE OR YELLOW V-NECK, XXXL $6.98 each  $7.81 each  No Bid each  $5.29 each  

 2014-122--02-37 DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE OR YELLOW, V-NECK, 4X $8.55 each  $8.26 each  No Bid each  $5.56 each  

 2014-122--02-38 DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE OR YELLOW, V-NECK, 5X $9.45 each  $8.70 each  No Bid each  $5.86 each  

 2014-122--02-39 DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE OR YELLOW, V-NECK, 6X $10.35 each  $9.15 each  No Bid each  $6.13 each  

 2014-122--02-40 DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE OR YELLOW, V-NECK, 7X $11.25 each  $12.08 each  No Bid each  $6.13 each  

 2014-122--02-51 MEN'S COTTON T-SHIRTS, WHITE , S,M,XL $1.60 each  $1.65 each  No Bid each  $1.35 each  

 2014-122--02-52 MEN'S COTTON T-SHIRTS, WHITE , XXL $24.50 pkg $40.20 pkg No Bid each  $31.80 pkg

 2014-122--02-53 MEN'S COTTON T-SHIRTS, WHITE , XXXL $29.00 pkg $49.80 pkg No Bid each  $31.80 pkg

 2014-122--02-54 MEN'S COTTON BRIEFS, WHITE, S-XL $0.86 each  $2.08 each  No Bid each  $0.71 each  

 SECTION#1: BEDDING AND TOWELS

SECTION #2: INMATE CLOTHING



Award - Bid No. 2014-122 Renewal
Supplies: Jail and IPersonal Inmate

 2014-122--02-55 MEN'S COTTON BRIEFS, WHITE, XXL $0.97 each  $2.86 each  No Bid each  $0.77 each  

 2014-122--02-56 MEN'S COTTON BRIEFS, WHITE, XXXL $1.07 each  $2.86 each  No Bid each  $0.81 each  

 2014-122--02-57 BOY'S COTTON BRIEFS, WHITE, S-XL $13.97 pkg $25.01 pkg No Bid each  $8.97 pkg

 2014-122--02-58 GIRL'S COTTON BRIEFS, WHITE, S-XL $10.28 pkg $8.98 pkg No Bid each  $9.87 pkg

 2014-122--02-59 WOMEN'S COTTON BRIEFS, WHITE, 5-7 $0.77 each  $0.57 each  No Bid each  $0.48 each  

 2014-122--02-60 WOMEN'S COTTON BRIEFS, WHITE, 8-10 $0.81 each  $0.66 each  No Bid each  $0.52 each  

 2014-122--02-61 WOMEN'S COTTON BRIEFS, WHITE, 11-12 $0.86 each  $0.70 each  No Bid each  $0.61 each  

 2014-122--02-62 WOMEN'S COTTON BRIEFS, WHITE, 13-14 $0.91 each  $0.75 each  No Bid each  $0.63 each  

 2014-122--02-63 WOMEN'S BRA: WHITE, 34-44, A CUP $2.42 each  $1.36 each  No Bid each  No Bid each  

 2014-122--02-64 WOMEN'S BRA: WHITE, 34-44, B CUP $2.42 each  $1.36 each  No Bid each  No Bid each  

 2014-122--02-65 WOMEN'S BRA: WHITE, 34-44, C CUP $2.42 each  $1.36 each  No Bid each  No Bid each  

 2014-122--02-66 WOMEN'S BRA: WHITE, 34-44, D CUP $2.78 each  $1.36 each  No Bid each  No Bid each  

 2014-122--02-67 WOMEN'S BRA: WHITE, 34-44, E CUP $2.94 each  $1.36 each  No Bid each  No Bid each  

 2014-122--02-71 SOCKS:CREW, CALF LENGTH STYLE $0.48 each  $0.45 each  No Bid each  $0.40 each  

 2014-122--02-76 CAPS, BASEBALL: 3/4 OPEN MESH $1.99 each  $1.95 each  No Bid each  $1.96 each  

 2014-122--02-77 SUICIDE SUIT:ADJUSTABLE SMOCK, 34"-52" CHEST SIZE $105.00 each  $68.50 each  No Bid each  $56.98 each  

 2014-122--02-78 SUICIDE SUIT:ADJUSTABLE SMOCK, 44"-56" CHEST SIZE $105.00 each  $72.10 each  No Bid each  $56.98 each  

 2014-122--02-79 EVA SNEAKER, EVA-SNK-OR, Sizes small through 3XL, Color Orange $4.15 each  $3.48 each  No Bid each  $2.94 each  

 2014-122--02-80 Sports Bra - Gray- Size 32-38 $2.98 each  $2.53 each  No Bid each  $1.64 each  

 2014-122--02-81 Sports Bra - Gray - Size 40-48 $3.50 each  $2.79 each  No Bid each  $1.71 each  

 2014-122--02-82 Sports Bra - Gray - Size 50-54 $3.72 each  $3.04 each  No Bid each  $1.83 each  

 2014-122--02-83 DETENTION SUIT PANT:BLUE OR ORANGE STRIPED ELASTIC WAIST, S-XL $7.65 each  $9.15 each  No Bid each  $4.62 each  

 2014-122--02-84 DETENTION SUIT PANT:BLUE OR ORANGE STRIPED ELASTIC  WAIST, XXL $7.65 each  $9.15 each  No Bid each  $4.62 each  

 2014-122--02-85 DETENTION SUIT PANT:BLUE OR ORANGE STRIPED ELASTIC  WAIST, XXXL $7.65 each  $10.37 each  No Bid each  $4.94 each  

 2014-122--02-86 DETENTION SUIT PANT:BLUE OR ORANGE STRIPED ELASTIC WAIST, 4X $12.15 each  $10.37 each  No Bid each  $5.28 each  

 2014-122--02-87 DETENTION SUIT PANT:BLUE OR ORANGE STRIPED ELASTIC WAIST, 5X $13.05 each  $10.37 each  No Bid each  $5.58 each  

 2014-122--02-88 DETENTION SUIT PANT:BLUE OR ORANGE STRIPED ELASTIC WAIST, 6X $13.95 each  $10.37 each  No Bid each  $5.98 each  

 2014-122--02-89 DETENTION SUIT PANT: BLUE OR ORANGE STRIPED ELASTIC WAIST, 7X $14.85 each  $13.42 each  No Bid each  $5.98 each  

 2014-122--02-90 DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE OR ORANGE STRIPED V-NECK, S-XL $6.98 each  $7.01 each  No Bid each  $4.98 each  

 2014-122--02-91 DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE OR ORANGE STRIPED V-NECK, XXL $6.98 each  $7.35 each  No Bid each  $4.98 each  

 2014-122--02-92 DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE OR ORANGE STRIPED V-NECK, XXXL $6.98 each  $7.81 each  No Bid each  $5.29 each  

 2014-122--02-93 DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE OR ORANGE STRIPED, V-NECK, 4X $9.45 each  $8.26 each  No Bid each  $5.56 each  

 2014-122--02-94 DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE OR ORANGE STRIPED, V-NECK, 5X $10.35 each  $8.70 each  No Bid each  $5.86 each  

 2014-122--02-95 DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE OR ORANGE STRIPED, V-NECK, 6X $11.25 each  $9.15 each  No Bid each  $6.13 each  
 2014-122--02-96 DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE OR ORANGE STRIPED, V-NECK, 7X $12.15 each  $12.08 each  No Bid each  $6.13 each  

ICS Bob Barker Co. Tabb Textiles Victory Supply
Line Item Price UOM Price UOM Price UOM Price UOM Note:   

 2014-122--03-01 COMB:5" PLASTIC, NON BREAKABLE $0.016 each  $0.029 each  No Bid each  No Bid each  
 2014-122--03-02 DEODORANT - Maxium Security FD-05 $0.170 each  $0.305 each  No Bid each  No Bid each  
 2014-122--03-03 DEODORANT  - .5 oz $1.180 each  $0.700 each  No Bid each  No Bid each  

SECTION #3: MISCELLANEOUS



Award - Bid No. 2014-122 Renewal
Supplies: Jail and IPersonal Inmate

 2014-122--03-05 SANITARY NAPKINS:SUPER, BELTLESS $0.160 each  $0.051 each  No Bid each  $0.056 each  
 2014-122--03-07 SHAMPOO:LICE TREATMENT KIT $1.614 each  $1.800 each  No Bid each  No Bid each  
 2014-122--03-14 NET LAUNDRY BAG: 24" X 36" $3.850 each  $2.658 each  No Bid each  $2.460 each  
 2014-122--03-15 ID BANDS:CLINCHER, IV PHOTO WHITE, METAL FASTENER $0.329 each  $0.340 each  No Bid each  $0.350 each  
2014-122-03-16 INDIGENT KIT (PACKGED IN PLASTIC BAG) TO INCLUDE THE FOLLOWING: 1 

EA - .6 OZ TOOTHPASTE, 1 EA - SHORT HANDLE TOOTHBRUSH, 1 EA - 5 
COMB, 1 EA 2OZ SHAMPOO, 1 EA FLEX PEN.

$0.620 each  $1.480 each  No Bid each  $0.680 each  
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