Zones, LLC Lenovo, Inc. GTS Technology Solutions Inc.
Total Price | $111,132.00| Total Price| $745,069.00 Total Price $1,000,954.24
Line # Description Mfgr Mfgno Qry uom Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
1 GTS Technology Solutions
Tablet - Dell Latitude 5290 2-in-1 XCTO, 17 Dell Latitude 5290 2 - in - 1 XCTO, 17 150 each No Bid $1,857.00| $278,550.00 $1,906.33 $285,949.50 Inc.
1.1 |1ablet Dell 5290 2-in-1 XCTO 1 each $1,676.00 $1,555.50
1.2 |pocking Station Dell 450-AFGM 1 each $181.00 $143.00
1.3 [Keyboard Cover Dell 580-AGY! 1 each No Bid $94.20
1.4 Istylus/Pen Dell 750-AATY 1 each No Bid $45.63
1.5 Absolute Control (Pr ) Software License - 3 year Absolute 1 each No Bid $38.00
1.6 |Collin County custom image - Installed 1 each No Bid 30.00
2 GTS Technology Solutions
Dell 7390 Laptop 150 each No Bid $1,534.00| $230,100.00 $1,858.05 $278,707.50 Inc.
2ALT1 [pel| Latitude 7390 Standard (nota 2 in 1) Dell 210-ANQM 150 each $1,674.50
2.1 Laptop 7390 2-in-1 XCTO Base Dell 210-ANRD 1 each $1,353.00 $1,601.42
2.2 Dock - WD15 with 130W Adapter Dell 450-AFGM 1 each $181.00 $143.00
2.3 |stylus/Pen Dell 750-AATY 1 each No Bid 45.63
2.4 Absolute Control (Pr ) Software License - 3 year Absolute 1 each No Bid $38.00
25 Collin County custom image - Installed 1 each No Bid 30.00
Dell or Collin
TS Technol, luti
3 kpack - Dell Urban Backpack - 15 Ly 460-BBYL 1 each No Bid 19.00 $19.00 $31.59 $31.59 6T Technology Solutions
approved Inc.
equal
VEIBIECT GTS Technology Soluti
4 approved ecl nc: ogy Solutions
Rolling Laptop Case equal TBROO3US 1 each No Bid No Bid $57.70 $57.70 ne.
5 Desktop - Optiplex 3060 Micro Form Factor XCTO, i5 Dell 300 each No Bid $788.00( $236,400.00 $795.60 $238,680.00 Lenovo, Inc.
5.1 [Desktop Dell 338-BKYO 1 each $685.00 $723.85
5.2 |Micro AIO Stand MFS CUS KIT Dell 452-BCQC 1 each $103.00 $71.75
6 24 inch Monitors ViewSonic VA24525M 900 each $115.49 | $103,941.00| No Bid $131.30 $118,170.00 Zones, LLC
7 GTS Technology Solutions
4 port USB hubs 3.0 Hub with Individual Power Switches and LEDs Sabrent N/A 150 each No Bid No Bid $19.50 $2,925.00 Inc.
8 GTS Technology Solutions
6x Slim Portable USB 3.0 Bd/DVD/CD Burner Pioneer BDR-XD05S 150 each No Bid No Bid $132.25 $19,837.50 Inc.
9 6' Display Port to Display Port Cable 300 each $8.58 $2,574.00| No Bid $10.40 $3,120.00 Zones, LLC
10 HDMI to VGA Adapter 300 each $15.39 $4,617.00 No Bid $20.65 $6,195.00 Zones, LLC
Tripp Lite P/N P131-000-A
1 GTS Technology Solutions
Mobile Data Computer 15 each No Bid No Bid $3,152.03 $47,280.45 Inc.
11ALTL |pell Latitude 5424 15 each $2,655.58
11.1  |pell Latitude 5420 Rugged, CTO 1 each $2,515.98
1.2 GTS Technology Solutions
3 Vehicle Dock for Dell Latitude 5420 Havis DS-DELL-402 1 each $636.05 Inc.
;t}a\;e the cooperative contract name this quote is offered under. (i.e. TX DIR, TXMAS, TCPN, National IPA, Buyboard, TIPS/TAPS, etc.) If none, answer TIPS 180306 TXDIR DIR
State the cooperative contract number this quote is offered under. If none, answer N/A. TIPS 180306 DIR-TSO-3808 DIR-TSO-3763

Please provide the website URL for the cooperative contract this quote is offered under. If none, answer N/A.

www.tips-usa.com

https://dir.texas.gov/View;
Search/Contracts-
Detail.aspx?contractnumb
er=DIR-TSO-3808

https://dir.texas.gov/View-
Search/Contracts-
Detail.aspx?contractnumber=DIR-TSO-
3763
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