
IFB 2018-263
Services: Body Repair And Painting For Light, Medium Heavy Duty Vehicles

El Dorado Collision 
(El Dorado Motors)

Maaco Collision 
Repair & Auto 

Painting (Collision 
Repair Unit 3, LLC)

Bob Tomes Ford

Line # Description QTY UOM Unit Unit Unit
1 Light Duty Vehicle: Body Repair Labor 1 hour $45.00 $39.50 $46.00

2
Light Duty Vehicle: Aluminum Body Repair 
Labor 1 hour $45.00 $39.50 $85.00

3 Light Duty Vehicle: Frame Repair Labor 1 hour $45.00 $42.50 $46.00
4 Light Duty Vehicle: Glass Repair Labor 1 hour $45.00 $39.50 $46.00
5 Light Duty Vehicle: Mechanical Labor 1 hour $128.00 $95.00 $85.00
6 Light Duty Vehicle: Paint Technician Labor 1 hour $45.00 $39.50 $46.00
7 Light Duty Vehicle: Paint Supplies Labor 1 hour $37.00 $35.00 $36.00

8
Light Duty Vehicle: Discount Off OEM 
Replacement Parts-Domestic 1 percent 0% 5% 0%

9
Light Duty Vehicle: Discount Off OEM 
Replacement Parts-Import 1 percent 0% 5% 0%

10
Light Duty Vehicle: Discount Off 
Aftermarket/Used Replacement Parts 1 percent 0% 8% 0%

11 Light Duty Vehicle: Towing 1 lump sum $125.00 No Bid $150.00
12 Medium Duty Vehicle: Body Repair Labor 1 hour No Bid $46.50 *
13 Medium Duty Vehicle: Frame Repair Labor 1 hour No Bid $50.00 *
14 Medium Duty Vehicle: Glass Repair Labor 1 hour No Bid $39.50 *
15 Medium Duty Vehicle: Mechanical Labor 1 hour No Bid $95.00 *

16
Medium Duty Vehicle: Paint Technician 
Labor 1 hour No Bid $39.50 *

17 Medium Duty Vehicle: Paint Supplies Labor 1 hour No Bid $35.00 *

18
Medium Duty Vehicle: Discount Off OEM 
Replacement Parts 1 percent No Bid 5% *

19
Medium Duty Vehicle: Discount Off 
Aftermarket/Used Replacement Parts 1 percent No Bid 8% *

20 Medium Duty Vehicle: Towing 1 lump sum No Bid No Bid *
21 Heavy Duty Vehicle: Body Repair Labor 1 hour No Bid $65.00 *
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22 Heavy Duty Vehicle: Frame Repair Labor 1 hour No Bid $75.00 *
23 Heavy Duty Vehicle: Glass Repair Labor 1 hour No Bid $39.50 *
24 Heavy Duty Vehicle: Mechanical Labor 1 hour No Bid $95.00 *

25 Heavy Duty Vehicle: Paint Technician Labor 1 hour No Bid $39.50 *
26 Heavy Duty Vehicle: Paint Supplies Labor 1 hour No Bid $35.00 *

27
Heavy Duty Vehicle: Discount Off OEM 
Replacement Parts-Domestic 1 percent No Bid 5% *

28
Heavy Duty Vehicle: Discount Off 
Aftermarket/Used Replacement Parts 1 percent No Bid 8% *

29 Heavy Duty Vehicle: Towing 1 lump sum No Bid No Bid

Primary Award
Secondary Award
No Award

Red River Truck Repair is non-responsive
*Bob Tomes Ford is non-responsive for
Medium Duty and Heavy Duty Vehicles




