Example 1
Item No.

2018-263-01-01
2018-263-01-02
2018-263-01-03
2018-263-01-04
2018-263-01-05
2018-263-01-06
2018-263-01-07
2018-263-01-08
2018-253-01-09
2018-263-01-10
2018-263-01-11

Example 2
Item No.

2018-263-01-01
2018-263-01-02
2018-263-01-03
2018-263-01-04
2018-263-01-05
2018-263-01-06
2018-263-01-07
2018-263-01-08
2018-253-01-09
2018-263-01-10
2018-263-01-11

Light Duty Trucks
Light Duty

Brief Desc

Metal

Aluminum

Frame

Glass
Mechanical

Paint

Paint Supplies
OEM Domes Disc
OEM Import Disc
Aftermarket Disc
Towing

Miles @0.545/mi
Total Cost

Light Duty
Brief Desc

Metal

Aluminum

Frame

Glass
Mechanical

Paint

Paint Supplies
OEM Domes Disc
OEM Import Disc
Aftermarket Disc
Towing

Miles @0.545/mi
Total Cost

#hrsor$

35.2

_\wom

6.4
22.3

$2,000
$0
$0

#hrsor$

12.5
2
$1,100
$0
$0

EVALUATION OF BID NO. 2018-263
Note: Towing charges were not considered in this evaluation

1/2/2019
El Dorado Total Maaco Total Bob Tomes Total
rate rate rate
$45 $1,584.00 $39.50 $1,390.40 $46 $1,619.20
$45 $0.00 $39.50 $0.00 $85 $0.00
$45 $135.00 $42.50 $127.50 $46 $138.00
$45 $45.00 $39.50 $39.50 $46 $46.00
$128 $819.20 $95.00 $608.00 $85 $544.00
$45 $1,003.50 $39.50 $880.85 $46 $1,025.80
$37 $74.00 $35.00 $70.00 $36 $72.00
0% $2,000.00 5% $1,900.00 0% $2,000.00
0% $0.00 5% $0.00 0% $0.00
0% $0.00 8% $0.00 0% $0.00
$125 n/b $150.00
2 $1.09 40.5 $22.07 8.3 $4.52
$5,661.79 $5,038.32 $5,449.52
El Dorado Total Maaco Total Bob Tomes Total
rate rate rate
$45 $1,147.50 $39.50 $1,007.25 $46 $1,173.00
$45 $0.00 $39.50 $0.00 $85 $0.00
$45 $0.00 $42.50 $0.00 $46 $0.00
$45 $0.00 $39.50 $0.00 $46 $0.00
$128 $512.00 $95.00 $380.00 $85 $340.00
$45 $562.50 $39.50 $493.75 $46 $575.00
$37 $74.00 $35.00 $70.00 $36 $72.00
0% $1,100.00 5% $1,045.00 0% $1,100.00
0% $0.00 5% $0.00 0% $0.00
0% $0.00 8% $0.00 0% $0.00
$125 n/b n/b $150.00
2 $1.09 40.5 $22.07 8.3 $4.52
$3,397.09 $3,018.07 $3,264.52
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Example 3
Iltem No.

2018-263-01-01
2018-263-01-02
2018-263-01-03
2018-263-01-04
2018-263-01-05
2018-263-01-06
2018-263-01-07
2018-263-01-08
2018-253-01-09
2018-263-01-10
2018-263-01-11

Example 4
Item No.

2018-263-01-01
2018-263-01-02
2018-263-01-03
2018-263-01-04
2018-263-01-05
2018-263-01-06
2018-263-01-07
2018-263-01-08
2018-253-01-09
2018-263-01-10
2018-263-01-11

Light Duty
Brief Desc

Metal

Aluminum

Frame

Glass
Mechanical

Paint

Paint Supplies
OEM Domes Disc
OEM Import Disc
Aftermarket Disc
Towing

Miles @0.545/mi
Total Cost

Light Duty
Brief Desc

Metal

Aluminum

Frame

Glass
Mechanical

Paint

Paint Supplies
OEM Domes Disc
OEM Import Disc
Aftermarket Disc
Towing

Miles @0.545/mi
Total Cost

#hrsor$

29.7
0
12.4
1
4.8

16.5
2
$5,043
$0
$0

#hrsor$

13.6
2
$0
$0
$1,066

El Dorado Total Maaco Total Bob Tomes Total
rate rate rate
$45 $1,336.50 $39.50 $1,173.15 $46 $1,366.20
$45 $0.00 $39.50 $0.00 $85 $0.00
$45 $558.00 $42.50 $527.00 $46 $570.40
$45 $45.00 $39.50 $39.50 $46 $46.00
$128 $614.40 $95.00 $456.00 $85 $408.00
$45 $742.50 $39.50 $651.75 $46 $759.00
$37 $74.00 $35.00 $70.00 $36 $72.00
0% $5,043.00 5% $4,790.85 0% $5,043.00
0% $0.00 5% $0.00 0% $0.00
0% $0.00 8% $0.00 0% $0.00
$125 n/b $150.00
2 $1.09 40.5 $22.07 8.3 $4.52
$8,414.49 $7,730.32 $8,269.12
El Dorado Total Maaco Total Bob Tomes Total
rate rate rate
$45 $594.00 $39.50 $521.40 $46 $607.20
$45 $0.00 $39.50 $0.00 $85 $0.00
$45 $0.00 $42.50 $0.00 $46 $0.00
$45 $45.00 $39.50 $39.50 $46 $46.00
$128 $0.00 $95.00 $0.00 $85 $0.00
$45 $612.00 $39.50 $537.20 $46 $625.60
$37 $74.00 $35.00 $70.00 $36 $72.00
0% $0.00 5% $0.00 0% $0.00
0% $0.00 5% $0.00 0% $0.00
0% $1,066.00 8% $980.72 0% $1,066.00
$125 n/b $150.00
2 $1.09 40.5 $22.07 8.3 $4.52
$2,392.09 $2,170.89 $2,421.32
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Example 5
Iltem No.

2018-263-01-01
2018-263-01-02
2018-263-01-03
2018-263-01-04
2018-263-01-05
2018-263-01-06
2018-263-01-07
2018-263-01-08
2018-253-01-09
2018-263-01-10
2018-263-01-11

Example 6
Iltem No.

2018-263-01-01
2018-263-01-02
2018-263-01-03
2018-263-01-04
2018-263-01-05
2018-263-01-06
2018-263-01-07
2018-263-01-08
2018-253-01-09
2018-263-01-10
2018-263-01-11

Light Duty
Brief Desc

Metal

Aluminum

Frame

Glass
Mechanical

Paint

Paint Supplies
OEM Domes Disc
OEM Import Disc
Aftermarket Disc
Towing

Miles @0.545/mi
Total Cost

Light Duty
Brief Desc

Metal

Aluminum

Frame

Glass
Mechanical
Paint

Paint Supplies
OEM Domes Disc
OEM Import Disc
Aftermarket Disc
Towing

Miles @0.545/mi
Total Cost

#hrsor$

-
N

aoonNOo

$2,600

$0

#hrsor$

0 WwWo oo,

2
$1,174
$0
$0

El Dorado Total Maaco Total Bob Tomes Total
rate rate rate
$45 $540.00 $39.50 $474.00 $46 $552.00
$45 $0.00 $39.50 $0.00 $85 $0.00
$45 $90.00 $42.50 $85.00 $46 $92.00
$45 $0.00 $39.50 $0.00 $46 $0.00
$128 $640.00 $95.00 $475.00 $85 $425.00
$45 $225.00 $39.50 $197.50 $46 $230.00
$37 $74.00 $35.00 $70.00 $36 $72.00
0% $2,600.00 5% $2,470.00 0% $2,600.00
0% $0.00 5% $0.00 0% $0.00
0% $0.00 8% $0.00 0% $0.00
$125 n/b $150.00
2 $1.09 40.5 $22.07 8.3 $4.52
$4,170.09 $3,793.57 $3,975.52
El Dorado Total Maaco Total Bob Tomes Total
rate rate rate
$45 $369.00 $39.50 $323.90 $46 $377.20
$45 $0.00 $39.50 $0.00 $85 $0.00
$45 $0.00 $42.50 $0.00 $46 $0.00
$45 $0.00 $39.50 $0.00 $46 $0.00
$128 $384.00 $95.00 $285.00 $85 $255.00
$45 $360.00 $39.50 $316.00 $46 $368.00
$37 $74.00 $35.00 $70.00 $36 $72.00
0% $1,174.00 5% $1,115.30 0% $1,174.00
0% $0.00 5% $0.00 0% $0.00
0% $0.00 8% $0.00 0% $0.00
$125 n/b $150.00
2 $1.09 40.5 $22.07 8.3 $4.52
$2,362.09 $2,132.27 $548.30 $2,250.72
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Example 7
Item No.

2018-263-01-01
2018-263-01-02
2018-263-01-03
2018-263-01-04
2018-263-01-05
2018-263-01-06
2018-263-01-07
2018-263-01-08
2018-253-01-09
2018-263-01-10
2018-263-01-11

Example 8
Iltem No.

2018-263-01-01
2018-263-01-02
2018-263-01-03
2018-263-01-04
2018-263-01-05
2018-263-01-06
2018-263-01-07
2018-263-01-08
2018-253-01-09
2018-263-01-10
2018-263-01-11

Light Duty
Brief Desc

Metal

Aluminum

Frame

Glass
Mechanical

Paint

Paint Supplies
OEM Domes Disc
OEM Import Disc
Aftermarket Disc
Towing

Miles @0.545/mi
Total Cost

Light Duty
Brief Desc

Metal

Aluminum

Frame

Glass
Mechanical

Paint

Paint Supplies
OEM Domes Disc
OEM Import Disc
Aftermarket Disc
Towing

Miles @0.545/mi
Total Cost

Light Duty

Total all examples Summary-Total

#hrsor$

0 O O O .

$1,174

$0

#hrsor$

0
103.6
40
0
3.6
29.7
2
$8,975
$0
$0

El Dorado Total Maaco Total Bob Tomes Total
rate rate rate
$45 $0.00 $39.50 $0.00 $46 $0.00
$45 $261.00 $39.50 $229.10 $85 $493.00
$45 $0.00 $42.50 $0.00 $46 $0.00
$45 $0.00 $39.50 $0.00 $46 $0.00
$128 $0.00 $95.00 $0.00 $85 $0.00
$45 $360.00 $39.50 $316.00 $46 $368.00
$37 $37.00 $35.00 $35.00 $36 $36.00
0% $1,174.00 5% $1,115.30 0% $1,174.00
0% $0.00 5% $0.00 0% $0.00
0% $0.00 8% $0.00 0% $0.00
$125 n/b $150.00
2 $1.09 40.5 $22.07 8.3 $4.52
$1,833.09 $1,717.47 $2,075.52
El Dorado Total Maaco Total Bob Tomes Total
rate rate rate
$45 $0.00 $39.50 $0.00 $46 $0.00
$45 $4,662.00 $39.50 $4,092.20 $85 $8,806.00
$45 $1,800.00 $42.50 $1,700.00 $46 $1,840.00
$45 $0.00 $39.50 $0.00 $46 $0.00
$128 $460.80 $95.00 $342.00 $85 $306.00
$45 $1,336.50 $39.50 $1,173.15 $46 $1,366.20
$37 $74.00 $35.00 $70.00 $36 $72.00
0% $8,975.00 5% $8,526.25 0% $8,975.00
0% $0.00 5% $0.00 0% $0.00
0% $0.00 8% $0.00 0% $0.00
$125 n/b $150.00
2 $1.09 40.5 $22.07 8.3 $4.52
$17,309.39 $15,925.67 $21,369.72
El Dorado Maaco Bob Tomes
$45,540 $41,527 $49,076

RECOMMEND PRIMARY AWARD TO LOW BIDDER-MAACO

RECOMMEND SECONDARY AWARD TO 2ND LOW -El DORADO
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Example 1
Item No.

2018-263-01-12
2018-263-01-13
2018-263-01-14
2018-263-01-15
2018-263-01-16
2018-263-01-17
2018-263-01-18
2018-263-01-19
2018-263-01-20

Example 2
Item No.

2018-263-01-12
2018-263-01-13
2018-263-01-14
2018-263-01-15
2018-263-01-16
2018-263-01-17
2018-263-01-18
2018-263-01-19
2018-263-01-20

Medium Duty Trucks

Medium Duty
Brief Desc

Body

Frame

Glass
Mechanical
Paint

Paint Supplies
OEM Domes Disc
Aftermarket Disc
Towing

Miles @0.545/mi
Total Cost

Medium Duty
Brief Desc

Body

Frame

Glass
Mechanical
Paint

Paint Supplies
OEM Domes Disc
Aftermarket Disc
Towing

Miles @0.545/mi
Total Cost

#hrsor$

35.2
1
1
6.4
22.3
2
$2,000
$0

#hrsor$

25.5
0
0
4
12.5
2
$1,100
$0

El Dorado Total Maaco Total Bob Tomes Total
rate rate rate
$0.00 $46.50 $1,636.80 $0.00
$0.00 $50.00 $50.00 $0.00
$0.00 $39.50 $39.50 $0.00
$0.00 $95.00 $608.00 $0.00
$0.00 $39.50 $880.85 $0.00
$0.00 $35.00 $70.00 $0.00
$0.00 5% $1,900.00 $0.00
$0.00 8% $0.00 $0.00
n/b
405 $22.07
NO BID $5,207.22 Incomplete Bid
El Dorado Total Maaco Total Bob Tomes Total
rate rate rate
$0.00 $46.50 $1,185.75 $0.00
$0.00 $50.00 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $39.50 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $95.00 $380.00 $0.00
$0.00 $39.50 $493.75 $0.00
$0.00 $35.00 $70.00 $0.00
$0.00 5% $1,045.00 $0.00
$0.00 8% $0.00 $0.00
n/b
405 $22.07
NO BID $3,196.57 Incomplete Bid
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Example 3
Item No.

2018-263-01-12
2018-263-01-13
2018-263-01-14
2018-263-01-15
2018-263-01-16
2018-263-01-17
2018-263-01-18
2018-263-01-19
2018-263-01-20

Example 4
Item No.

2018-263-01-12
2018-263-01-13
2018-263-01-14
2018-263-01-15
2018-263-01-16
2018-263-01-17
2018-263-01-18
2018-263-01-19
2018-263-01-20

Medium Duty
Brief Desc

Body

Frame

Glass
Mechanical
Paint

Paint Supplies
OEM Domes Disc
Aftermarket Disc
Towing

Miles @0.545/mi
Total Cost

Medium Duty
Brief Desc

Body

Frame

Glass
Mechanical
Paint

Paint Supplies
OEM Domes Disc
Aftermarket Disc
Towing

Miles @0.545/mi
Total Cost

#hrsor$

29.7
12.4
0
4.8
16.5
2
$5,043
$0

#hrsor$

13.3
0
0
0
14.6
1
$1,066
$0

El Dorado Total Maaco Total Bob Tomes Total
rate rate rate
$0.00 $46.50 $1,381.05 $0.00
$0.00 $50.00 $620.00 $0.00
$0.00 $39.50 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $95.00 $456.00 $0.00
$0.00 $39.50 $651.75 $0.00
$0.00 $35.00 $70.00 $0.00
$0.00 5% $4,790.85 $0.00
$0.00 8% $0.00 $0.00
n/b
405 $22.07
NO BID $7,991.72 Incomplete Bid
El Dorado Total Maaco Total Bob Tomes Total
rate rate rate
$0.00 $46.50 $618.45 $0.00
$0.00 $50.00 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $39.50 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $95.00 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $39.50 $576.70 $0.00
$0.00 $35.00 $35.00 $0.00
$0.00 5% $1,012.70 $0.00
$0.00 8% $0.00 $0.00
n/b
405 $22.07
NO BID $2,264.92 Incomplete Bid
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Example 5
Item No.

2018-263-01-12
2018-263-01-13
2018-263-01-14
2018-263-01-15
2018-263-01-16
2018-263-01-17
2018-263-01-18
2018-263-01-19
2018-263-01-20

Example 6
Item No.

2018-263-01-12
2018-263-01-13
2018-263-01-14
2018-263-01-15
2018-263-01-16
2018-263-01-17
2018-263-01-18
2018-263-01-19
2018-263-01-20

Medium Duty
Brief Desc

Body

Frame

Glass
Mechanical
Paint

Paint Supplies
OEM Domes Disc
Aftermarket Disc
Towing

Miles @0.545/mi
Total Cost

Medium Duty
Brief Desc

Body

Frame

Glass
Mechanical
Paint

Paint Supplies
OEM Domes Disc
Aftermarket Disc
Towing

Miles @0.545/mi
Total Cost

#hrsor$

27.9
12.4
0
4.8
5
1
$1,066
$0

#hrsor$

o w o o,

1
$0
$2,104

El Dorado Total Maaco Total Bob Tomes Total
rate rate rate
$0.00 $46.50 $1,297.35 $0.00
$0.00 $50.00 $620.00 $0.00
$0.00 $39.50 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $95.00 $456.00 $0.00
$0.00 $39.50 $197.50 $0.00
$0.00 $35.00 $35.00 $0.00
$0.00 5% $1,012.70 $0.00
$0.00 8% $0.00 $0.00
n/b
40.5 $22.07
NO BID $3,640.62 Incomplete Bid
El Dorado Total Maaco Total Bob Tomes Total
rate rate rate
$0.00 $46.50 $381.30 $0.00
$0.00 $50.00 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $39.50 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $95.00 $285.00 $0.00
$0.00 $39.50 $316.00 $0.00
$0.00 $35.00 $35.00 $0.00
$0.00 5% $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 8% $1,935.68 $0.00
n/b
40.5 $22.07
NO BID $2,975.05 Incomplete Bid
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Example 7
Item No.

2018-263-01-12
2018-263-01-13
2018-263-01-14
2018-263-01-15
2018-263-01-16
2018-263-01-17
2018-263-01-18
2018-263-01-19
2018-263-01-20

Example 8
Iltem No.

2018-263-01-12
2018-263-01-13
2018-263-01-14
2018-263-01-15
2018-263-01-16
2018-263-01-17
2018-263-01-18
2018-263-01-19
2018-263-01-20

Medium Duty
Brief Desc

Body

Frame

Glass
Mechanical
Paint

Paint Supplies
OEM Domes Disc
Aftermarket Disc
Towing

Miles @0.545/mi
Total Cost

Medium Duty
Brief Desc

Body

Frame

Glass
Mechanical
Paint

Paint Supplies
OEM Domes Disc
Aftermarket Disc
Towing

Miles @0.545/mi
Total Cost

Medium Duty

Total all examples Summary-Total

#hrsor$

103.6
40

3.6
29.7

$8,075
$0

#hrsor$

o0 O oo

$1,174

El Dorado Total Maaco Total Bob Tomes Total
rate rate rate
$0.00 $46.50 $4,817.40 $0.00
$0.00 $50.00 $2,000.00 $0.00
$0.00 $39.50 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $95.00 $342.00 $0.00
$0.00 $39.50 $1,173.15 $0.00
$0.00 $35.00 $70.00 $0.00
$0.00 5% $7,671.25 $0.00
$0.00 8% $0.00 $0.00
n/b
40.5 $22.07
NO BID $16,095.87 Incomplete Bid
El Dorado Total Maaco Total Bob Tomes Total
rate rate rate
$0.00 $46.50 $269.70 $0.00
$0.00 $50.00 $300.00 $0.00
$0.00 $39.50 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $95.00 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $39.50 $316.00 $0.00
$0.00 $35.00 $35.00 $0.00
$0.00 5% $1,115.30 $0.00
$0.00 8% $0.00 $0.00
n/b
40.5 $22.07
NO BID $2,058.07 Incomplete Bid
Maaco
$43,430

|RECOMMEND PRIMARY AWARD TO LOW BIDDER-MAACO
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Example 1
Item No.

2018-263-01-21
2018-263-01-22
2018-263-01-23
2018-263-01-24
2018-263-01-25
2018-263-01-26
2018-263-01-27
2018-263-01-28
2018-263-01-29

Example 2
Item No.

2018-263-01-21
2018-263-01-22
2018-263-01-23
2018-263-01-24
2018-263-01-25
2018-263-01-26
2018-263-01-27
2018-263-01-28
2018-263-01-29

Heavy Duty
Brief Desc

Body

Frame

Glass
Mechanical
Paint

Paint Supplies
OEM Domes Disc
Aftermarket Disc
Towing

Miles @0.545/mi
Total Cost

Heavy Duty
Brief Desc

Body

Frame

Glass
Mechanical
Paint

Paint Supplies
OEM Domes Disc
Aftermarket Disc
Towing

Miles @0.545/mi
Total Cost

#hrsor$
35.2

1
4.7
1.2

2
$2,300
$0

#hrsor$

14.6
5
0
8.2
16.5
1
$8,100
$0

El Dorado Total Maaco Total Bob Tomes Total
rate rate rate
$0.00 $65.00 $2,288.00 $0.00
$0.00 $75.00 $225.00 $0.00
$0.00 $39.50 $39.50 $0.00
$0.00 $95.00 $446.50 $0.00
$0.00 $39.50 $47.40 $0.00
$0.00 $35.00 $70.00 $0.00
$0.00 5% $2,185.00 $0.00
$0.00 8% $0.00 $0.00
n/b
40.5 $22.07
NO BID $5,323.47 NO BID
El Dorado Total Maaco Total Bob Tomes Total
rate rate rate
$0.00 $65.00 $949.00 $0.00
$0.00 $75.00 $375.00 $0.00
$0.00 $39.50 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $95.00 $779.00 $0.00
$0.00 $39.50 $651.75 $0.00
$0.00 $35.00 $35.00 $0.00
$0.00 5% $7,695.00 $0.00
$0.00 8% $0.00 $0.00
n/b
40.5 $22.07
NO BID $10,506.82 NO BID
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Example 3
Item No.

2018-263-01-21
2018-263-01-22
2018-263-01-23
2018-263-01-24
2018-263-01-25
2018-263-01-26
2018-263-01-27
2018-263-01-28
2018-263-01-29

Example 4
Item No.

2018-263-01-21
2018-263-01-22
2018-263-01-23
2018-263-01-24
2018-263-01-25
2018-263-01-26
2018-263-01-27
2018-263-01-28
2018-263-01-29

Heavy Duty
Brief Desc

Body

Frame

Glass
Mechanical
Paint

Paint Supplies
OEM Domes Disc
Aftermarket Disc
Towing

Miles @0.545/mi
Total Cost

Heavy Duty
Brief Desc

Body

Frame

Glass
Mechanical
Paint

Paint Supplies
OEM Domes Disc
Aftermarket Disc
Towing

Miles @0.545/mi
Total Cost

#hrsor$

22.3
3.6
0
11.2
11.3
2
$14,000
$0

#hrsor$

6.7
0
0
8.3
12.4
1
$6,100
$0

El Dorado Total Maaco Total Bob Tomes Total
rate rate rate
$0.00 $65.00 $1,449.50 $0.00
$0.00 $75.00 $270.00 $0.00
$0.00 $39.50 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $95.00 $1,064.00 $0.00
$0.00 $39.50 $446.35 $0.00
$0.00 $35.00 $70.00 $0.00
$0.00 5% $13,300.00 $0.00
$0.00 8% $0.00 $0.00
n/b
40.5 $22.07
NO BID $16,621.92 NO BID
El Dorado Total Maaco Total Bob Tomes Total
rate rate rate
$0.00 $65.00 $435.50 $0.00
$0.00 $75.00 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $39.50 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $95.00 $788.50 $0.00
$0.00 $39.50 $489.80 $0.00
$0.00 $35.00 $35.00 $0.00
$0.00 5% $5,795.00 $0.00
$0.00 8% $0.00 $0.00
n/b
40.5 $22.07
NO BID $7,565.87 NO BID

Page 11




Example 5
Item No.

2018-263-01-21
2018-263-01-22
2018-263-01-23
2018-263-01-24
2018-263-01-25
2018-263-01-26
2018-263-01-27
2018-263-01-28
2018-263-01-29

Example 6
Item No.

2018-263-01-21
2018-263-01-22
2018-263-01-23
2018-263-01-24
2018-263-01-25
2018-263-01-26
2018-263-01-27
2018-263-01-28
2018-263-01-29

Heavy Duty
Brief Desc

Body

Frame

Glass
Mechanical
Paint

Paint Supplies
OEM Domes Disc
Aftermarket Disc
Towing

Miles @0.545/mi
Total Cost

Heavy Duty
Brief Desc

Body

Frame

Glass
Mechanical
Paint

Paint Supplies
OEM Domes Disc
Aftermarket Disc
Towing

Miles @0.545/mi
Total Cost

#hrsor$

13.4
0
0
0
13.6
1
$2,015
$0

#hrsor$

255
8.5
0
4
12.5
2
$0
$2,500

El Dorado Total Maaco Total Bob Tomes Total
rate rate rate
$0.00 $65.00 $871.00 $0.00
$0.00 $75.00 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $39.50 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $95.00 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $39.50 $537.20 $0.00
$0.00 $35.00 $35.00 $0.00
$0.00 5% $1,914.25 $0.00
$0.00 8% $0.00 $0.00
n/b
40.5 $22.07
NO BID $3,379.52 NO BID
El Dorado Total Maaco Total Bob Tomes Total
rate rate rate
$0.00 $65.00 $1,657.50 $0.00
$0.00 $75.00 $637.50 $0.00
$0.00 $39.50 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $95.00 $380.00 $0.00
$0.00 $39.50 $493.75 $0.00
$0.00 $35.00 $70.00 $0.00
$0.00 5% $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 8% $2,300.00 $0.00
n/b
40.5 $22.07
NO BID $5,560.82 NO BID
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Example 7
Item No.

2018-263-01-21
2018-263-01-22
2018-263-01-23
2018-263-01-24
2018-263-01-25
2018-263-01-26
2018-263-01-27
2018-263-01-28
2018-263-01-29

Example 8
Item No.

2018-263-01-21
2018-263-01-22
2018-263-01-23
2018-263-01-24
2018-263-01-25
2018-263-01-26
2018-263-01-27
2018-263-01-28
2018-263-01-29

Heavy Duty
Brief Desc

Body

Frame

Glass
Mechanical
Paint

Paint Supplies
OEM Domes Disc
Aftermarket Disc
Towing

Miles @0.545/mi
Total Cost

Heavy Duty

Brief Desc

Body

Frame

Glass
Mechanical
Paint

Paint Supplies
OEM Domes Disc
Aftermarket Disc
Towing

Miles @0.545/mi
Total Cost

Total all examples Heavy Duty

Summary-Total

#hrsor$

19.8
24
0
4.8
16.5
1
$5,250
$0

#hrsor$

13.2
0
0
0
13.6
1
$1,099
$0

El Dorado Total Maaco Total Bob Tomes Total
rate rate rate

$0.00 $65.00 $1,287.00 $0.00

$0.00 $75.00 $180.00 $0.00

$0.00 $39.50 $0.00 $0.00

$0.00 $95.00 $456.00 $0.00

$0.00 $39.50 $651.75 $0.00

$0.00 $35.00 $35.00 $0.00

$0.00 5% $4,987.50 $0.00

$0.00 8% $0.00 $0.00

n/b $0.00

40.5 $22.07 $0.00

NO BID $7,619.32 NO BID
El Dorado Total Maaco Total Bob Tomes Total
rate rate rate

$0.00 $65.00 $858.00 $0.00

$0.00 $75.00 $0.00 $0.00

$0.00 $39.50 $0.00 $0.00

$0.00 $95.00 $0.00 $0.00

$0.00 $39.50 $537.20 $0.00

$0.00 $35.00 $35.00 $0.00

$0.00 5% $1,044.05 $0.00

$0.00 8% $0.00 $0.00

$0.00 n/b $0.00

$0.00 40.5 $22.07 $0.00

NO BID $2,496.32 NO BID
Maaco
$59,074

RECOMMEND PRIMARY AWARD TO LOW BIDDER-MAACO
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