IFB 2019-048 GROUNDS MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT

Longhorn Inc.

IRRIGATORS SUPPLY INC

McKinney Outdoor
Power (Thirteen
Partners Inc)

Ed's Lawn Equipment

Sam' Lawn Riders

Richardson Saw &
Lawnmower Company
(Richardson Saw &

Plano Power Equipment
(Plano Motor Mart Inc)

Total Price[ $3,154.00( Total Price|] $9,925.08| Total Price| $17,852.00 Total Price| $20,237.00| Total Price| $39,750.00| Total Price| $59,147.11| Total Price| $61,067.92| Equipment Services Comments
Line#  Description QTyYy | uom Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended | on Not Meeting Specifications
4 Stihl FS 240 Trimmer/Brush Cutter with Bike
Handle, 2 Auto Cut Heads and 2 Brush Knife
Blades, or Collin County Approved Equal 6 each |No Bid $485.09  $2,910.54 $604.30 $3,625.80 $587.00  $3,522.00|No Bid $498.75  $2,992.50 $496.00 $2,976.00
iSRM-410U BRUSHCUTTER 42.7cc *Alternate does not meet
1ALT1 ECOMMERCIAL 60" SOLID STEEL SHAFT. specifications - will not accept
{COMES WITH 10” 80 TOOTH BLADE. 6 each *$462.85 cutting heads; blades only
($593.05 price when these
Dle1esS it et i added) Auto cut heads sold
EXCEPTIONS p ? separately @24.29 ea. Brush N/A None Any quantities No Exception
heads. Only Blades )
knife blades sold separtely
@29.69 ea
WARRANTY 2 year 2 years 2 years 2 years 2 years 2 year
DELIVERY TIME 5-7 days 2 days 1 day 3-4 days 14 days 3-5 days
Stihl FS 131R Trimmer/Brush Cutter with
) Loop Handle and 2 Auto Cut Heads,
Deflectors, and Harnesses or Collin County
Approved Equal 3 each [No Bid $307.99 $923.97 $357.60 $1,072.80 $401.00 $1,203.00|No Bid $318.75 $956.25 $314.49 $943.47
9 ALTL Echo: SRM-3020T 30.5cc Proextreme series
straight shaft commercial trimmer. 3 each $336.82
Unit comes with a
deflector harness. If this is
($356.57 price when these asking for an acc?ssc?ry
deflector, my price is - )
EXCEPTIONS 2 spare bump heads added) Auto cut heads sold ) None Any quantities No Exception
rately @24.29 $13.42/ea. Optional
separately o ea backpack style harness is
$17.98. This would be in
addition to my stated bid.
WARRANTY 2 year 2 year 2 year 2 year 2 year 2 year
DELIVERY TIME 5-7 days 2 days 1day 3-4 days 14 days 3-5 days
Stihl MS 441 Chainsaw with 16" Bar and 2
3 spare chains, case, or Collin County
Approved Equal 1 each |No Bid $769.99 $769.99 $824.20 $824.20 $769.00 $769.00|No Bid $798.75 $798.75 $828.00 $828.00
*Alternate does not meet
3 ALT1 iEcho: CS-680-20 66.7cc chainsaw specifications for bar length; no
performance cutting system. 1 each *$484.91 spare chains
($868.96 price when these
added) Chains sold
X separately @22.49 ea. Case L. .
N/A N Al No E
EXCEPTIONS 2 spare chains e e / one ny quantities o Exception
MS441 replaced by
MS441CM.
WARRANTY 1year 90 days 90 days 90 days 90 days 2 year
DELIVERY TIME 5-7 days 2 days 1day 3-4 days 14 days 3-5 days
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Stihl MS 362 C-M Chainsaw with 16" Bar
4 and 2 spare chains, case, or Collin County

Approved Equal 4 each |No Bid $585.19  $2,340.76 $632.20 $2,528.80 $616.00 $2,464.00|No Bid $618.75  $2,475.00 $607.00 $2,428.00
*Alternate does not meet
4 ALT1 {ECHO: CS-590-18 59.8cc CHAIN SAW specifications for bar length; no
PROFESSIONAL GRADE. 4 each *$312.85 spare chains

($687.76 price when these
. added) Spare chains sold - .
2 h N/A None Any quantities No Exception
EXCEPTIONS spare chains separately @24.29 ea. Case / va P

sold separately @53.99 ea

WARRANTY 1year 90 days 90 days 90 days 90 days 2 year
DELIVERY TIME 5-7 days 2 days 1day 3-4 days 14 days 3-5 days

- Stihl HT 133 Pole Pruner, 2 spare chains, or
Collin County Approved Equal 2 each |No Bid $500.49  $1,000.98 $543.88 $1,087.76 $509.00 $1,018.00|No Bid $474.75 $949.50 $512.00 $1,024.00

= AT ECHO: PPF-2620 25.4cc FIXED SHAFT *Alternate does not meet
PRUNNER 2 each *$372.15 specifications - does not state if
($545.47 price when these 3' ext included; oal 96" vs 132"
EXCEPTIONS added) Chains sold N/A None Any quantities No Exception otherwise; engine power is less;
separately @22.49 ea. fuel capacity is less (less run

WARRANTY 2 year 2 year 2 year 2 year 2 year 2 year time)
DELIVERY TIME 5-7 days 2 days 1 day 3-4 days 14 days 3-5 days

6 Stihl BR 430 Backpack Blower, or Collin
County Approved Equal 2 each |No Bid $307.99 $615.98 $319.00 $638.00 $297.00 $594.00|No Bid $292.75 $585.50 $314.49 $628.98

ECHO: PB-755ST 63.3cc BACKPACK BLOWER
6 ALT1 {WITH SIDE MOUNTED AIR FILTER AND TUBE

MOUNTED THROTTLE 2 each $354.00
EXCEPTIONS None N/A None Any quantities No Exception
WARRANTY 2 year 2 year 2 year 2 year 2 year 2 year
DELIVERY TIME 3-5 days 2 days 1 day 3-4 days 14 days 3-5 days
; Stihl BG 86 C-E Handheld Blower, or Collin
County Approved Equal 1 each |No Bid $207.89 $207.89 $215.00 $215.00 $191.00 $191.00|No Bid $171.75 $171.75 $212.00 $212.00
*Alternate does not meet
7 ALT1 {ECHO: PB-255LN 25.4cc HAND HELD specifications - has flared-end
BLOWER WITH LOW NOISE PERFORMANCE. 1 each *$157.00 pipe only; does not offer both
EXCEPTIONS - N/A N Regular BG86 without No Exception pipe e-'nds (round & flat); blowing
Easy2Start starter force is less; less air volume;
WARRANTY 2 year 2 year 2 year 2 year 2 year 2 year slightly heavier
DELIVERY TIME 3-5 days 2 days 1 day 3-4 days 14 days 3-5 days
3 Stihl FC111 Edger with 2 spare blades, or
Collin County Approved Equal 3 each |No Bid $384.99 $1,154.97 $401.40 $1,204.20 $378.00 $1,134.00|No Bid $364.75  $1,094.25 $393.49 $1,180.47
8 ALTL ECHO: PB-255LN 25.4cc HAND HELD *Alternate does not meet
BLOWER WITH LOW NOISE PERFORMANCE. 3 each *$281.00 specifications - did not bid
($386.87 price when these comparable/correct item. (bid
EXCEPTIONS added) Edger blades sold N/A None Any quantities No Exception blower not an edger)
separately @0.94 ea.
WARRANTY 2 year 2 year 2 year 2 year 2 year 2 year
DELIVERY TIME 3-5 days 2 days 1day 3-4 days 14 days 3-5 days
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9ALT1

10 ALT1

10 ALT1

Scag SWZT61-22FSE 61" Electric Start Walk-
Behind Lawn Mower with 22 hp Kawasaki
gasoline engine, Electric Start, or Collin
County Approved Equal

2

each

HUSTLER 930412: TRIMSTAR 54” WALK
BEHIND MOWER WITH HYDROSTATIC DRIVE
TRANSMISSION

2

each

EXCEPTIONS

WARRANTY

DELIVERY TIME

Scag STTII-61V-26CH-EFI 61" Zero-Turn Turf
Tiger Il Riding Lawn Mower, Air Cooled 26
hp Kohler EFI Gasoline Engine, or Collin
County Approved Equal

1

each

HUSTLER 936985: HUSTLER SUPER Z
MOWER 60” VX4 DECK WITH GRAMMER
SEAT SUSPENSION, 33HP KOHLER EFI.

1

each

Bob-Cat Pro-Cat 6000MX Series, Model
9996006

2

each

EXCEPTIONS

No Bid

$5,670.72
Not available in 61" deck

2 year - No hour limit

5-7 days

No Bid

$10,519.92

Not available in 61" deck

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

*$8900.00

$4,675.00 $9,350.00

None

2 year limited, belts tires
battery and hoses 90 days,
cutter decks 3 years against
cracks, first and second
year parts and labor, third
year parts or labor only,
hydrolic components and
clutches 2 years, spindles 3
years, third year parts only,
engine 3 year

10-14 days

$10,200.00 $10,200.00

None

$5,137.36 $10,274.72

Any quantities

Wear items including drive
belts, blades, hydraulic
hoses & tires 90 days,

Batteries 90 days, Frame
and structural components
including oil reservoir and
oil coolers are warranted
for two (2) years (parts and
labor), Cutter decks are
warranted against cracking
for a period of three (3)
years. (parts and labor 1st
and 2nd year; parts only
3rd year), The repair or
replacement of the cutter
deck will be at the option
of Scag Power Eqmt.

14 days

$9,793.41  $9,793.41

Any quantities

$4,999.00 $9,998.00

No Exception

Scag 2 Year Commercial
Warranty New Scag
mowers are covered by a
limited two year warranty
for commercial use. This
warranty covers
manufacturing defects for
two years, Including Parts
and Labor

3-5 days

$10,399.00 $10,399.00

No Exception

*Alternate does not meet
specifications - does not have
driveshaft driven cutter deck;
cutting height only 5.5" not 6";
unknown increments (1/4"
preferred); drive tires smaller;
engine is not electronic fuel
injection
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WARRANTY

DELIVERY TIME
Scag STTII-72V-26CH-EFI 72" Zero-Turn Turf
Tiger Il Riding Lawn Mower, Air Cooled 26

1 hp Kohler EFI Gasoline Engine, or Collin
County Approved Equal 2 each
Bob-Cat Predator-Pro 7000 Series, Model
11ALTL 9997003 2 each
HUSTLER 938993: HUSTLER SUPER Z 72”
11 ALT1 VX4 DECK WITH GRAMMER SUSPENSION
SEAT, 33HP KOHLER EFI. 2 each

EXCEPTIONS

2 year
5-7 days
No Bid
$11,013.12

No Bid

No Bid

6 yrs or 2750 hours, limited
lifetime for deck pan &
carrier frame, 3 yrs for

engine

10-14 days

No Bid

$10,450.00

None

2 year limited warranty,
belts tires battery hoses 90
days, cutter decks 3 years

against cracks, first and

second year parts and
labor, third year parts or
labor only, hydrolic
components and clutches 2
years, spindles 3 years,
third year parts only

As Needed

$10,100.00 $20,200.00

None

Wear items including drive
belts, blades, hydraulic
hoses & tires 90 days,

Batteries 90 days, Frame
and structural components
including oil reservoir and
oil coolers are warranted
for two (2) years (parts and
labor), Cutter decks are
warranted against cracking
for a period of three (3)
years. (parts and labor 1st
and 2nd year; parts only
3rd year), The repair or
replacement of the cutter
deck will be at the option
of Scag Power Eqmt.

14 days

$9,990.00 $19,980.00

The mower quoted is on
limited availability and Scag
will not be producing any
more with that engine
option. If available at time
of award we can honor the
quoted price. If unit is no
longer available at time for
awarded bid the closest to
that cost replacement
mower is the Scag Turf
Tiger 72" with a 35HP
Briggs and Stratton
Vanguard Engine and the
price it would sell for is
shown on attachment 2019
Scag Collin County Pricing -
RSLM

Scag 2 Year Commercial
Warranty New Scag
mowers are covered by a
limited two year warranty
for commercial use. This
warranty covers
manufacturing defects for
two years, Including Parts
and Labor

3-5 days

$10,299.00 $20,598.00

No Exception
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12

13

14

WARRANTY

DELIVERY TIME

Billy Goat Outback BC2600 HEBH Field and

Brush Cutter, 26" cutting deck, hydrostatic,

390 cc engine, cutting height up to 3 3/4"or

Collin County Approved Equal 1 each

EXCEPTIONS

WARRANTY

DELIVERY TIME

Honda FC600 Mid-Tine Tiller, 26" tilling

width, Honda 163 cc engine, 13" tine

diameter, or Collin County Approved Equal 4 each

EXCEPTIONS

WARRANTY
DELIVERY TIME

Honda HRC2163HXA 21" self propelled,

hydrostatic, commercial grade mower,

Honda GXV160 engine, recoil start, rear

discharge with bagger, 8 cutting height

adjustments, or Collin County Approved

Equal 2 each

EXCEPTIONS

WARRANTY

DELIVERY TIME

$3,154.00

No Bid

No Bid

2 year

5-7 days

$3,154.00

None

1vyear
5-7 days

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1,146.50 $4,586.00

2 years
4-5 days

$1,034.72 $2,069.44
N/A

1year

4-5 days

6 yrs or 2750 hours, limited
lifetime for deck pan &
carrier frame, 3 yrs for

engine

10-14 days

$3,320.00 $3,320.00

None

1 year chasis, 2 year engine
7-10 days

$982.00 $3,928.00

3 years
3-4 days

$1,047.00 $2,094.00

None

1 year chasis, 2 year engine

3-4 days

2 year limited warranty,
belts tires battery hoses 90
days, cutter decks 3 years

against cracks, first and

second year parts and
labor, third year parts or
labor only, hydrolic
components and clutches 2
years, spindles 3 years,
third year parts only

As Needed

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Wear items including drive
belts, blades, hydraulic
hoses & tires 90 days,

Batteries 90 days, Frame
and structural components
including oil reservoir and
oil coolers are warranted
for two (2) years (parts and
labor), Cutter decks are
warranted against cracking
for a period of three (3)
years. (parts and labor 1st
and 2nd year; parts only
3rd year), The repair or
replacement of the cutter
deck will be at the option
of Scag Power Egmt.

14 days

$3,203.96  $3,203.96

Any quantities

1year
14 days

$1,006.63

$4,026.52

3 years
14 days

$922.50

Any quantities

$1,845.00

1 year

14 days

Scag 2 Year Commercial
Warranty New Scag
mowers are covered by a
limited two year warranty
for commercial use. This
warranty covers
manufacturing defects for
two years, Including Parts
and Labor

3-5 days

$3,154.00 $3,154.00

No Exception

1year
3-5 days

$1,182.00

$4,728.00

3 years
3-5 days

$985.00

No Exception

$1,970.00

1 year other components, 2
year engine

3-5 days
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15

16

17

18

19

20

Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List
Price for any STIHL Equipment Not Listed
Herein

Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List
Price for any SCAG Equipment Not Listed
Herein

Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List
Price for any BILLY GOAT Equipment Not
Listed Herein

Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List
Price for any HONDA Equipment Not Listed
Herein

Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List
Price for any TORO Equipment Not Listed
Herein

Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List
Price for any SNAPPER Equipment Not
Listed Herein

24

28

20.000000

No Bid

No Bid

12.000000

15.000000

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

22

23.000000

20

28

No Bid

21.000000

20

23.000000

20

20.000000

10

Low bid meeting specifications
Tie
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