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IFB 2019-114 LIQUID ASPHALTS

PRIMARY
SECONDARY

Total Price $13,372.70 Total Price $23,367.28 Total Price $28,104.78
Line # Description QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1 CRS-1 --- Delivered 500 gallon $2.99 * Alt product $1,495.00 No Bid No Bid
2 CRS-1P --- Delivered 300 gallon No Bid $6.80 $2,040.00 No Bid
3 CRS-2P --- Delivered 300 gallon No Bid $5.55 $1,665.00 $2.415 $724.50
4 CSS-1 --- Delivered 8000 gallon $1.45 ** Alt Product $11,600.00 $2.41 $19,280.00 No Bid
5 MC-250 --- Delivered 2000 gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 MC-30 --- Delivered 1000 gallon No Bid No Bid $3.365 $3,365.00
7 MC-3000 --- Delivered 1000 gallon No Bid No Bid $3.234 $3,234.00
8 MC-800 --- Delivered 500 gallon No Bid No Bid $3.04 $1,520.00
9 RC-250 --- Delivered 5000 gallon No Bid No Bid $3.629 $18,145.00

10 RC-3000 --- Delivered 1000 gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid
11 RC-800 --- Delivered 500 gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid

12
Please state the cost for per hour demurrage 
charges beyond the three (3) hours included in 
the quoted delivery cost. 1 hour $80.00 $80.00

*ALT LINE 1 -  CWE-2
**ALT LINE 4 - Lucky 7 Return freight is one-half of the outgoing tariff

Pump and hose charge is $90.00 per load

13 CRS-1 --- Pick-Up 1 gallon $2.74 $139.62 $139.62 No Bid No Bid
14 CRS-1P --- Pick-Up 1 gallon No Bid $2.80 $188.40 $188.40 No Bid
15 CRS-2P --- Pick-Up 1 gallon No Bid $2.55 $67.51 $67.51 $2.13 $222.53 $222.53
16 CSS-1 --- Pick-Up 1 gallon $1.20 $138.08 $138.08 $2.25 $126.37 $126.37 No Bid
17 MC-250 --- Pick-Up 1 gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid
18 MC-30 --- Pick-Up 1 gallon No Bid No Bid $3.10 $223.50 $223.50
19 MC-3000 --- Pick-Up 1 gallon No Bid No Bid $2.95 $223.35 $223.35
20 MC-800 --- Pick-Up 1 gallon No Bid No Bid $2.75 $223.15 $223.15
21 RC-250 --- Pick-Up 1 gallon No Bid No Bid $3.35 $223.75 $223.75
22 RC-3000 --- Pick-Up 1 gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid
23 RC-800 --- Pick-Up 1 gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid

Plant Location Address for Pick-Up 516 S. McLennan Loop, Elm Mott, TX 76640 Line 14 - 4648 Western Way, Temple, TX 76504 1505 Custer Rd., Brownwood, TX 76801

Approx 236 miles roundtrip with IRS tax rate $136.88 Approx 320 miles roundtrip with IRS tax rate $185.60 Approx 380 miles roundtrip with IRS tax rate $220.40

Line 15 - 600 Minton Rd, Saginaw, TX 76179

Approx 112 miles roundtrip with IRS tax rate $64.96

Line 16 - 209 Robert Nance Rd, Mt Pleasant, TX 76455

Approx 214 miles roundtrip with IRS tax rate $124.12

P2 Emulsions (P Squared Emulsion Plants, 
LLC)

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc.
Wright Asphalt Products Company (Wright 

Asphalt Products Company LLC)

$100/hour after 2 free hours

Price with 
Mileage

Price with 
Mileage

Price with 
Mileage

No minimum. Freight, however, is based on a full transport 
load of 5,500 gallons.

5000 gal. minimum. Smaller quantities available, subject to 
freight differential of $0.25/gallon

5500 gal. minimum. 


	Lines

