SYNOPSIS
BID NO. 2018.057-6750
ustin Asohalt Ine. Er00n Asohat & Emutsions Nartin Marieta Olccaste Materils Texas, Inc. Texas it proessonalCoatine Technololes. Inc. Riaht pante LC u
and Highviay . Asphal 11612 Rm 2204 Building 1, Suie
35 Commerce Drive. Suite 150 250 10615 Soancler Roat 420 Decker rive,Suite 200 1001 Wit Lebanon Road . Bo a7 £.0.80x 791550
Irving, Tews 75083 Ausin, Texas 78738 Dalles, Teas 75220 i, Texas 75062 Cedar il Texas 75104 Defalb, Texas 60115 san Antoni, Texas 78279
INITIAL CONTRACT PERIOD: November 20, 2018 through Novernber 19, 2019 Eric Johson David Suoud Chiis Moret 1ot Reid raron Band. Jenniferskonie evin Vaushn
THREE ADDITIONAL ONE YEAR PERIDS GeneralPlants Nanacer Toas Recional Manager Sales ve/asst sec. NationsI SalesDirctor r.sal
[BUYER: JAMES GAY (214) 653-7434  james gav@dallascounty org Emailerci@austin-nd.com i
Pt 866.567.0001 P 512.469.0292 P 972.409-3240 Pht 2147413531 Pht 214.673-4703 Phi 8157545700 P 2105203577
Fa 512-469.0391 NA Faxt 2147423540 Faxt 9722916220 Faxt 8157505702 Fari 2105243555
AWARDED ITEMS: 18,19,20]
3,24,32
Estimated
Aonual
tem s Description Quan Unit Extended unit Extended Unit Extended unit Etended | unit Extended unit Extended
1 1000
|AGGREGATE FOR SURFACE, TX DOT ITEM 312, TYPE B, CRUSHED STONE, GRADE 3(CHAT) 1o [N ot o Response o Response o Response
LOADED ON COUNTY TRUCKS AT VENDOR PLANT
sPECIFY:
PLANT LOCATION
STREET ADDRESS:
CITVISTATEZIPCODE:
TELEPHONE NO
HOURS OF OPERATION:
"™ | AGGREGATE FOR SURFACE, TX DOT ITEM 302, TYPE B, CRUSHED STONE. GRADE 3 (CHaT) | >0
. TYPES: Tons [ o 8id osia NoResporse NoResporse NoResporse No Response
2
above i price |
DELIVERED TO ROAD & BRIDGE DISTRICT OFFICE determined by
Plantlocaton
Plant#1
s o0
PLANT LOCATION #1
Plant#2
STREET ADDRESS: G
cirvisTare 2 cope:
TeL 3 s ton
HOURS OF OPERATION:
PLANT LOCATION £2
STREET ADDRESS:
CITVISTATEZIPCODE:
TELEPHONE NO.
HOLRS OF OPERATION:
PLANT LOCATION £3
STREET ADDRESS:
CITVISTATEZIPCODE:
TELEPHONE NO.
HOLRS OF OPERATION:
et TXDOT ITEM 302, TYPE B, CRUSHED STONE. GRADE 000 | Tans [ NoBid oo NoReporse NoResporse NoResporse NoResponse
3 |LOADED ON COUNTY TRUCKS AT VENDOR PLANT
SPECIFY:
PLANT LOCATION
STREET ADDRESS:
CITVISTATEZIPCODE:
TELEPHONE NO
HOURS OF OPERATION:
e TXDOT ITEM 302, TYPE B, CRUSHED STONE. GRADE 5000 | Tons|NoBd oo NoResporse NoResporse NoResporse NoResponse
above i price |
DELIVERED TO ROAD & BRIDGE DISTRICT OFFICE determined by
Plantlocaton
a Z
Plant#1
spECIEY: P
PLANT LOCATION #1
Plant#2
s o
STREET ADDRESS:
Plant#3
s fon
CITVISTATEZIPCODE:
TELEPHONE NO
HOURS OF OPERATION:
PLANT LOCATION 72
STREET ADDRESS:
CITVISTATEZIPCODE:
TELEPHONE NO
HOURS OF OPERATION:
PLANT LOCATION #3
STREET ADDRESS:
CITVISTATEZIPCODE:
TELEPHONE NO
HOURS OF OPERATION:
e  TXDOT, Tow
HIGHWAYS, STREETS AND BRIDGES, ITEM 421 (5) : Tons Nogid osia NoResporse NoResporse NoResporse NoResporse e
s |FiNEAceREGATE
LOADED ON COUNTY TRUCKS AT VENDOR PLANT
SPECIFY:
PLANT LOCATION
STREET ADDRESS:
CITVISTATEZIPCODE:
TELEPHONE NO.
Trem [ CEMENT 20000 | Tors [NoBi oo NoResporse NoResporse NoResporse e
& |LOADED ON COUNTY TRUCKS AT VENDOR PLANT
SPECIFY:
PLANTLOCATION




SYNOPSIS
BID NO. 20180576750

and High Asphatic Materia

INITIAL CONTRACT PERIOD: November 20, 2018 through Novernber 19, 2019
THREE ADDITIONAL ONE YEAR PERIODS

BUYER: JAVES GAY (214) 6537434 james.gay@dallascounty.org

Austin AsohaltIn.

General Plants Manacer

Emal: erci@austin-ind.com
P 866-587-0001
A

Fact

5330 Commerce Drive. Suite 150

Er00n Asohalt & Emulsions
11612 Rm 2244 Building 1, Sute
250

nustin, Texas 78738

Martin Marietia

10615 Spanaler Road
Dalas, Texas 75220

Oldcastle Materials Texas,Inc. Texas Bt

420 Decker Drive, Suite 200

|AWARDED ITEMS: 18, 19, 20)
3,24,32

David St Chris Moreti Lohn e
Texas Reaional Manacer sales Ve/Asst. sec.

Emall com
Ph 512-469.0292 P 072-408-3240 P 2147413531
Fax 512-469-0391 NA Faxh 214.742-3540

| AwaRoED mems: 8,9, 10,11, 12,13, 14, 15
1

Professionsl Coatine Technolosies. Inc.

1001 Wit Lebanon Road
Cedar il Texas 75104
Aaron Bland
NationalSales Director

Rieht Pointe LLC

P.0.80x467
Dekalo, Texas 60115,
Jennifer Skonie

Vulcan Construction Materials. LLC

P.0. Box 791550
a0 Antonio. Texas 76279
Kevin Vaushn

P 214.673-4703
Faxt972-291-6224

P 815-754-5700
Faxt 815.754-5702

Pht 210-524-3577
Fax# 210-524-3555

|AWARDED ITEMS 7 AND 16 23,24, | AWARDED ITEMS: 6,30,31 | Awaroeo mems: 21,22,25, 26,27, 29 | awaroeo mem s AWARDED ITEWS:1.2.3.4
Estimated
Annual
tem Description Quantity nit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended unit Extended | unit Extended Unit Extended |unit Extended
STREET ADDRESS:
ciTvisTATEZIPCODE:
TELEPHONE NO:
HOLRS OF OPERATION:
DMIX.AS ) R3OR
temi |EOUAL 100 | Tons $99.00 $9,900.00 [ No id No Response $105.00 S 1050000 |NoResponse No Response e
LOADED ON COUNTY TRUCKS AT VENDOR PLANT
SPECIFY: 320 ron Horse D
PLANT LOCATION Terel. Texas 75160
9725634095
STREET ADDRESS: 11143 Goodrieht tn 7am-Som
Dalla. Texas 75299
866-587.0001
ciTvisTATEZIPCODE:
TELEPHONE NO:
HOLRS OF OPERATION:
ot mix asphaltc concrete pavement, 6ot em 340, type b, instaled o faid by Gontactor personnel,
ttemi[as oer bid soecifcations 2000 | Tons [NoBid NoBid No Response 36988 $ 13976000 [NoResponse No Response NB
aboveif prce |
1,500 tons or more per job determined by
Plant location
and enter below: 7258 s 1s16000
AWARD.
Plant #1
SECIFY: s fon 4625 Leston Ave
PLANT LOCATION #1 Dalles, Texas 75247
Plant #2
fon 2166317682
STREET ADDRESS:
Plant 3
s fon 4601 Scvene Road
Sunnvvale, Texas 75182
ciTvisTATEZIPCODE: 972224074
TELEPHONE NO:
HOURS OF OPERATION:
PLANT LOCATION #2
STREET ADDRESS:
ciTvisTATEZIPCODE:
TELEPHONE NO:
HOURS OF OPERATION:
PLANT LOCATION #3
STREET ADDRESS:
ciTvisTATEZIPCODE:
TELEPHONE NO:
HOURS OF OPERATION:
HOT MIX ASPHALTIC CONCRETE PAVEMENT, TXDOT ITEM 340, TYPE B, INSTALLED OR
ttemi [LAIDBY ASPER 1500 | Tons [Nosid NoBid No Response No Response No Response e
s 10527000
aboveif prce |
500-1499 tons per job determined by
Plant location
and enter below:
s7288 s 1932000
J— S P AWARD.
PLANT LOCATION 1 4625 Leston Ave
Plant #2
s fon Dalle, Texas 75247
STREET ADDRESS: 2106317682
Plant#3
s fon -am-5 om
ciTvisTATEZIPCODE: 4601 Scvene Road
Sunmvvale. Texas 75182
TELEPHONE NO: 972:226-4074
8 am-5om
HOURS OF OPERATION:
PLANT LOCATION 2
STREET ADDRESS:
ciTvisTATEZIPCODE:
TELEPHONE NO:
HOLRS OF OPERATION:
PLANT LOCATION 3
STREET ADDRESS:
ciTvisTATEZIPCODE:
TELEPHONE NO:
HOLRS OF OPERATION:
HOT MIX ASPHALTIC CONCRETE PAVEMENT, TXDOT ITEM 340 TYPE, B, INSTALLED OR
ttemi [FAIDBY (ASPER 1000 | Tons [Nosis Nosid No Response $81.60 S 8160000 |NoResponse No Response e
10 [7.5499 Tons ver Job $8430 s 830000
AWARD.
SPECIFY:
above f price i
PLANT LOCATION i1 determined by
Plant location
and entr below:
4625 Leston Ave
STREET ADDRESS: Plant#1
s fon

Dallas, Texas 75247
2146317682




SYNOPSIS
BID NO. 20180576750

and High Asphatic Materia

INITIAL CONTRACT PERIOD: November 20, 2018 through Novernber 19, 2019
THREE ADDITIONAL ONE YEAR PERIODS

BUYER: JAVES GAY (214) 6537434 james.gay@dallascounty.org

Austin AsohaltIn.

5330 Commerce Drive. Suite 150

General Plants Manacer

Emal: erci@austin-ind.com
P 866-587-0001
A

Fact

Er00n Asohalt & Emulsions
11612 Rm 2244 Building 1, Sute
250

Martin Marietia

10615 Spanaler Road

Oldcastle Materials Texas,Inc. Texas Bt

420 Decker Drive, Suite 200

|AWARDED ITEMS: 18, 19, 20)
3,24,32

nustin, Texas 78738 Dales, Texas 75220 Irving, Texas
David St Chris Moreti Lohn e
Texas Reaional Manacer sales Ve/Asst. sec.
Emall com
Ph 512-469.0292 P 072-408-3240 P 2147413531
Fax 512-469-0391 NA Faxh 214.742-3540

| AwaRoED mems: 8,9, 10,11, 12,13, 14, 15
1

Professionsl Coatine Technolosies. Inc.

1001 Wit Lebanon Road
Cedar il Texas 75104
Aaron Bland
NationalSales Director

Rieht Pointe LLC

P.0.80x467
Dekalo, Texas 60115,
Jennifer Skonie

Vulcan Construction Materials. LLC

P.0. Box 791550
a0 Antonio. Texas 76279
Kevin Vaushn

P 214.673-4703
Faxt972-291-6224

P 815-754-5700
Faxt 815.754-5702

Pht 210-524-3577
Fax# 210-524-3555

| awaroED 1TEMS 7 AND 16 23,21, | AWARDED ITEMS: 630,31 | awaroeo mems: 21,22,25,26, 27,29 | awasoeo mem r2s AWARDED TEwS: 1.2.3.4
Estimated
Aonual
tem Description uantity Unit Extended Unit extended Unit Extended Uit Extended | unit Extended unit Extended | unit Extended
Plant 12 Sam-Spm
s fon
CITVISTATEZIPCODE: 4501 scvene Rosd
Plant 43
s fon Sunnwale, Texas 75182
9722264078
TELEPHONE NO. 5am-som
HOURS OF OPERATION
PLANT LOCATION #2
STREET ADDRESS
CITVISTATEZIPCODE:
TELEPHONE NO.
HOURS OF OPERATION
PLANT LOCATION #3
STREET ADDRESS
CITVISTATEZIPCODE:
TELEPHONE NO.
HOURS OF OPERATION
ot i asphalic concrete avement, 6ot fem 340, type ¢, nsaled or laid by conracor prsonnl,
ttemi | a oerbid soecifications 1500 | Tons | Noid NoBid o Response AWARD NoResponse NoResponse e
111500 tons or more oer ob s75.00 s 1310000
speCIEY: 7850 s 19000
above i price s
PLANT LOCATION #1 determined by
Plant location
and enter below: 4525 Leston Ave
Dalls. Texas 75247
< rReET ADDRESS S 210.6317682
7am-som
Plant 42
s fon 4501 scvene Rosd
CITVISTATEZIPCODE: Sunnwale, Texas 75182
Plant #3 972.226 4074
s ron
7am-som
TELEPHONE NO.
HOURS OF OPERATION
CITVISTATEZIPCODE:
TELEPHONE NO.
HOURS OF OPERATION
ot i asphallic cancret pavemen, GOt e 340, tpe 0, Insialed r aid by CONTacor prsonTe,
ttem# | a oerbid soecifications 10000 | Tons |Nosid NoBid o Response 752 S 74620000 [NoResoonse NoResponse e
121500 tons or more oer ob
7816 s 7160000
speCIEY:
AWaRD
above i price s
PLANT LOCATION #1 determined by
Plant location
and enter below:
4525 Leston Ave
STREET ADDRESS: Plant 41
s fon Dallas. Texas 75247
210.6317682
Plant 42
s fon
CITVISTATEZIPCODE: 4501 scvene Rosd
Plant #3
s fon Sunnwale, Texas 75182
972.226-40
TELEPHONE NO! 7am-som
HOURS OF OPERATION:
PLANT LOCATION £2
STREET ADDRESS:
CITVISTATEZIPCODE:
TELEPHONE NO!
HOURS OF OPERATION:
PLANT LOCATION #3
STREET ADDRESS:
CITVISTATEZIPCODE:
TELEPHONE NO!
HOURS OF OPERATION:
ot i asphalic conrete pavement, 6ot e 340, typed. Installed o aid by conracior personnel,
ttem | a oerbid soecifications 2500 | Tons |Nosid NoBid o Response NoResponse NoResponse e
135001499 tonsoer iob s75.8 s 19795000
7872 s 1930000
speCIEY: AwaRD
above i price s
PLANT LOCATION #1 determined by
Plant location
and enter below:
Plant 41
STREET ADDRESS s fon 4525 Leston Ave

Dalls, Texas 75247




SYNOPSIS
BID NO. 20180576750

and High Asphatic Materia

INITIAL CONTRACT PERIOD: November 20, 2018 through Novernber 19, 2019
THREE ADDITIONAL ONE YEAR PERIODS

BUYER: JAVES GAY (214) 6537434 james.gay@dallascounty.org

Austin AsohaltIn.

Irving, Texas 75063
Eric Johnson
General Plants Manacer

Emal: erci@austin-ind.com
866-507-0001

P 865
Fact NA

5330 Commerce Drive. Suite 150

Er00n Asohalt & Emulsions
11612 Rm 2244 Building 1, Sute
250

nustin, Texas 78738

David Stroud
Texas Reaional Manacer

Martin Marietia

10615 Spanaler Road
Dalas, Texas 75220

Chris Moreti
Sales

Oldcastle Materials Texas,Inc. Texas Bt

420 Decker Drive, Suite 200

Ve/Asst. sec.

Ph 512-469.0292
Fax 512-469-0391

|AWARDED ITEMS: 18, 19, 20)
3,24,32

23,24,

P 072-408-3240
NA

P 2147413531
Faxh 214.742-3540

| AwaRoED mems: 8,9, 10,11, 12,13, 14, 15
1

Professionsl Coatine Technolosies. Inc.

1001 Wit Lebanon Road
Cedar il Texas 75104
Aaron Bland
NationalSales Director

Rieht Pointe LLC

P.0.80x467
Dekalo, Texas 60115,
Jennifer Skonie

Vulcan Construction Materials. LLC

P.0. Box 791550
a0 Antonio. Texas 76279
Kevin Vaushn

P 214.673-4703
Faxt972-291-6224

P 815-754-5700
Faxt 815.754-5702

Pht 210-524-3577
Fax# 210-524-3555

| awaroED 1TEMS 7 AND 16 ) | AWARDED ITEMS: 630,31 | awaroeo mems: 21,22,25,26, 27,29 | awasoeo mem r2s
Estimated
Aonual
tem Description uantity Unit Extended Unit extended Unit Extended Uit Extended | unit Extended unit Extended | unit Extended
Plant 12 e 6317682
s fon
CITVISTATEZIPCODE: 7am-som
Plant 43
s fon 4501 scvene Rosd
Sunnwale, Texas 75182
TELEPHONE NO. 972.226.4074
7am-som
HOURS OF OPERATION
PLANT LOCATION #2
STREET ADDRESS
CITVISTATEZIPCODE:
TELEPHONE NO.
HOURS OF OPERATION
PLANT LOCATION #3
STREET ADDRESS
CITVISTATEZIPCODE:
TELEPHONE NO.
HOURS OF OPERATION
Trem# | ot mix 5pPalic concree pavement, ot em 340, ype . nstalled or id by conactor personnel,
a5 oer bid soccifications 1000 | Tons | Noid NoBid NoResponse NoResponse NoResponse e
1075499 tons ver ob 587.06 s 06000
spECIEY: 590,00 s 000000
AWaRD
above i price s
PLANT LOCATION #1 determined by
Plant location
and enter below:
Plant 41
STREET ADDRESS s fon 4525 Leston Ave
Dalls. Texas 75247
Plant 42 210.6317682
s fon
CITVISTATEZIPCODE: 7am-som
Plant 43
s fon 4501 scvene Rosd
Sunnwale, Texas 75182
TELEPHONE NO. 972.226.4074
7am-som
HOURS OF OPERATION
PLANT LOCATION #2
STREET ADDRESS
CITVISTATEZIPCODE:
TELEPHONE NO.
HOURS OF OPERATION
PLANT LOCATION #3
STREET ADDRESS
CITVISTATEZIPCODE:
TELEPHONE NO.
HOURS OF OPERATION
HOT MIX ASPHALTIC CONCRETE PAVEMENT, TXDOT 340, TYPE B w00 | Toms
ttemi s51.00 $204000.00 [No 8id No Response 54650 $186.000.00 [ o Response o Response e
15 |LOADED ON COUNTY TRUCKS AT VENDOR PLANT
s5300 s21200000 4892 $195.68000
SPECIFY:
AwaRD
above f prie s
PLANT LOCATION #1 Getermined by
Plant location
and entr lo
Plant
n ron 14443 Goodright L 4625 Leston Ave
STREET ADDRESS Dallss, Texas 75229 Dalls,Texas 75247
Plant 12 o8
7am-5om
Plant 135

CITYISTATEZIPCODE:

TELEPHONE NO:

HOURS OF OPERATION:

PLANT LOCATION £2

STREET ADDRESS:

CITYISTATEZIPCODE:

TELEPHONE NO:

HOURS OF OPERATION:

PLANT LOCATION #3

STREET ADDRESS:

CITYISTATEIZIPCODE:

TELEPHONE NO:

9722012781

7am- 5 omMF

75805, Central Exomy

Dalls, Texas 75216

866-587.0001

7am-5 omM-F

4601 Scyene Road
Sunnyvale, Texas 75182
9722264070
7am-som




tem ¢

SYNOPSIS
BID NO. 2018.057-6750

INITIAL CONTRACT PERIOD: No
THREE ADDITIONAL ONE YEAR PERIODS

[BUYER: JAMES GAY (214) 653-7434. james gay@dallascounty.org

Description

vember 20, 2018 through November 19, 2019

Estimated
‘Annual

 ustin Asohalt Inc.
5330 Commerce Drive. Suite 150
Irving, Texas 75063

Eric Johnson

General Plants Manacer

Emal: erci@austin-ind.com
P 866-567-0001

Extended

Eraon Asohalt & Emulsions.
11612 R 2244 Building 1, Suite
250

Oldcastle Materials Texas,In. Texas Bt

420 Decker Drive Suite 200
Irving, Texas 75062
Lot
vp/nsst.sec

Extended

Pho 2147413531
Faxh 214.742-3540

Extended

HOURS OF OPERATION:

Hemi

HOT MIX ASPHALTIC CONCRETE PAVEMENT, TXDOT 340, TYPE D
LOADED ON COUNTY TRUCKS AT VENDOR PLANT

SPECIFY:

PLANT LOCATION #1

|STREET ADDRESS:

CITYISTATEZIPCODE:

TELEPHONE NO:

HOURS OF OPERATION:

PLANT LOCATION #2

|STREET ADDRESS:

CITYISTATEZIPCODE:

TELEPHONE NO:

HOURS OF OPERATION:

PLANT LOCATION #3

|STREET ADDRESS:

CITYISTATEIZIPCODE:

TELEPHONE NO:

HOURS OF OPERATION:

above i price is|

Plant 52
s

Plant 53
s on

[ DELIVERED TO PROJECT JOB SITES WITHIN DALLAS COUNTY.
SPECIFY:

PLANT LOCATION #1

|STREET ADDRESS:

CITYISTATEIZIPCODE:

TELEPHONE NO:

HOURS OF OPERATION:

PLANT LOCATION #2

STREET ADDRESS:
cmvisTATEZIPCODE:
TeLEPHONE No
HOLRS OF OPERATION:

PLANT LOCATION #3

|STREET ADDRESS:
CITYISTATEZIPCODE:

TELEPHONE NO:

HOURS OF OPERATION:

HOT MIX ASPHALTIC CONCRETE PAVEMENT, TXDOT ITEM 340, TYPE D

40000

PHALT 3 3

AE-P OR EQUAL

IDELIVERED TO PROJECT JOBSITE WITHIN DALLAS COUNTY.
sPECIFY.

rand,

Product No:

Minimum Truckloag:

PLANT LOCATION

|STREET ADDRESS:
CITYISTATEIZIPCODE:
TELEPHONE NO:

HOURS OF OPERATION:

T COMPANY

18000

Gal | Nosid

o bid

No Response

o Bid

No Response

No Response

No Response

Professionsl Coatine Technolosies. Inc.

1001 Wit Lebanon Road
Cedar Hil Texas 75100
 naron Bland

Nationsl Sales Director

Rieht Pointe LLC

) Box 467
Dekaly, Texas 60115,
Jennifer Skonie:

£.0.B0x 791550
San Antonio, Texas 78279

Kevin Vaus
i

Ph 214.673-4703
Faxt 9722916220

Extended

Ph 8157545700
Faxt 8157505702

Extended

Pt 2105243577
Faxt 2105203555

unit Extended

No Response

No Response

e

No Response

No Response

ne

No Response

No Response

ne

MARTIN ASPHALT CRS-2 OR EQUAL
LOADED ON COUNTY TRUCKS AT VENDOR PLANT

sPECIFY.

(ASPHALT EMULSION, RAPID SETTING (TABLE 6 OR 8), AS PER BID SPECIFICATIONS,

6000

Gal | NoBid

No Response

No Response

No Response

No Response

ne




tem ¢

SYNOPSIS
BID NO. 20180576750

and High Asphatic Materia

INITIAL CONTRACT PERIOD: November 20, 2018 through Novernber 19, 2019
THREE ADDITIONAL ONE YEAR PERIODS

BUYER: JAVES GAY (214) 6537434 james.gay@dallascounty.org

Description

Estimated
‘Annual
Quantity

Austin AsohaltIn.
5330 Commerce Drive. Suite 150

General Plants Manacer

Emal: erci@austin-ind.com
P 866-587-0001

Fact

| AWARDED ITEMS 7 AND 16

Extended

Er00n Asohalt & Emulsions
11612 Rm 2244 Building 1, Sute
250

nustin, Texas 78738

David St
Texas Reaional Manacer

Martin Marieta

10615 Spanaler Road
Dalas, Texas 75220
Chris Moreti

Sales

Oldcastle Materials Texas,Inc. Texas Bt

420 Decker Drive, Suite 200

Ve/Asst. sec.

Ph 512-469.0292
Fax 512-469-0391

|AWARDED ITEMS: 18, 19, 20)
23,24,32

Extended

P 072-408-3240
NA

| AWARDED ITEMS: 6,30,31

Extended

P 2147413531
Faxh 214.742-3540

| AwaRoED mems: 8,9, 10,11, 12,13, 14, 15
1

unit

Extended

Professionsl Coatine Technolosies. Inc.

1001 Wit Lebanon Road
Cedar il Texas 75104
Aaron Bland
NationalSales Director

Rieht Pointe LLC

P.0.80x467
Dekalo, Texas 60115,
Jennifer Skonie

Vulcan Construction Materials. LLC

P.0. Box 791550
a0 Antonio. Texas 76279

Kevin Vaushn

P 214.673-4703
Faxt972-291-6224

| awaroeo mems: 21, 22,25, 26, 27,2

unit

Extended

P 815-754-5700
Faxt 815.754-5702

| Awaroep mem 128

Unit

Extended

Pht 210-524-3577
Fax# 210-524-3555

| AWARDED ITEWS: 12,3,

Unit

Extended

Brand

Product No

Minimum Truckload:

PLANT LOCATION

STREET ADDRESS:

CITYISTATEIZIPCODE:

TELEPHONE NO:

HOURS OF OPERATION:

et

(ASPHALT EMULSION, RAPID SETTING (TABLE 6 OR ), AS PER BID SPECIFICATIONS,
MARTIN ASPHALT CRS-2 OR EQUAL
DELIVERED TO PROJECT JOBSITE WITH DALLAS COUNTY.
sPECIFY.
Brand
Product No
Minimum Truckload:
PLANT LOCATION

STREET ADDRESS:
CITYISTATEZIPCODE:

TELEPHONE NO:

HOURS OF OPERATION:

0000

Gal | Nosid

5229

AWARD

s

18320000

No Response

No Response

No Response

No Response

Ttemit

[ASPHALT EMULSION, MEDIUM SETTING (TABLE 6 OR 8), AS PER BID SPECIFICATIONS,
AL

LOADED QN COUNTY TRUCKS AT VENDOR PLANT
SPECIFY.
Brand
Product No
Minimum Truckload:
PLANT LOCATION

STREET ADDRESS:
CITYISTATEIZIPCODE:

TELEPHONE NO:

HOURS OF OPERATION:

6000

Gal | NoBid

Nogid

No Response

No Response

sa80

AwWARD

Mes-600C

MF830am.

$28.800.00

No Response

et
2

[ASPHALT EMULSION, MEDIUM SETTING (TABLE 6 OR 8), AS PER BID SPECIFICATIONS,

DELIVERED TO PROJECT JOBSITE WITHING DALLAS COUNTY

sPECIFY.

Brand

Product No

Minimum Truckioad:

PLANT LOCATION

STREET ADDRESS:

CITYISTATEZIPCODE:

TELEPHONE NO:

HOURS OF OPERATION:

6000

Gal | NoBid

Nogid

No Response

No Response

sa80

AwWARD

MCs 6001

3.000 eallons

MF 830am-4300m

2880000

No Response

e
2

[ASPHALT EMULSION POLYWER MODIFIED, RAPID SETTING (TABLE 9). AS PER BID
SPECIFICATIONS. MARTIN ASPHALT CRS-2P OR EQUAL

LOADED ON COUNTY TRUGKS AT VENDOR PLANT

SPECIFY.

Brand

Product No

Minimum Truckioad:

PLANT LOCATION

STREET ADDRESS:
CITYISTATEZIPCODE:

TELEPHONE NO:

HOURS OF OPERATION:

2000

Gal | NoBid

5250

s

5.000.00

No Response

No Response

No Response

No Response

e
2

[ASPHALT EMULSION POLYWER MODIFIED, RAPID SETTING (TABLE 9). AS PER BID
SPECIFICATIONS. MARTIN ASPHALT CRS-2P OR EQUAL
DELIVERED TO PROJECT JOBSITE WITHIN DALLAS COUNTY

SPECIFY.

Brand

Product No

Minimum Truckload:

PLANT LOCATION

STREET ADDRESS:
CITYISTATEZIPCODE:

TELEPHONE NO:

HOURS OF OPERATION:

5000

Gal |Nosid

5261

15.840.00

No Response

No Response

No Response

No Response

et

(ASPHALT ROADER SEALER, AS PER BID SPECIFICATIONS, PROFESSIONAL COATING.
TECHNOLOGIES COS-50 OR EOUAL
\DED ON COUNTY TRUCK:

1000

Gl
No Bid

NoBid

No Response

No Response

sa.60

No Response




tem ¢

SYNOPSIS
BID NO. 20180576750

and High Asphatic Materia

INITIAL CONTRACT PERIOD: November 20, 2018 through Novernber 19, 2019
THREE ADDITIONAL ONE YEAR PERIODS

BUYER: JAVES GAY (214) 6537434 james.gay@dallascounty.org

Description

Estimated
‘Annual
Quantity

Austin AsohaltIn.
5330 Commerce Drive. Suite 150

General Plants Manacer

Emal: erci@austin-ind.com
P 866-587-0001

Fact

| AWARDED ITEMS 7 AND 16

Extended

Er00n Asohalt & Emulsions
11612 Rm 2244 Building 1, Sute
250

nustin, Texas 78738

Martin Marieta

10615 Spanaler Road
Dalas, Texas 75220

Oldcastle Materials Texas,Inc. Texas Bt

420 Decker Drive, Suite 200

David St Chris Moreti ohn e
Texas Reaional Manacer sales Ve/Asst. sec.

Emal com
Ph 512-469.0292 P 072-408-3240 P 2147413531
Fax 512-469-0391 NA Faxh 214.742-3540

|AWARDED ITEMS: 18, 19, 20)
23,24,32

Extended

| AWARDED ITEMS: 6,30,31

Extended

| AwaRoED mems: 8,9, 10,11, 12,13, 14, 15
1

unit

Extended

Professionsl Coatine Technolosies. Inc.

1001 Wit Lebanon Road

NationslSales Director

Rieht Pointe LLC

P.0. Box 46
Dekalo, Texas 60115,
Jennifer Skonie

Vulcan Construction Materials. LLC

P.0. Box 791550
San Antonio, Texas 78279
Kevin Vaushn

Ph 214.673-4703
Foxt 9722916224

| awaroeo mems: 21, 22,25, 26, 27,2

unit

Extended

Ph 8157545700
Faxt 8157545702

| Awaroep mem 128

Unit

Extended

Phi 2105203577
Fax 210.524-3555

| AWARDED ITES: 12,3,

Unit

Extended

sPECIFY.

Brand

Product No

Minimum Truckload:

PLANT LOCATION

STREET ADDRESS:

CITYISTATEZIPCODE:

TELEPHONE NO:

HOURS OF OPERATION:

AWARD

o550

MF830am-4:300m.

et

REJUVENATING AGENT, AS PER BID SPECIFICATIONS, PROFESSIONAL COATING,
TECHNOLOGIES ARE-68 OR EQUAL
LOADED ON COUNTY TRUCKS AT VENDOR PLANT
sPECIFY.
Brand
Product No
Minimum Truckload:
PLANT LOCATION

STREET ADDRESS:
CITYISTATEZIPCODE:

TELEPHONE NO:

HOURS OF OPERATION:

6000

Gl

No Bid

NoBid

No Response

No Response

sa.50

AwWARD

M-F830am-4:300m

27.60000

No Response

et

REIUVENATING AGENT, AS PER BID SPECIFICATIONS, PROFESSIONAL COATING
TECHNOLOGIES AREE OR EOUAL
DELIVERED TO PROJECT JOBSITE WITHIN DALLAS COUNTY
speCIEY
Brand
Proguct o
Minimum Truckload:
PLANT LOCATION
STREET ADDRESS
CITVISTATEZIPCODE:
TELEPHONE NO.

HOURS OF OPERATION:

12000

Gal

No Bid

NoBid

No Response

No Response

s4.90

AwWARD

5880000

No Response

itemi

et

JOINT SEALANT, HOT POURED RUBBER, AS PER BID SPECIFICATIONS, CRAFCO POLYFLEX]
TYPE 3 OR EO
DELIVERED TO ROAD AND BRIDGE DISTRICT OFFICE
sPECIFY.
Brand
Product No
Minimum Truckioad:
PLANT LOCATION

STREET ADDRESS:
CITYISTATEZIPCODE:

TELEPHONE NO:

HOURS OF OPERATION:

LIGUID GEO-TECH MEMBRANE FOR POTHOLE REPAIR, AS PER BID SPECIFICATIONS,
COATING UAL

LOADED ON COUNTY TRUCK AT VENDOR
PLANT LOCATION

STREET ADDRESS:

CITYISTATEZIPCODE:

TELEPHONE NO:

HOURS OF OPERATION:

95,000

s

No Bid

NoBid

No Response

No Response

No Response

AWARD

$ 3610000

NB

10,000

Gl

Noid

NoBid

No Response

No Response

AwarD

M 8300.m4.30am.

650000

No Response

et
0

LIGUEFIED CEMENT SLURRY. TEXAS INDUSTRIES SUPERSLURRY(m OR EOUAL
LOADED ON COUNTY TRUCKS AT VENDOR PLANT

PLANT LOCATION

STREET ADDRESS:
CITYISTATEIZIPCODE:

TELEPHONE NO:

HOURS OF OPERATION:

%00

Tons

Nogia

Nobid

AwWARD

§ 153000

No Response

NoResporse

et
3

LIGUEFIED CEMENT SLURRY. TEXAS INDUSTRIES SUPERSLURRY{m OR EOUAL
DELIVERED AND SPREAD BY SUPPLIER AT PROJECT SITE(S) WITHIN DALLAS|

PLANT LOCATION

STREET ADDRESS:

CITYISTATEZIPCODE:

TELEPHONE NO:

HOURS OF OPERATION:

5000

Tons

Nogia

Nobid

$192.00

AwWARD

$ 960,000.00

NoResporse

NoResponse




SYNOPSIS
BID NO. 20180576750
 ustin Asohlt Inc Er00n Asohalt & Emulsions Martin Marieta Oldcastle Materials Texas,Inc. Texas Bt Professionsl Coatine Technolosies. Inc. Rieht Pointe LLC Vulcan Construction Materials. LLC
and Higt Asphaltic Materia 11612 Rm 2244 Building 1, Sute
5330 Commerce Drive. Suite 150 250 10615 Spanaler Road 420 Decker Drive, Suite 200 1001 Wit Lebanon Road P.0.80x 467 P.0. Box 791550
Irving, Texas 75063 Austin, Texas 78738 Dales, Texas 75220 Irving, Texas 75062 Cedar Hil Texas 75104 Dekalo, Texas 60115, San Antonio, Texas 78279
INITIAL CONTRACT PERIOD: November 20, 2018 through Novernber 19, 2019 Eric Johnson David stroud Chris Moreti oo Reid Raron Bland Jennifer Skorie Kevin Vaushn
THREE ADDITIONAL ONE YEAR PERIODS General Plants Manacer Texas Reaional Manacer sales Ve/Asst. sec. NationslSales Director Mar. S
BUYER: JAVES GAY (214) 6537434 james.gay@dallascounty.org Emal: erci@austin-ind.com Emal: h com Email Email
P 866-587-0001 Ph 512:469-9292 P 972-409-3240 Phe 2147413531 Ph 214.673-4703 Ph 8157545700 Phi 2105203577
Fact NA Fax 512-469-0391 NA Faxt 214.742:3540 Foxt 9722916224 Faxt 8157545702 Fax 210.524-3555
|AWARDED ITEMS: 18, 19, 20) | AwaRoED mems: 8,9, 10,11, 12,13, 14, 15
| AWARDED ITEMS 7 AND 16 23,24, 32 | AWARDED ITEMS: 6,30,31 1 | awaroeo mems: 21, 22,25, 26, 27,2 | Awaroep mem 128 | AWARDED ITEMS: 1. 2.3.4
Estimated
‘Annual
tem ¢ Description Quantity Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended unit Extended | unit Extended Unit Extended |unit Extended
et
CSS1H, CATIONIC, WATER-BASED ASPHALT EMULSION PRODUCT USED| 20000 | oms
PRIMARILY FOR TACK COAT AND FOG SEAL-AASHTO M/DE, T:Dat STD ¢
No Bid 5220 S 4400000 [NoResponse No Response No Response NB
32 |SPECIFICATION -ITEM 300
PLANT LOCATION AWARD
STREET ADDRESS:
CITYISTATEZIPCODE:
TELEPHONE NO:
HOURS OF OPERATION:
listed herein. The
hargesifees shallbe lsted on the invoice as a separate line item cost.
1. Demurrage Charge (use of common carrier) After hour $5000 /e 50 7500 s50 B 9500
After 1 hour
2 Demurrage Charge (use of own equipmen) After hour s 6000 /e s - B 9500
3. Pump and Hose Charge After hour N %0
4 four After hour $0.40/t0n So14/gal 090 N
mie
5. Move In Charge After hour N $2,000/fat N
NA
6 st (i anv) not this contract After hour
Name of ChargefFee: Rateprice $2.00/t0n
For Deliery to County forces, dd $2.00/on
fortandems
Name of ChargefFee Rateprice N
Name of ChargefFee: Rateprice N
Name of ChargefFee: Rateprice N
Name of ChargefFee: Rateprice N
7. Other charaesffes (f anv) o lsted but required inthe performance of his contract
Name of ChargefFee Rateprice N
Name of ChargefFee: Rateprice N
Name of ChargefFee: Rateprice N
Name of ChargefFee: Rateprice N
Name of ChargefFee: Rateprice N
Total $335.990
9,325.900.00 31476000 51.261,53000 12,338,26000! 13510000 3510000




	2018-057-6750

