Bid Tabulation ﬁl_

19_41FP Street Striping and Pavement McKINNEY. A & M Maintenance . Total Highway Cl Pavement (Alderink

Materials . Stripe-A-zone, Inc. ] .

Bid Opening: April 4, 2019 at 2:00 PM C.S.T. Unlque by nature. Services, Inc. Maintenance, LLC Enterprises, Inc)
PRIMARY Total Price $1,420.90( Total Price| $1,748.11 Total Price $4,786.89 Total Price $4,947.53
SECONDARY
Line# Description QTrYy (UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1 4" Broken, White 1 LF No Bid $0.80 $0.80 $1.25 $1.25 $1.10 $1.10
2 4" Solid, White 1 LF No Bid S0.80 $0.80 $1.00 $1.00 $1.10 $1.10
3 6" Broken, White 1 LF No Bid $1.00 $1.00 $1.45 $1.45 $1.65 $1.65
4 6" Solid, White 1 LF No Bid $1.00 $1.00 $1.35 $1.35 $1.65 $1.65
5 8" Broken, White 1 LF No Bid $2.25 $2.25 $2.00 $2.00 $2.20 $2.20
6 8" Solid, White 1 LF No Bid $2.25 $2.25 $1.85 $1.85 $2.20 $2.20
7 12" Solid, White 1 LF No Bid $3.95 $3.95 $5.00 $5.00 S4.40 $4.40
8 18" Solid, White 1 LF No Bid $4.60 $4.60 $6.00 $6.00 $6.10 $6.10
9 24" Solid, White 1 LF No Bid $5.95 $5.95 $7.00 $7.00 $6.60 $6.60
10 Arrow (White, Single) . . 1 EA No Bid $145.00| $145.00 $145.00 $145.00 $165.00 $165.00
. Section |. Thermoplasic -
11 Arrow (White, Combo) (Type 1} Pavement Markings 1 EA No Bid $300.00| $300.00 $255.00 $255.00 $220.00 $220.00
12  Yield Triangle (Symbol) (18" x 24") s &M EA No Bid $50.00 $50.00 $70.00 $70.00 $8.25 $8.25
13 Yield Triangle (Symbol) (24" x 36") (60 MIL) (Hand Work) 1 EA No Bid $55.00]  $55.00 $90.00 $90.00 $16.50 $16.50
14 Word (White) 1 EA No Bid $160.00| $160.00 $165.00 $165.00 $175.00 $175.00
15 Symbol (White) 1 EA No Bid $240.00| $240.00 $600.00 $600.00 $580.00 $580.00
16 4" Broken, Yellow 1 LF No Bid S0.80 $0.80 $1.25 $1.25 $1.10 $1.10
17 4" Solid, Yellow 1 LF No Bid $0.80 $0.80 $1.00 $1.00 $1.10 $1.10
18 8" Solid, Yellow 1 LF No Bid $2.25 $2.25 $1.85 $1.85 $2.20 $2.20
19 12" Solid, Yellow 1 LF No Bid $3.95 $3.95 $5.00 $5.00 $4.40 $4.40
20 24" Solid, Yellow 1 LF No Bid $6.15 $6.15 $7.00 $7.00 $6.60 $6.60
21 4" Shadow, Black 1 LF No Bid $2.15 $2.15 $4.00 $4.00 $1.10 $1.10
22 6" Shadow, Black 1 LF No Bid $2.95 $2.95 $4.00 $4.00 $1.65 $1.65
23 4" Broken, White 1 LF No Bid $0.70 $0.70 S0.85 $0.85|No Bid
24 4" Solid, White 1 LF No Bid $0.70 $0.70 $0.70 $0.70|No Bid
25 6" Broken, White 1 LF No Bid $0.90 $S0.90 $0.95 S0.95|No Bid
26 6" Solid, White Segetton T, Thineslestiic 1 LF No Bid $0.90 $0.90 $0.80 $0.80(No Bid
27 8" Broken, White (Type 1) Pa;/ement VTR 1 LF No Bid $2.10 $2.10 $1.45 $1.45|No Bid
28 8" Solid, White (60 MIL) (LONG LINE) (City 1 LF No Bid $2.10 $2.10 $1.25 $1.25(No Bid
29 4" Broken, Yellow Roads) 1 LF No Bid S0.70 $0.70 $0.85 $0.85|No Bid
30 4" Solid, Yellow 1 LF No Bid $0.90 $0.90 $0.70 $0.70(No Bid
31 8" Solid, Yellow 1 LF No Bid $2.10 $2.10 $1.25 $1.25|No Bid
32 4" Shadow, Black 1 LF No Bid $2.15 $2.15 $2.00 $2.00|No Bid
33 6" Shadow, Black 1 LF No Bid $2.95 $2.95 $2.00 $2.00|No Bid
34 gn Broken, White 1 LF No Bid S0.70 $0.70 $0.85 $0.85|No Bid
Section lll. Thermoplastic

35 4" Broken, White (Type 1) Pavement Markings|1 LF No Bid $0.70 $0.70 $0.70 $0.70(No Bid
36 4 Broken White (60 MIL) (LONG LINE) (Rural-l B . _

, County Roads) o Bid $0.70 $0.70 $0.85 $0.85|No Bid
37 4" Broken, White 1 LF No Bid $0.70 $0.70 $0.70 $0.70{No Bid
38 4" Broken, White 1 LF $2.50 $2.50 S0.55 $0.55 $0.60 $0.60 S0.18 $0.18
39 4" Solid, White 1 LF $1.00 $1.00 $0.55 $0.55 $0.55 $0.55 S0.18 S0.18
40 6" Broken, White 1 LF $3.50 $3.50 $0.65 $0.65 $0.75 $0.75 $0.24 $0.24
41 6" Solid, White 1 LF $1.50 $1.50 S0.65 S0.65 S0.65 S0.65 $0.24 S0.24
42 8" Broken, White 1 LF $4.50 $4.50 $1.00 $1.00 $0.85 $0.85 S0.36 $0.36
43 8" Solid, White 1 LF $2.25 $2.25 $1.00 $1.00 $0.75 $0.75 $0.36 $0.36
44 12" Solid, White 1 LF $3.45 $3.45 $1.80 $1.80 $2.00 $2.00 $1.00 $1.00
45 18" Solid, White 1 LF $4.50 $4.50 $2.60 $2.60 $3.00 $3.00 $1.50 $1.50
46 24" Solid, White 1 EA $9.50 $9.50 $3.00 $3.00 $4.00 $4.00 $2.00 $2.001.. .
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47  Arrow (White, Single) 1 EA $45.00 $45.00 $60.00(  $60.00 $55.00 $55.00 $18.00 $18.00

48  Arrow (White, Combo) 1 EA $90.00 $90.00 $70.00(  $70.00 $100.00 $100.00 $30.00 $30.00

49  Yield Triangle (Symbol) (18" x 24") 1 EA $25.00 $25.00 $22.00(  $22.00 $30.00 $30.00 $3.50 $3.50

50 Yield Triangle (Symbol) (24" x 36") Section IV. Paint (Type 1) |1 EA $25.00 $25.00 $30.00  $30.00 $40.00 $40.00 $6.00 $6.00

51  Word (White) Pavement Markings - Hand |1 EA $75.00 $75.00 $55.00 $55.00 $125.00 $125.00 $40.00 $40.00

52  Symbol (White) Work 1 EA $85.00 $85.00 $55.00(  $55.00 $300.00 $300.00 $50.00 $50.00

53  Stenciled Lettering (Parking Space) 1 Per Space $75.00 $75.00 $47.75|  $47.75 $25.00 $25.00 $12.00 $12.00

54 4" Broken, Yellow 1 LF $2.50 $2.50 $0.48 $0.48 $0.60 $0.60 $0.18 $0.18

55 4" Solid, Yellow 1 LF $1.00 $1.00 $0.48 $0.48 $0.55 $0.55 $0.18 $0.18

56 8" Solid, Yellow 1 LF $2.25 $2.25 $2.00 $2.00 $0.75 $0.75 $0.36 $0.36

57 12" Solid, Yellow 1 LF $3.45 $3.45 $2.30 $2.30 $2.00 $2.00 $1.00 $1.00

58 24" Solid, Yellow 1 LF $9.50 $9.50 $2.80 $2.80 $4.00 $4.00 $2.00 $2.00

59 4" Shadow, Black 1 LF $2.90 $2.90 $3.00 $3.00 $0.20 $0.20

60 6" Shadow, Black 1 LF $2.25 $2.25 $2.95 $2.95 $3.00 $3.00 $0.26 $0.26

61 6" Red w/ White Letters (Fire Lane) 1 LF $0.50 $0.50 $0.45 $0.45 $1.00 $1.00 $0.28 $0.28

62 12" Red w/ White Letters (Fire Lane Curb) 1 LF $1.20 $1.20 $0.63 $0.63 $2.00 $2.00 S0.56 $0.56

63 Handicap Pad (6'x6’ Max. Blue w/ White Symbol) 1 EA $45.00 $45.00 $37.40|  $37.40 $125.00 $125.00 $30.00 $30.00

64 4" Broken, White 1 LF No Bid $0.42 $0.42 $0.55 $0.55(No Bid

65 4" Solid, White 1 LF No Bid $0.42 $0.42 $0.45 $0.45|No Bid

66 6" Broken, White 1 LF No Bid S0.55 $0.55 $0.65 $0.65|No Bid

67 6" Solid, White 1 LF No Bid $0.55 $0.55 $0.55 $0.55|No Bid

68 8" Broken, White Section V. Paint (Type Il) |1 LF No Bid $0.80 $0.80 $1.00 $1.00(No Bid

69 8" Solid, White Pavement Markings (LONG |1 LF No Bid $0.80 $0.80 $0.75 $0.75|No Bid

70 4" Broken, Yellow LINE)(City Roads) 1 LF No Bid $0.42 $0.42 $0.55 $0.55|No Bid

71 4" Solid, Yellow 1 LF No Bid $0.42 $0.42 $0.45 $0.45|No Bid

72 8" Solid, Yellow 1 LF No Bid $0.80 $0.80 $1.00 $1.00|{No Bid

73 4" Shadow, Black 1 LF No Bid $1.10 $1.10 $2.00 $2.00{No Bid

74 6" Shadow, Black 1 LF No Bid $1.20 $1.20 $2.00 $2.00{No Bid

75 4" Broken, White 1 LF No Bid $0.60 $0.60 $0.45 $0.45|No Bid

76 4" Solid, White Psaizt;?:n\t/'vzar';;(;y&gwc_] 1 LF No Bid $0.60|  $0.60 $0.42 $0.42|No Bid

77 4" Broken, Yellow LINE)(Rural - County Roads) |1 LF No Bid $0.60 $0.60 $0.45 $0.45|No Bid

78 4" Solid, Yellow 1 LF No Bid $0.60 $0.60 $0.42 $0.42|No Bid
1 LF $2.00 $2.00[No Bid $4.00 $4.00 $3.30 $3.30
1 LF $1.50 $1.50[No Bid $2.00 $2.00 $3.30 $3.30
1 LF $3.50 $3.50(No Bid $4.00 $4.00 $4.95 $4.95
1 LF $2.35 $2.35(No Bid $3.00 $3.00 $4.95 $4.95
1 LF $4.75 $4.75|No Bid $6.00 $6.00 $6.60 $6.60
1 LF $3.75 $3.75(No Bid $5.00 $5.00 $6.60 $6.60
1 LF $4.50 $4.50(No Bid $6.00 $6.00 $8.25 $8.25
1 LF $5.50 $5.50(No Bid $10.00 $10.00 $13.20 $13.20
1 LF $9.00 $9.00(No Bid $15.00 $15.00 $16.50 $16.50
1 EA $85.00 $85.00[No Bid $175.00 $175.00 $495.00 $495.00
1 EA $150.00 $150.00[No Bid $250.00 $250.00 $740.00 $740.00
1 EA $35.00 $35.00|No Bid $100.00 $100.00 $16.50 $16.50
1 EA $35.00 $35.00[No Bid $145.00 $145.00 $24.75 $24.75
1 EA $175.00 $175.00|No Bid $300.00 $300.00 $495.00 $495.00
1 EA $175.00 $175.00|No Bid $1,000.00  $1,000.00{  $1,000.00 $1,000.00
1 LF $2.50 $2.50[No Bid $4.00 $4.00 $3.30 $3.30
1 LF $1.50 $1.50(No Bid $2.00 $2.00 $3.30 $3.30
1 LF $3.75 $3.75(No Bid $5.00 $5.00 $6.60 $6.60
1 LF $4.50 $4.50[No Bid $6.00 $6.00 $8.25 $8.25
1 LF $9.00 $9.00[No Bid $15.00 $15.00 $16.50 $16.50

99 4" Line, Broken 1 LF $1.00 $1.00 $0.68 $0.68 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00

100 4" Line, Solid 1 LF $1.00 $1.00 $0.68 $0.68 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00
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101 6" Line 1 LF $1.00 $1.00 S0.68 S0.68 $1.25 $1.25 $1.50 $1.50
102 8"Line 1 LF $1.20 $1.20 $0.90 $0.90 $2.00 $2.00 $2.00 $2.00
103 10" Line 1 LF $1.50 $1.50 $1.00 $1.00 $3.00 $3.00 $2.50 $2.50
104 12" Line Section VIIl. * Removal of |1 LF $1.50 $1.50 $1.40 $1.40 $4.00 $4.00 $3.00 $3.00
105 18" Line SevEmET e s B LF $2.00 $2.00 $1.60]  $1.60 $5.00 $5.00 $4.50 $4.50
106 24" Line Markers 1 LF $2.25 $2.25 $240]  $2.40 $6.00 $6.00 $5.50 $5.50
107 Arrow 1 EA $25.00 $25.00 $65.00 $65.00 $100.00 $100.00 $175.00 $175.00
108 Word 1 EA $55.00 $55.00 $65.00 $65.00 $125.00 $125.00 $225.00 $225.00
109 Symbol 1 EA $55.00 $55.00 $65.00 $65.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00
110 Miscellaneous Markings 1 SF $3.00 $3.00 $55.00 $55.00 $3.00 $3.00 $2.75 $2.75
111  Traffic Button / RPM 1 EA $1.00 $1.00 $5.75 $5.75 $2.00 $2.00 $1.25 $1.25
112 Type I-A, 1-Way Amber Refl Pvmt Marker 1 EA $4.00 $4.00 $5.75 $5.75 $5.00 $5.00 $4.40 $4.40
113  Type I-C, 1-Way Clear Refl Pvmt Marker 1 EA $4.00 $4.00 $5.75 $5.75 $5.00 $5.00 $4.40 $4.40
114 Type lI-A-A, 2-Way Amber Refl Pvmt Marker 1 EA $4.00 $4.00 S5.75 $5.75 $5.00 $5.00 S4.40 S4.40
A Type II-A-R, 2-Way Amber / Red Refl Pvmt Marker 1 EA $6.50 $6.50 $5.75 $5.75 $5.00 $5.00 $4.40 $4.40
116 Type II-C-R, 2-Way Clear / Red Refl Pvmt Marker Section IX. ¥ Reflective |1 EA $4.00 $4.00 $5.75 $5.75 $5.00 $5.00 $4.40 $4.40
117  Type Il-B-B, 2-Way Blue Refl Pvmt Marker Pavement Markers |1 EA $6.50 $6.50 $20.00]  $20.00 $10.00 $10.00 $4.40 $4.40
L Traffic Button, Non-reflective, Round (Type W) 1 EA $4.00 $4.00 $4.90 $4.90 $4.00 $4.00 $4.40 $4.40
) Traffic Button, Non-Reflective, Round (Type Y) 1 EA $4.00 $4.00 $4.90 $4.90 $4.00 $4.00 $4.40 $4.40
State additional percent discount offered for
120 items not specified on this bid. 1 EA No Bid No Bid

*Section 8 and 9 are awarded to the contractor who was awarded the major work item (section 1 through 7) and are incidental to the work items assigned by the City.
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