Kathx Nagel

From: Gersbach, Chris <Chris.Gersbach@oag.texas.gov>
Sent: Friday, January 10, 2020 9:55 AM

To: Kathy Nagel

Cc: Janna Benson-Caponera

Subject: RE: Vine

*REEX WARNING: External Email. Do not click links or open attachments that are unsafe. *****

Kathy,

In the Appriss Service Agreement Section 5.2 states, “not to exceed $7542.58”. The actual amounts for the Quarters
are:

1% - $7542.56
2M . $7542.56
3™ -$7542.56
4™ - $7542.58

Totaling $30170.26 which is the contracted amount.

Also, we have not received a signed copy of the Appriss Service Agreement from your County. | cannot send out the
Invoicing paperwork until it is received. Thanks.

Chris Gersbach

Lead Grant Manager and

Texas SAVNS Program Manager

Supervisor: Karly Watson - Karly.watson@oag.texas.gov
Grants Administration Division

Office of the Attorney General

512-936-1653

chris.gersbach@oag.texas.gov

From: Kathy Nagel <knagel@co.collin.tx.us>

Sent: Thursday, January 9, 2020 1:11 PM

To: Gersbach, Chris <Chris.Gershach@oag.texas.gov>

Cc: Janna Benson-Caponera <jbenson-caponera@co.collin.tx.us>
Subject: RE: Vine

Thanks Chris.

From: Gersbach, Chris <Chris.Gersbach@oag.texas.cov>
Sent: Thursday, January 9, 2020 12:03 PM

To: Kathy Nagel <knagel@co.collin,tx.us>

Subject: RE: Vine

WREEE WARNING: External Email. Do not click links or open attachments that are unsafe, ***#*




| will contact Appriss. Looks like it a mistake on their end. 1 will get back with you.

Chris Gersbach

Lead Grant Manager and

Texas SAVNS Program Manager

Supervisor: Karly Watson - Karly.watson@oag.texas.qgov
Grants Administration Division

Office of the Attorney General

512-936-1653

chris.gersbach@oag.texas.gov

From: Kathy Nagel <knagel@co.collin.tx.us>

Sent: Thursday, January 9, 2020 11:36 AM

To: Gersbach, Chris <Chris.Gershach @oag.texas.gov>
Subject: RE: Vine

$7542.58

From: Gersbach, Chris <Chris.Gershach@oag.texas.gcov>
Sent: Thursday, January 9, 2020 11:35 AM

To: Kathy Nagel <knagel@co.collin.tx.us>

Subject: RE: Vine

*rEEE WARNING: External Email. Do not click links or open attachments that are unsafe, *****

What is the Appriss invoice Quarterly amount?

Chris Gersbach

Lead Grant Manager and

Texas SAVNS Program Manager

Supervisor: Karly Watson - Karly.watson@oag.texas.gov
Grants Administration Division

Office of the Attorney General

512-936-1653

chris.gersbach@oag.texas.gov

From: Kathy Nagel <knagel@co.collin.tx.us>

Sent: Thursday, January 9, 2020 11:20 AM

To: Gersbach, Chris <Chris.Gersbach@oag.texas.gov>
Subject: Vine

Chris,
I am working on the Appriss court approval for the Vine grant.  The Appriss contract shows $7542.58 per quarter =
$30,170.32. However the OAG contract is approved at $30,170.26? Can you please advise regarding the

difference in contract totals.

Thank you,



Kathy Nagel

Collin County Auditor’s Office
2300 Bloomdale Road, Suite 3100
McKinney, TX 75071
972-548-4646



