
Total Price $649,223.19 Total Price $672,571.10 Total Price $724,128.86 Total Price $886,931.40 Total Price $927,197.77 Total Price $930,329.00 Total Price $939,390.00 Total Price $994,385.20 Total Price $760,486.50
Line # Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1 Lexmark C734, C736 - Black Return Toner CartridgeLexmark C734A1KG 180 each $98.00 $17,640.00 $91.25 $16,425.00 $114.14 $20,545.20 $161.60 $29,088.00 $174.99 $31,498.20 $149.00 $26,820.00 $139.00 $25,020.00 $164.12 $29,541.60 $119.00 $21,420.00
2 Lexmark C734, C736 - Cyan Return Toner CartridgeLexmark C734A1CG 115 each $125.00 $14,375.00 $145.00 $16,675.00 $180.43 $20,749.45 $256.80 $29,532.00 $279.99 $32,198.85 $237.00 $27,255.00 $220.00 $25,300.00 $260.78 $29,989.70 $179.00 $20,585.00
3 Lexmark C734, C736 - Magenta Return Toner CartridgeLexmark C734A1MG 140 each $125.00 $17,500.00 $145.00 $20,300.00 $180.43 $25,260.20 No Bid $279.99 $39,198.60 $237.00 $33,180.00 $220.00 $30,800.00 $260.78 $36,509.20 $179.00 $25,060.00
4 Lexmark C734, C736 - Yellow Return Toner CartridgeLexmark C734A1YG 100 each $125.00 $12,500.00 $145.00 $14,500.00 $180.43 $18,043.00 No Bid $279.99 $27,999.00 $237.00 $23,700.00 $220.00 $22,000.00 $260.78 $26,078.00 $179.00 $17,900.00
5 Lexmark C734, C736 - Photoconductor Unit Lexmark C734X20G 1100 each $33.51 $36,861.00 $26.75 $29,425.00 $28.00 $30,800.00 No Bid $49.99 $54,989.00 $36.00 $39,600.00 $35.00 $38,500.00 $29.78 $32,758.00 $34.75 $38,225.00
6 Lexmark C734, C736 - Waste Toner Bottle Lexmark C734X77G 90 each $8.80 $792.00 $6.87 $618.30 $7.36 $662.40 $10.20 $918.00 $11.99 $1,079.10 $10.00 $900.00 $11.00 $990.00 $8.26 $743.40 $14.95 $1,345.50
7 Lexmark C734, C736 - 110-120V Fuser Maintenance KitLexmark 40X8110 20 each $188.26 $3,765.20 $185.00 $3,700.00 $200.18 $4,003.60 $218.20 $4,364.00 No Bid $201.00 $4,020.00 $190.00 $3,800.00 $228.62 $4,572.40 $190.00 $3,800.00
8 Lexmark C734, C736 - Transfer Module Kit Lexmark 40X6401 40 each $177.87 $7,114.80 $176.00 $7,040.00 $188.10 $7,524.00 $206.10 $8,244.00 $237.59 $9,503.60 $190.00 $7,600.00 $177.00 $7,080.00 $214.84 $8,593.60 $179.00 $7,160.00
9 Lexmark C746, C748 - Black Toner Cartridge Lexmark C746H1KG 200 each $131.00 $26,200.00 $136.90 $27,380.00 $135.21 $27,042.00 $203.70 $40,740.00 $143.61 $28,722.00 $188.00 $37,600.00 $176.00 $35,200.00 $206.87 $41,374.00 $145.00 $29,000.00

10 Lexmark C746, C748 - Cyan Toner Cartridge Lexmark C746A1CG 150 each $150.00 $22,500.00 $170.60 $25,590.00 $144.25 $21,637.50 $253.80 $38,070.00 $274.99 $41,248.50 $234.00 $35,100.00 $218.00 $32,700.00 $257.80 $38,670.00 $195.00 $29,250.00
11 Lexmark C746, C748 - Magenta Toner CartridgeLexmark C746A1MG 120 each $150.00 $18,000.00 $170.60 $20,472.00 $144.25 $17,310.00 $253.80 $30,456.00 $274.99 $32,998.80 $234.00 $28,080.00 $218.00 $26,160.00 $257.80 $30,936.00 $195.00 $23,400.00
12 Lexmark C746, C748 - Yellow Toner Cartridge Lexmark C746A1YG 140 each $150.00 $21,000.00 $170.60 $23,884.00 $144.25 $20,195.00 $253.80 $35,532.00 $274.99 $38,498.60 $234.00 $32,760.00 $218.00 $30,520.00 $257.80 $36,092.00 $195.00 $27,300.00
13 Lexmark CS310, CS410, CS510 - 110-120V Fuser Maintenance KitLexmark 40X7615 10 each $246.10 $2,461.00 $242.85 $2,428.50 $251.43 $2,514.30 $280.20 $2,802.00 $360.26 $3,602.60 $263.00 $2,630.00 $248.00 $2,480.00 $309.40 $3,094.00 $256.00 $2,560.00
14 Lexmark CS310dn, CS410dn, CS510de - Black/Color High Yield Imaging KitLexmark 70C0Z50 65 each $222.70 $14,475.50 $177.60 $11,544.00 $178.27 $11,587.55 $242.10 $15,736.50 $279.99 $18,199.35 $238.00 $15,470.00 $224.00 $14,560.00 $249.41 $16,211.65 $210.00 $13,650.00
15 Lexmark CS410-CS510 - Black/Color High Yield Waste Toner CartridgeLexmark C540X75G 90 each $8.95 $805.50 $6.99 $629.10 $7.17 $645.30 $10.40 $936.00 $7.32 $658.80 $10.00 $900.00 $11.00 $990.00 $9.56 $860.40 $17.00 $1,530.00
16 Lexmark CS510de - Black High Yield Toner CartridgeLexmark 70C1HKO 490 each $67.00 $32,830.00 $68.45 $33,540.50 $72.14 $35,348.60 $98.00 $48,020.00 $73.63 $36,078.70 $96.00 $47,040.00 $90.00 $44,100.00 $101.18 $49,578.20 $77.00 $37,730.00
17 Lexmark CS510de - Cyan High Yield Toner CartridgeLexmark 70C1HCO 310 each $85.00 $26,350.00 $92.40 $28,644.00 $97.36 $30,181.60 $132.20 $40,982.00 $99.37 $30,804.70 $131.00 $40,610.00 $121.00 $37,510.00 $136.47 $42,305.70 $97.00 $30,070.00
18 Lexmark CS510de - Magenta High Yield Toner CartridgeLexmark 70C1HMO 440 each $85.00 $37,400.00 $92.40 $40,656.00 $97.36 $42,838.40 $132.20 $58,168.00 $99.37 $43,722.80 $131.00 $57,640.00 $121.00 $53,240.00 $136.47 $60,046.80 $97.00 $42,680.00
19 Lexmark CS510de - Yellow High Yield Toner CartridgeLexmark 70C1HYO 382 each $85.00 $32,470.00 $92.40 $35,296.80 $97.36 $37,191.52 $132.20 $50,500.40 $99.37 $37,959.34 $131.00 $50,042.00 $121.00 $46,222.00 $136.47 $52,131.54 $97.00 $37,054.00
20 Lexmark CS720, CS725, CX725 - Cyan Return Toner CartridgeLexmark 74C10C0 50 each $94.00 $4,700.00 $76.15 $3,807.50 $82.96 $4,148.00 $114.70 $5,735.00 $80.82 $4,041.00 $106.00 $5,300.00 $102.00 $5,100.00 $116.42 $5,821.00 $96.00 $4,800.00
21 Lexmark CS720, CS725, CX725 - Magenta Return Toner CartridgeLexmark 74C10M0 50 each $94.00 $4,700.00 $76.15 $3,807.50 $82.96 $4,148.00 $114.70 $5,735.00 $80.82 $4,041.00 $106.00 $5,300.00 $102.00 $5,100.00 $116.42 $5,821.00 $96.00 $4,800.00
22 Lexmark CS720, CS725, CX725 - Yellow Return Toner CartridgeLexmark 74C10Y0 50 each $94.00 $4,700.00 $76.15 $3,807.50 $82.96 $4,148.00 $114.70 $5,735.00 $80.82 $4,041.00 $106.00 $5,300.00 $145.00 $7,250.00 $116.42 $5,821.00 $96.00 $4,800.00
23 Lexmark CS720de - Black Return Toner CartridgeLexmark 74C1SK0 125 each $118.00 $14,750.00 $109.05 $13,631.25 $118.86 $14,857.50 $164.30 $20,537.50 $115.80 $14,475.00 $152.00 $19,000.00 $166.00 $20,750.00 $166.81 $20,851.25 $136.00 $17,000.00
24 Lexmark CS720de - Cyan Return Toner CartridgeLexmark 74C1SC0 125 each $136.00 $17,000.00 $124.98 $15,622.50 $136.21 $17,026.25 $188.20 $23,525.00 $132.70 $16,587.50 $174.00 $21,750.00 $166.00 $20,750.00 $191.76 $23,970.00 $139.00 $17,375.00
25 Lexmark CS720de - Magenta Return Toner CartridgeLexmark 74C1SM0 125 each $155.00 $19,375.00 $124.98 $15,622.50 $136.21 $17,026.25 $188.20 $23,525.00 $132.70 $16,587.50 $174.00 $21,750.00 Non-Resp. $191.76 $23,970.00 $139.00 $17,375.00
26 Lexmark CS720de - Yellow Return Toner CartridgeLexmark 74C10Y0 125 each $155.00 $19,375.00 $124.98 $15,622.50 $136.21 $17,026.25 $272.20 $34,025.00 $80.82 $10,102.50 $174.00 $21,750.00 $102.00 $12,750.00 $191.76 $23,970.00 $99.00 $12,375.00
27 Lexmark CS720de - Color Imaging Unit Lexmark 74C0Z50 5 each $234.84 $1,174.20 $185.03 $925.15 $196.96 $984.80 $272.20 $1,361.00 No Bid $251.00 $1,255.00 $247.00 $1,235.00 $283.20 $1,416.00 $245.00 $1,225.00
28 Lexmark CS720de - Black Imaging Unit Lexmark 74C0Z10 5 each $79.62 $398.10 $62.73 $313.65 $66.77 $333.85 $24.00 $120.00 $114.09 $570.45 $84.00 $420.00 $83.00 $415.00 $96.01 $480.05 $84.00 $420.00
29 Lexmark CS720de - Waste Toner Bottle Lexmark 74C0W00 5 each $20.66 $103.30 $15.90 $79.50 $17.32 $86.60 $107.60 $538.00 $25.99 $129.95 $22.00 $110.00 $24.00 $120.00 $24.35 $121.75 $29.00 $145.00
30 Lexmark CS720de - Fuser Lexmark 41X0252 5 each $370.74 $1,853.70 $373.00 $1,865.00 $385.09 $1,925.45 $429.60 $2,148.00 No Bid $396.00 $1,980.00 No Bid $289.51 $1,447.55 $390.00 $1,950.00
31 Lexmark MS415dn-MS510dn - Black High Yield Toner CartridgeLexmark 50F1H00 315 each $97.00 $30,555.00 $100.45 $31,641.75 $122.28 $38,518.20 $153.20 $48,258.00 $124.09 $39,088.35 $141.00 $44,415.00 $394.00 $124,110.00 $148.24 $46,695.60 $119.90 $37,768.50
32 Lexmark MS415dn-MS510dn - Imaging Unit Lexmark 50F0Z00 50 each $39.10 $1,955.00 $30.82 $1,541.00 $36.17 $1,808.50 $42.50 $2,125.00 $36.90 $1,845.00 $44.00 $2,200.00 $135.00 $6,750.00 $44.71 $2,235.50 $45.00 $2,250.00
33 Lexmark MS510, MS510dn - 110-120V Fuser Maintenance Kit, BlackLexmark 40X8281 5 each $221.79 $1,108.95 $224.05 $1,120.25 $227.61 $1,138.05 $257.00 $1,285.00 No Bid $237.00 $1,185.00 Non-Resp. $188.24 $941.20 $240.00 $1,200.00
34 Lexmark MS810 - Imaging Unit Lexmark 52D0Z00 45 each $41.82 $1,881.90 $32.97 $1,483.65 $38.68 $1,740.60 $45.50 $2,047.50 $39.47 $1,776.15 $45.00 $2,025.00 $43.00 $1,935.00 $47.06 $2,117.70 $39.90 $1,795.50
35 Lexmark MS810, MS811 - 110 - 120V Fuser Maintenance Kit, BlackLexmark 40X8420 5 each $224.67 $1,123.35 $216.98 $1,084.90 $185.39 $926.95 $260.60 $1,303.00 $370.99 $1,854.95 $240.00 $1,200.00 $226.00 $1,130.00 $197.65 $988.25 $240.00 $1,200.00
36 Lexmark MS810 - Black High Yield Toner CartridgeLexmark 52D1HOO 200 each $249.00 $49,800.00 $332.45 $66,490.00 $387.32 $77,464.00 $429.40 $85,880.00 $349.72 $69,944.00 $390.00 $78,000.00 $373.00 $74,600.00 $415.29 $83,058.00 $335.00 $67,000.00
37 Lexmark Re-Inking Ribbon Lexmark 3070166 5 each $12.08 $60.40 $11.71 $58.55 $12.59 $62.95 $14.00 $70.00 $20.89 $104.45 $16.00 $80.00 $15.00 $75.00 $14.25 $71.25 $14.00 $70.00
38 Lexmark T640, T642, T644 - Black High Yield Toner CartridgeLexmark 64004HA 20 each $199.00 $3,980.00 $254.03 $5,080.60 $406.70 $8,134.00 $420.00 $8,400.00 $349.07 $6,981.40 $415.00 $8,300.00 $398.00 $7,960.00 $457.06 $9,141.20 $399.00 $7,980.00
39 Lexmark T654 - Black High Yield Toner CartridgeLexmark T650H11A 40 each $280.00 $11,200.00 $287.22 $11,488.80 $406.14 $16,245.60 $477.30 $19,092.00 $414.41 $16,576.40 $464.00 $18,560.00 $498.00 $19,920.00 $516.78 $20,671.20 $289.00 $11,560.00
40 Lexmark T650, T652, T654 - 110 - 120V Fuser Maintenance Kit, BlackLexmark 40X4724 5 each $190.00 $950.00 $249.05 $1,245.25 $267.18 $1,335.90 $291.20 $1,456.00 $338.99 $1,694.95 $268.00 $1,340.00 $320.00 $1,600.00 $305.14 $1,525.70 $277.00 $1,385.00
41 Lexmark X746-748 - Black High Yield Toner CartridgeLexmark X746H1KG 130 each $122.00 $15,860.00 $124.07 $16,129.10 $130.76 $16,998.80 $189.30 $24,609.00 $204.99 $26,648.70 $175.00 $22,750.00 $165.00 $21,450.00 $192.27 $24,995.10 $160.00 $20,800.00
42 Lexmark X746-748 - Cyan Toner Cartridge Lexmark LEXX746A1CG 100 each $135.00 $13,500.00 $138.73 $13,873.00 $136.76 $13,676.00 $211.70 $21,170.00 $290.59 $29,059.00 $195.00 $19,500.00 $184.00 $18,400.00 $214.96 $21,496.00 $179.00 $17,900.00
43 Lexmark X746-748 - Magenta Toner CartridgeLexmark LEXX746A1MG 80 each $135.00 $10,800.00 $138.73 $11,098.40 $136.76 $10,940.80 $211.70 $16,936.00 $290.59 $23,247.20 $195.00 $15,600.00 $184.00 $14,720.00 $214.96 $17,196.80 $179.00 $14,320.00
44 Lexmark X746-748 - Yellow Toner Cartridge Lexmark LEXX746A1YG 70 each $135.00 $9,450.00 $138.73 $9,711.10 $136.76 $9,573.20 $211.70 $14,819.00 $227.99 $15,959.30 $195.00 $13,650.00 $184.00 $12,880.00 $214.96 $15,047.20 $179.00 $12,530.00
45 Lexmark X954dhe - Black High Yield Toner CartridgeLexmark X950X2KG 40 each $80.00 $3,200.00 $80.92 $3,236.80 $83.17 $3,326.80 $113.00 $4,520.00 $130.99 $5,239.60 $112.00 $4,480.00 $105.00 $4,200.00 $122.28 $4,891.20 $98.50 $3,940.00
46 Lexmark X954dhe - Cyan High Yield Toner CartridgeLexmark X950X2CG 20 each $250.00 $5,000.00 $382.59 $7,651.80 $393.20 $7,864.00 $534.00 $10,680.00 $613.99 $12,279.80 $524.00 $10,480.00 Non-Resp. $578.15 $11,563.00 $415.00 $8,300.00
47 Lexmark X954dhe - Magenta High Yield Toner CartridgeLexmark X950X2MG 20 each $250.00 $5,000.00 $382.59 $7,651.80 $393.20 $7,864.00 $534.00 $10,680.00 $613.99 $12,279.80 $524.00 $10,480.00 $494.00 $9,880.00 $578.15 $11,563.00 $415.00 $8,300.00
48 Lexmark X954dhe - Yellow High Yield Toner CartridgeLexmark X950X2YG 12 each $250.00 $3,000.00 $382.59 $4,591.08 $393.20 $4,718.40 $534.00 $6,408.00 $613.99 $7,367.88 $524.00 $6,288.00 $494.00 $5,928.00 $578.15 $6,937.80 $415.00 $4,980.00
49 Lexmark X954dhe - Black Photoconductor UnitLexmark C950X71G 20 each $175.00 $3,500.00 $185.79 $3,715.80 $186.53 $3,730.60 $253.30 $5,066.00 $292.99 $5,859.80 $252.00 $5,040.00 $245.00 $4,900.00 $255.41 $5,108.20 $199.00 $3,980.00
50 Lexmark X954dhe - Waste Toner Bottle Lexmark C950X76G 40 each $28.13 $1,125.20 $21.92 $876.80 $23.97 $958.80 $10.20 $408.00 $367.99 $14,719.60 $31.00 $1,240.00 $31.00 $1,240.00 $29.46 $1,178.40 $45.00 $1,800.00
51 Lexmark MS 521DN - High Yield Toner Lexmark 56F1X00 16 each $259.00 $4,144.00 $263.64 $4,218.24 $284.46 $4,551.36 $320.70 $5,131.20 $367.99 $5,887.84 $312.00 $4,992.00 $298.00 $4,768.00 $347.06 $5,552.96 $290.00 $4,640.00
52 Lexmark MS 521 DN - Imaging Unit Lexmark 56F0ZA0 2 each $72.88 $145.76 $69.10 $138.20 $73.41 $146.82 $79.30 $158.60 $90.99 $181.98 $79.00 $158.00 $75.00 $150.00 $107.05 $214.10 $77.00 $154.00
53 Lexmark MS 521 DN - Fuser Lexmark 41X1228 5 each $186.48 $932.40 $187.05 $935.25 $193.22 $966.10 $216.10 $1,080.50 No Bid $169.00 $845.00 $195.00 $975.00 $176.47 $882.35 $180.00 $900.00
54 Lexmark MS 821 DN - High Yield Toner Lexmark 58D1H00 40 each $195.00 $7,800.00 $175.87 $7,034.80 $189.76 $7,590.40 $213.90 $8,556.00 $324.99 $12,999.60 $208.00 $8,320.00 $198.00 $7,920.00 $231.76 $9,270.40 $196.00 $7,840.00
55 Lexmark MS 821 DN - Imaging Unit Lexmark 58D0ZA0 4 each $83.30 $333.20 $56.72 $226.88 $60.49 $241.96 $90.60 $362.40 $122.99 $491.96 $89.00 $356.00 $202.00 $808.00 $99.60 $398.40 $90.00 $360.00
56 Lexmark MS 821 DN - Fuser Lexmark 41X2233 5 each $228.06 $1,140.30 $228.05 $1,140.25 $235.41 $1,177.05 $264.30 $1,321.50 $308.99 $1,544.95 $251.00 $1,255.00 Non-Resp. $222.35 $1,111.75 $239.00 $1,195.00
57 Lexmark CS 521 DN - Black Toner Lexmark 78C1XK0 64 each $120.00 $7,680.00 $99.51 $6,368.64 $108.45 $6,940.80 $149.90 $9,593.60 $184.99 $11,839.36 $138.00 $8,832.00 $133.00 $8,512.00 $152.94 $9,788.16 $128.00 $8,192.00
58 Lexmark CS 521 DN - Cyan Toner Lexmark 78C1XC0 24 $140.00 $3,360.00 $122.24 $2,933.76 $133.23 $3,197.52 No Bid $226.99 $5,447.76 $169.00 $4,056.00 $162.00 $3,888.00 $187.06 $4,489.44 $157.00 $3,768.00
59 Lexmark CS 521 DN - Magenta Toner Lexmark 78C1XM0 24 each $140.00 $3,360.00 $122.24 $2,933.76 $133.23 $3,197.52 $184.10 $4,418.40 $226.99 $5,447.76 $169.00 $4,056.00 $162.00 $3,888.00 $187.06 $4,489.44 $157.00 $3,768.00
60 Lexmark CS 521 DN - Yellow Toner Lexmark 78C1XY0 24 each $140.00 $3,360.00 $122.24 $2,933.76 $133.23 $3,197.52 $184.10 $4,418.40 $226.99 $5,447.76 $169.00 $4,056.00 $162.00 $3,888.00 $187.06 $4,489.44 $157.00 $3,768.00
61 Lexmark CS 521 DN - Black and Color Imaging UnitLexmark 78C0ZV0 5 each $245.42 $1,227.10 $193.36 $966.80 $205.84 $1,029.20 $284.40 $1,422.00 $350.99 $1,754.95 $260.00 $1,300.00 $259.00 $1,295.00 $289.41 $1,447.05 $260.00 $1,300.00
62 Lexmark CS 521 DN - Waste Toner Bottle Lexmark 78C0W00 2 each $24.99 $49.98 $19.24 $38.48 $20.97 $41.94 $27.20 $54.40 $35.79 $71.58 $29.00 $58.00 $29.00 $58.00 $29.41 $58.82 $29.00 $58.00
63 Lexmark CS 521 DN - Fuser Lexmark 41X2097 5 each $166.41 $832.05 $171.80 $859.00 $171.91 $859.55 $192.90 $964.50 No Bid $178.00 $890.00 Non-Resp. $197.78 $988.90 $160.00 $800.00
64 Lexmark X954 - 110 - 120V Fuser Maintenance KitLexmark 40X7550 5 each $541.99 $2,709.95 $552.50 $2,762.50 $557.78 $2,788.90 $628.00 $3,140.00 No Bid $578.00 $2,890.00 Non-Resp. $580.94 $2,904.70 $540.00 $2,700.00
65 HP 72 - Photo Black High Yield (130ml) Ink CartridgeHP C9370A 10 each $65.00 $650.00 $62.40 $624.00 $53.95 $539.50 $66.00 $660.00 $51.55 $515.50 $70.00 $700.00 $55.00 $550.00 $73.36 $733.60 No Bid
66 HP 72 - Cyan High Yield (130ml) Ink Cartridge HP C9371A 5 each $65.00 $325.00 $62.40 $312.00 $53.95 $269.75 $66.00 $330.00 $51.55 $257.75 $70.00 $350.00 $55.00 $275.00 $73.36 $366.80 No Bid
67 HP 72 - Magenta High Yield (130ml) Ink CartridgeHP C9372A 5 each $65.00 $325.00 $62.40 $312.00 $53.95 $269.75 $66.00 $330.00 $51.55 $257.75 $70.00 $350.00 $55.00 $275.00 $73.36 $366.80 No Bid
68 HP 72 - Yellow High Yield (130ml) Ink CartridgeHP C9373A 10 each $65.00 $650.00 $62.40 $624.00 $53.95 $539.50 $66.00 $660.00 $51.55 $515.50 $70.00 $700.00 $55.00 $550.00 $73.36 $733.60 No Bid
69 HP 72 - Gray High Yield (130ml) Ink Cartridge HP C9374A 10 each $65.00 $650.00 $62.40 $624.00 $53.95 $539.50 $66.00 $660.00 $51.55 $515.50 $70.00 $700.00 $55.00 $550.00 $73.36 $733.60 No Bid
70 HP 72 - Matte Black High Yield (130ml) Ink CartridgeHP C9403A 5 each $62.98 $314.90 $62.40 $312.00 $53.95 $269.75 $69.20 $346.00 $51.55 $257.75 $70.00 $350.00 $55.00 $275.00 $73.36 $366.80 No Bid
71 HP 72 - Black/Yellow Printhead HP C9384A 5 each $66.03 $330.15 $62.40 $312.00 $56.95 $284.75 $69.20 $346.00 $54.05 $270.25 $70.00 $350.00 $58.00 $290.00 $88.04 $440.20 No Bid
72 HP 72 - Gray/Photo Black Printhead HP C9380A 5 each $66.03 $330.15 $62.40 $312.00 $56.95 $284.75 $69.20 $346.00 $54.05 $270.25 $70.00 $350.00 $58.00 $290.00 $88.04 $440.20 No Bid
73 HP 72 - Cyan/Magenta Printhead HP C9383A 5 each $66.03 $330.15 $62.40 $312.00 $56.95 $284.75 $69.20 $346.00 $54.05 $270.25 $70.00 $350.00 $58.00 $290.00 $88.04 $440.20 No Bid
74 HP 87X - Black High Yield Toner Cartridge HP CX287X 5 each $220.00 $1,100.00 $154.72 $773.60 $222.95 $1,114.75 No Bid No Bid $272.00 $1,360.00 $216.00 $1,080.00 $268.07 $1,340.35 No Bid
75 Primera Bravo 4100 Series - Cyan Ink CartridgePrimera Technology53601 5 each $25.95 $129.75 $26.00 $130.00 $26.95 $134.75 No Bid $40.95 $204.75 $29.00 $145.00 No Bid $28.25 $141.25 No Bid
76 Primera Bravo 4100 Series - Magenta Ink CartridgePrimera Technology53602 5 each $25.95 $129.75 $26.00 $130.00 $26.95 $134.75 No Bid $40.95 $204.75 $29.00 $145.00 No Bid $28.25 $141.25 No Bid
77 Primera Bravo 4100 Series - Yellow Ink CartridgePrimera Technology53603 5 each $25.95 $129.75 $26.00 $130.00 $26.95 $134.75 No Bid $40.95 $204.75 $29.00 $145.00 No Bid $28.25 $141.25 No Bid
78 Primera Bravo 4100 Series - Black Ink CartridgePrimera Technology53604 5 each $32.00 $160.00 $35.00 $175.00 $36.95 $184.75 No Bid $54.95 $274.75 $36.00 $180.00 No Bid $38.05 $190.25 No Bid
79 Primera Bravo 4100 Series - Print Head Primera Technology53471 5 each $74.95 $374.75 $75.00 $375.00 $79.95 $399.75 No Bid No Bid $83.00 $415.00 No Bid $105.01 $525.05 No Bid

Cooperative 
Cooperative Contract No.
Cooperative Contract Expiration
Cooperative Contract Renewal Opt.
Certified  HP Reseller (Y/N)
Certified Lexmark Reseller (Y/N)

Pristore Services; responded "N/A" to cooperative attributes.

The Tree House; no current cooperative conract available

The Office Pal; vendor will honor cooperative pricing through term of contract (see email)

Softchoice Corporation; responded "N/A" to cooperative attributes
Saitech Inc.; responded "N/A" to cooperative attributes
Royal Media Network; responded "N/A" to cooperative attributes

Smart Group Systems; lines 25 & 46 are non-responsive.

Barbarian USA Inc. dba. World tech 
Supply (Barbarian USA Inc.)

Manual Submission: RE Business Solutions; responded "N/A" to cooperative attributes.

12/21/2021
2

9/28/2024
N/A

N
Y

N
Y

19-12R
BuyBoard

Y
Y

Notes / Justification:

Y
Y

BuyBoard
579-19

OMNIA

*** 01/24/20 DRAFT UNTIL AWARD DETERMINATION IS MADE ***

Beyond Technology; no current cooperative contract available

5/31/2020
0

9/28/2024 / 9/3/2024
N/A

9/28/2024 / 9/3/2024
N/A

12/21/2021
2

10/13/2023
4

Y

DIR
TSO-4159

Choice Partners
17/026KH-10

YY

Xerox Business Solutions Southwest 
(Dahill Office Technology Corporaton)

Y

Peacock Enterprises; not listed as authorized reseller under DIR cooperative

BuyBoard
528-17

DIR
HP: TSO-4159 / Lexmark: CPO-4438

DIR
HP: TSO-4159 / Lexmark: CPO-4438

Y
Y
Y

579-19

N
Y

2

COOP QUOTE 2020-136 BID TAB

Howard Technology Solutions 
(Howard Industries Inc.)

SMART GROUP SYSTEMS 
(BEEPSMART COMMUNICATIONS INC)

V-Questthe office pal
Dream Ranch Office Suppliez (Dream 

Ranch LLC)

6/19/2020

SHI Government Solutions Office Depot

OMNIA
R171403

2/28/2021
2
N 
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Line #
1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29
30
31
32
33
34
35
36
37
38
39
40
41
42
43
44
45
46
47
48
49
50
51
52
53
54
55
56
57
58
59
60
61
62
63
64
65
66
67
68
69
70
71
72
73
74
75
76
77
78
79

Total Price $824,142.80 Total Price $979,571.74 Total Price $877,449.47 Total Price $882,876.30
Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

$128.25 $23,085.00 $157.46 $28,342.80 $141.95 $25,551.00 $142.72 $25,689.60
$203.75 $23,431.25 $250.21 $28,774.15 $225.37 $25,917.55 $226.78 $26,079.70
$203.75 $28,525.00 $250.21 $35,029.40 $225.37 $31,551.80 $226.78 $31,749.20
$203.75 $20,375.00 $250.21 $25,021.00 $225.37 $22,537.00 $226.78 $22,678.00

$31.65 $34,815.00 $32.90 $36,190.00 $34.30 $37,730.00 $34.30 $37,730.00
$8.15 $733.50 $10.16 $914.40 $9.13 $821.70 $9.01 $810.90

$223.50 $4,470.00 $222.03 $4,440.60 $197.48 $3,949.60 $192.68 $3,853.60
$210.00 $8,400.00 $208.65 $8,346.00 $186.58 $7,463.20 $182.05 $7,282.00
$161.65 $32,330.00 $198.47 $39,694.00 $178.80 $35,760.00 $179.89 $35,978.00
$201.40 $30,210.00 $247.33 $37,099.50 $222.83 $33,424.50 $224.18 $33,627.00
$201.40 $24,168.00 $247.33 $29,679.60 $222.83 $26,739.60 $224.18 $26,901.60
$201.40 $28,196.00 $247.33 $34,626.20 $222.83 $31,196.20 $224.18 $31,385.20
$288.20 $2,882.00 $286.35 $2,863.50 $258.16 $2,581.60 $251.88 $2,518.80
$210.25 $13,666.25 $249.36 $16,208.40 $226.09 $14,695.85 $227.93 $14,815.45

$8.30 $747.00 $10.34 $930.60 $9.29 $836.10 $9.16 $824.40
$82.85 $40,596.50 $101.77 $49,867.30 $92.06 $45,109.40 $92.24 $45,197.60

$111.85 $34,673.50 $137.34 $42,575.40 $123.79 $38,374.90 $124.48 $38,588.80
$111.85 $49,214.00 $137.34 $60,429.60 $123.79 $54,467.60 $124.48 $54,771.20
$111.85 $42,726.70 $137.34 $52,463.88 $123.79 $47,287.78 $124.48 $47,551.36

$89.85 $4,492.50 $111.70 $5,585.00 $101.08 $5,054.00 $101.23 $5,061.50
$89.85 $4,492.50 $111.70 $5,585.00 $101.08 $5,054.00 $101.23 $5,061.50
$89.85 $4,492.50 $111.70 $5,585.00 $101.08 $5,054.00 $101.23 $5,061.50

$128.75 $16,093.75 $160.04 $20,005.00 $143.49 $17,936.25 $145.06 $18,132.50
$147.50 $18,437.50 $183.40 $22,925.00 $164.82 $20,602.50 $166.23 $20,778.75
$147.50 $18,437.50 $183.40 $22,925.00 $168.67 $21,083.75 $166.23 $20,778.75

$89.85 $11,231.25 $183.40 $22,925.00 $101.08 $12,635.00 $101.23 $12,653.75
$219.00 $1,095.00 $273.40 $1,367.00 $243.90 $1,219.50 $240.36 $1,201.80

$74.25 $371.25 $92.69 $463.45 $81.33 $406.65 $81.49 $407.45
$18.85 $94.25 $20.28 $101.40 $21.21 $106.05 $21.15 $105.75

$441.40 $2,207.00 $438.56 $2,192.80 $388.91 $1,944.55 $379.45 $1,897.25
$140.20 $44,163.00 $149.29 $47,026.35 $133.74 $42,128.10 $135.31 $42,622.65

$41.55 $2,077.50 $44.16 $2,208.00 $39.79 $1,989.50 $40.02 $2,001.00
$265.10 $1,325.50 $264.86 $1,324.30 $232.66 $1,163.30 $227.00 $1,135.00

$45.55 $2,049.75 $47.22 $2,124.90 $42.62 $1,917.90 $42.80 $1,926.00
$265.75 $1,328.75 $264.06 $1,320.30 $235.67 $1,178.35 $229.95 $1,149.75
$392.95 $78,590.00 $418.41 $83,682.00 $374.72 $74,944.00 $379.23 $75,846.00

$13.95 $69.75 $13.64 $68.20 $12.41 $62.05 $12.36 $61.80
$447.70 $8,954.00 $417.63 $8,352.60 $394.97 $7,899.40 $397.46 $7,949.20
$465.65 $18,626.00 $495.80 $19,832.00 $444.13 $17,765.20 $449.38 $17,975.20
$299.90 $1,499.50 $280.57 $1,402.85 $263.58 $1,317.90 $257.17 $1,285.85
$150.20 $19,526.00 $184.47 $23,981.10 $166.19 $21,604.70 $167.20 $21,736.00
$167.95 $16,795.00 $210.93 $21,093.00 $189.68 $18,968.00 $186.93 $18,693.00
$167.95 $13,436.00 $210.93 $16,874.40 $189.68 $15,174.40 $186.93 $14,954.40
$167.95 $11,756.50 $210.93 $14,765.10 $189.68 $13,277.60 $186.93 $13,085.10

$95.55 $3,822.00 $117.32 $4,692.80 $106.05 $4,242.00 $106.33 $4,253.20
$451.70 $9,034.00 $554.70 $11,094.00 $499.59 $9,991.80 $502.75 $10,055.00
$451.70 $9,034.00 $554.70 $11,094.00 $499.59 $9,991.80 $502.75 $10,055.00
$451.70 $5,420.40 $554.70 $6,656.40 $499.59 $5,995.08 $502.75 $6,033.00
$220.00 $4,400.00 $271.28 $5,425.60 $237.06 $4,741.20 $238.51 $4,770.20

$26.00 $1,040.00 $32.49 $1,299.60 $28.80 $1,152.00 $28.79 $1,151.60
$311.65 $4,986.40 $333.13 $5,330.08 $298.32 $4,773.12 $301.94 $4,831.04

$82.25 $164.50 $84.85 $169.70 $74.47 $148.94 $74.59 $149.18
$225.15 $1,125.75 $226.23 $1,131.15 $195.61 $978.05 $190.86 $954.30
$207.90 $8,316.00 $227.27 $9,090.80 $199.00 $7,960.00 $201.41 $8,056.40

$66.80 $267.20 $96.97 $387.88 $86.51 $346.04 $85.26 $341.04
$272.80 $1,364.00 $272.58 $1,362.90 $239.23 $1,196.15 $233.42 $1,167.10
$117.45 $7,516.80 $142.11 $9,095.04 $130.96 $8,381.44 $132.36 $8,471.04
$144.30 $3,463.20 $207.52 $4,980.48 $161.26 $3,870.24 $162.59 $3,902.16
$144.30 $3,463.20 $207.52 $4,980.48 $161.26 $3,870.24 $162.59 $3,902.16
$144.30 $3,463.20 $207.52 $4,980.48 $161.26 $3,870.24 $162.59 $3,902.16
$228.85 $1,144.25 $285.70 $1,428.50 $248.19 $1,240.95 $251.19 $1,255.95

$22.80 $45.60 $28.86 $57.72 $25.55 $51.10 $25.58 $51.16
$200.80 $1,004.00 No Bid $174.57 $872.85 $170.32 $851.60
$647.95 $3,239.75 $647.38 $3,236.90 $568.54 $2,842.70 $554.73 $2,773.65

$74.00 $740.00 $59.26 $592.60 $56.36 $563.60 $64.46 $644.60
$74.00 $370.00 $59.26 $296.30 $56.36 $281.80 $64.46 $322.30
$74.00 $370.00 $59.26 $296.30 $56.36 $281.80 $64.46 $322.30
$74.00 $740.00 $59.26 $592.60 $56.36 $563.60 $64.46 $644.60
$74.00 $740.00 $59.26 $592.60 $56.36 $563.60 $64.46 $644.60
$74.00 $370.00 $59.26 $296.30 $56.36 $281.80 $64.46 $322.30
$76.75 $383.75 $62.14 $310.70 $59.10 $295.50 $67.58 $337.90
$76.75 $383.75 $62.14 $310.70 $59.10 $295.50 $67.58 $337.90
$76.75 $383.75 $62.14 $310.70 $59.10 $295.50 $67.58 $337.90

$294.55 $1,472.75 $245.30 $1,226.50 No Bid $263.11 $1,315.55
$25.99 $129.95 $27.50 $137.50 $29.05 $145.25 $33.34 $166.70
$25.99 $129.95 $27.50 $137.50 $29.05 $145.25 $33.24 $166.20
$25.99 $129.95 $27.50 $137.50 $29.05 $145.25 $33.24 $166.20
$35.00 $175.00 $37.04 $185.20 $36.64 $183.20 $44.77 $223.85
$84.55 $422.75 $88.63 $443.15 $81.97 $409.85 $80.52 $402.60

Southern Computer Warehouse 
(SCW)

Liberty Data Products DBA Liberty 
Office Products

Cesco, Inc.
Can-Am Wireless LLC dba Can-Am IT 

Solutions
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