
Total Price $1,251.90 Total Price $22,695.00 Total Price $55,236.30 Total Price $63,269.83 Total Price $69,540.14 Total Price $70,712.69 Total Price $75,344.55 Total Price $83,302.00 Total Price $86,938.17 Total Price $94,053.40 Total Price $94,113.86 Total Price $96,648.86 Total Price #########
Line # Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY UOM Unit Qty/Pkg Price Ea. Unit Qty/Pkg Price Ea. Unit Qty/Pkg Price Ea. Unit Qty/Pkg Price Ea. Unit Qty/Pkg Price Ea. Unit Qty/Pkg Price Ea. Unit Qty/Pkg Price Ea. Unit Qty/Pkg Price Ea. Unit Qty/Pkg Price Ea. Unit Qty/Pkg Price Ea. Unit Qty/Pkg Price Ea. Unit Qty/Pkg Price Ea. Unit Qty/Pkg Price Ea.

1 Trash Bags: 24"x33", 16-16 gal. 1.0 Mil. or greater Natural Color 
Only, 1000 units/ case 300 case No Bid $18.25 1000/case $0.01825 No Bid $13.74 250/case $0.05496 $24.37 1000/case $0.02437 $27.42 1000/case $0.02742 $20.52 500/case $0.04104 No Bid $28.39 500/case $0.05678 $39.91 1000/case $0.03991 No Bid $27.40 1000/case $0.0274 $22.58 1000/case 0.02258

1 ALT1 24x33 8mic 12-16 natural liner Berry HR243308N 300 case $26.05 1000/case 0.02605

1 ALT1 Trash Bags: 24"x33", 16-16 gal. 1.0 Mil. **CLEAR**, 1000 units/ 
case NAPCO CUST24X331.0MIL 300 case

2 Trash Bags: 38"x60",60 gal. 1.5 Mil or greater Natural Color Only, 
150 units/ case 560 case No Bid $24.60 150/case $0.164 No Bid $22.21 100/case $0.2221 $24.61 200/case $0.12305 $22.25 200/case $0.11125 $17.43 100/case $0.1743 No Bid $22.36 100/case $0.2236 $20.47 150/case $0.136467 No Bid $22.21 200/case $0.11105 $27.41 100/case 0.2741

2 ALT1 AFXZ7660VNFR1 420 case $24.61 200/case 0.12305
2 ALT1 WESTCRAFT 38X58 1.5MIL, CLEAR 100/CS Westcraft L385815C 560 case $22.21 100/case 0.2221
2 ALT1 38x60, 60gal 14MIC natural liner, 200 units per case Berry OKTC-3860-14N 560 case $24.75 200/case 0.12375
2 ALT1 Trash Bags: 38"x60",60 gal. 1.5 Mil **CLEAR**, 150 units/ case NAPCO RST3858X1C 560 case

3 Drum Liners: 38"x63" 2.7 Mil. Or greater Black Color Only, 50 units / 
roll 140 case No Bid $24.60 50/case $0.492 $27.52 50/case $0.5504 $22.75 50/case $0.455 $29.53 50/case $0.5906 $22.53 50/roll $0.4506 $36.46 50/case $0.7292 No Bid $24.37 50/case $0.4874 No Bid $43.45 50/case $0.869 $30.01 50/case $0.6002 $26.80 50/case 0.536

3 ALT1
WESTCRAFT 38X63 2.5MIL DRUM LINER BLACK 50/CS(L38632.5K) Westcraft 38632.5MIL 140 case $22.75 50/case 0.455

4 Gloves: 5 Mil. Nitrile, 9.5" Long, Powder Free, Textured Hand, Light 
Blue SM, MD, LG, XL, 100 units / box 130 box $9.63 100/box $0.0963 No Bid $6.25 100/box $0.0625 $4.62 100/box $0.0462 $3.78 100/box $0.0378 $4.91 100/box $0.0491 $13.80 100/box $0.138 No Bid $3.93 100/box $0.0393 $23.75 100/box $0.2375 No Bid $1.94 100/box $0.0194 $3.41 100/box 0.0341

4 ALT1 4 Mil. Nitrile, 9.5" Long, Powder Free, Textured Hand, Light Blue 
SM, MD, LG, XL, 100 units / BOXbox Tradex NSM200, NMD200, NL200, NXL200130 box $4.62 100/box 0.0462

5
Roll Tissue / Towel: Premium Quality, super absorbent, 8"x800' 
Must fit Kimberly Clark 09765 dispenser 6 units / case, Bleached 
Only 585 case No Bid No Bid $31.20

4800/lf        
6/cs $0.0065 $25.45

4800/lf        
6/cs $0.005302 $27.33

4800/lf        
6/cs $0.005694 $19.53

4800/lf        
6/cs $0.004069 $37.77

6000/lf        
6/cs $0.006295 No Bid $62.12

9600/lf        
12/cs $0.006471 $53.82

4800/lf        
6/cs $0.011213 $98.12

9600/lf        
12/cs $0.010221 $66.60

12000/lf        
12/cs $0.00555 $111.30

9600/lf        
12/cs 0.011594

5 ALT1
Roll Tissue / Towel: Premium Quality, super absorbent, 8"x800' 
Must fit Kimberly Clark 09765dispenser 6 units / case, Bleached 
Only Westcraft WC2101W 585 case $25.45

4800/lf        
6/cs 0.00530208

5 ALT1 Roll Tissue / Towel: Premium Quality, super absorbent, 7.87"x800', 
6 units / case, Bleached Only Marcal P708B 585 case

5 ALT1
Preserve ,Bleach, Recycle,1-5/8" CORE 7.9"X800' BLCH 35CS/PL 
12RL/CS. NOTE: This item is package 12/CS. Towel will fit in 
KCC09765 Vondrehle 88115B 585 case $46.59

9600/lf        
12/cs 0.004853125

6
Wipers: White 12.5"x12" 1/4 Fold, double re-creped material. Wipe 
All Brand OR Collin County Approved Equal 56 units / package, 18 
packages / case 50 case No Bid No Bid $76.20 1008/case $0.075595 $58.35 1008/case $0.057887 $47.29 1008/case $0.046915 $65.99 1008/case $0.065466 No Bid No Bid $56.22 1080/case $0.052056 $128.58 1008/case $0.12756 $74.48 1008/case $0.073889 $49.20 1008/case $0.04881 $70.61 1008/case 0.07005

6 ALT1 Wipers: White 12.5"x12" 1/4 Fold, double re-creped material. 
**50/PKG, 20 PKG/CASE** MDI 86207 50 case

7 Hand Soap: Gentle Lotion Hand Soap 1000mL (1-liter) refill, floral 
scent, must fit Kimberly Clark 92144 Dispenser 6 units / case 191 case No Bid No Bid No Bid $48.58 6000/ml $0.008097 $32.69 6000/ml $0.005448 $36.74 6000/ml $0.006123 $39.60 6000/ml $0.0066 No Bid $50.37 6000/ml $0.008395 No Bid $44.76 6000/ml $0.00746 $43.86 6000/ml $0.00731 $58.31 6000/ml 0.009718

7 ALT1 SPARTAN FOAMYiQ CRANBERRY ICE, ALL-IN-ONE DISP/SOAP SPARTAN CHEMICAL4602-4 191 case $32.62 5000/ml 0.006524

8 Hand Soap: Bulk pour moisturizing lotion hand soap, 1 gallon 
bottles, 1500 - 2500 cPs viscosity. 4 units / case 500 case No Bid No Bid $28.67 4 gal/case $7.1675 $13.56 4 gal/case $3.39 $19.18 4 gal/case $4.795 $20.31 4 gal/case $5.0775 $22.52 4 gal/case $5.63 $152.06 4 gal/case $38.015 $4.88 1 gal/case $4.88 $46.40 4 gal/case $11.60 $27.20 4 gal/case $6.80 $18.08 4 gal/case $4.52 $19.96 4 gal/case 4.99

8 ALT1 SWOOP EF, 4 X 1 GL, NAC NC CHEMSEARCH10177317 500 case $152.06 4 gal/case 38.015

9 Cleaner: All Purpose Cleaner Lavender Scented (liquid) Ready to 
Use 1 Gallon Container 200 gallon No Bid No Bid $30.50 4 gal/case $7.625 $6.58 1 gallon $6.58 $5.90 1 gallon $5.90 $18.50 4 gal/case $4.625 $8.56 1 gallon $8.56 $36.36 5 gal/case $7.272 $10.67 1 gallon $10.67 $4.19 1 gallon $4.19 $3.18 1 gallon $3.18 $9.96 1 gallon $9.96 $7.02 1 gallon $7.02

9 ALT1 SPA001904 50 case $23.61 4 gal/case 5.9025
9 ALT1 FRESH SENSE, 2 X 2.5 GL, US NC CHEMSEARCH10031009 200 case $36.36 5 gal/case 7.272

10 Floor Finish: High Solids Floor Finish, RTU, 25% Solids content, 2000 
to 2500 sf coverage per gallon 5- Gallon bucket / container 50 bucket No Bid No Bid $71.40 5 gal. cont. $14.28 $65.35 5 gal. cont. $13.07 $59.34 5 gal. cont. $11.868 $55.99 5 gal. cont. $11.198 $82.02 5 gal. cont. $16.404 No Bid $66.82 6 gal. cont. $11.136667 $90.04 5 gal. cont. $18.008 $65.85 5 gal. cont. $13.17 $67.50 5 gal. cont. $13.50 $60.02 5 gal. cont. 12.004

11 Carpet Cleaner: Encapsulating Powdered carpet cleaning Emulsifier 
4 gallons / case (1 gallon containers) 10 case No Bid No Bid $141.20 4 gal/case $35.30 $18.70 4 gal/case $4.675 $34.08 4 gal/case $8.52 No Bid $46.96 4 gal/case $11.74 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

11 ALT1 Carpet Cleaner: Encapsulating Powdered carpet cleaning Emulsifier 
4 gallons / case (1 galloncontainers) Betco 4200400 10 case $18.70 4 gal/case 4.675

12 Wood Mop Handle, Screw-In 1/4" Thread, 60" long, 1-1/8" 
diameter 100 each No Bid No Bid $6.10 each $2.67 each $4.82 each $3.14 each $4.42 each No Bid $1.43 each $10.76 each $4.15 each $3.99 each $3.80 each

13
Wood Push Broom Handle, threaded tip, 60" long, 1-5/8" diameter 100 each No Bid No Bid $6.10 each $1.49 each $4.86 each $4.40 each $2.46 each No Bid $2.85 each No Bid $4.14 each $3.99 each No Bid

13 ALT1 Wood Push Broom Handle, threaded tip, 60" long, **1-1/8" 
DIAMETER** ABCO 01121 100 each

14 24oz Mop Head  threaded screw type, blue poly-blend, cut end, lie 
flat 260 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.93 each $3.97 each $11.81 each $5.32 each No Bid $4.09 each $5.71 $1,484.60 No Bid

14 ALT1 AMAB3524- MOP,CUT,STAFLAT,RAY,24OZ,DZ/CS $47.67/CS Amarillo Mop & BroomAMAB3524 22 case $47.67 12 ea/case 3.9725

15 32oz Mop Head  threaded screw type, blue poly-blend, cut end, lie 
flat 260 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.24 each $4.95 each $13.47 $3,502.20 $8.38 each No Bid $3.89 each $7.24 each No Bid

15 ALT1 AMAB3532- MOP,CUT,STAFLAT,RAY,32OZ,DZ/CS $59.34/CS Amarillo Mop & BroomAMAB3532 22 case $59.34 12 ea/case 4.945
16 Microfiber handheld duster, 12 length, 19 overall length 130 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.44 each $6.94 each No Bid $8.29 each No Bid $13.82 each $5.13 each No Bid

17
Microfiber "cob web" duster to fit extension pole, 8" circumference 130 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.09 each $6.53 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.62 each $7.50 $975.00 No Bid

17 ALT1 MAXIWEB COBWEB DUSTER W/ 62"EXTENSION HANDLE 6/CS Nextstep Commercial Products96460 130 each $7.09
17 ALT1 UNGCOBW0- DUSTER,COBWEB TOTAL REACH,EA Unger UNGCOBW0 130 each No Response

18 Aromatic absorbent and disinfectant, non-toxic, powder, for bodily 
fluids. Absorbs 1 to 2 gal. 3 to 5 lb. bottle 50 bottle No Bid No Bid $37.44 72oz/case $0.52 $2.41 16oz/box $0.150625 $2.19 16oz/bottle $0.136875 $10.22 48oz/cont. $0.212917 No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.51 72oz/cont. $0.42375 No Bid

18 ALT1 VOBAN AROMATIC ABSORBENT 1 POUND BAG 24 PER CASE - 
PRICED BY THE 1# BAG FRANK MILLER & SONSV/24-1#B 50 bag $2.41 16oz/box 0.15$             

18 ALT1 G4CGVA12- ABSORBENT,VOMIT GRANUL,1LB, 12/CS $26.33/CS Empire Paper G4CGVA12 13 case $26.33 192oz/ case 0.13713542

NON-RESPONSIVE:
CCP Industries; Uses GSA contract, not available to County Government

Pyramid School; Choice Partners coop contract does not include products quoted.
Western-BRW Paper Co.: TIPS Coop contract does not include products quoted

Interboro Packaging; No ILA with GISD

All American Poly; stated N/A on Coop attribute
Central Poly-Bag; stated N/A on Coop attribute

Cooperative Contract
Cooperative Contract Number

URL for the Cooperative Contract

Medco Supply Company Unipak Corp. Wedge Supply, LLCInterline Brands, Inc. dba Chemsearch (NCH Corporation) Complete Supply Inc Mavich llc Eagle Brush & Chemical, Inc. Pollock Paper Distirbutors

OKTC-3860-14N

WCL24321.0C
Not to Mil. Specified

5477.896032
Not to Mil. Specified

Pollock # 128165
Not to Mil. Specified

REN21512-CA
Not to Mil. Specified

AFXZ7660VNFR1
Not to Mil. Specified

Sample did not meet spec.

2020-141 JANITORIAL SUPPLIES BID TAB Olmsted-Kirk Matera Paper dba. Ferguson Supply Empire Paper MANS Distributors inc

Product Code Quoted:

Z7660HNR01
Not to Mil. Specified

Grainger Item# 4CU29
Not to Mil. Specified

Product Code Quoted:
Justification Notes:

Product Code Quoted:
Justification Notes: Not to Mil. Specified

8115T / 88115B
Not to size specified

Justification Notes:

Product Code Quoted:
Justification Notes:

Product Code Quoted:
Justification Notes:
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