2019-188 Jail and Personal Inmate Supplies

Amercare Products, Inc.

Tabb Textiles Co., Inc. ] ] JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES Mavich llc Victory Supply Bob Barker Company Inc ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC Charm-Tex
(Phoenix Trading, Inc.)
Total Price $3,975.50( Total Price $31,587.30| Total Price $54,985.35| Total Price $58,443.20| Total Price $79,487.13| Total Price $79,616.51| Total Price $80,709.75| Total Price $84,034.65
Line # Description Qry UuoM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
1 BEDDING AND TOWELS: TOWELS: BATH
TURKISH, WHITE, 20" X 40" 500 each $0.65 $325.00|No Bid No Bid $3.2291 $1,614.55 $0.73 $365.00 $0.915 $457.50
Brand Bid Tabb R&R TEXTILE VS| Bob Barker Company - BBC
Product Number BT120 GRAINGER ITEM# 5NWR7 BTWH2040 BT2040
Quantity per Case/Pkg 300 ea 12 12 12
Price Per Case/Pkg 195.00 38.75 8.76 10.98
Non Responsive  |Non Responsive
5 BEDDING AND TOWELS: WASH CLOTHS:
WHITE, 12" x 12" 1,000 each $0.14 $140.00|No Bid No Bid $0.4158 $415.80 $0.14 $140.00 $0.218 $218.00 $0.1825 $182.50 $0.18 $180.00
Brand Bid Tabb R&R TEXTILE VSI BBC ICS CT
Product Number WC110 GRAINGER ITEM# 5NWTO WCWHECO 41050 L0172 WC1212J1.0E
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1200 ea 12 12 12 1 DOZEN OR 100 DOZEN PER BA[100 Dz
Price Per Case/Pkg 168.00 4.99 1.68 2.62 $2.19 PER DOZEN $216
MUST ORDER IN INCREMENTS
OF 12 EACH
BEDDING AND TOWELS: PILLOW CASES:
3 WHITE STANDARD SIZE, POLYESTER
COTTON BLEND 400 each $0.62 $248.00|No Bid No Bid $3.0825 $1,233.00 $0.70 $280.00 $0.77 $308.00 $0.8483 $339.32
Brand Bid Tabb R&R TEXTILE VSI BBC ICS
Product Number PC100 GRAINGER ITEM# 36N041 PCWH4234 PC4234 L022
Quantity per Case/Pkg 144 ea 12 12 12 1 DOZEN OR 25 DOZEN PER BALE
Price Per Case/Pkg 89.28 36.99 8.40 9.24 $10.18 PER DOZEN
MUST ORDER IN INCREMENTS .
OF 12 EACH Non Responsive
BEDDING AND TOWELS: MATTRESS
4 COVER:PILLOW CASE STYLE 25"X75"X4",
WHITE 1 each [NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.415 $3.42 $5.9175 $5.92
Brand Bid BBC ICS
Product Number MC30754T130WH LO26S
Quantity per Case/Pkg 12 1 DOZEN
Price Per Case/Pkg 40.98 $71.01 PER DOZEN
MUST ORDER IN INCREMENTS
Non Responsive OF 12 EACH Non Responsive
BEDDING AND TOWELS: MATTRESS, SEALED
5 SEAM, VINYL COVER, POLYESTER SCRIM
25"x75"x4" 300 each |No Bid No Bid No Bid $73.99 $22,197.00 $49.24 $14,772.00 $44.98 $13,494.00 $38.99 $11,697.00 $46.90 $14,070.00
Brand Bid C-MATT VSI BBC ICS CT
Product Number GRAINGER ITEM# 25UL83 MASV42575 SSPM25754CLS LPM25SS MT/SS25754
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1 1 1 EACH 1
Price Per Case/Pkg 73.99 49.24 44 .98 $38.99 PER EACH $46.90
6 BEDDING AND TOWELS: BLANKET: BED 62"
x 80" WHITE OR GRAY 110 each $6.25 $687.50|No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.47 $601.70 $9.98 $1,097.80 $6.78 $745.80
Brand Bid Tabb VSl BBC ICS
Product Number WB110 BLW628070 WB6280 LO10
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 ea 20 1 EACH OR 40 PER BALE
Price Per Case/Pkg 150.00 109.40 9.98 $6.78 PER EACH
Non Responsive
2 BEDDING AND TOWELS: BLANKET: BED, 66"
x 90" WHITE 500 each $5.15 $2,575.00(No Bid No Bid $21.99 $10,995.00 $4.54 $2,270.00 $6.98 $3,490.00 $5.55 $2,775.00 S5.54 $2,770.00
Brand Bid Tabb R&R TEXTILE VSI BBC ICS CT
Product Number TB200 GRAINGER ITEM# 36N046 LNBLSFWHEC EGTB L027 Thermal20
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 ea 1 20 1 EACH OR 50 PER BALE 24
Price Per Case/Pkg 123.60 21.99 90.80 6.98 $5.55 PER EACH $132.96
3 BEDDING AND TOWELS: SUICIDE
BLANKET:54" X 80" 25 each ([No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $57.11 $1,427.75 $68.98 $1,724.50
Brand Bid VSI BBC
Product Number SPBL SB5480
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1 1
Price Per Case/Pkg 57.11 68.98
Non Responsive [Non Responsive
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2019-188 Jail and Personal Inmate Supplies

Amercare Products, Inc.

Tabb Textiles Co., Inc. ] ] JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES Mavich llc Victory Supply Bob Barker Company Inc ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC Charm-Tex
(Phoenix Trading, Inc.)
Total Price $3,975.50( Total Price $31,587.30| Total Price $54,985.35| Total Price $58,443.20| Total Price $79,487.13| Total Price $79,616.51| Total Price $80,709.75| Total Price $84,034.65
Line # Description Qry UuoM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
INMATE CLOTHING: SUICIDE
9 SUIT:ADJUSTABLE SMOCK, 34"-52" CHEST
SIZE 25 each |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $49.98 $1,249.50 $70.88 $1,772.00
Brand Bid BBC ICS
Product Number 505JR ICS-SBS-100
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1 EACH
Price Per Case/Pkg 49.98 $70.88 PER EACH
AVAILABLE IN BLACK OR GREEN
Non Responsive Non Responsive
INMATE CLOTHING: SUICIDE
10 SUIT:ADJUSTABLE SMOCK, 44"-56" CHEST
SIZE 25 each |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $53.41 $1,335.25 $81.18 $2,029.50 $70.88 $1,772.00 $64.90 $1,622.50
Brand Bid VSI BBC ICS CT
Product Number SPBL-44-56 505 ICS-SBS-100X SM/GREEN
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1 1 EACH 1
Price Per Case/Pkg 53.41 81.18 $70.88 PER EACH $64.90
AVAILABLE IN BLACK OR GREEN
INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION
11 JUMPSUIT:GREEN, ORANGE, RED, or WHITE
SHORT SLEEVE, S-XL 1 each |NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.99 $11.99 $11.663 $11.66 $20.30 $20.30|No Bid
Brand Bid VSI BBC ICS
J24220NE-size (Green),
J24217NE-size (Red), JOJSNE-
size (Orange), and J24219NE-
Product Number UNJS(color)-(Sz) size (White) C030
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1 6 EACH
Price Per Case/Pkg 11.99 69.98 $20.30 PER EACH
INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION
12 JUMPSUIT:GREEN, ORANGE, RED, or WHITE
SHORT SLEEVE, 2XL 1 each [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.99 $11.99 $12.748 $12.75 $20.30 $20.30|No Bid
Brand Bid VSI BBC ICS
J24220NE-size (Green),
J24217NE-size (Red), JOJSNE-
size (Orange), and J24219NE-
Product Number UNJS(color)-(S2) size (White) C030
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1 6 EACH
Price Per Case/Pkg 11.99 76.49 $20.30 PER EACH
INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION
13 JUMPSUIT:GREEN, ORANGE, RED, or WHITE
SHORT SLEEVE, 3XL 1 each [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.99 $11.99 $12.748 $12.75 $22.06 $22.06(No Bid
Brand Bid VSI BBC ICS
J24220NE-size (Green),
J24217NE-size (Red), JOJSNE-
size (Orange), and J24219NE-
Product Number UNJS(color)-(SZ) size (White) C030
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1 6 EACH
Price Per Case/Pkg 11.99 76.49 $22.06 PER EACH
INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION
14 JUMPSUIT:GREEN, ORANGE, RED, or WHITE
SHORT SLEEVE, 4XL 1 each [NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.99 $12.99 $13.082 $13.08 $22.06 $22.06(No Bid
Brand Bid VS| BBC ICS
J24220NE-size (Green),
J24217NE-size (Red), JOJSNE-
size (Orange), and J24219NE-
Product Number UNJS(color)-(S2) size (White) C030
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1 6 EACH
Price Per Case/Pkg 12.99 78.49 $22.06 PER EACH
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2019-188 Jail and Personal Inmate Supplies

Tabb Textiles Co., Inc. Amercare Products, Inc. JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES Mavich llc Victory Supply Bob Barker Company Inc ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC Charm-Tex
(Phoenix Trading, Inc.)
Total Price $3,975.50( Total Price $31,587.30| Total Price $54,985.35| Total Price $58,443.20| Total Price $79,487.13| Total Price $79,616.51| Total Price $80,709.75| Total Price $84,034.65
Line # Description Qry UuoM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION
15 JUMPSUIT:GREEN, ORANGE, RED, or WHITE
SHORT SLEEVE, 5XL each ([No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.99 $12.99 $14.748 $14.75 $22.06 $22.06|No Bid
Brand Bid VSI BBC ICS
J24220NE-size (Green),
J24217NE-size (Red), JOJSNE-
size (Orange), and J24219NE-
Product Number UNJS(color)-(S2) size (White) C030
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1 6 EACH
Price Per Case/Pkg 12.99 88.49 $22.06 PER EACH
INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION
16  JUMPSUIT:GREEN, ORANGE, RED, or WHITE
SHORT SLEEVE, 6XL each [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.99 $13.99 $14.748 $14.75 $24.28 $24.28|No Bid
Brand Bid VSI BBC ICS
J24220NE-size (Green),
J24217NE-size (Red), JOJSNE-
size (Orange), and J24219NE-
Product Number UNJS(color)-(SZ2) size (White) C030
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1 6 EACH
Price Per Case/Pkg 13.99 88.49 $24.28 PER EACH
INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION
17 JUMPSUIT:GREEN, ORANGE, RED, or WHITE
SHORT SLEEVE, 7XL each [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.99 $14.99 $15.415 $15.42 $24.28 $24.28(No Bid
Brand Bid VS| BBC ICS
J24220NE-size (Green),
J24217NE-size (Red), JOJSNE-
size (Orange), and J24219NE-
Product Number UNJS(color)-(Sz) size (White) €030
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1 6 EACH
Price Per Case/Pkg 14.99 92.49 $24.28 PER EACH
INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION
18 JUMPSUIT:GREEN, ORANGE, RED, or WHITE
SHORT SLEEVE, 8XL each [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.99 $15.99 $15.415 $15.42 $24.28 $24.28|No Bid
Brand Bid VS BBC ICS
J24220NE-size (Green),
J24217NE-size (Red), JOJSNE-
size (Orange), and J24219NE-
Product Number UNJS(color)-(SZ) size (White) €030
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1 6 EACH
Price Per Case/Pkg 15.99 92.49 $24.28 PER EACH
INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION
19 JUMPSUIT:ORANGE STRIPED SHORT SLEEVE,
S-XL each [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.99 $11.99 $11.199 $11.20 $20.03 $20.03(No Bid
Brand Bid VS| BBC ICS
Product Number UNJSOW-(SIZE) JOWIJNE-size C030
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1 12 EACH
Price Per Case/Pkg 11.99 134.39 $20.03 PER EACH
INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION
20 JUMPSUIT:ORANGE STRIPED SHORT SLEEVE,
2XL each [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.99 $11.99 $11.199 $11.20 $20.03 $20.03|No Bid
Brand Bid VSI BBC ICS
Product Number UNJSOW-2XL JOWIJNE-size C030
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1 12 EACH
Price Per Case/Pkg 11.99 134.39 $20.03 PER EACH
INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION
21 JUMPSUIT:ORANGE STRIPED SHORT SLEEVE,
3XL each |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.99 $11.99 $11.199 $11.20 $22.06 $22.06(No Bid
Brand Bid VSI BBC ICS
Product Number UNJSOW-3XL JOWIJNE-size C030
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1 12 EACH
Price Per Case/Pkg 11.99 134.39 $22.06
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2019-188 Jail and Personal Inmate Supplies

Tabb Textiles Co., Inc. Amercare Products, Inc. JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES Mavich lic Victory Supply Bob Barker Company Inc ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC Charm-Tex
(Phoenix Trading, Inc.)
Total Price $3,975.50| Total Price $31,587.30| Total Price $54,985.35| Total Price $58,443.20| Total Price $79,487.13| Total Price $79,616.51| Total Price $80,709.75| Total Price $84,034.65
Line # Description Qry UuoM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION
22 JUMPSUIT:ORANGE STRIPED SHORT SLEEVE,
4XL 1 each [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.99 $12.99 $11.199 $11.20 $22.06 $22.06|No Bid
Brand Bid VSI BBC ICS
Product Number UNJSOW-4XL JOWIJNE-size C030
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1 12 EACH
Price Per Case/Pkg 12.99 134.39 $22.06 PER EACH
INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION
23 JUMPSUIT:ORANGE STRIPED SHORT SLEEVE,
5XL 1 each [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.99 $12.99 $11.199 $11.20 $22.06 $22.06|No Bid
Brand Bid VSI BBC ICS
Product Number UNJSOW-5XL JOWINE-size C030
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1 12 EACH
Price Per Case/Pkg 12.99 134.39 $22.06 PER EACH
INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION
24 JUMPSUIT:ORANGE STRIPED SHORT SLEEVE,
6XL 1 each [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.99 $13.99 $11.199 $11.20 $24.28 $24.28|No Bid
Brand Bid VS| BBC ICS
Product Number UNJSOW-6XL JOWINE-size C030
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1 12 EACH
Price Per Case/Pkg 13.99 134.39 $24.28 PER EACH
INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION
25 JUMPSUIT:ORANGE STRIPED SHORT SLEEVE,
7XL 1 each [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.99 $14.99 $12.866 $12.87 $24.28 $24.28(No Bid
Brand Bid VS| BBC ICS
Product Number UNJSOW-7XL JOWINE-size C030
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1 12 EACH
Price Per Case/Pkg 14.99 154.39 $24.28 PER EACH
INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION
26 JUMPSUIT:ORANGE STRIPED SHORT SLEEVE,
8XL 1 each [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.99 $15.99 $12.866 $12.87 $24.28 $24.28|No Bid
Brand Bid VSI BBC ICS
Product Number UNJSOW-8XL JOWINE-size C030
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1 12 EACH
Price Per Case/Pkg 15.99 154.39 $24.28 PER EACH
INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT
27 PANT:BLUE OR YELLOW ELASTIC WAIST, S-
XL 1 each [No Bid No Bid $4.50 $4.50|No Bid $4.97 $4.97 $6.46 $6.46 $9.39 $9.39 $6.18 $6.18
Brand Bid JAB Trading VS| BBC ICS CT
TNT-size (Blue) and TYT-size
Product Number TR-B-(S-XL) UNTR(color)-(SIZE) (Yellow) CP0O05 P
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 1 1 EACH 24
Price Per Case/Pkg $108 4.97 6.46 $9.39 PER EACH $148.32
FLAT FRONT, WHITE THREAD
28 INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT
PANT:BLUE OR YELLOW ELASTIC WAIST, 2XL 1 each [No Bid No Bid $4.50 $4.50(No Bid $4.97 $4.97 $6.46 $6.46 $9.39 $9.39 $6.36 $6.36
Brand Bid JAB Trading VS BBC ICS CcT
TNT-size (Blue) and TYT-size
Product Number TR-B-2XL UNTR(color)-2XL (Yellow) CP0O0O5 P
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 1 1 EACH 24
Price Per Case/Pkg $108 4.97 6.46 $9.39 PER EACH $152.64
FLAT FRONT, WHITE THREAD
29 INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT
PANT:BLUE OR YELLOW ELASTIC WAIST, 3XL 1 each [No Bid No Bid $4.80 $4.80(No Bid $5.44 S5.44 $7.46 $7.46 $10.35 $10.35 $6.54 $6.54
Brand Bid JAB Trading VS| BBC ICS CT
TNT-size (Blue) and TYT-size
Product Number TR-B-3XL UNTR(color)-3XL (Yellow) CPO05 P
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 1 1 EACH 24
Price Per Case/Pkg $115.20 5.44 7.46 $10.35 PER EACH $156.96
FLAT FRONT, WHITE THREAD
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2019-188 Jail and Personal Inmate Supplies

Tabb Textiles Co., Inc. Amercare Products, Inc. JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES Mavich llc Victory Supply Bob Barker Company Inc ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC Charm-Tex
(Phoenix Trading, Inc.)
Total Price $3,975.50| Total Price $31,587.30| Total Price $54,985.35| Total Price $58,443.20| Total Price $79,487.13| Total Price $79,616.51| Total Price $80,709.75| Total Price $84,034.65
Line # Description Qry UuoM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
30 INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT
PANT:BLUE OR YELLOW ELASTIC WAIST, 4XL 1 each [No Bid No Bid $5.20 $5.20(No Bid S5.44 $5.44 $7.46 $7.46 $10.35 $10.35 $6.72 $6.72
Brand Bid JAB Trading VSI BBC ICS CT
TNT-size (Blue) and TYT-size
Product Number TR-B-4XL UNTR(color)-4XL (Yellow) CP005 P
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 1 1 EACH 24
Price Per Case/Pkg $124.80 5.44 7.46 $10.35 PER EACH $161.28
FLAT FRONT, WHITE THREAD
31 INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT
SHIRT:BLUE OR YELLOW V-NECK, S-XL 250 each [No Bid No Bid $4.90 $4.90(No Bid $4.63 $1,157.50 $4.78 $1,195.00 $7.24 $1,810.00 $5.90 $1,475.00
Brand Bid JAB Trading VSI BBC ICS CT
TNS-size (Blue) and TYS-size
Product Number VNECK-B-(S-XL) UNSH(color)-(SIZE) (Yellow) CS005 S
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 1 1 EACH 24
Price Per Case/Pkg S117.60 4.63 4.78 $7.24 PER EACH S141.60
WHITE THREAD
INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT
32 . . .
SHIRT:BLUE OR YELLOW V-NECK, 2XL 50 each [No Bid No Bid $4.90 $4.90|No Bid $4.63 $231.50|$4.98 $249.00 $7.24 $362.00 $5.90 $295.00
Brand Bid JAB Trading VS BBC ICS CcT
TNS-size (Blue) and TYS-size
Product Number VNECK-B-2XL UNSH(color)-2XL (Yellow) CS005 S
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 1 1 EACH 24
Price Per Case/Pkg $117.60 4.63 4.98 $7.24 PER EACH $141.60
WHITE THREAD
INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT
33 : . .
SHIRT:BLUE OR YELLOW V-NECK, 3XL 50 each [No Bid No Bid $5.15 $257.50|No Bid S5.57 $278.50 $4.98 $249.00 $7.99 $399.50 $6.18 $309.00
Brand Bid JAB Trading VSI BBC ICS CT
TNS-size (Blue) and TYS-size
Product Number VNECK-B-3XL UNSH(color)-3XL (Yellow) CS005 S
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 1 1 EACH 24
Price Per Case/Pkg $123.60 5.57 4.98 $7.99 PER EACH $148.32
WHITE THREAD
INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT
34 . . .
SHIRT:BLUE OR YELLOW V-NECK, 4XL 25 each ([No Bid No Bid $5.45 $136.25|No Bid $5.57 $139.25 $5.28 $132.00 $7.99 $199.75 $6.36 $159.00
Brand Bid JAB Trading VS BBC ICS CcT
TNS-size (Blue) and TYS-size
Product Number VNECK-B-4XL UNSH(color)-4XL (Yellow) CS005 S
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 1 1 EACH 24
Price Per Case/Pkg $130.80 5.57 5.28 $7.99 PER EACH $152.64
WHITE THREAD
INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT
35 : . .
SHIRT:BLUE OR YELLOW V-NECK, 5XL 25 each [No Bid No Bid $5.70 $142.50|No Bid S5.57 $139.25 $5.28 $132.00 $7.99 $199.75 $6.72 $168.00
Brand Bid JAB Trading VSI BBC ICS CT
TNS-size (Blue) and TYS-size
Product Number VNECK-B-5XL UNSH(color)-5XL (Yellow) CS005 S
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 1 1 EACH 24
Price Per Case/Pkg $136.80 5.57 5.28 $7.99 PER EACH $161.28
WHITE THREAD
INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT
36 ) . .
SHIRT:BLUE OR YELLOW V-NECK, 6XL 25 each |No Bid No Bid $6.00 $150.00|No Bid $5.89 $147.25 $5.28 $132.00 $8.80 $220.00 $6.90 $172.50
Brand Bid JAB Trading VS BBC ICS CcT
TNS-size (Blue) and TYS-size
Product Number VNECK-B-6XL UNSH(color)-6XL (Yellow) CS005 S
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 1 1 EACH 24
Price Per Case/Pkg S144 5.89 5.28 $8.80 PER EACH $165.60
WHITE THREAD
37 INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT
SHIRT:BLUE OR YELLOW V-NECK, 7XL 1 each |NoBid No Bid $6.00 $6.00|No Bid $5.89 $5.89 $7.48 $7.48 $8.80 $8.80 $7.18 $7.18
Brand Bid JAB Trading VS BBC ICS CcT
TNS-size (Blue) and TYS-size
Product Number VNECK-B-7XL UNSH(color)-7XL (Yellow) CS005 S
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 1 1 EACH 24
Price Per Case/Pkg S144 5.89 7.48 $8.80 PER EACH $172.32
WHITE THREAD

2019-188 Addendum 1 - Page 5
4/8/2020

2019-188

Draft document until award



2019-188 Jail and Personal Inmate Supplies

Tabb Textiles Co., Inc. Amercare Products, Inc. JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES Mavich llc Victory Supply Bob Barker Company Inc ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC Charm-Tex
(Phoenix Trading, Inc.)
Total Price $3,975.50| Total Price $31,587.30| Total Price $54,985.35| Total Price $58,443.20| Total Price $79,487.13| Total Price $79,616.51| Total Price $80,709.75| Total Price $84,034.65
Line # Description Qry UuoM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
38 INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT
PANT:BLUE STRIPED ELASTIC WAIST, S-XL 250 each [No Bid No Bid $4.50 $1,125.00(No Bid $4.97 $1,242.50 $5.88 $1,470.00 $9.39 $2,347.50 $6.18 $1,545.00
Brand Bid JAB Trading VSI BBC ICS CT
JTBLWT-S(size small) and
Product Number TR-SB-(S-XL) UNTRBLW-(SIZE) TBLWT-size (M-XL) CP005 P45
6 per case for size small and
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 1 per each for M-XL EACH 24
$35.28 size small for case of 6
Price Per Case/Pkg $108 4.97 and $5.88/ea for size M-XL $9.39 PER EACH $148.32
FLAT FRONT, WHITE THREAD
39 INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT
PANT:BLUESTRIPED ELASTIC WAIST, 2XL 1 each |NoBid No Bid $4.50 $4.50|No Bid $4.97 $4.97 $5.88 $5.88 $9.39 $9.39 $6.36 $6.36
Brand Bid JAB Trading VSI BBC ICS CT
Product Number TR-SB-2XL UNTRBLW-2XL TBLWT-size CPO05 P45
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 1 1 EACH 24
Price Per Case/Pkg $108 4.97 5.88 $9.39 PER EACH $152.64
FLAT FRONT, WHITE THREAD
40 INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT
PANT:BLUE STRIPED ELASTIC WAIST, 3XL 1 each [NoBid No Bid $4.80 $4.80|No Bid $5.44 $5.44 $6.48 $6.48 $10.35 $10.35 $6.54 $6.54
Brand Bid JAB Trading VSI BBC ICS CcT
Product Number TR-SB-3XL UNTRBLW-3XL TBLWT-size CP005 P45
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 1 1 EACH 24
Price Per Case/Pkg $115.20 5.44 $6.48 $10.35 PER EACH $156.96
FLAT FRONT, WHITE THREAD
INMATE CLOTHING: SUIT PANT:BLUE
41 . . .
STRIPED ELASTIC WAIST, 4XL 1 each [No Bid No Bid $5.20 $5.20|No Bid S5.44 S5.44 $6.48 $6.48 $10.35 $10.35 $6.72 $6.72
Brand Bid JAB Trading VS BBC ICS CT
Product Number TR-SB-4XL UNTRBLW-4XL TBLWT-size CP005 P45
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 1 1 EACH 24
Price Per Case/Pkg $124.80 5.44 6.48 $10.35 PER EACH $161.28
FLAT FRONT, WHITE THREAD
42 INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT
PANT:BLUE STRIPED ELASTIC WAIST, 5X 1 each [No Bid No Bid $5.40 $5.40(No Bid $5.44 $5.44 $6.48 $6.48 $10.35 $10.35 $6.90 $6.90
Brand Bid JAB Trading VSI BBC ICS CcT
Product Number TR-SB-5XL UNTRBLW-5XL TBLWT-size CS005 P45
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 1 1 EACH 24
Price Per Case/Pkg $129.60 5.44 6.48 $10.35 PER EACH $165.60
FLAT FRONT, WHITE THREAD
43 INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT
PANT:BLUE STRIPED ELASTIC WAIST, 6X 1 each [No Bid No Bid $5.80 $5.80(No Bid S5.72 $5.72 $6.98 $6.98 S11.31 S11.31 $7.18 $7.18
Brand Bid JAB Trading VSI BBC ICS CT
Product Number TR-SB-6XL UNTRBLW-6XL TBLWT-size CP0O0O5 P45
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 1 1 EACH 24
Price Per Case/Pkg $139.20 5.72 6.98 $11.31 PER EACH $172.32
FLAT FRONT, WHITE THREAD
44 INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT PANT:
BLUE STRIPED ELASTIC WAIST, 7X 1 each [No Bid No Bid $5.80 $5.80|No Bid $5.72 $5.72 $7.98 $7.98 $11.31 $11.31 $7.54 $7.54
Brand Bid JAB Trading VS BBC ICS cT
Product Number TR-SB-7XL UNTRBLW-7XL TBLWT-size CPOO5 P45
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 1 6 EACH 24
Price Per Case/Pkg $139.20 5.72 47.88 $11.31 PER EACH $180.96
FLAT FRONT, WHITE THREAD
45 INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT
SHIRT:BLUE STRIPED V-NECK, S-XL 1 each |NoBid No Bid $4.90 $4.90|No Bid $4.63 $4.63 $4.68 $4.68 $7.24 $7.24 $5.90 $5.90
Brand Bid JAB Trading VSI BBC ICS CcT
JTBLWS-S for size small and
Product Number VNECK-SB-(S-XL) UNSHBLW-(SIZE) TBLWS-size for M-XL CS005 $45
6 per case for size small and
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 1 per each for sizes M-XL EACH 24
28.08 per case for size small
Price Per Case/Pkg $117.60 4.63 and 4.68 per each for sizes M- [$7.24 PER EACH $141.60
WHITE THREAD
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2019-188 Jail and Personal Inmate Supplies

Amercare Products, Inc.

Tabb Textiles Co., Inc. . ) JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES Mavich llc Victory Supply Bob Barker Company Inc ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC Charm-Tex
(Phoenix Trading, Inc.)
Total Price $3,975.50| Total Price $31,587.30| Total Price $54,985.35| Total Price $58,443.20| Total Price $79,487.13| Total Price $79,616.51| Total Price $80,709.75| Total Price $84,034.65
Line # Description QTy UoM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
16 INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT
SHIRT:BLUE STRIPED V-NECK, 2XL 1 each [NoBid No Bid $4.90 $4.90|No Bid $4.63 $4.63 $4.98 $4.98 $7.24 $7.24 $5.90 $5.90
Brand Bid JAB Trading VS| BBC ICS CcT
Product Number VNECK-SB-2XL UNSHBLW-2XL TBLWS-size CS005 $45
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 1 1 EACH 24
Price Per Case/Pkg $117.60 4.63 4.98 $7.24 PER EACH $141.60
WHITE THREAD
47 INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT
SHIRT:BLUE STRIPED V-NECK, 3XL 1 each [NoBid No Bid $5.15 $5.15|No Bid $5.57 $5.57 $4.98 $4.98 $7.99 $7.99 $6.18 $6.18
Brand Bid JAB Trading VS| BBC ICS CT
Product Number VNECK-SB-3XL UNSHBLW-3XL TBLWS-size CS005 S45
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 1 1 EACH 24
Price Per Case/Pkg $123.60 5.57 4.98 $7.99 PER EACH $148.32
WHITE THREAD
48 INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT
SHIRT:BLUE STRIPED, V-NECK, 4XL 1 each |NoBid No Bid $5.45 $5.45|No Bid $5.57 $5.57 $5.48 $5.48 $7.99 $7.99 $6.36 $6.36
Brand Bid JAB Trading VS BBC ICS cT
Product Number VNECK-SB-4XL UNSHBLW-4XL TBLWS-size CS005 S45
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 1 1 EACH 24
Price Per Case/Pkg $130.80 5.57 5.48 $7.99 PER EACH $152.64
WHITE THREAD
49 INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT
SHIRT:BLUE STRIPED, V-NECK, 5XL 1 each [NoBid No Bid $5.70 $5.70|No Bid S5.57 $5.57 S5.48 $5.48 $7.99 $7.99 $6.72 $6.72
Brand Bid JAB Trading VSI BBC ICS CT
Product Number VNECK-SB-5XL UNSHBLW-5XL TBLWS-size CS005 S45
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 1 1 EACH 24
Price Per Case/Pkg $136.80 5.57 5.48 $7.99 PER EACH $161.28
WHITE THREAD
50 INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT
SHIRT:BLUE STRIPED, V-NECK, 6XL 1 each [NoBid No Bid $6.00 $6.00|No Bid $5.89 $5.89 $5.48 $5.48 $8.80 $8.80 $6.90 $6.90
Brand Bid JAB Trading VSI BBC ICS cT
Product Number VNECK-SB-6XL UNSHBLW-6XL TBLWS-size CS005 S45
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 1 1 EACH 24
Price Per Case/Pkg $144 5.89 5.48 $8.80 PER EACH $165.60
WHITE THREAD
51 INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT
SHIRT:BLUE STRIPED, V-NECK, 7XL 1 each [NoBid No Bid $6.00 $6.00|No Bid $5.89 $5.89 $5.98 $5.98 $8.80 $8.80 $7.18 $7.18
Brand Bid JAB Trading VSI BBC ICS CT
Product Number VNECK-SB-7XL UNSHBLW-7XL TBLWS-size CS005 S45
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 1 6 EACH 24
Price Per Case/Pkg $144 5.89 35.88 $8.80 PER EACH $172.32
WHITE THREAD
59 INMATE CLOTHING: MEN'S COTTON T-
SHIRTS, WHITE, S - XL 100 each [NoBid No Bid $1.65 $165.00|No Bid $1.60 $160.00 $2.373 $237.30 $1.4533 $145.33 $19.90 $1,990.00
Brand Bid JAb Trading VSI BBC ICS CT
Product Number G500W TSHIRTWHT-(SZ) TSWH1S-Size €049 CL/1US
Quantity per Case/Pkg 72 12 12 1 DOZEN 6 DZ
Price Per Case/Pkg $118.80 19.20 28.48 $17.44 PER DOZEN $119.40
MUST ORDER IN INCREMENTS
OF 12 EACH 19.90 - PRICE PER DZ
53 INMATE CLOTHING: MEN'S COTTON T-
SHIRTS, WHITE , 2XL 50 each [No Bid No Bid $1.65 $82.50(No Bid $2.02 $101.00 $2.373 $118.65 $2.0792 $103.96 $25.72 $1,286.00
Brand Bid JAb Trading VSI BBC ICS CcT
Product Number G500W TSHIRTWHT-2XL TSWH1S-size C049 CL/1US2XL
Quantity per Case/Pkg 72 12 12 1 DOZEN 6 DZ
Price Per Case/Pkg $118.80 24.24 28.48 $24.95 PER DOZEN $154.32
MUST ORDER IN INCREMENTS
OF 12 EACH 25.72 - PRICE PER DZ
54 INMATE CLOTHING: MEN'S COTTON T-
SHIRTS, WHITE , 3XL 1 each [NoBid No Bid $1.65 $1.65|No Bid $2.36 $2.36 $3.707 $3.71 $2.3917 $2.39 $28.18 $28.18
Brand Bid JAb Trading VSI BBC ICS CT
Product Number G500W TSHIRTWHT-3XL TSWH1S-size C040 CL/1US3XL
Quantity per Case/Pkg 72 12 12 1 DOZEN 6 DZ
Price Per Case/Pkg $118.80 28.32 4448 $28.70 PER DOZEN $169.08
MUST ORDER IN INCREMENTS
OF 12 EACH 28.18 - PRICE PER DZ
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2019-188 Jail and Personal Inmate Supplies

Tabb Textiles Co., Inc. Amercare Products, Inc. JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES Mavich llc Victory Supply Bob Barker Company Inc ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC Charm-Tex
(Phoenix Trading, Inc.)
Total Price $3,975.50| Total Price $31,587.30| Total Price $54,985.35| Total Price $58,443.20| Total Price $79,487.13| Total Price $79,616.51| Total Price $80,709.75| Total Price $84,034.65
Line # Description Qry UuoM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
55 INMATE CLOTHING: SWEATSHIRT:ORANGE,
LONG SLEEVE, S (Price should include
screening and/ or stenciling) 60 each |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.03 $361.80 $6.88 $412.80 $12.37 $742.20 $8.18 $490.80
Brand Bid VSI BBC ICS CT
Product Number SSOR-S SSOR-size Co45 SWEATSOR
Quantity per Case/Pkg 12 1 EACH 36
Price Per Case/Pkg 72.36 6.88 $12.37 PER EACH $294.48
56 INMATE CLOTHING: SWEATSHIRT:ORANGE,
LONG SLEEVE,M (Price should include
screening and/ or stenciling) 60 each |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.03 $361.80 $6.88 $412.80 $12.37 $742.20 $8.18 $490.80
Brand Bid VSI BBC ICS CT
Product Number SSOR-M SSOR-size Co45 SWEATSOR
Quantity per Case/Pkg 12 1 EACH 36
Price Per Case/Pkg 72.36 6.88 $12.37 PER EACH $294.48
57 INMATE CLOTHING: SWEATSHIRT:ORANGE,
LONG SLEEVE,L (Price should include
screening and/ or stenciling) 60 each |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.03 $361.80 $6.88 $412.80 $12.37 $742.20 $8.18 $490.80
Brand Bid VSI BBC ICS CT
Product Number SSOR-L SSOR-size Co45 SWEATSOR
Quantity per Case/Pkg 12 1 EACH 36
Price Per Case/Pkg 72.36 6.88 $12.37 PER EACH $294.48
58 INMATE CLOTHING: SWEATSHIRT:ORANGE,
LONG SLEEVE,XL (Price should include
screening and/ or stenciling) 60 each |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.03 $361.80 $7.44 $446.40 $12.37 $742.20 $8.18 $490.80
Brand Bid VS| BBC ICS CT
Product Number SSOR-XL SSOR-size C045 SWEATSOR
Quantity per Case/Pkg 12 1 EACH 36
Price Per Case/Pkg 72.36 7.44 $12.37 PER EACH $294.48
59 INMATE CLOTHING: SWEATSHIRT:ORANGE,
LONG SLEEVE,2XL (Price should include
screening and/ or stenciling) 20 each |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.67 $153.40 $7.44 $148.80 $13.43 $268.60 $9.90 $198.00
Brand Bid VSI BBC ICS CT
Product Number SSOR-2XL SSOR-size Co45 SWEATSOR
Quantity per Case/Pkg 12 1 EACH 36
Price Per Case/Pkg 92.04 7.44 $13.43 PER EACH $356.40
60 INMATE CLOTHING: SWEATSHIRT:ORANGE,
LONG SLEEVE,3XL (Price should include
screening and/ or stenciling) 1 each |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.67 $7.67 $7.88 $7.88 $14.50 $14.50 $11.54 $11.54
Brand Bid VSI BBC ICS CT
Product Number SSOR-3XL SSOR-size C045 SWEATSOR
Quantity per Case/Pkg 12 1 EACH 36
Price Per Case/Pkg 92.04 7.88 $14.50 PER EACH $415.44
61 INMATE CLOTHING: MEN'S COTTON BRIEFS,
WHITE, S-XL 800 each ([No Bid No Bid $0.70 $560.00|No Bid $0.695 $556.00 $2.082 $1,665.60 $0.89 $712.00 $0.90 $720.00
Brand Bid JAB Trading VS Fruit of the Loom ICS CcT
Product Number MW3401-(S-XL) BRWH-(SZ) 7603N-size C051 CL/BRIEF
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 dozen/case 12 12 1 DOZEN 240
Price Per Case/Pkg $201.60 8.34 24.98 $10.68 PER DOZEN $216.00
MUST ORDER IN INCREMENTS
OF 12 EACH
62 INMATE CLOTHING: MEN'S COTTON BRIEFS,
WHITE, 2XL 400 each ([No Bid No Bid $0.75 $300.00|No Bid S0.76 $304.00 $2.83 $1,132.00 $1.07 $428.00 $0.90 $360.00
Brand Bid JAB Trading VS Fruit of the Loom ICS CcT
Product Number MW3401-2XL BRWH-2XL 7690N-size C051 CL/BRIEF
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 dozen/case 12 6 1 DOZEN 240
Price Per Case/Pkg S216 9.12 16.98 $12.84 PER DOZEN $216.00
MUST ORDER IN INCREMENTS
OF 12 EACH
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2019-188 Jail and Personal Inmate Supplies

Tabb Textiles Co., Inc. Amercare Products, Inc. JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES Mavich llc Victory Supply Bob Barker Company Inc ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC Charm-Tex
(Phoenix Trading, Inc.)
Total Price $3,975.50| Total Price $31,587.30| Total Price $54,985.35| Total Price $58,443.20| Total Price $79,487.13| Total Price $79,616.51| Total Price $80,709.75| Total Price $84,034.65
Line # Description Qry UuoM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
63 INMATE CLOTHING: MEN'S COTTON BRIEFS,
WHITE, 3XL 100 each |No Bid No Bid $0.79 $79.00|No Bid $0.795 $79.50 $2.83 $283.00 $1.1683 $116.83 $0.99 $99.00
Brand Bid JAB Trading VS| Fruit of the Loom ICS CT
Product Number MW3401-3XL BRWH-3XL 7690N-size C051 CL/BRIEF
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 dozen/case 12 6 1 DOZEN 240
Price Per Case/Pkg $228 9.54 16.98 $14.02 PER DOZEN $237.60
MUST ORDER IN INCREMENTS
OF 12 EACH
64 INMATE CLOTHING: BOY'S COTTON BRIEFS,
WHITE, S-XL 50 each [No Bid No Bid $0.73 $36.50|No Bid $0.72 $36.00 $2.082 $104.10 $1.7042 $85.21 $0.99 $49.50
Brand Bid JAB Trading VS Fruit of the Loom FOL CcT
Product Number MW3401Y-(S-XL) BRWHB-(5Z) 7603N-size CY051 CL/BRIEF
Quantity per Case/Pkg 36 dozen/case 12 12 1 DOZEN 240
Price Per Case/Pkg $316.80 8.64 24.98 $20.45 PER DOZEN $237.60
MUST ORDER IN INCREMENTS
OF 12 EACH
65 INMATE CLOTHING: BOY'S COTTON BRIEFS,
WHITE, 2XL 10 each |No Bid No Bid S0.73 $7.30|No Bid $0.72 $7.20 $2.83 $28.30 $2.3992 $23.99 $0.99 $9.90
Brand Bid JAB Trading VSI Fruit of the Loom FOL CT
Product Number MW3401Y-2XL BRWHB-2XL 7690N-size CY051 CL/BRIEF
Quantity per Case/Pkg 36 dozen/case 12 6 1 DOZEN 240
Price Per Case/Pkg $316.80 8.64 16.98 $28.79 PER DOZEN $237.60
MUST ORDER IN INCREMENTS
OF 12 EACH
66 INMATE CLOTHING: GIRL'S COTTON BRIEFS,
WHITE, S-XL 30 each [NoBid No Bid $0.73 $21.90|No Bid $0.72 $21.60 $0.563 $16.89 $1.3083 $39.25 $0.72 $21.60
Brand Bid JAB Trading VS BBC FOL CcT
Product Number LP1091K-G-(10-16) PNTYG-(SZ) ELBLCTN-Size CY062 CL/PANT
Quantity per Case/Pkg 36 dozen/case 12 12 1 DOZEN 240
Price Per Case/Pkg $315 8.64 6.75 $15.70 PER DOZEN $172.80
MUST ORDER IN INCREMENTS
OF 12 EACH
67 INMATE CLOTHING: WOMEN'S COTTON
BRIEFS, WHITE, 5-7 600 each |No Bid No Bid $0.48 $288.00|No Bid $0.47 $282.00 $0.563 $337.80 $0.798 $478.80 S0.65 $390.00
Brand Bid JAB Trading VSI BBC ICS CT
Product Number LP1091KW-(S-L) PNTYWH-(SZ) ELBLCTN-Size C062 CL/PANT
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 dozen/case 12 12 1 DOZEN 240
Price Per Case/Pkg $138 5.64 6.75 $9.58 PER DOZEN $156.00
MUST ORDER IN INCREMENTS
OF 12 EACH
68 INMATE CLOTHING: WOMEN'S COTTON
BRIEFS, WHITE, 8-10 600 each |No Bid No Bid $0.50 $300.00|No Bid $0.51 $306.00 $0.659 $395.40 $0.8542 $512.52 $0.72 $432.00
Brand Bid JAB Trading VS| BBC ICS CcT
Product Number LP1091KW-(XL-3XL) PNTYWH-(SZ) ELBLCTN-Size C062 CL/PANT
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 dozen/case 12 12 1 DOZEN 240
Price Per Case/Pkg $144 6.12 7.91 $10.25 PER DOZEN $172.80
MUST ORDER IN INCREMENTS
OF 12 EACH
69 INMATE CLOTHING: WOMEN'S COTTON
BRIEFS, WHITE, 11-12 100 each |No Bid No Bid S0.61 $61.00|No Bid $0.59 $59.00 $0.748 $74.80 $0.905 $90.50 S0.82 $82.00
Brand Bid JAB Trading VSI BBC ICS CT
Product Number LP1091KW-(4XL-5XL) PNTYWH-(SZ) ELBLCTN-Size C062 CL/PANT
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 dozen/case 12 12 1 DOZEN 240
Price Per Case/Pkg $175.68 7.08 8.98 $10.86 PER DOZEN $196.00
MUST ORDER IN INCREMENTS
OF 12 EACH
70 INMATE CLOTHING: WOMEN'S COTTON
BRIEFS, WHITE, 13-14 1 each [NoBid No Bid $0.61 $0.61|No Bid $0.60 $0.60 $0.823 $0.82 $1.0042 $1.00 $0.93 $0.93
Brand Bid JAB Trading VSI BBC ICS CcT
Product Number LP1091KW-(6XL-7XL) PNTYWH-(SZ) ELBLCTN-Size C062 CL/PANT
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 dozen/case 12 12 1 DOZEN 240
Price Per Case/Pkg $175.68 7.20 9.88 $12.05 PER DOZEN $223.20
MUST ORDER IN INCREMENTS
OF 12 EACH
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2019-188 Jail and Personal Inmate Supplies

Tabb Textiles Co., Inc. Amercare Products, Inc. JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES Mavich llc Victory Supply Bob Barker Company Inc ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC Charm-Tex
(Phoenix Trading, Inc.)
Total Price $3,975.50| Total Price $31,587.30| Total Price $54,985.35| Total Price $58,443.20| Total Price $79,487.13| Total Price $79,616.51| Total Price $80,709.75| Total Price $84,034.65
Line # Description Qry UuoM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
71 INMATE CLOTHING: WOMEN'S BRA: WHITE,
34-44, A CUP 50 each ([No Bid No Bid $1.83 $91.50(No Bid $2.00 $100.00 $1.36 $68.00 $2.4525 $122.63 $2.18 $109.00
Brand Bid JAB Trading VS| BBC ICS CT
Product Number CC-(34-44)A NBWH-(S2) EBANY(band)(cup) C060 CL/1BRA
Quantity per Case/Pkg 15 dozen/case 12 12 1 DOZEN 240
Price Per Case/Pkg $330 24.00 16.32 $29.43 PER DOZEN $523.20
MUST ORDER IN INCREMENTS
OF 12 EACH
7 INMATE CLOTHING: WOMEN'S BRA: WHITE,
34-44, B CUP 50 each [No Bid No Bid $1.83 $91.50(No Bid $2.00 $100.00 $1.36 $68.00 $2.4525 $122.63 $2.18 $109.00
Brand Bid JAB Trading VS BBC ICS CcT
Product Number CC-(34-44)B NBWH-(SZ) EBANY(band)(cup) C060 CL/1BRA
Quantity per Case/Pkg 15 dozen/case 12 12 1 DOZEN 240
Price Per Case/Pkg $330 24.00 16.32 $29.43 PER DOZEN $523.20
MUST ORDER IN INCREMENTS
OF 12 EACH
73 INMATE CLOTHING: WOMEN'S BRA: WHITE,
34-44, C CUP 50 each ([No Bid No Bid $1.83 $91.50(No Bid $2.00 $100.00 $1.36 $68.00 $2.4525 $122.63 $2.18 $109.00
Brand Bid JAB Trading VSI BBC ICS CT
Product Number CC-(34-44)C NBWH-(SZ) EBANY(band)(cup) C060 CL/1BRA
Quantity per Case/Pkg 15 dozen/case 12 12 1 DOZEN 240
Price Per Case/Pkg $330 24.00 16.32 $29.43 PER DOZEN $523.20
MUST ORDER IN INCREMENTS
OF 12 EACH
74 INMATE CLOTHING: WOMEN'S BRA: WHITE,
34-44, D CUP 10 each |No Bid No Bid $1.83 $18.30|No Bid $2.00 $20.00 $1.36 $13.60 $2.7217 $27.22 $2.54 $25.40
Brand Bid JAB Trading VS BBC ICS CcT
Product Number CC-(34-44)D NBWH-(S2) EBANY(band)(cup) C060 CL/1BRA
Quantity per Case/Pkg 15 dozen/case 12 12 1 DOZEN 240
Price Per Case/Pkg $330 24.00 16.32 $32.66 PER DOZEN $609.60
MUST ORDER IN INCREMENTS
OF 12 EACH
75 INMATE CLOTHING: WOMEN'S BRA: WHITE,
34-44, E CUP 1 each [No Bid No Bid $1.83 $1.83|No Bid $2.00 $2.00|No Bid $5.0142 S5.01 $3.72 $3.72
Brand Bid JAB Trading VS| ICS CT
Product Number CC-(34-44)E NBWH-(S2) C060 CL/1BRA
Quantity per Case/Pkg 15 dozen/case 12 1 DOZEN 240
Price Per Case/Pkg $330 24.00 $60.17 PER DOZEN $892.80
MUST ORDER IN INCREMENTS
OF 12 EACH
76 INMATE CLOTHING: SPORTSBRA - GRAY;
SIZE32-38 50 each [No Bid No Bid $1.58 $79.00(No Bid $1.53 $76.50 $1.557 $77.85 $2.7075 $135.38 $2.07 $103.50
Brand Bid JAB Trading VS| BBC ICS CcT
Product Number 15G-(32-38) SBGY-(SZ) GEBASPLSG(size) C1910G CL/GYSBRA
Quantity per Case/Pkg 10 dozen/case 12 12 1 DOZEN 240
Price Per Case/Pkg $190 18.36 18.68 $32.49 PER DOZEN $496.80
MUST ORDER IN INCREMENTS
OF 12 EACH
77 INMATE CLOTHING: SPORTSBRA - GRAY;
SIZE40-48 1 each [No Bid No Bid $1.67 $1.67|No Bid $1.62 $1.62 S1.64 S1.64 $3.2242 S3.22 $2.07 $2.07
Brand Bid JAB Trading VSI BBC ICS CT
Product Number 15G-(40-48) SBGY-(SZ) GEBASPLSG(size) C1910G CL/GYSBRA
Quantity per Case/Pkg 10 dozen/case 12 12 1 DOZEN 240
Price Per Case/Pkg $200 19.44 19.68 $38.69 PER DOZEN $496.80
MUST ORDER IN INCREMENTS
OF 12 EACH
78 INMATE CLOTHING: SPORTS BRA - GRAY;
SIZE 50-54 1 each [NoBid No Bid $1.79 $1.79|No Bid $1.62 $1.62 $1.64 S1.64 $3.4342 $3.43 $2.36 $2.36
Brand Bid JAB Trading VSI BBC ICS CcT
Product Number 15G-(50-54) SBGY-(SZ2) GEBASPLSG(size) C1910G CL/GYSBRA
Quantity per Case/Pkg 10 dozen/case 12 12 1 DOZEN 240
Price Per Case/Pkg $215 19.44 19.68 $41.21 PER DOZEN $566.40
MUST ORDER IN INCREMENTS
OF 12 EACH
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2019-188 Jail and Personal Inmate Supplies

Amercare Products, Inc.

Tabb Textiles Co., Inc. ] ] JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES Mavich llc Victory Supply Bob Barker Company Inc ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC Charm-Tex
(Phoenix Trading, Inc.)
Total Price $3,975.50( Total Price $31,587.30| Total Price $54,985.35| Total Price $58,443.20| Total Price $79,487.13| Total Price $79,616.51| Total Price $80,709.75| Total Price $84,034.65
Line # Description Qry UuoM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
79 INMATE CLOTHING: SPORTS BRA - WHITE;
SIZE32-38 50 each |No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.31 $65.50 $1.9233 $96.17
Brand Bid VS| ICS
Product Number SBWH-SZ C1910
Quantity per Case/Pkg 12 1 DOZEN
Price Per Case/Pkg 15.72 $23.08 PER DOZEN
MUST ORDER IN INCREMENTS
OF 12 EACH
Non Responsive Non Responsive Non Responsive
INMATE CLOTHING: SPORTSBRA - WHITE;
80 SIZE40-48 1 each [NoBid No Bid $1.35 $1.35|No Bid $1.36 $1.36 $1.64 $1.64 $2.2433 $2.24 $1.90 $1.90
Brand Bid JAB Trading VSI BBC ICS cT
Product Number 15-(40-48) SBWH-SZ EBASPLS(size) C1910 CL/SBRA
Quantity per Case/Pkg 10 dozen/case 12 12 1 DOZEN 240
Price Per Case/Pkg $162.50 16.32 19.68 $26.92 PER DOZEN $456.00
MUST ORDER IN INCREMENTS
OF 12 EACH
31 INMATE CLOTHING: SPORTSBRA - WHITE;
SIZE50-54 1 each |No Bid No Bid $1.35 $1.35|No Bid $1.41 $1.41 S1.64 S1.64 $2.4042 $2.40 $1.90 $1.90
Brand Bid JAB Trading VSI BBC ICS CT
Product Number 15-(50-54) SBWH-SZ EBASPLS(size) C1910 CL/SBRA
Quantity per Case/Pkg 12 12 12 1 DOZEN 240
Price Per Case/Pkg $16.25 16.92 19.68 $28.85 PER DOZEN $456.00
MUST ORDER IN INCREMENTS
OF 12 EACH
82 INMATE CLOTHING: SOCKS:CREW, CALF
LENGTH STYLE 3,000 each [No Bid No Bid $0.39 $1,170.00 $1.3316 $3,994.80 $0.385 $1,155.00 $0.565 $1,695.00 $0.475 $1,425.00 $0.49 $1,470.00
Brand Bid JAB Trading FRUIT OF THE LOOM VSI BBC ICS CT
Product Number PC174 GRAINGER ITEM# 34VH14 SKCRWH WC C068-10 SCK/CewW
Quantity per Case/Pkg 20 dozen/case 6 pair 12 12 1 DOZEN 240
Price Per Case/Pkg $94 7.99 4.62 6.78 $5.70 PER DOZEN $117.60
MUST ORDER IN INCREMENTS
OF 12 EACH unit price is per pair
83 INMATE CLOTHING: SOCKS: SPORT, WHITE 1,000 each [No Bid No Bid $0.39 $390.00(No Bid $0.385 $385.00 $0.419 $419.00 $0.4642 $464.20 $0.49 $490.00
Brand Bid JAB Trading VSI BBC ICS CT
Product Number PC184 SKWHNS M4595 CA58W-IM SCK/MSPORT
Quantity per Case/Pkg 20 dozen/case 12 12 1 DOZEN 240
Price Per Case/Pkg $94 4.62 5.03 $5.57 PER DOZEN $117.60
MUST ORDER IN INCREMENTS
OF 12 EACH
84 INMATE CLOTHING: CAPS, BASEBALL: 3/4
OPEN MESH 200 each [No Bid No Bid $1.90 $380.00(No Bid $1.92 $384.00 $1.657 $331.40 $1.8342 $366.84 $36.90 $7,380.00
Brand Bid JAB Trading VSI BBC ICS CT
Product Number BX019 BBC-BK Z39165-BK CBB CL/CAP
Quantity per Case/Pkg 144 12 12 1 DOZEN 12
Price Per Case/Pkg $273.60 23.04 19.88 $22.01 PER DOZEN $442.80
MUST ORDER IN INCREMENTS
OF 12 EACH
INMATE CLOTHING: CANVAS TENNIS
85  SHOES: LOW TOP, HEAVY DUTY, BLACK OR
WHITE 50 each ([No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.69 $234.50 $6.48 $324.00 $7.29 $364.50
Brand Bid VSl BBC ICS
Product Number SHCVLT(B/W)-(S2) FCNGB21-color-size SC1011
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1 1 EACH
Price Per Case/Pkg 4.69 6.48 $7.29 PER EACH
Non Responsive
36 INMATE CLOTHING: LEATHER TENNIS
SHOES, BLACK 276 each |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.84 $4,371.84 $13.98 $3,858.48 $14.76 $4,073.76 $15.90 $4,388.40
Brand Bid VSI BBC ICS CT
Product Number SHLAVBD-(SZ) B730-size SC2800 F/CLEARBK
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1 1 EACH 12
Price Per Case/Pkg 15.84 13.98 $14.76 PER EACH $190.80
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2019-188 Jail and Personal Inmate Supplies

Tabb Textiles Co., Inc. Amercare Products, Inc. JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES Mavich llc Victory Supply Bob Barker Company Inc ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC Charm-Tex
(Phoenix Trading, Inc.)
Total Price $3,975.50| Total Price $31,587.30| Total Price $54,985.35| Total Price $58,443.20| Total Price $79,487.13| Total Price $79,616.51| Total Price $80,709.75| Total Price $84,034.65
Line # Description Qry UuoM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
INMATE CLOTHING: SHOES - EVA SNEAKER,
87 ONE PIECE CONSTRUCTION -ORANGE, SIZE S
-L 700 each [No Bid No Bid $2.85 $1,995.00(No Bid $2.87 $2,009.00 $3.09 $2,163.00 $4.00 $2,800.00 $3.99 $2,793.00
Brand Bid JAB Trading VSI BBC ICS CT
Product Number EVA-STEPIN-O-(S-L) SHEVDSO-(SZ) FEVST35-OR-size SC70774 F/STEP-OR
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 1 1 12 PAIR PER CASE 12
Price Per Case/Pkg $68.40 2.87 3.09 $48.00 PER CASE $47.88
MUST ORDER MINIMUM OF
120 PAIR
INMATE CLOTHING: SHOES - EVA SNEAKER,
88 ONE PIECE CONSTRUCTION -ORANGE, SIZE
XL 700 each [No Bid No Bid $2.85 $1,995.00(No Bid $2.87 $2,009.00 $3.09 $2,163.00 $4.00 $2,800.00 $3.99 $2,793.00
Brand Bid JAB Trading VS BBC ICS CcT
Product Number EVA-STEPIN-O-XL SHEVDSO-XL FEVST35-OR-size SC70774 F/STEP-OR
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 1 1 12 PAIR PER CASE 12
Price Per Case/Pkg $68.40 2.87 3.09 $48.00 PER CASE $47.88
MUST ORDER MINIMUM OF
120 PAIR
INMATE CLOTHING: SHOES - EVA SNEAKER,
89 ONE PIECE CONSTRUCTION -ORANGE, SIZE
2XL 175 each |No Bid No Bid $2.85 $498.75|No Bid $2.87 $502.25 $3.49 $610.75 $4.00 $700.00 $3.99 $698.25
Brand Bid JAB Trading VSI BBC ICS CT
Product Number EVA-STEPIN-O-2XL SHEVDSO-2XL FEVST35-OR-size SC70774 F/STEP-OR
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 1 1 12 PAIR PER CASE 12
Price Per Case/Pkg $68.40 2.87 3.49 $48.00 PER CASE $47.88
MUST ORDER MINIMUM OF
120 PAIR
INMATE CLOTHING: SHOES - EVA SNEAKER,
90 ONE PIECE CONSTRUCTION -ORANGE, SIZE
3XL 100 each [No Bid No Bid $2.85 $285.00|No Bid $2.87 $287.00 $3.49 $349.00 $4.00 $400.00 $3.99 $399.00
Brand Bid JAB Trading VS BBC ICS CcT
Product Number EVA-STEPIN-O-3XL SHEVDSO-3XL FEVST35-OR-size SC70774 F/STEP-OR
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 1 1 12 PAIR PER CASE 12
Price Per Case/Pkg $68.40 2.87 3.49 $48.00 PER CASE $47.88
MUST ORDER MINIMUM OF
120 PAIR
91 INMATE CLOTHING: SHOES- EVA SLIDES,
ORANGE, S-XL 120 each |No Bid No Bid $2.05 $246.00|No Bid $2.04 $244.80 $1.88 $225.60 $2.04 $244.80 $2.99 $358.80
Brand Bid JAB Trading VS BBC ICS CT
Product Number EVA-SLIDE-O-(S-XL) SHEVSSO-(SIZE) SEVA-OR-size MJAS F/EVA-OR
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 1 1 24 PAIR PER CASE 12
Price Per Case/Pkg $49.20 2.04 1.88 S48.96 PER CASE $35.88
MUST ORDER IN CASE PACKS
OF 24
92 MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: INDIGENT
HYGIENE KIT 25,000 each |[No Bid $0.62 $15,500.00 $0.62 $15,500.00|No Bid $0.604 $15,100.00 $0.52 $13,000.00 $0.49 $12,250.00 $0.66 $16,500.00
Brand Bid Amercare JAB Trading VS BBC ICS cT
Product Number AMK-5-COL HYG-KIT-CC KITCOLLIN KIT KIT-COL5 KIT/
Quantity per Case/Pkg 100 72 50 1 150 KITS PER CASE 100
Price Per Case/Pkg 62.00 S44.64 30.20 0.52 $73.50 PER CASE $66.00
93 MISCELLANEQOUS ITEMS: COMB: 5" PLASTIC,
NON BREAKABLE 100 each |No Bid $0.03 $3.00 S0.04 $4.00|No Bid $0.02 $2.00 $0.022 $2.20 $0.0165 $1.65 $0.027 $2.70
Brand Bid Amercare JAB Trading VS| BBC ICS CT
Product Number C-5 Cc7 SUC5 C-5 T123 H/GCS
Quantity per Case/Pkg 144 1,440 2160 $144.00 2160 PER CASE 144
Price Per Case/Pkg 3.00 S61 43.20 $3.18 $35.64 PER CASE $3.90
MUST ORDER IN FULL CASE
e PACKS
93 ALTL
:MISCELLANEQOUS ITEMS: COMB 7" PLASTIC .. 100 each $0.04
Brand Bid JAB Trading
Product Number C7
Quantity per Case/Pkg S61
Price Per Case/Pkg 1,440
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2019-188 Jail and Personal Inmate Supplies

Amercare Products, Inc.

Tabb Textiles Co., Inc. . ) JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES Mavich llc Victory Supply Bob Barker Company Inc ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC Charm-Tex
(Phoenix Trading, Inc.)
Total Price $3,975.50| Total Price $31,587.30| Total Price $54,985.35| Total Price $58,443.20| Total Price $79,487.13| Total Price $79,616.51| Total Price $80,709.75| Total Price $84,034.65
Line # Description QTy UoM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
94 MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: DEODORANT -
Maximum Security .5 oz 10,000 each [No Bid $0.42 $4,200.00 $0.32 $3,200.00(No Bid $0.21 $2,100.00 $0.271 $2,710.00 $0.2796 $2,796.00 $0.27 $2,700.00
Brand Bid Amerfresh Freshscent VS| BBC ICS CcT
Product Number STD-05 STD5 SUSDO5 FD-05 T063 H/CTSDOS
Quantity per Case/Pkg 60.48 $180 576 144 576 PER CASE $38.90
Price Per Case/Pkg 144 576 120.96 38.98 $161.05 PER CASE 144
MUST ORDER IN FULL CASE
PACKS
95 MISCELLANEQUS ITEMS: DEODORANT - .5
oz Degree 3,500 each |No Bid $0.42 $1,470.00 $0.32 $1,120.00 $1.6663 $5,832.05 $1.09 $3,815.00 $1.111 $3,888.50 $0.7694 $2,692.90(No Bid
Brand Bid Amerfresh Freshscent DEGREE VSI/DEGREE Degree DEGREE
Product Number STD-05 STD5 GRAINGER ITEM# 32GN21 SUDEDES 152296 T502827
Quantity per Case/Pkg 144 $180 36 36 36 36 PER CASE
Price Per Case/Pkg 60.48 576 59.99 39.24 39.98 $27.70 PER CASE
AVAILABLE IN MEN OR
WOMEN MUST ORDER IN FULL
96 MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: SOAP: WRAPPED,
ANTIBACTERIAL DEODERANT SOAP .5 OZ 10,000 each |No Bid $0.033 $330.00 $0.06 $600.00|No Bid No Bid $0.049 $490.00 $0.0412 $412.00 $0.0429 $429.00
Brand Bid Amerfresh Freshscent BBC FRESHSCENT cT
Product Number S-1/2-UN S34 62101-C T040 H/S1/2AB
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1000 1,000 1000 1000 PER CASE 1000
Price Per Case/Pkg 33.00 $61.00 $48.98 $41.20 PER CASE $42.90
MUST ORDER IN FULL CASE
PACKS
97 MISCELLANEQUS ITEMS: LIQUID TWO-IN-
ONE SHAMPOO ANDCONDITIONER, GALLON 50 each [No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.99 $749.50 $14.22 $711.00 $9.62 $481.00
Brand Bid VS| BBC FRESHSCENT
Product Number SUSC128 CSC128 TMS128
Quantity per Case/Pkg 4 4 4 GALLONS PER CASE
Price Per Case/Pkg 59.96 $56.88 $38.48 PER CASE
. MUST ORDER IN FULL CASE .
Non Responsive PACKS Non Responsive
98 MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: DIAL ALL-IN-ONE
SHAMPOO, GALLON 50 each [No Bid $10.50 $525.00 $20.00 $1,000.00(No Bid $15.19 $759.50 $16.745 $837.25 $11.725 $586.25|No Bid
Brand Bid Amerfresh Dial VSI/DIAL Dial DIAL
Product Number 3IN1-GAL ARDO03986 SUSSBDIAL128 3986 T03986
Quantity per Case/Pkg 4 4 4 4 4 GALLONS PER CASE
Price Per Case/Pkg 42.00 $80.00 60.76 66.98 $46.90 PER CASE
MUST ORDER IN FULL CASE
PACKS
99 MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: SHAMPOO:LICE
TREATMENT KIT 150 each [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.2442 $1,836.63|No Bid
Brand Bid SUNMARK
Product Number 0T10705
Quantity per Case/Pkg 12 PER CASE
Price Per Case/Pkg $146.93 PER CASE
MUST ORDER IN FULL CASE
PACKS
100 MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: TOOTHPASTE:
CREST .85 0z 10,000 each [No Bid $0.16 $1,600.00 $1.50 $15,000.00|No Bid $0.41 $4,100.00 $0.333 $3,330.00 $0.3965 $3,965.00(No Bid
Brand Bid Amerfresh Crest VSI/CREST Crest CREST
Product Number TP-085-G CLN0282120 SUTP85CREST CG9782 TPC85
Quantity per Case/Pkg 144 240 240 240 240 PER CASE
Price Per Case/Pkg 23.04 $360.00 98.40 79.88 $95.16 PER CASE
MUST ORDER IN FULL CASE
_________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ PACKS
100 AI__I_léTOOTH PASTE, PREMIUM ANTI-CAVITY ADA
APPROVED; 8507 10,000 each $0.2167
‘Brand Bid FRESHMINT
Product Number TPADAS85
Quantity per Case/Pkg 144 PER CASE
Price Per Case/Pkg $31.20 PER CASE
MUST ORDER IN FULL CASE
PACKS
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2019-188 Jail and Personal Inmate Supplies

Amercare Products, Inc.

Tabb Textiles Co., Inc. . ) JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES Mavich llc Victory Supply Bob Barker Company Inc ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC Charm-Tex
(Phoenix Trading, Inc.)
Total Price $3,975.50| Total Price $31,587.30| Total Price $54,985.35| Total Price $58,443.20| Total Price $79,487.13| Total Price $79,616.51| Total Price $80,709.75| Total Price $84,034.65
Line # Description QTy UoM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
101 MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: SHORTY
TOOTHBRUSHES, WRAPPED 10,000 each [No Bid $0.065 $650.00 $0.05 $500.00(No Bid $0.041 $410.00 $0.043 $430.00 $0.0316 $316.00 $0.04 $400.00
Brand Bid Amercare New World VS| BBC ICS CT
Product Number TB-SH-H TBSH SUTB20I BBST25 TBSH H/TB20
Quantity per Case/Pkg 144 1,440 144 144 1440 PER CASE 144
Price Per Case/Pkg 9.36 $72.00 5.904 6.22 $45.50 PER CASE $5.90
MUST ORDER IN FULL CASE
PACKS
102 MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: SANITARY
NAPKINS: SUPER, BELTLESS, ADHESIVE 25,000 each |[No Bid $0.0515 $1,287.50 $0.15 $3,750.00(No Bid $0.148 $3,700.00 $0.052 $1,300.00 $0.0711 $1,777.50 $0.052 $1,300.00
Brand Bid Amerfresh Medline Feminine Pads VS| BBC SANITEX CcT
Product Number AF-250 NON241279 SUMTSM SN12-C TSN300 H/FSNC864
Quantity per Case/Pkg 250 600 288 576 288 PER CASE 864
Price Per Case/Pkg 12.88 $90.00 42.624 29.99 $20.48 PER CASE $44.90
MUST ORDER IN FULL CASE
PACKS
MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: NET LAUNDRY
104 . .
BAG: 24" X 36" 500 each |No Bid No Bid $16.99 $8,495.00 $2.42 $1,210.00 $2.807 $1,403.50 $2.9525 $1,476.25
Brand Bid TOUGH GUY VS| BBC ICS
Product Number GRAINGER ITEM# 1TTZ2 LB2436DC-WH W2436 LO55-36
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1 12 12 1 DOZEN
Price Per Case/Pkg 16.99 29.04 33.68 $35.43 PER DOZEN
. MUST ORDER IN FULL CASE .
Non Responsive PACKS Non Responsive
MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: ID
105 BANDS:CLINCHER, IV PHOTO WHITE, METAL
FASTENER 3,000 each [No Bid $0.4481 $1,344.30(No Bid No Bid $0.37 $1,110.00 $0.353 $1,059.00 $0.3552 $1,065.60(No Bid
Brand Bid Clincher VSI/CLINCHER Clincher PRECISION DYNAMICS
Product Number 645M-WH WBCLNCHRIIM-WH 645M-WH 645M
Quantity per Case/Pkg 500 500 500 500 PER CASE
Price Per Case/Pkg 224.05 185.00 176.50 $177.60 PER CASE
MUST ORDER IN FULL CASE
PACKS
Percentage Discount Off Latest Suggested
107  List Price for Bedding and TowelsNot Listed
Herein 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 27.0% 5.0% 15.0% 5.0%
Percentage Discount Off Latest Suggested
108 List Price for Inmate ClothingNot Listed
Herein 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 27.0% 10.0% 15.0% 5.0%
Percentage Discount Off Latest Suggested
109  List Price for Personal Hygiene Products Not
Listed Herein 1 No Bid 8.0% No Bid No Bid 22.0% 5.0% 15.0% 5.0%
110 MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: TAMPONS:
REGULAR, WRAPPED 20,000 each |[No Bid $0.099 $1,980.00 $0.1833 $3,666.00 $0.1169 $2,338.00 $0.092 $1,840.00 $0.0876 $1,752.00 $0.0978 $1,956.00
Brand Bid Bodyform by Premier Care HOSPECO VS| BBC ICS cT
Product Number AMT-500 GRAINGER ITEM# 3U822 SUMTMPR TPX500 TO67 H/FTSOOR
Quantity per Case/Pkg 500 500 500 500 500 PER CASE 500
Price Per Case/Pkg 49.50 91.69 58.44 45.98 $43.80 PER CASE $48.90
111 MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: TAMPONS: SUPER,
WRAPPED 20,000 each |No Bid $0.11 $2,200.00 No Bid $0.1169 $2,338.00 $0.096 $1,920.00 $0.0924 $1,848.00 $0.1098 $2,196.00
Brand Bid Bodyform by Premier Care VS| BBC ICS CcT
Product Number AMT-500-S SUMTMPS SBTPX500 T067S H/FTSOO0S
Quantity per Case/Pkg 500 500 500 480 PER CASE 500
Price Per Case/Pkg 55.00 58.44 47.98 $44.35 PER CASE $54.90

Grouped lines for award:

Lines: 11-18 Group total - $106.92
Lines: 19-26 Group total - $92.93
Lines: 27-30 Group total - $19.00
Lines: 31-51 Group total - $112.20
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