IFB 2020-125 Firearms, Ammunition, and Accessories

Line items not awarded: 7, 20, 22, 23, 24, 25, 26, 27, 32, 33, 34, 38, 40, 41, 43, 44, 46, 47, 56, 57, 58, 59,70, 71, 74, 75, 77,78, 79, 81, 82, 83, 84

silencerCo Clyde Armory, Inc. RTP ARA'\;;':;;;'C TP Precision Delta Corporation | ¢ Tm';z;?:;:ﬁi‘; Sunrise GALLS, LLC GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC
Total Price [$  7,757.44 | TotalPrice [ $ 48,678.44 | TotalPrice | $ 52,343.84 | TotalPrice| $ 75,215.00 | TotalPrice | $ 76,046.56 | Total Price | § 137,882.00 | Total Price | $ 286,771.01
Line#  Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY__UOM Unit Unit unit | Unit Unit unit__| Unit
1 9MM with night sights, 3-17 round Glock or Collin County  Model 17,
magazines approved equal Generation 5 207  each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 409.00 $  84,663.00
2 Glock or Collin County
Simulator Handgun, Fixed Sights, 5Ib aproved equal 177 5 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 454.00 $ 2,270.00
Force on Force Training
B] B
or Collin County
Conversion Kit, Bolt 5.56mm, M4 approved equal 5 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 261.18 $ 1,305.90
4 Silencer, Omega 300 Suppressor Includes 5 Silencerco or Collin
8x24 ASR Muzzle Brake and ASR Mount County approved equal 4 each $ 754.80 S 3,019.20 | No Bid No Bid No Bid S 888.00 S 3,552.00 | No Bid No Bid
5 Silencer, Omega 300 Suppressor, includes  Silencerco or Collin
1/2x28 ASR Muzzle Brake and ASR Mount ~ County approved equal 2 each $ 754.80 $ 1,509.60 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 888.00 $ 1,776.00 | No Bid No Bid
6 Silencerco or Collin
Silencer, Omega 36M Suppressor County approved equal 4 each $ 807.16 $ 3,228.64 | No Bid No Bid No Bid S 950.00 S 3,800.00 | No Bid No Bid
8 Super SCAR Trigger, FN SCAR 16/17, Two  Geissele or Collin
Stage Matte County approved equal 6 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 285.00 S 1,710.00 | No Bid N 29546 S 1,772.76
Blue Force Gear or
9 Viking Tactics Padded Vickers Combat Collin County approved
Sling, Black equal 6 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 5200 $ 312.00 | $ 34.06 S 204.36
9ALT3 " o " " a ict :
Savvy Sniper Precision Sling with HK hooks ~ Savvy Sniper Precision sling 6 each $ 59.00
9ALTL Savvy Sniper dual QD attachment sling with
i black nylon Savvy Sniper quad dual 6 each $ 79.00
Blue Force Gear or
10 Collin County approved
AR-15/M16 Vickers Combat Sling equal VCAS1250ABK 4 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N 45.00 S 180.00 | § 36.90 S 147.60
Savvy Sniper dual QD attachment sling with
10 ALT1 iadjustment black nylon (Can be a dual HK
hook style as well) Savvy Sniper quad dual 4 each S 79.00
11 Brownell's or Collin
1" HK Style Sling Snap Hook County approved equal 6 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 60.00 $ 360.00 | $ 565 S 33.90
11ALTL UDC PADDED BUNGEE ONE POINT SLING
W/ HK HOOK ADAPTERTP018 Blue Force Gear UDC-200-BG-HK-BK 6 each $ 60.00
Sling Snap Hooks are fast, secure sling
attachment hardware that allows quick
installation and removal of any sling they
11 ALT1 iare attached too. The Sling Snap Hook has
a 1" sling slot and fits on any Padded or
Vickers Combat
Sling. Blue Force Gear P-HK-100 6 each
12 SureFire or Collin
DS-SRO7-IT Dual Pressure Switch County approved equal 12 each No Bid S 20381 S 2,445.72 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 151.14 S 1,813.68
13 Safariland or Collin
ALS Holster, Glock 17, County approved equal 6360 154  each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $  12,936.00 | $ 133.08 $  20,494.32
UL AND GOOBRICH K FORCE
13 ALT1 {HOLSTERLP653 BRH G17 Gould & Goodrich K391-G17W 154  each $ 8400
14 Ammunition, 9mm Luger +P 134 gr Flexlock Hornady or Collin
Duty County approved equal 90225 59 box No Bid No Bid No Bid $  24,485.00 | No Bid $ 2655000 |$ 44558 $  26,289.22
9MM 147gr Ranger Bonded ONE JHPSee
14 ALT1 iattachments for product specification
sheet WINCHESTER RA9B1 59 box $ 415.00
14 ALT1 R 9MM LUG 147 BJHP BON i 29353 59 box $ 450.00
15  Ammunition, LE Only Brass Case 9mm 135 Hornady or Collin
gr County approved equal 90238 100  box No Bid No Bid No Bid $  17,900.00 | No Bid $  19,000.00 [ $ 316,59 $  31,659.00
9MM 124gr Full Metal JacketSee
15 ALT1 fat for product
sheet WINCHESTER USAIMM 100  box $ 179.00
15 ALT1 :LOMM2 L SMM LUG 124 FMJ 500/CA i 23718 100  box S 190.00
Federal Law Enforcement Tactical Bonded
15 ALT1 {9mm Luger Ammo 135 Grain +P Hollow
Point Federal LE9TS 100  box S 660.00

2020-125 Addendum 1 - Page 1
5/6/2020

2020-125

Draft document until award



IFB 2020-125 Firearms, Ammunition, and Accessories

" RTP ARMOR, LLC (RTP . . Tk Tactical (Colorado Sunrise
SilencerCo Clyde Armory, Inc. ARMOR) Precision Delta Corporation Holdings LLC) GALLS, LLC GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC
Total Price [$  7,757.44 | TotalPrice [ $ 48,678.44 | TotalPrice | § 52,343.84 | TotalPrice| $ 75,215.00 | TotalPrice | $ 76,046.56 | Total Price | § 137,882.00 | Total Price | $ 286,771.01
Line#  Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY__UoM i unit | unit | unit | unit | unit__| unit__| Unit

16  Ammunition, .223 55 Gr Practice Ammo Hornady or Collin
Lacquered County approved equal 9754 EL 50 box No Bid No Bid No Bid $  16,000.00 | No Bid $  17,000.00 [ $ 287.42 $  14,371.00
.223 Rem 55gr Full Metal JacketSee

16 ALT1 {attachments for product specification
sheet WINCHESTER USA223R1K 50 box s 320.00
16 ALT1 {L223R3B L 223 REM 55 FMJ 500/C il 23685 50 box S 340.00

17 Hornady or Collin
TAP 223 Rem-62 Gr-Barrier _County approved equal 83285 22 box No Bid No Bid No Bid $  16,830.00 | No Bid $ 1326600 |$ 68364 $ 15040.08
R

17 ALT1 iPRCZ: S REN 62 CLUBPS 28918 227" "box $  603.00
5.56MM 64gr. Ranger Bonded Solid
17 ALT1 iBaseSee attachments for product
if sheet WINCHESTER RA556B 22 box $  765.00
18 Eotech or Collin County
Optics, Weapon Sight approved equal XPS3-0 4 each No Bid $ 54365 $ 217460 |$  599.27 $  2,397.08 | NoBid $ 55500 $  2,220.00 | No Bid $ 53478 $  2,139.12
18 ALT1 iSteiner Optics Steiner DRS1X 4 each S 528.00
DOES NOT MEET SPECS
19 Troy Industries or Collin
AR-15 Flip-Up Adjustable Rear Sight County approved equal SSIGFBSROBTOO 4 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 101.39 $ 405.56 | No Bid $ 10142 S 405.68

21 Double Star or Collin
AR-15 ACE ARFX-E Skeleton Stock County approved equal A110B 4 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 120.00

S 480.00 | No Bid

28  Magazines, AR-15 PMAG-D-60 223/5.56 Magpul or Collin County

60RD Polymer, Black approved equal MAG576 300 each No Bid $ 10266 $ 30,798.00|$ 10425 $  31,275.00 | No Bid $ 10155 $  30,465.00 | No Bid $ 9491 $ 28473.00
29  Magazines, AR-15 PMAG GEN M3 223/5.56 Magpul or Collin County

30RD Polymer, Black approved equal MAG557 300 each No Bid $ 11.81 $ 3,543.00 | $ 1375 $ 4,125.00 | No Bid $ 13.00 $ 3,900.00 | No Bid $ 10.92 $ 3,276.00
30 Magpul or Collin County

Magazines, PMAG 17GL9, 3 Pack (Glock 17) approved equal 7 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 42.00 $ 294.00 | No Bid $ 2839 S 198.73

Precision Gun
Specialities or Collin
County approved equal ST9YELLOW 3 box No Bid

Ammunition, Training: 9mm Yellow No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 112.50

$ 3750 $

HD XR Night Sight Set, Glock 17, 19, 22, 26, Trijicon or approved

e 32, 37 orange frnt equal GL601C600836 3 each No Bid No Bid $ 12132 $ 363.96 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 108.79 $ 326.37
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IFB 2020-125 Firearms, Ammunition, and Accessories

" RTP ARMOR, LLC (RTP . . Tk Tactical (Colorado Sunrise
SilencerCo Clyde Armory, Inc. ARMOR) Precision Delta Corporation Holdings LLC) GALLS, LLC GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC
Total Price [$  7,757.44 | TotalPrice [ $ 48,678.44 | TotalPrice | § 52,343.84 | TotalPrice| $ 75,215.00 | TotalPrice | $ 76,046.56 | Total Price | § 137,882.00 | Total Price | $ 286,771.01
Line#  Description Wifgr Mfgno QTY__UoM Unit Unit unit__| Unit Unit unit__| Unit
Surefire or Collin County
Pistol LightX300-U approved equal X300-U 12 each No Bid $ 26611 $ 3,193.32($ 21030 $ 2,523.60 | No Bid No Bid $ 23000 $ 2,760.00 [ $  204.67 $ 2,456.04
36 ALT1 iTLRI-HL Streamlight 69260 12 each $  148.00
DOES NOT MEET SPECS
37 Ecotech or Collin County
k ic Weapon Sights approved equal Model XPS3 12 each No Bid $ 54365 $ 652380 |$ 59927 $  7,191.24 | NoBid $ 55500 $  6,660.00 | NoBid 34042 $  4,085.04
37 ALT1 iSteiner Optic Steiner DRS1X 12 each S 528.00
Safariland or Collin
7395 7TSALSHOLSTER/W/WEAPON LIGHT  County approved equal 12 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 780.00 | $ 86.88 $ 1,042.56
0GR {G&G X CALIBER MID RIDE DUTY HOLSTER
iW/ LIGHTLH624 BRH G17 X200 Gould & Goodrich X2000-17X2W 12 each $ 6500
DOES NOT MEET SPECS

45

45 ALT1

48

49

50

51

52

53

54

55

Scope Mount, Quick Detach 34MM

LaRue Tactical or Collin

County approved equal LT111-34

: teiner cantilever mount

DBAL-A3 Restricted Dual Beam Aiming

Steiner 5972

Steiner or Collin County

50 ALT1

Laser - Advanced 3 approved equal 12 each
ASP, Inc or Collin County

Tri-Fold Disposable Restaints, 6-pack approved equal 56192 12 each
Safariland or Collin

Mag Pouch, 79 Open Top 2x County approved equal 775 154  each

G002 K617 K FORCE OPEN TOP

IAGZW038 BW G36 Gould & Goodrich K617-2 154  each

Defense Technology or
Collin County approved

Indirect Fire Munitions equal 300 each
Defense Technology or

LMT 40MM Light Weight Single Shot Collin County approved

Launcher equal 3 each
Defense Technology or
Collin County approved

Chemical Munitions equal 300 each
Defense Technology or
Collin County approved

Chemical Ferret Rounds equal 300 each
Defense Technology or
Collin County approved

Pyrotechnic Penetrating Rounds equal 300 each

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Line items not awarded: 7, 20, 22, 23, 24, 25, 26, 27, 32, 33, 34, 38, 40, 41, 43, 44, 46, 47, 56, 57, 58, 59,70, 71, 74, 75, 77,78, 79, 81, 82, 83, 84

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
$ 2583 $

309.96

$ 2700 $ 415800

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 1537900 $  16,548.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 230000 $  27,600.00
S 2000 $ 240.00
S 2300 $  3,542.00
S 23.00

$ 1900 $  5700.00
$ 1,0000 $  3,300.00
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 1,037.63 $ 1245156
$ 1794 $ 215.28
$ 2074 $ 31939
$ 1877 $ 563100
$ 81565 $ 244695
$ 2124 $ 637200
$ 2187 $ 656100
$ 2187 $ 656100
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IFB 2020-125 Firearms, Ammunition, and Accessories

" RTP ARMOR, LLC (RTP . . Tk Tactical (Colorado Sunrise
SilencerCo Clyde Armory, Inc. ARMOR) Precision Delta Corporation Holdings LLC) GALLS, LLC GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC
Total Price [$  7,757.44 | TotalPrice [ $ 48,678.44 | TotalPrice | § 52,343.84 | TotalPrice| $ 75,215.00 | TotalPrice | $ 76,046.56 | Total Price | § 137,882.00 | Total Price | $ 286,771.01

Line #

60

61

62

63

64

65

66

67

68

69

Description

Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List
Price for manufacturer bid on line 8 for
items not Listed Herein

Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List
Price for manufacturer bid on lines 9 and
10 for items Not Listed Herein

Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List
Price for manufacturer bid on line 11 for
item Not Listed Herein

Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List
Price for manufacturer bid on lines 12 and
36 for items Not Listed Herein

Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List
Price for manufacturer bid on lines 13, 39
and 50 for items not Listed Herein

Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List
Price for manufacturer bid on lines 14, 15,
16 and 17 for items not Listed Herein
Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List
Price for manufacturer bid on lines 18 and
37 for items Not Listed Herein

Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List
Price for manufacturer bid on line 19 for
items not Listed Herein

Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List
Price for manufacturer bid on lines 20 and
45 for items Not Listed Herein

Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List
Price for manufacturer bid on line 21 for
items not Listed Herein

Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List
Price for manufacturer bid on lines 28, 29
and 30 for items Not Listed Herein
Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List
Price for manufacturer bid on lines 31 and
32 for items Not Listed Herein

Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List
Price for manufacturer bid on line 35 for
items not Listed Herein

Estimated Extended

21% No Bid No Bid 15%
No Bid No Bid 15%

Extended

11%

17%

Extended

Extended

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Extended

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Extended

15%

Extended

10%
10%
No Bid
5%
25%
No Bid
10%
10%
No Bid
No Bid

Line items not awarded: 7, 20, 22, 23, 24, 25, 26, 27, 32, 33, 34, 38, 40, 41, 43, 44, 46, 47, 56, 57, 58, 59,70, 71, 74, 75, 77, 78, 79, 81, 82, 83, 84
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IFB 2020-125 Firearms, Ammunition, and Accessories

" RTP ARMOR, LLC (RTP . . Tk Tactical (Colorado Sunrise
SilencerCo Clyde Armory, Inc. ARMOR) Precision Delta Corporation Holdings LLC) GALLS, LLC GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC
Total Price [$  7,757.44 | TotalPrice [ $ 48,678.44 | TotalPrice | § 52,343.84 | TotalPrice| $ 75,215.00 | TotalPrice | $ 76,046.56 | Total Price | § 137,882.00 | Total Price | $ 286,771.01

85

86

87

88

Description

Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List
Price for manufacturer bid on line 42 for
items not Listed Herein

Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List
Price for manufacturer bid on line 48 for
items not Listed Herein

Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List
Price for manufacturer bid on line 49 for
items not Listed Herein

Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List

Price for manufacturer for lines 51, 52, 53,
54 and 55 for items Not Listed Herein

L4 G24 Mount

Wilcox or Collin County
approved equal

QTY UOM

12 each

Estimated

No Bid

Extended

Extended

26%

No Bid

Extended

No Bid

Extended

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Extended

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$  393.00 $ 4,716.00

No Bid

Extended

15%

15%

15%

Extended

No Bid

Line items not awarded: 7, 20, 22, 23, 24, 25, 26, 27, 32, 33, 34, 38, 40, 41, 43, 44, 46, 47, 56, 57, 58, 59,70, 71, 74, 75, 77, 78, 79, 81, 82, 83, 84
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