2020-186 Safety Wear

Sunset Survival & First

Municipal Emergency

2ALTL

2ALT1

4 ALT1

4 ALT1

4 ALT2

4 ALT3

4 ALT4

5ALT1

First Spear or

Collin County
approved
Helmet Hut, Black equal 12 each
VIPER HELMET BAG POINT BLANK HLMH870000 12 each
bag- helment and plate carrierBG1473 POINT BLANK BAGN00130D 12 each
Blue Force
Gear or Collin
County
approved BT-TKN-Filled-
Micro Trauma Kit NOW!, Black equal 003-BK 12 each
Safariland or
Collin County
PROTECH FAST ATTACK VEST - ADVANCED  approved
WEBLESS SYSTEM, Black equal 12 each
5.11 TACTICAL TACTEC PLATE
CARRIERBP210 5.11 56100 12 each
SOHPC Gen IV Laser CARRIER ONLY NO
BALLISTICS PARACLETE ~ HC8600BVZ9 12 each
SOHPC Gen IV Laser SE WITH WARSOC
BUCKLE CARRIER ONLY NO BALLISTICS PARACLETE  HC8600B1Z9 12 each
HC8600BVZ9-
HC6GNDBDO
H-
SOHPC Gen IV Laser WITH LEVEL 3A CUDGNDBSO
BALLISTICS PARACLETE H 12 each
HC8600B1Z29-
HC6GNDBDO
H-
SOHPC Gen IV Laser SE WITH WARSOC CUDGNDBSO
BUCKLE WITH LEVEL 3A BALLISTICS PARACLETE H 12 each
Blue Force
Gear or Collin
County
approved
Tourniquet NOW! Strap Tourniquet Holder equal M-TNS-BK 24 each
KRYDEX First Aid Tourniquet Holder RG
Tactical Outdoor Application TQ Stretch
MOLLE Strap For CAT SOF-T NATO Style
Tourniquets KRYDEX TA-F1342 24 each

Line Items #: 1, 9, 12, 33 will not be awarded.

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 42.88

DOES NOT MEET SPECS

No Bid

No Bid

S 399.00
DOES NOT MEET SPECS
$  589.00

DOES NOT MEET SPECS

$  720.00

DOES NOT MEET SPECS

$  910.00

DOES NOT MEET SPECS

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 17738 S 2,128.56

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 14736

$  460.96

$ 8.81

$

$

$

1,768.32

5,531.52

211.44

B Mavich llc Nardis Public Safety AARDVARK N GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC GALLS, LLC
Aid, Inc. Services, Inc
Total Price [ §  863.76 | Total Price | $ 6,150.00 | Total Price | §  9,068.00 | Total Price | $  13,140.00 | Total Price [ $  73,868.70 | Total Price [ $ 175,415.08 | Total Price [ $ 211,265.00
Line#  Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY UOM Estimated Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

$ 828.00
S 69.00
DOES NOT MEET SPECS
$ 17000 $  2,040.00
S 1,644.00
$  137.00
DOES NOT MEET SPECS
$ 1000 $ 240.00
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2020-186 Safety Wear

Sunset Survival & First
Aid, Inc.

Mavich llc

Nardis Public Safety

AARDVARK

Municipal Emergency
Services, Inc

GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC

GALLS, LLC

Total Price [ $  863.76

Total Price [ $ 6,150.00

Total Price | $  9,068.00

Total Price | $

13,140.00

Total Price | $  73,868.70

Total Price | $ 175,415.08

Total Price | $  211,265.00

Line #

uom

Unit

Unit

Description

Mfgr

Mfgno Qry

Unit |

unit |

unit |

unit |

unit |

COMBAT APPLICATION TOURNIQUET (C-A-

n

North
American
Rescue or
Collin County
approved
equal

each

6 ALT1 {ALIEXPRESS AOLIKES

ALIEXPRESS

AOLIKES 24

each

FM53 Gas Mask Specialist Responder Kit

Avon
Protection
Systems or
Collin County
approved
equal

each

iwell the price includes both parts

iFM54 new version will need the VPU as

AVON

70501-697-
size 12

each

Gas Mask Drop Leg/Pouch

10

Standard Issue Ballistic M Frame Alpha

11

SUPPRESSOR SENSOR GLOVES

TYR Tactical
or Collin
County
approved
equal

Oakley or
Collin County
approved
equal

Outdoor
Research or
Collin County
approved
equal

TYR-0D730-
CAN 12

266840

each

each

each

Cobra Cuffs
or Collin
13 County
approved MS24D-250-6-
Cobra Cuffs. equal BK 12 each
Point Blank
or Collin
14 County
FLXIIIA-1 w/2 Hi Lite Carriers and Soft approved
Trauma Insert equal 3 each
Armor
Express or
B Collin County
Ballistic Vest with Revolution Carrier / approved
Level Il equal 1 each
15 ALT3 POINT BLANK BLANK GNX2 LEVEL Il WITH
HILITE CARRER POINT BLANK HILITE GNX2 1 each
15 ALT2 POINT BLANK BII LEVEL Il WITH HILITE
CARRIER POINT BLANK HILITE BIl 1 each
15 ALTL ARMOR EXPRESS VORTEX LEVEL Il WITH ~ ARMOR
REVOLUTION CARRIER EXPRESS VORTEX Il 1 each
15 ALTA POINT BLANK LIGHTWEIGHT AXIl WITH
HILITE CARRIER POINT BLANK HILITEAX2 1 each

Line Items #: 1, 9, 12, 33 will not be awarded.

$ 3599 $ 863.76

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
$ 9.40

DOES NOT MEET SPECS

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$  749.00 $  2,247.00
$ 52100 $ 521.00
$  539.00

$  548.00

S 624.00

S 692.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 2764 S 663.36

$ 114375 $ 13,725.00

$ 1,283.54

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
$ 81279 $ 243837
S 71438 S 714.38

$ 2222 $ 533.28

$ 1,389.96 $ 16,679.52

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$

$ 1,10000 $

$ 41.00

2500 $

S

$ 12500 $

$ 55.00

S

$ 1575 $
S 810.00 $
$ 62000 $

13,200.00

600.00

492.00

1,500.00

660.00

189.00

2,430.00

620.00
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2020-186 Safety Wear

Sunset Survival & First

Municipal Emergency

B Mavich lic Nardis Public Safety AARDVARK N GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC GALLS, LLC
Aid, Inc. Services, Inc
Total Price [ $  863.76 | Total Price | $ 6,150.00 | Total Price | $  9,068.00 | Total Price | $  13,140.00 | Total Price [ $  73,868.70 | Total Price [ $ 175,415.08 | Total Price | $ 211,265.00
Line#  Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY UuoM Unit | Unit Unit | Unit | Unit | Unit | Unit |
Armor
16 Expn.'ess or
Collin County
Ballistic Vest with Revolution Carrier / approved
Level Ill equal 1 each No Bid No Bid $ 61200 $ 612.00 | No Bid $ 85284 $ 852.84 | No Bid $  800.00 $ 800.00
16 ALT2
POINT BLANK BC3A WITH HILITE CARRER  POINT BLANK HILITE BC3A 1 each $ 562.00
16 ALT3 HILITE
POINT BLANK GNX3A WITH HILITE CARRER POINT BLANK GNX3A 1 each $ 585.00
16 ALTL ARMOR EXPRESS VORTEX LEVEL 3A WITH  ARMOR
REVOLUTION CARRIER EXPRESS VORTEX3A 1 each S 742.00
16 ALT4 POINT BLANK LIGHTWEIGHT AX3A WITH
HILITE CARRER POINT BLANK HILITE AX3A 1 each S 787.00
16 ALTS POINT BLANK LIGHTWEIGHT AXB3A WITH
HILITE CARRIER POINT BLANK HILITE AXB3A 1 each $ 821.00
Safariland or
17 Collin County
PROTECH FAST ATTACK VEST - Hardwire 68 approved PTA-FAV-
Level IlIA, Black equal HW68-3A 12 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 131579 $ 15789.48 $  35,880.00
17 ALT2 APC Gen IV Laser SE-WARSOC Base Vest
WITH GNX3A BALLISTICS PARACLETE  AP4AWN3B1Z9 12 each $  1,209.00
DOES NOT MEET SPECS
17 ALTL APC Gen IV Laser SE-WARSOC Base Vest APAWADB1Z
WITH AX3A BALLISTICS PARACLETE 9 12 each $  1,497.00
DOES NOT MEET SPECS
17 ALTL PARACLETE ARMIS SE COMPLETE W/
AXIIIABF262 POINT BLANK AM2UE3C10J 12 each $ 2,990.00
DOES NOT MEET SPECS
Safariland or
18 Collin County
PROTECH Collar - Hardwire 68 Level IlIA,  approved PTA-CLR-
Black equal HW68-3A 12 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 157.89 $  1,894.68 | No Bid
18 ALT2 APC Gen IV Laser SE-WARSOC COLLAR
WITH GNX3A BALLISTICS PARACLETE  CO6GNDOS0J 12 each $ 70.00
DOES NOT MEET SPECS
18 ALTL APC Gen IV Laser SE-WARSOC COLLAR
WITH AX3A BALLISTICS PARACLETE  CO6AXDOS0J 12 each $ 95.00
DOES NOT MEET SPECS
Safariland or
19 Collin County
PROTECH Throat - Hardwire 68 Level IlIA, approved PTA-THR-
Black equal HW68-3A 12 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 13158 $  1,578.96 | No Bid
19 ALTL APC Gen IV Laser SE-WARSOC THROAT PTA-THR-
WITH AX3A BALLISTICS PARACLETE  HW68-3A 12 each $ 62.60
DOES NOT MEET SPECS
19 ALT2 APC Gen IV Laser SE-WARSOC THROAT PTA-THR-
WITH GNX3A BALLISTICS PARACLETE  HW68-3A 12 each $ 62.60
DOES NOT MEET SPECS
Safariland or
20 Collin County
PROTECH Structured Upper Arms - approved PTA-SBCP-
Hardwire 68 Level IIA, Black equal HW68-3A 12 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 44737 $ 536844 | NoBid
20 ALT2 APC Gen IV Laser SE-WARSOC BICEPS WITH
GNX3A BALLISTICS PARACLETE  BIUBN30SOJ 12 each $ 199.00
DOES NOT MEET SPECS
20 ALTL APC Gen IV Laser SE-WARSOC BICEPS WITH
AX3A BALLISTICS PARACLETE ~ BIUBE30S0) 12 each $ 33100
DOES NOT MEET SPECS

Line Items #: 1, 9, 12, 33 will not be awarded.
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2020-186 Safety Wear

Sunset Survival & First
Aid, Inc.

Mavich llc

Nardis Public Safety

AARDVARK

Municipal Emergency
Services, Inc

GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC

GALLS, LLC

Total Price [ $  863.76

Total Price [ $ 6,150.00

Total Price | $  9,068.00

Total Price | $

13,140.00

Total Price | $  73,868.70

Total Price [ $ 175,415.08

Total Price | $  211,265.00

22ALT2

22ALT1

26 ALT1

26 ALT1

Mfgno

Safariland or
Collin County PTA-ERGN-

QTY UOM

PROTECH Enhanced Groin AWS - Hardwire approved AWS-HW68-

68 Level llIA, Black equal 3A 12 each
APC Gen IV Laser SE-WARSOC ENHANCE

GROIN PROTECTOR WITH GNX3A

BALLISTICS PARACLETE  GPRGNDOSO0J 12 each
APC Gen IV Laser SE-WARSOC ENHANCE

GROIN PROTECTOR WITH AX3A BALLISTICS PARACLETE  GPRAXDOSOJ 12 each

PROTECH Small ID Panel 6"x2", Black

Safariland or

Collin County

approved PTA-I-POL-
equal SM

{ID PANEL FREE WITH PURCHASE OF LINE

ID PANELS

PARACLETE ~ SMALL

Safariland or

Collin County
PROTECH X CAL DTC1 Type Il ICW 10X12  approved
Multi-Curve, Black equal PTA-1345363 1) each
10x12 LEVEL [1l/IV ICW BLACK PARACLETE _ PLT220TCSK 12 each
LVL 7000 10 X 12 SPECIAL THREAT
PLATEBP2928 POINT BLANK PLT463MHEA 12 each

Line Items #: 1, 9, 12, 33 will not be awarded.

Estimated

Extended

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Extended

No Bid

$  110.00

DOES NOT MEET SPECS

$  154.00

DOES NOT MEET SPECS

No Bid
$  198.25

DOES NOT MEET SPECS

No Bid

No Bid

Extended

Extended

No Bid

No Bid

$ 36095 $

$ 23695 $

4,331.40

595 $ 71.40

2,843.40

No Bid

No Bid

$ 6,420.00

$  535.00

DOES NOT MEET SPECS
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2020-186 Safety Wear

Sunset Survival & First
Aid, Inc.

Mavich llc

Nardis Public Safety

AARDVARK

Municipal Emergency
Services, Inc

GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC

GALLS, LLC

Total Price [ $  863.76

Total Price [ $ 6,150.00

Total Price | $  9,068.00

Total Price

[s

13,140.00

Total Price

[s  73,3868.70

Total Price | $ 175,415.08

Total Price | $  211,265.00

Line #

uom

Unit

Unit

Unit

Description

Mfgr Mfgno Qry

Unit |

unit |

unit |

unit |

27

27 ALT1
27 ALT1

28

29

30

31

32

34

35

36

37

38

39

PROTECH X CAL DTC1 Type IIl ICW 10X12

Multi-Curve, Black

Safariland or
Collin County
approved

equal PTA-1345363 12

each

LVL 7000 10 X 12 SPECIAL THREAT
PLATEBP2928

POINT BLANK PLT463MHEA 12

each

10x12 LEVEL I11/IV ICW BLACK

PARACETE  PLT220TCSK 12

each

XPRT Tactical Pant, Green

XPRT Rapid Shirt, Green

XPRT Waterproof Jacket, Black

XPRT Waterproof Pant, Black

Quest 4D GTX Forces Boots, Black

P7 Integrated Helmet System

Mil Spec Antidote 1.5L Reservoir

Clarus Systems Headset Kit

Motorola APX Cable Adaptor

Dual Comm:s Splitter

Micro Wireless PTT

Line Items #: 1, 9, 12, 33 will not be awarded.

5.11 or Collin
County
approved
equal 74068 12
5.11 or Collin
County
approved
equal 72090 12
5.11 or Collin
County
approved
equal 48332 12
5.11 or Collin

County

approved

equal 48333 12

Salomon or
Collin County
approved
equal

373478

ARRADVARK
or Collin
County
approved
equal

ATHQP7IHS-
LT-XX-00 12

CamelBak or

Collin County

approved

equal 12

Silynx or
Collin County
approved
equal CLAR-T-N-002 4
Silynx or
Collin County
approved
equal CA0117-03 4
Silynx or
Collin County
approved
equal CA0175-01 4
Silynx or
Collin County
approved
equal

MWPTT-K-
004-01 4

each

each

each

each

each

each

each

each

each

each

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Response

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 1,095.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$

13,140.00

No Bid

$ 12833

$  108.59

$  301.09

$  246.79

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 1,539.96

$ 1,303.08

$ 3,613.08

$ 2,961.48

$ 23695 S 2,843.40

$ 12838 S 1,540.56

$ 10863 S

1,303.56

$ 30119 S

3,614.28

$ 24688 S

2,962.56

2,145.00

No Bid

345.60

$ 2880 $

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 6,420.00

$  535.00

$ 13800 $ 1,656.00

$ 12200 $

1,464.00

$ 33000 $

3,960.00

$ 28000 $ 3,360.00

1,020.00

No Bid
No Bid
$ 89500 S 3,580.00
$ 156.00 S 624.00
$ 22500 S 900.00
$ 25000 S 1,000.00
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2020-186 Safety Wear

Sunset Survival & First

Mavich llc

Nardis Public Safety

AARDVARK

Municipal Emergency

GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC

GALLS, LLC

Aid, Inc. Services, Inc
Total Price [ $  863.76 | Total Price | $ 6,150.00 | Total Price | $  9,068.00 | Total Price | $  13,140.00 | Total Price [ $  73,868.70 | Total Price [ $ 175,415.08 | Total Price | $ 211,265.00
[Line # Mfgr Mfgno QY __uom unit_ | ded Unit unit | ded unit | ded unit | ded unit | ded unit | ded
Silynx or
40 Collin County

Clarus XPR

Antenna Relocation Kit x 2 for Dual Comms
TCIM.AS.T.

Ballistic Shield Phalanx Level IlIA+

47

CTCF50Riot Agent Filter 4 Pack

approved CXPRQH-D-
equal 002

Safariland or
Collin County
approved
equal

Point Blank
Enterprises
or Collin
County
approved
equal

Avon
Protection
Systems or
Collin County
approved
equal 3 10

AVON-72606-

Safariland or

49 Collin County
approved
Ballistic Panel SX Level IlIA, A7 equal 50 each
49 ALTL BALLITICS
POINT BLANK AX3A BALLISTICS ONLY POINT BLANK AX3A 50 each
49 ALT1 GALLS G-FORCE LVL IlIA VEST WITH 1
CARRIERS BP1142 POINT BLANK 50 each

Line Items #: 1, 9, 12, 33 will not be awarded.

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 3689.00 $ 3,689.00

No Bid

No Bid
$  709.50

DOES NOT MEET SPECS

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 65000 $ 5,200.00

$ 839 $  1,343.36 | NoBid

$ 4,161.22

$ 15153 $

$  112.80

No Bid

1,515.30 | $

$ 86842 S

4,161.22 | No Bid

175.00 $

43,421.00

1,750.00 | $

$ 430000 $  4,300.00

160.00 $ 1,600.00

$  37,000.00

S 740.00

DOES NOT MEET SPECS
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2020-186 Safety Wear

Sunset Survival & First
Aid, Inc.

Mavich llc

Nardis Public Safety

AARDVARK

Municipal Emergency
Services, Inc

GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC

GALLS, LLC

Total Price [ $  863.76

Total Price [ $ 6,150.00

Total Price | $  9,068.00

Total Price | $  13,140.00

Total Price | $  73,868.70

Total Price [ $ 175,415.08

Total Price | $  211,265.00

Line #  Description

Safariland or

51 Collin County
approved
2.0 Soft Trauma Plate 5 x 8 equal 50 each
SOFT

51ALT1 TRAUMA

SOFT TRAUMA PLATE POINT BLANK PLATE 50 each
51ALT1

GALLS SOFT TRAUMA PAK- 5X8BP183 POINT BLANK TTIGEN580R 50

Safariland or

53 Collin County
approved
PROTECH 2.0 Oregon City Carrier equal DN6566 50 each
£ GUARDIAN
53 ALTL:
{POINT BLANK GUARDIAN 1.5 POINT BLANK 1.5 50 each

Estimated

Extended

No Bid

No Bid

Extended

Extended

Extended

$ 15995

$ 7,997.50

$

280.00 $  14,000.00

Line Items #: 1, 9, 12, 33 will not be awarded.
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