
IFB 2018-251 JANITORIAL SUPPLIES: FY21 REQUESTED PRICE INCREASES ITEMS ADDED

Current Vendor:
Line # Description Old Price New Price % Incr. UoM Notes Price UoM Price UoM Price UoM Price UoM

27 CLEANING ACCESSORIES - Trigger 
Sprayer to fit Quart Bottle 0.40$     0.43$       7% ea 1.38$         ea.

47 PAPER/PERSONAL - Absorbant Multi 
Fold Paper Towels- to dispense one 
towel per pull or be used without a 
dispenser - Tork MB 578 or Collin 
County approved equal

18.95$   20.49$     8% cs
2160/ cs - 
$0.0094 ea.

Alt: Paper Towel Sheets WC4501W 
(white)

19.99$       

4000/cs - 
$0.0049 
ea.

8%

Current Vendor:

Line # Description Old Price New Price % Incr. UoM Notes Price UoM Price UoM Price UoM Price UoM
9 CHEMICALS - Stainless Steel Cleaner- 

water-based, nonabrasive -Misty AMR 
1001557 or Collin County approved 
equal 29.98$   32.38$     8% Case

12/cs - 
$2.70 ea. $45.99/cs

12/cs - 
$3.83ea

13 CHEMICALS - Aerosol Germicidal 
Spray/Disinfectant- Shall be effective in 
killing strep, staph, T.B., HIV-I hepatitus, 
pseudonacidal, fungicidal, herpes 
simplex, influenza A2 and vaccininia and 
preventing the growth of mold and 
mildew on hard surfaces for up to 14 
days. Shall have light or neutral odor. - 
ABC Compounding ABC 457120FA

26.98$   29.14$     8% Case
12/cs - 
$2.43 ea. $43.24/cs

12/cs - 
$3.60ea

No Bid

No Bid

Pollock

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Eagle Empire Matera

Empire Paper

Pyramid School Products

InfinityFastenalMateraEagle

No bid

No bid

Avg. Increase:

Quotes for Comparison

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Quotes for Comparison

No Bid

No Bid



IFB 2018-251 JANITORIAL SUPPLIES: FY21 REQUESTED PRICE INCREASES ITEMS ADDED

20 CHEMICALS - Urinal Screens - Mango
9.98$     10.78$     8% Case

12/cs - 
$0.898 ea. $21.19/cs

12/cs - 
$1.77ea

26 CLEANING ACCESSORIES - All Purpose 
Bowl Brush- all plastic, no metal, 
polypropylene fill, approximately 14"

0.89$     0.96$       8% Each $2.40/ea
28 CLEANING ACCESSORIES - Plastic Bottle, 

quart size, clear 0.42$     0.45$       8% Each
Min. Order 
100 $0.73/ea

29 FLOOR TOOLS - 20" White Floor Buffer 
Pads 10.79$   11.65$     8% Case

5/cs - $2.33 
ea. $14.93/cs

5/cs - 
$2.99ea

30 FLOOR TOOLS - 20" Red Floor Buffer 
Pads 10.79$   11.65$     8% Case

5/cs - $2.33 
ea. $14.93/cs

5/cs - 
$2.99ea

31 FLOOR TOOLS - 20" Black Floor Buffer 
Pads 10.79$   11.65$     8% Case

5/cs - $2.33 
ea. $14.93/cs

5/cs - 
$2.99ea

32 FLOOR TOOLS - 27" White Floor Buffer 
Pads 9.98$     10.78$     8% Case 2/cs - $5.39 $76.40/cs

5/cs - 
$15.28

33 FLOOR TOOLS - 24"x5" Dust Mop Head- 
Blue 4 ply synthetic blend 3.89$     4.20$       8% Each $10.50/ea

36 FLOOR TOOLS - 36"x5" Dust Mop Head- 
Blue 4 ply synthetic blend 3.99$     4.31$       8% Each $15.00/ea

37 FLOOR TOOLS - 36" Dust Mop Frame
2.79$     3.01$       8% Each $4.05/ea

38 FLOOR TOOLS - Dust Mop Handle to fit 
24" and 36" dust mop frames

4.79$     5.17$       8% Each $6.99/ea
39 FLOOR TOOLS - 7/8" Screw Clamp Mop 

Handles 3.39$     3.66$       8% Each $5.50/ea
40 FLOOR TOOLS - 24oz. Looped end Blue 

Mop Head 3.37$     3.64$       8% Each $61.21/cs
12/cs - 
$5.10ea

41 FLOOR TOOLS - 32oz. Looped end Blue 
Mop Head 4.19$     4.53$       8% Each $74.98/cs

12/cs - 
$6.25ea

42 FLOOR TOOLS - Broom Angle Cut, 42" 
Handle, No Wire, No Straw 3.29$     3.55$       8% Each $4.00/ea

43 FLOOR TOOLS - Dust Pan- rubber only, 
no metal or plastic 1.69$     1.84$       8% Each $2.40/ea

53 PAPER/PERSONAL - Waxed Paper Bags 
For Sanitary Napkins 12.98$   14.02$     8% Case

500/cs - 
$0.028 ea. $20.35/cs

500/cs - 
$0.040ea

8%

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Avg. Increase:

Quotes for Comparison

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No BidNo Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No Bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid



IFB 2018-251 JANITORIAL SUPPLIES: FY21 REQUESTED PRICE INCREASES ITEMS ADDED

Current Vendor:

Line # Description Old Price New Price % Incr. UoM Notes Price UoM Price UoM Price UoM Price UoM
45

PAPER/PERSONAL - Toilet Tissue, 2-ply, 
white 25.38$   28.33$     12% Case

96/case - 
$0.30 rl. 36.75$         

 96rl/cs - 
$0.38rl. 35.65$     

96 rl /cs - 
$0.37 rl. 48.53$     

 96rl/cs - 
$0.51rl. 

12%

Current Vendor:

Line # Description Old Price New Price % Incr. UoM Notes Price UoM Price UoM Price UoM Price UoM
46

PAPER/PERSONAL - Toilet Tissue, 2-ply, 
white, jumbo roll- facial quality softness, 
to fit Scott JRT Escort 09551 dispenser 16.73$   19.68$     15% Case

12/case - 
$1.64 rl. 24.18$       

12/case - 
$2.02 rl.

15%

Line # Description Price UoM Price UoM Price UoM Price UoM
61

Case $31.40/cs
240oz/cs - 
$0.13oz

Alt. 1 Pro. Lysol Disinfectant Foam Cleaner $6.16ea
24oz/cn - 
$0.26oz

Alt. 2 SPA321003 Foaming Disinfectant $24.99/cs
384oz/cs - 
$0.07oz

Alt. 3 JW4531 Envy Foaming Dis. $46.62/cs
228oz/cs - 
$0.20oz

62
Each $14.10 each $18.86 each

Alt. 1 20" Handle, straight squeegee $3.41 each
63

Each $10.67 each $7.52 each

Choice P. 18/047TJ-03

No bid No bid

Avg. Increase:

Avg. Increase:

No bid

MateraBuckeyeM.A.N.S Distributors

Infinity Supply

Eagle Empire

PollockEmpireEagle

No bid

Quotes for Comparison

Matera

CHEMICALS - #455920FA Foaming Disinfectant or Collin County Approved 
Equal

CLEANING ACCESSORIES - 12” Plastic, threaded hdle, straight Squeegee 
(does not contain metal)  

CLEANING ACCESSORIES - 24” Plastic, threaded hdle, straight Squeegee 
(does not contain metal) No bid

No bid

New Items added to Contract:

Fastenal MateraEagle Empire

Does not meet spec.

Quotes for Comparison



IFB 2018-251 JANITORIAL SUPPLIES: FY21 REQUESTED PRICE INCREASES ITEMS ADDED

Alt. 1 16" handle, straight squeegee $2.98 each
64

Box $28.85/bx
36/bx - 
$0.801ea. $29.52/bx

36/bx - 
$0.82ea.

*** 04/24/20 DRAFT UNTIL AWARD DETERMINATION IS FINAL ***

CHEMICALS - Soft, Mild Abrasive Cleaning Pad- shall be able to remove 
tough grime and everyday stains from walls and floors. No bidNo bid


