. N Dahill Office Technology
et Can-Am Wireless LLC Howard Technology Solutions N " Industri
Adorama Inc. Zones, Inc. Troxell Communications, Inc. M&A Technology b Con A 1T Sotutions 3-CTechnology, LLC o Howars mimates | Corporation dba Yer Office Depot, Inc. s, 8y Inc | NEW dustries, Inc{ SHI
Total Price| __$69,411.50| Total Price| __ $71,870.00| Total Price| __ $75.290.00| Total Price| __$88.006.40| Total Price| _$135.185.45 Total Price| _$155,813.50 [ $319.848.00 $721,068.65| Total Price| _ $762,285.26| _ Total Price | 770,176.36]_Total Price | 846,746 rice | $848,051.94 | Total Price| $880,555.40| Total Price| _ $942,152.7"
Line# _ Description Mfer Mfeno Qry__uom Unit | Extended Unit | Extended Unit__ | Extended Unit | Extended Unit | Extended Unit | Extended | Extended Extended Unit__ | Extended Unit | Extended unit | Extended Unit | Extended Unit | Extended Unit | Extended
1 DesktopPC 150 each NoBid NoBid NoBid 0 Bid NoBid NoBid $150,600.00] $12680250|  $86660  $129,99000|  $92088  $13813200| $1.145.00 $171,750.00| $972.46 $145869.00| $989.90 $148.485.00| $117633  $176,449.50)
1.1 Optilex 3070 Micro Form Factor XCTO 1 each No Bid $791.83 $850.88 $1.065.00 $901.97 $989.90 $1.059.90
12 Micro AIO Stand MFS CUS KIT Dell 4s28caC 1 each Noid $74.77 $70.00 $80.00 $70.49 Noid 11643
2 Laotoo 200 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $388.606.00| $2.153.74  $430.748.00| $1.88750  $377.500.00| $2.169.00 $433.800.00 i $455.238.00| $2.424.30 $484.860.00| $2.73855  $547.710.00
3 Tablet 1 each NoBid No gid NoBid No8id NoBid Noid $2378.00| $200272| $224313  $220313| $2.0207 $212974  $2674.00 $2,674.00 | st $2147.93) $2013.40  $201340| $246135  $246135
3.1 DellLatitude 7200 2-in-1 Business Laptoo 1 each No Bid $2.267.00 $213097 $2.024.74 $2.584.00 »«»«»«»« $2.013.40 $2.461.35
32 Dell SB0AGYI 1 each No8id $111.00 $11216 $105.00 590,00 $105.74 No8id No8id
4 2 eah No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.05338| $3145.89  $629178| $3.41261 $6.825.22| $4.045.00 $8.090.00 | s $6.070.46 | No Bid Bid
5 10 each No Bid No8id Noid $3.12100  $3121000 $2840530| $314580  $3145890| $296661  $29.666.10| $3.409.00 $34,090.00 | i $30,734.10( $2.971.00  $29.71000| $332732  $33.273.20
6 Lanton 5 eah No Bid No Bid No Bid $12649.00| $3.586.80  $17.934.00| $3.20563  $16.028.15| $3.900.00 $19.500.00| sk $17.120.00| $2.905.20  $14526.00| $a574.85  $22.87.25
6.1 DellLatitude 5420 Rugged, CTO Del 200AQPT 1 each Noid NoBid $2,640.74 $2426.72 3,065.00 sy $2.905.20 $3611.29
6.2 Dock - Vehicle Dock for Dell atitude 5420 _Dell DSDEU-412:1 each No Bid No Bid $946.06 $778.91 $835.00 $735.29 No Bid $963.56
7 Active Pen PNSS7W Dell T50AATY 210 each No8id No8id $4817  $10,115.70 $5694  $11.957.40 $4900  $10,290.00 $47.24 $9.92040 $43.97  $923370 54563 $958230|  $53.25 $1118250| $4582  $9.62220| $4980  $1045800  $5189  $10,896.90
WD19 with 130W Adapter Del 210.ARI0 each Nosid Nosid $102.89 542.435.80| _$217.50 _$47.85000] _$196.00 64312000 _$18169 _$39.971.80] _$177.05 _ $3895100] __$177.53 ___$39.056.60| _$216.00 $47.520.00| $181.88 $40.013.60 $197.70 _$43.494.00 20324 __$44.712.80
104 port USB 3.0 Hub with Individual Power Sv_abrent each No Bid o Bid $1395  $2790.00 $1565  $3.130.00 $7.19  $1438.00|NoBid No Bid $1263  $252600 $1805  $3.61000 1932 $3864.00)  $1175 $235000| $24.07 $4.81400) $35.60  $7.12000(  $2319  $4.638.00
10 ALT1 [ 4-port StarTech.com 4-Port USB 3.0 Hub -4 StarTech each (0 Respo.
11 6xSiim Portable USB 3.0 BD/DVD/CD Burne Pioneer each NoBid No Bid NoBid No Bid NoBid No Bid NoBid $10835  $6501.00|NoBid 54265 s2.559.00(  $145.00 $8.700.00| $15223  $9.133.80|NoBid NoBid
11 AUTA Dell USB Slim DVDRW Drive Dell each $4265
11 ALT1 | DW316 SLIM DVDR DR USB Dell each $47.92
11 ALT1 Pioneer 6X 5P USB3 BD/DVD/CD Burner SL; 1 Pioneer. each $97.82  $5.869.20
11AUT +Ray Drive. Portable Blu-Ray Buffalo each s11350
11 ALT U2-BDRW-SL Kanguru QS Slim BD-RE Blu-ray Kanguru each $134.03
11 ALTI 6x Sim Portable USB 3.0 BD/DVD/CD Burne Pioneer. each 5137.09
1 Al" BUFFALO BRXL-16U3 - Disk drive - BDXL - 16 BUFFALO each NoRespo
6'Disolav Port to Disolay Port Cable each NoBid $765  $4.590.00|NoBid $1005  $6.030.00 $767 5460200 $1103  $6.618.00|NoBid $1102  $661200 $682  $4.09200 $9.23 $5.538.00 $7.00 $420000| $14.61 $876600| $1410  $8.460.00  $1077  $6.462.00
s 6FT DISPLAY PORT TO DISPLAY PORT CABLE! Mmmz ATLA CG54401 600 _each $1275
13 HOMI to VGA Adanter enfel FBA 000113t 175 _each NoBid No Bid NoBid No Bid $819  $1.433.25|NoBid NoBid $2333 408275 §1773 $310275 $2843 $497525|  $12.00 5210000| $2149 $376075| $37.40  $654500| 2174 $3.804.50
13 ALTA [ Tripp Lite 6in HDMI to VGA Adapter Convert rmm PI3LOGN 175 each $0.00
13 ALTL| HDMI to VGA with Audio Converter Cable A« Trioo-Lite P 175 _each s17.25
13 ALTL| HOMI MALE TO VGA FEMALE ADAPTER CON MIDDLEATLA CGA1350 175 _each $24.50
13 ALT | STARTECH.COM : Convert an HOMI video'ss StarTech _HD2VGAA2 175 _each 52636
13 AUT1 Dell Adapter HOMI-VGA Dell 70-AB2X 175 _each $28.43
14 Urban Backoack 15 el 460BBYL 200 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $3080  $6.960.00 $30.87 697400 $4127 825000 $30.00  $6.80000 $3270 654000 $3186  $637200 $32.00 $6.40000|  $34.00 $680000| $3172 $6344.00| $3450  $6.900.00|  $3387  $6.774.00
15 pto Case Targus TBROO3US 1 eh $53.65 $536.50 No Bid NoBid $64.50 $645.00 $6225 $622.50] $77.51 $77510 $63.00 $630.00] $60.63 $606.30 $63.62 $636.20] 6150 $615.00|  $69.00 $690.00| $6019  $60190|  $76.60 s766.00|  S6167 $616.70]
16 Crad\ePomr 5 eah No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $205006  $1025030| $1639.16  $8.19580|  $1681.00 $8.405.00| $1840.00 $9.200.00 | No Bid $185391  $9.269.55
161 Intearated Category 18 Modem and Firstiel CradlePoint  MAS-090012(1  each NoBid Noid NoBid NoBid NoBid $1306.76 $1.430.19 $1.104.74 $1245.00 No8id No8id $1330.94.
162 5n-1 Shark Fin Antenna CradlePoint  CP-1002-1PA 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $330.93 520897 $226.26 $245.00 No Bid No Bid $222.97
163 installation 1 each No gid NoBid NoBid NoBid $412.37 $0.00 $350.00 $350.00 No8id No8id $300.00
Cooverative Contract Name TIPS TIPS BuyBoard BuyBoard TIPS TIPS BuyBoard HCDE/Cholce Partners OMNIA Partners DR TIPS DR DR TIPS
Cooperative Contract Number 171001 200105 579-19 57919 200105 171001 79- 17/026KH-10 #9128 See below 200105 DIR-TS03763 DIRTSO-3763 200105

Nonresponsive: Magnatesoft LLC

Line 9 not recommended for award due to changes in IT Standards
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