
DRAFT AS OF 6/15/2020

Total Price $5,600.00 Total Price $4,975.00 Total Price Total Price $3,150.00 Total Price $208.00 Total Price Total Price $303,024.92 Total Price $10,070.00 Total Price $7,860.00 Total Price
Line # Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1 Dell Latitude 3500 CTO DELL 210-ARRH 228 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,150.00 No Bid $1,244.17 $283,670.76 $1,289.00 $293,892.00 $1,346.06 $306,901.68 $1,435.00 $327,180.00

Notes:
2 Rolling Lap Top Bag Targus TBR003US 100 each $56.00 $5,600.00 $57.50 $5,750.00 $62.61 $6,261.00 $62.62 $6,262.00 $60.01 $6,001.00 $66.00 $6,600.00 $61.50 $6,150.00 $63.80 $6,380.00 $59.99 $5,999.00 $65.99 $6,599.00
3 USB 3.0 SuperSpeed 7-port USB Hub J5 or approved equal JUH377 100 each $33.99 $3,399.00 No Bid $48.62 $4,862.00 $31.50 $3,150.00 No Bid $37.00 $3,700.00 No Bid $39.00 $3,900.00 $49.99 $4,999.00

3 ALT1 7PORT USB 3.0 SUPERSPEED HUB PERP SPLITT    Tripplite U360-007-AL 100 each $35.98
3 ALT1 7-Port USB 3.0 SuperSpeed Hub/Splitter Porta    Tripp Lite U360-007-AL 100 each $37.22
3ALT1 Startech ST73007UA 100 each $44.39

4 USB Scan Gun Zebra Symbol DS4308 100 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $339.00 $33,900.00 No Bid $148.00 $14,800.00 $242.00 $24,200.00
4 ALT1 Zebra Symobol LS2208 Zebra LS2208-7AZU0100ZNA 100 each $100.70 $10,070.00
4 ALT1 Zebra DS4608-SR Area Scanner, Scanner only    Zebra DS4608-SR00007ZZWW 100 each $205.25 20,525.00$        
4 ALT1 ZEBRA EVM, DS4308-SR, USB KIT (USB Kit, 2D        Zebra DS4308-SR7U2100AZW 100 each $219.30 21,930.00$        $219.25
4 ALT1 Same definition as Motorola Sc Gun Zebra DS4308-SR7U2100AZ 100 each
4 ALT1 CLOVER 2D HAND HELD BARCODE SCANNER Clover VS-CLVR-AC6 100 each $272.97

5 6Ft Hi-Speed USB 2.0 to USB B Cable Coiled -    Tripp Lite U022-006-COIL 100 each No Bid $2.15 $215.00 $2.50 $250.00 $2.50 $250.00 $2.08 $208.00 $3.00 $300.00 $2.15 $215.00 $2.20 $220.00 $2.90 $290.00 $2.35 $235.00
6 USB Optical Mouse DELL 275-BBCB 100 each No Bid No Bid $17.35 $1,735.00 No Bid No Bid $18.00 $1,800.00 $15.00 $1,500.00 $18.00 $1,800.00 $15.63 $1,563.00 $17.25 $1,725.00

6 ALT1 Logitech B200 corded mouse Logitech 910-001439 100 each $6.25 625.00$              
7 QL-800 Label Printer Brother QL-800 100 each $85.99 $8,599.00 $86.25 $8,625.00 $91.82 $9,182.00 $94.00 $9,400.00 $92.14 $9,214.00 $94.00 $9,400.00 $87.75 $8,775.00 $89.40 $8,940.00 $78.60 $7,860.00 $94.25 $9,425.00
8 USB Magnetic Card Reader MagTek 21073062 100 each No Bid $43.50 $4,350.00 No Bid $43.80 $4,380.00 $43.87 $4,387.00 $44.00 $4,400.00 $49.33 $4,933.00 $44.80 $4,480.00 $89.90 $8,990.00 $47.80 $4,780.00

8 ALT1 PROMO HP USB MINI SBY MSR W/ BRACKETS HP FK186AT 100 each $69.10
9 Dell Optiplex 7071 MT XCTO SI# B50D04 Opti   DELL 210-ATZN 8 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,419.27 $19,354.16 $2,660.00 $21,280.00 $2,597.47 $20,779.76 $2,999.00 $23,992.00

contract expires 9/30/2021 contract expires 5/31/2023 contract expires 5/31/2023 contract expires 11/30/2021 contract expires 5/31/2023 contract expiration 12/31/2021 contract expires 1/10/2022 contract expires 1/10/2022 contract expires 6/18/2021 contract expires 5/31/2023
Non-Responsive: contract expire 1/03/2021
DEVICELAND (Advanced Micro Systems, Inc.) - Not on a cooperative contract. contract expires 8/22/2021

TIPS, BUYBOARD

TIPS 200105

https://www.tips-
usa.com/buzpartners/acco

unt0.cfm

DIR-TSO-3763

DIR-TSO-3763 Subcontract # 
C000000181141

N/A

HCDE/Choice Partners

17-026KH

https://www.choicepartners.or
g/vendors/dahill-6

NEWCOM Wireless 
Services LLC

OMNIA Partners (National 
IPA/U.S. Communities)

Contract Number R160901

https://www.bhphotovideo.com
/find/shared/b2bHub/home.jsp

TIPS

TIPS TECHNOLOGY 200105 
CONTRACT

https://www.tips-
usa.com/vendorProfile.cfm?Rec
ordID=7A5FE17D9E05A0A4DF8

55B6CCFAE0453

Tips.Taps

200105

N/A

TIPS/TAPS

180902

https://tips-usa.com/

TIPS
TIPS CONTRACT: 200105 

Technology Solutions Products 
and Services

https://www.tips-usa.com/

SHI Government Solutions Xerox Business Solutions 
Southwest (Dahill Office 

B & H Foto & Electronics Corp Zones, Inc. Next Step Innovation ADORAMA INC. Can-Am Wireless LLC dba Can-
Am IT Solutions

non-responsive

per email from vendor they did 
not quoted accurately

Cooperative contract Expiration

Howard Technology Solutions 
(Howard Industries Inc.)

GTS Technology Solutions Inc

State the cooperative contract name this quote is offered under. (i.e. TX DIR, TXMAS, OMNIA Partners, 
Buyboard, TIPS/TAPS, HGAC, HCDE, etc.) If none, answer N/A.

State the cooperative contract number this quote is offered under. If none, answer N/A.

Please provide the website URL for the cooperative contract this quote is offered under. If none, answer 
N/A.

To meet the required specs in 
Exhibit A, the Dell Latitude 3510 
had to be quoted due to parts 

constraints and availability.

BuyBoard

579-19

www.buyboard.com

DIR

DIR-TSO-3763, DIR-TSO-3866, 
DIR-CPO-4410

https://dir.texas.gov/

https://www.bhphotovideo.com/find/shared/b2bHub/home.jsp
https://www.bhphotovideo.com/find/shared/b2bHub/home.jsp
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