
2020-242
DRAFT ONLY UNTIL AWARD 

IFB 2020-242 Aggregate for Surface Treatment & Stone Rip Rap

PRIMARY AWARD
SECONDARY AWARD

Total Price $32,710.25 Total Price $34,130.00 Total Price $77,331.47 Total Price $88,604.63 Total Price $599,717.00 Total Price $1,317,135.00
Line Description QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1
State cost of Type B, Grade 3, Aggregate per ton 
delivered to the McKinney Stockpile 16000 ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $41.25 $660,000.00

1 Delivered to Farmersville 1 ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $44.75
1 Delivered to Anna 1 ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $42.25
1 Delivered to Copeville 1 ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $44.50

2
State cost of Type B, Grade 4, Aggregate per ton 
delivered to the McKinney Stockpile 13000 ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $46.13 $599,690.00 $42.25 $549,250.00

2 Delivered to Farmersville 1 ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 48.13$       $45.75
2 Delivered to Anna 1 ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 48.13$       $43.25
2 Delivered to Copeville 1 ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 46.87$       $45.50

3
State cost of Type B, Grade 5, Aggregate per ton 
delivered to the McKinney Stockpile 1000 ton No Bid No Bid $39.31 $39,310.00 $45.27 $45,270.00 No Bid $47.25 $47,250.00

3 Delivered to Farmersville 1 ton No Bid No Bid 41.59$         47.71$        No Bid $50.75
3 Delivered to Anna 1 ton No Bid No Bid 39.31$         45.27$        No Bid $48.25
3 Delivered to Copeville 1 ton No Bid No Bid 42.23$         48.40$        No Bid $50.50

4
Type B, Grade 3 Aggregate ---- State cost for Collin 
County to PICK UP at your plant site by Collin County 1 ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.00 198.48$     $21.00

5
Type B, Grade 4, Aggregate ---- State cost for Collin 
County to PICK UP at your plant site by Collin County 1 ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $27.00 149.96$     $27.00 $22.00 199.48$     $22.00

6
Type B, Grade 5 Aggregate --- State cost for Collin County 
to PICK UP at your plant site by Collin County trucks 1 ton No Bid No Bid $25.00 110.84$     $25.00 No Bid No Bid $27.00 204.48$     $27.00

7
State Cost per Ton for Delivery of Stone Rip Rap: Rip Rap 
3" x 7" to McKinney Stockpile 1 ton $27.75 $27.75 $40.00 $40.00 $27.47 $27.47 $31.53 $31.53 No Bid $45.00 $45.00

8
State Cost per Ton for Delivery of Stone Rip Rap: Rip Rap 
8" x 12" to McKinney Stockpile 600 ton $28.30 $16,980.00 $32.00 $19,200.00 $34.90 $20,940.00 $39.48 $23,688.00 No Bid $55.00 $33,000.00

9
State Cost per Ton for Delivery of Stone Rip Rap: Rip Rap 
12" x 18" to McKinney Stockpile 400 ton $34.75 $13,900.00 $33.00 $13,200.00 $37.70 $15,080.00 $43.55 $17,420.00 No Bid $60.00 $24,000.00

10
State cost Per Ton for Delivery of Stone Rip Rap: Rip Rap 
18" x 24" to McKinney Stockpile 50 ton $35.75 $1,787.50 $33.00 $1,650.00 $38.70 $1,935.00 $43.55 $2,177.50 No Bid $70.00 $3,500.00

11

             
County to PICK UP at your plant site by Collin County 
trucks. 1 ton $15.00 $96.78 $15.00 $40.00 $46.96 $40.00 $14.00 $99.84 $14.00 $17.60 $103.44 $17.60 No Bid $20.00 $197.48 $20.00

12

        
aggregate road material items offered that are not listed 
in this bid. 1 10.0% 0.0% 0.0%

Plant Location Address for Pick-Up (IRS tax rate .58 
cents)

Delivery time: 5 days 1-2 days 1 day 3 days 5 days 5 days
Minimum: 25 tons 10 tons 23 tons 25 tons 22 tons
Bid Notes:

Rip Rap

Additional %

Type B, Grade 3, 4, 5

Nobles Materials LLCP&K Stone LLC Stapleton Truck Lines LLC Martin Marietta Materials Green Dream International Vulcan Materials
Price with 
Mileage

Price with 
Mileage

Price with 
Mileage

Price with 
Mileage

Price with 
Mileage

Price with 
Mileage

Fuel Surcharge: Rates based on fuel prices 
up to $3.00 per gallon. 1% increase for 
every $.10 increase in fuel prices.

If ordering less than 10 tons, no delivery 
option. Must pick up product.

line 1-2 - 23 tons, line 7-9 200 tons, line 
10 50 tons

6030 FM 1810, Chico 76431 Approx 
141 miles roundtrip for $81.78 IRS tax 
rate 

2974 E. University, McKinney 75069 
Approx 12 miles roundtrip for $6.96 
IRS tax rate

856 FM 2952, Chico 76431 Approx 148 
miles roundtrip for $85.84 IRS tax rate

856 FM 2952, Chico 76431 Approx 148 
miles roundtrip for $85.84 IRS tax rate

1111 Gilbert Pit Rd, Millsap 76066 
Approx 212 miles roundtrip for 
$122.96 IRS tax rate

478 Hwy 2214, Eastland 76448 Approx 
306 miles roundtrip for $177.48 IRS tax 
rate


	Lines

