1§85 2020368 Suppl

Interboro Packaging Corp-
Total Prce] $

Infinity Supply & Service, inc
Total

‘Edward Don & Company.

55,564.15]
Extended | pr

[
I Total Pricel §__64,549.13]
it Extend

rub Pad green.
approved equal.

Griddle Pad 4 n.x5.5 n. or Collin County approved
4 equal.

Hairets or Collin County approved equal.

Toothpicks round or Collin County approved equal.

iddle Cleaner liquid
approved equal.

Snack Plates 6 in.styrofoam white or Collin County
approved equal.

Napkin white 1/4 fold 1
pproved equal

Brand i
Product Number

Quantity per Case/P

No Bid
Brand Bid
Product Number

Quantity per Case/Pkg

51198 5 383360

Brand Bid MPR-70424/305-FH20

027§ 1084 5 59360)
Brand Bid prime Source
Product Number 75004161

Quantityper Case/Pkg 60

NoBid
Brand Bid

Product Number
Quantity per Case/Pkg

s 2878

s 1647 5 527040]

Brand Bid Amercare

Quantityper Case/Pkg__Count: 144/8ox

NoBid

Brand Bid
Product Number

Quantity per Case/Pkg

No

Bi
Brand Bid

Product Number

Quantity per Case/P

No Bid

Brand Bid
Product Number

Quantity per Case/Pkg

No Bid
Brand Bid

Product Number

Quantity per Case/Pkg

RPH144LTBK

Quantityper Case/Phe. 144

No Bid

Brand Bid
Product Number

Quantity per Case/Pkg

No Bid
Brand Bid

Product Number

Quantity per Case/Pkg

o076 8 w61 s 26415
Brand Bid Dart
Product Number 6PWCR

Quantity per Case/Pkg 1000

00095 8 ass s 14275
Brand Bid Morcon

Product Number 1717M5.

Quantity per Case/Pkg 3000

s

s

s

s

0290 § s s 23360
Brand AFFEX
Product Number 6MS20

Quantityper Case/Pkg_ 20CS

10500 § @m 5 600
Brand Bid m
Product Number 19970

Quantity per Case/Pkg_ 60CS

905§ 28900

BOARDWALK
00030

s 25 179

Brand Bid ROVALPAPER
Product Number RPPRE20

Quantity per Case/Pkg_24/800CS

1385 ¢ sam. s 54340
Brand Bid e

Product Number 29603
3:202PACKs
Quantityper Case/Pkg 40 PER CASE

0003 § 034 s 0510)
Brand Bid Dart
Product Number SPWCR

Quantity per Case/Pkg__ 1000

00106 § a238 s 21190
Brand B EMPRESS

Product Number ELDN11717

Quantity per Case/Phg  16/250CS

Non-Responsive

Non-Responsive:

Non-Responsive:

Non-Responsive

Non-Responsive

Non-Responsive

Non-Responsive

s

02§ 16515 66040]
Brand Bid SCRUBBLE
Product Number #57996050

Quantityper Case/Pkg__60

11880 § s s s
Brand Bid SCOTCH BRITE
Product Number 3m736

Quantity per Case/Pkg_ 15

s

Brand Bid ROVALPAPER
Product Number RPH144LTB 24

Quantity per Case/Phe. 144

150 §
ROVALPAPER
Brand Bid GooDs.
Product Number 9024
Quantity per Case/Phkg 800

21000 ¢

130000 § 5200 § s52000)
Brand Bid Noble.

s

s

s

05785 § 157

Brand Bid
Product Number

Quantity per Case/?

11055 § 205

Brand Bid
Product Number

Quantity per Case/Pkg

01749 §

Brand Bid
Product Number

Quantity per Case/Pie

o003 §

Brand Bid
Product Number

Quantity per Case/Pkg

16058 § 6423

Brand Bid

Quantity per Case/Pkg_ 4

0007 § 0715 31065
DART
Brand Bid CONCORDE
Product Number SPWCR

Quantity per Case/Pkg_ 1000

000§ 4500 s 22500
Brand Bid Visions

Product Number 130R0LLKFSBK

Quantity per Case/Pkg 1000

s

s

Quantity per Case/

001§ u1

0.064

75

Brand Bid
Product Number

Quantity per Case/Pkg

7768
Brand Bid

Product Number

Quantityper Case/Pkg

s ae2s0)
e

%
20PADS/PER
case

s 2050

207PERPKG.

s ea3)
e

70040
20PACKETS

s siso)

s 3ssa0)
HOFFMASTER.

HOFFMASTER.

1,200 PER CASE

Non-Responsive:

Non-Responsive

Non-Responsive:

Non-Responsive

Non-Responsive

Non-Responsive:

Non-Responsive:
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1§85 2020368 Suppl

Interboro Packaging Corp- Infinity Supply & Service, inc rcial Refrigerati Wiatand Nuriinc ‘Edward Don & Company.
Total Price] $ Total Total Total Price] § otal

_= Total Price| §__55,564.15[ I Total Price] § _64,549.13]
Unit Exte it Extended | Price Each Unit Unit Extend

eavy,
16 equal. 35 e No s oo § 1622 5 6270 $ 0025 § 245 5 78575 Non-Responsive s 01286 § as0 s 15750 § 0052 § 2215 ss23 Non-Responsive
AMERCARE
Brand Bid Brand Bid Wallace Brand Bid EMPRESS Brand Bid visioN Brand Bid ROYAL
Product Number Product Number 6882 Product Number E181002 Product Number 130HSSWH Product Number P25058
Quantity per Case/Pkg Quantity per Case/Pkg__ 1000 Quantity per Case/Pkg_ 1000/CS Quantity per Case/Pkg_ 35 Quantity per Case/Pkg 1,000 PER CASE

00378 5

Lids ranslucent for 16 0z. bowls above o Colin County

B

approved equal. 15 e NoBid s oos s a7 s 2S5 oous § 21 s 30210 Non-Responsive s o2 s 10795 eiss|s 02917 5 4703 5 220545 Non-Responsive
Brand Bid Brand Bd Wincup. Brand Bid DaRT Brand Bid Choice Brand Bid pACTIV
Product Number Product Number ity Product Number EN Product Number En Product Number Yai800120000
Quantity per Cose/Phg Quantity per Case/Pkg_ 1000 Quantity per Cose/Phg_5/100Cs Quantity per Cose/Pkg_ 48 Quantity per Cose/Phg 504 PER CASE

s ooas g 3128
Forks plastic heavy duty ilver or Callin County approved

20 equal. 2 case NoBid B 00862 § 5170 5 103.40( § 00927 5561 § 11.22| Non-Responsive B 03000 1500 § 3000( § 00958 5749 § 114.98| Non-Responsive
Brand Bid Brand Bid wa Brand Bid wna Brand Bid SLVERVISIONS Brand Bid wna
Product Number Product Number 610155 Product Number 610155 Product Number 130SVERKSO. Product Number 610155
Quantity per Case/P Quantity per Case/Pig 600 Quantity per Case/Pkg_15/40CS Quantity per Case/Pkg_50°K Quantity per Case/Pkg__ 600 PER CASE

Kaifeplasic heavy duty silveror Colin County approved

2 equal. 2 case NoBid B 00862 § 5170 5 10340 $ 00954 5725 § 114.50| Non-Responsive B 03000 1500 § 3000( § 00958 5749 § 114.98| Non-Responsive
Brand Bid Brand Bid wa Brand Bid wna Brand Bid SLVERVISIONS Brand Bid wa
Product Number Product Number 630155 Product Number 630155 Product Number 1305VKNESOC Product Number 630155
Quantity per Case/P Quantity per Case/Pig 600 Quantity per Case/Pkg_ 15/40 CA Quantity per Case/Pkg_50°K Quantity per Case/Pkg__ 600 PER CASE

Hinged Container foam 9in. x9in. x31n. 3-

2 compartment or Collin County approved equal. 1000 case Noid s ooy s 1837 5 1577000 § oosss § 1768 s 1768000 Non-Responsive B 01400 § 2800 5 2800000 § 02085 § 3068 5 3068000 Non-Responsive
Brand id Brand B Dart Brand oaRT Brand bid oaRT Brand Bid pactv
Product Number ProductNumber  SOHTIR ProductNumber  SOHTIR ProductNumber  SOHTPFIR ProductNumber  YHLWOS03
Quantity per Case/P Quantityper Case/Phe 200 Quantity per Case/Pkg2/100CS Quantity per Case/Pig 200 Quantity per Case/Pkg 150 PER CASE

Plastic Wrap 18 n. 2000 f. ol or Collin County

% approved equal. w0 Noid s 103000 § 130 s sn2000 s 150300 § 1505 s o120 Non-Responsive s 1000 1700 s 000 s 185100 § 8515 74040 Non-Responsive
cHoice
Brand B Brand Bd Hivalu Brand B EnpRESS Brand B sarecuT Brand B ANCHORPKG
Product Number Product Number 73000009 Product Number  EFF182 Product Number  16218X25C Product Number 7300118
Quantityper Cose/Phg Quantityper Cose/Phg 11l 18°32000 Quantity per Case/Pkg_ ROLL Quantity per Case/Phs_ EACH Quantity per Cose/Pkg 1,000 PER CASE

s 3108

Roll Towels Enmotion 800 . roll or Colin County

approved equal. 7 case Noid s e2s0 s 65 S 28375 $ 90800 § 5448 5 4,086.00] Non-Responsive s 92000 § 9200 5 690000 § 91583 § 5495 S 412125 Non-Responsive
GeoRaiA G PRO
Brand Bid Brand Bid Morcon Brand Bid PACIFIC Brand Bid ENMOTION Brand Bid EssiTY
Product Number Product Number VT106 Product Number 89460 Product Number 80479 Product Number 200095
Quantity per Case/P Quantity per Case/Pkg 6 Quantity per Case/Pkg 6 ROLLS PER CS. Quantity per Case/Pkg 800 Quantity per Case/Pkg__6 PER CASE
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1F8.2020-368 Supplies: Jail Kitchen Non-Food

i g Empie Paper ic
| | Total Price] $ 4,50050 I Total Price] §__34,741.25| Total Price] §__40,128.76] Total Price| § _43,66.92] I Total Price] § __55,564.15| I Total Price] § _64,549.13] Total Price] §__99,146.96]
(line s Deserption g Wigno GV UOM _Estimated | rice Each Unit | Gnit T etendes rice Each Unit_| Uit |~ Etendea | price ach Umit | Uit [ Extendea Uit Extended | price Each Unit | Gt | Etendea | price ach Umit | Gt [ Extencea Gt [ Etences
50 White plate heavy duty; hard plastc material 1025 n. 3-
compartment divided or Collin County approved equal. 5 case NoBid $ 01423 $ 7116 § 35580 § 01523 § 7614 § 38070 Non-Respansive $ 30000 § 3600 § 18000 § 96908 § 1629 §  s8Las| Non-Respansive
THUNDERGROU
Brand B Brand B Dart Brand B oaRT Brand B » Brand B conuste
Product Number Product Number  10CPWF Product Number  10CPWF Product Number  NS702W Product Number
1268/PER
Quantityper Case/Phs Quantity per Case/Pks 500 Quantity per Case/Phs /1255 Quanityper Case/Pig 12 Quanityper Case/Pi_CASE
41 Colfeafiters 131nx5 norCalln County approved
20 case No Bid $ 00248 $ 1240 S 24800 $ 00349 1745 $ 349.00| Non-Responsive $ 00900 $ 4500 $ '900.00| No Bid Non-Responsive
Brand Bid Brand Bid Bunn Brand Bid BuNN Brand Bid GRINOMASTER Brand Bid
Product Number Product Number 20100 Product Number  TEASYS2 Product Number  1330mrk Product Number
Quantity per Case/Pkg Quantity per Case/Pkg 500 ‘Quantity per Case/Pkg  500/PK. Quantity per Case/Pkg 500 Quantity per Case/Pkg
52 Plte heawy dear plasic; 9in 20/12 t Finelie Setting or
Colln County approved equa. s s Notid NoBid s om $ 0088 S s0a20 NonResponsive s oams a000 5 ooo[s  oes § me s e NonResponsive
Brand B Brand B Brand B envosHI Brand Bd VISIONS WAVE Brand Bd wha
Product Number Product Number Product Number EMIGWPOWHS. Product Number sa7mpoCiss Product Number  CW9180
Quanityper Case/Phg Quanity per Case/Phg Quantity per Case/Phg _12/10¢ Quantity per Case/Phg 180 Quantity per Case/Pkg_ 180 PER CASE

Non-Responsive:
Sysco -Could not bid a set price for the whole contract term
i
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