

Line #	Description	Mfr	Mfno	QTY	UOM	Estimated	Interboro Packaging Corp.		Infinity Supply & Service, Inc		Empire Paper		BI Commercial Refrigeration, Inc.		Max and Nurit Inc		Edward Don & Company		Spico Bisco Food Service of North			
							Price Each Unit	Total Price	Unit	Extended	Price Each Unit	Total Price	Unit	Extended	Price Each Unit	Total Price	Unit	Extended	Price Each Unit	Total Price	Unit	Extended
1	Scouring Pad purple potts and pans abrasive or Collin County approved equal.			50	box		No Bid		No Bid	\$ 0.7921	\$ 39.60		Non-Response	\$ 0.8750	\$ 43.75	3M 2020C	1,750.00	1.0329	\$ 24.79	5	1,239.50	Non-Response
							Brand Bid		Brand Bid							Brand Bid		Brand Bid				
							Product Number		Product Number							Product Number		Product Number				
							Quantity per Case/Pkg		Quantity per Case/Pkg							Quantity per Case/Pkg		Quantity per Case/Pkg				
2	Scrub Pad green general purpose or Collin County approved equal.			40	box		No Bid	\$ 0.2473	\$ 9.89	\$ 0.2920	\$ 11.68		Non-Response	\$ 0.2750	\$ 11.00	3M 2020C	400.00	0.5785	\$ 11.57	5	462.80	Non-Response
							Brand Bid		Brand Bid							Brand Bid		Brand Bid				
							Product Number		Product Number							Product Number		Product Number				
							Quantity per Case/Pkg		Quantity per Case/Pkg							Quantity per Case/Pkg		Quantity per Case/Pkg				
3	Scouring Pad soap steel wool potts and pans abrasive SDS type or Collin County approved equal.			50	box		No Bid	\$ 0.0200	\$ 1.00	\$ 0.2054	\$ 10.27		Non-Response	\$ 0.3044	\$ 15.22	ACS 190LPS	2,000.00	0.8675	\$ 10.41	5	520.50	Non-Response
							Brand Bid		Brand Bid							Brand Bid		Brand Bid				
							Product Number		Product Number							Product Number		Product Number				
							Quantity per Case/Pkg		Quantity per Case/Pkg							Quantity per Case/Pkg		Quantity per Case/Pkg				
4	Griddle Pad 4 in. x 5.5 in. or Collin County approved equal.			10	box		No Bid			\$ 1.0500	\$ 10.50		Non-Response	\$ 1.1880	\$ 11.88	ACS 190LPS	9.00	1.1025	\$ 12.00	5	55.13	Non-Response
							Brand Bid		Brand Bid							Brand Bid		Brand Bid				
							Product Number		Product Number							Product Number		Product Number				
							Quantity per Case/Pkg		Quantity per Case/Pkg							Quantity per Case/Pkg		Quantity per Case/Pkg				
5	Grill Screen 4 in. x 5.5 in. or Collin County approved equal.			20	case		No Bid	\$ 0.1437	\$ 2.87	\$ 1.4463	\$ 28.93		Non-Response	\$ 0.3870	\$ 7.74	3M 20507	20.00	0.2338	\$ 4.68	5	935.20	Non-Response
							Brand Bid		Brand Bid							Brand Bid		Brand Bid				
							Product Number		Product Number							Product Number		Product Number				
							Quantity per Case/Pkg		Quantity per Case/Pkg							Quantity per Case/Pkg		Quantity per Case/Pkg				
6	Helmets or Collin County approved equal.			100	box		No Bid	\$ 0.0882	\$ 8.82	\$ 0.0905	\$ 9.05		Non-Response	\$ 0.0882	\$ 8.82	ROYAL PAPER R9144L78 34	100.00	0.1749	\$ 17.49	5	462.80	Non-Response
							Brand Bid		Brand Bid							Brand Bid		Brand Bid				
							Product Number		Product Number							Product Number		Product Number				
							Quantity per Case/Pkg		Quantity per Case/Pkg							Quantity per Case/Pkg		Quantity per Case/Pkg				
7	Oven Mitt 16 in. cuff (1 pair) or Collin County approved equal.			65	set		No Bid	\$ 4.9300	\$ 320.55				Non-Response	\$ 13.4900	\$ 877.35	ROYAL PAPER R9144L78 34	65.00	8.0000	\$ 520.00	5	1,040.00	Non-Response
							Brand Bid		Brand Bid							Brand Bid		Brand Bid				
							Product Number		Product Number							Product Number		Product Number				
							Quantity per Case/Pkg		Quantity per Case/Pkg							Quantity per Case/Pkg		Quantity per Case/Pkg				
8	Toothpicks round or Collin County approved equal.			1	case		No Bid			\$ 0.0008	\$ 0.08		Non-Response	\$ 0.0019	\$ 0.19	ROYAL PAPER R9144L78 34	1.00	0.0013	\$ 0.13	5	0.65	Non-Response
							Brand Bid		Brand Bid							Brand Bid		Brand Bid				
							Product Number		Product Number							Product Number		Product Number				
							Quantity per Case/Pkg		Quantity per Case/Pkg							Quantity per Case/Pkg		Quantity per Case/Pkg				
9	Oven Cleaner aerosol spray or Collin County approved equal.			20	case		No Bid	\$ 4.0683	\$ 81.37	\$ 3.9708	\$ 79.42		Non-Response	\$ 2.0000	\$ 40.00	NOBLE CHEMICAL 99910KLEEN	20.00	6.1800	\$ 123.60	5	618.00	Non-Response
							Brand Bid		Brand Bid							Brand Bid		Brand Bid				
							Product Number		Product Number							Product Number		Product Number				
							Quantity per Case/Pkg		Quantity per Case/Pkg							Quantity per Case/Pkg		Quantity per Case/Pkg				
9 ALT1	Oven Cleaner aerosol spray 18oz Lead time may take up to 2 weeks	Prime Source	75004150	20	case		No Bid	\$ 2.8417	\$ 56.83				Non-Response			ROYAL PAPER R9144L78 34	20.00					Non-Response
							Brand Bid		Brand Bid							Brand Bid		Brand Bid				
							Product Number		Product Number							Product Number		Product Number				
							Quantity per Case/Pkg		Quantity per Case/Pkg							Quantity per Case/Pkg		Quantity per Case/Pkg				
10	Griddle Cleaner liquid Scotch Brite type or Collin County approved equal.			10	case		No Bid			\$ 1.3585	\$ 13.58		Non-Response	\$ 13.0000	\$ 130.00	ROYAL PAPER R9144L78 34	10.00	1.6058	\$ 16.06	5	80.29	Non-Response
							Brand Bid		Brand Bid							Brand Bid		Brand Bid				
							Product Number		Product Number							Product Number		Product Number				
							Quantity per Case/Pkg		Quantity per Case/Pkg							Quantity per Case/Pkg		Quantity per Case/Pkg				
11	Paper Bags #12 lunch sized or Collin County approved equal.			45	case		No Bid	\$ 0.0315	\$ 1.42	\$ 0.0408	\$ 1.84		Non-Response	\$ 0.0400	\$ 1.80	ROYAL PAPER R9144L78 34	45.00	0.1415	\$ 6.27	5	31.28	Non-Response
							Brand Bid		Brand Bid							Brand Bid		Brand Bid				
							Product Number		Product Number							Product Number		Product Number				
							Quantity per Case/Pkg		Quantity per Case/Pkg							Quantity per Case/Pkg		Quantity per Case/Pkg				
12	Stack Plates 6 in. styrofoam white or Collin County approved equal.			15	case		No Bid	\$ 0.0176	\$ 0.26	\$ 0.0203	\$ 0.30		Non-Response	\$ 0.0207	\$ 0.31	ROYAL PAPER R9144L78 34	15.00	0.0341	\$ 0.51	5	1.71	Non-Response
							Brand Bid		Brand Bid							Brand Bid		Brand Bid				
							Product Number		Product Number							Product Number		Product Number				
							Quantity per Case/Pkg		Quantity per Case/Pkg							Quantity per Case/Pkg		Quantity per Case/Pkg				
13	Dinner Plates white 9 in. divided 3 compartment, Styrofoam or Collin County approved equal.			25	case		No Bid	\$ 0.0229	\$ 0.57	\$ 0.0366	\$ 0.92		Non-Response	\$ 0.0481	\$ 1.20	ROYAL PAPER R9144L78 34	25.00	0.1461	\$ 3.65	5	18.26	Non-Response
							Brand Bid		Brand Bid							Brand Bid		Brand Bid				
							Product Number		Product Number							Product Number		Product Number				
							Quantity per Case/Pkg		Quantity per Case/Pkg							Quantity per Case/Pkg		Quantity per Case/Pkg				
14	Napkin white 1/4 fold 17 in. x 17 in. or Collin County approved equal.			5	case		No Bid	\$ 0.0095	\$ 0.48	\$ 0.0106	\$ 0.53		Non-Response	\$ 0.0450	\$ 2.25	ROYAL PAPER R9144L78 34	5.00	0.0647	\$ 0.32	5	1.62	Non-Response
							Brand Bid		Brand Bid							Brand Bid		Brand Bid				
							Product Number		Product Number							Product Number		Product Number				
							Quantity per Case/Pkg		Quantity per Case/Pkg							Quantity per Case/Pkg		Quantity per Case/Pkg				

Line #	Description	Mfr	Mfno	QTY	UOM	Estimated	Interboro Packaging Corp.			Infinity Supply & Service, Inc			Empire Paper			ISI Commercial Refrigeration, Inc.			Max and Nurit Inc			Edward Don & Company			Swico Bisco Food Service of North					
							Price Each Unit	Total Price	Extended	Price Each Unit	Total Price	Extended	Price Each Unit	Total Price	Extended	Unit	Total Price	Extended	Price Each Unit	Total Price	Extended	Price Each Unit	Total Price	Extended	Price Each Unit	Total Price	Extended	Price Each Unit	Total Price	Extended
								\$			\$		\$		\$		\$			\$			\$			\$			\$	
30	White plate heavy duty, hard plastic material 10.75 in. 3 compartment divided or Collin County approved equal.			5	case																									
							No Bid		\$ 0.1423	\$ 71.16	\$ 355.80	\$ 0.1523	\$ 76.14	\$ 380.70	Non-Responsive	\$ 3.0000	\$ 36.00	\$ 180.00	\$ 9.6908	\$ 116.29	\$ 581.45	Non-Responsive								
							Brand Bid	Brand Bid				Brand Bid	DART					THUNDERGROU				Brand Bid	CORUSLE							
							Product Number	Product Number				Product Number	10CPWF					Product Number	N370ZW			Product Number	330002							
							Quantity per Case/Pkg	Quantity per Case/Pkg			500	Quantity per Case/Pkg	4725 CS					Quantity per Case/Pkg	12			Quantity per Case/Pkg	12 EA/PER CASE							
31	Coffee filters 13 in x 5 in or Collin County approved equal.			20	case				\$ 0.0248	\$ 12.40	\$ 248.00	\$ 0.0349	\$ 17.45	\$ 349.00	Non-Responsive	\$ 0.0900	\$ 45.00	\$ 900.00				No Bid								
							Brand Bid	Brand Bid				Brand Bid	BUNN					Brand Bid	GRINDMASTER			Brand Bid								
							Product Number	Product Number			20100	Product Number	TEA3752					Product Number	1330mk			Product Number								
							Quantity per Case/Pkg	Quantity per Case/Pkg			500	Quantity per Case/Pkg	500/PK					Quantity per Case/Pkg	500			Quantity per Case/Pkg								
32	Plate heavy clear plastic 9 in 20/12 or Finalie Setting or Collin County approved equal.			5	case						\$ 0.8403	\$ 100.84	\$ 504.20	Non-Responsive	\$ 0.3222	\$ 49.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 0.8879	\$ 123.83	\$ 619.15	Non-Responsive									
							Brand Bid	Brand Bid				Brand Bid	EMI YOSHI					Brand Bid	VISIONS WAVE			Brand Bid	WNA							
							Product Number	Product Number				Product Number	EMIGWPNWHS					Product Number	34789CL5S			Product Number	CWR180							
							Quantity per Case/Pkg	Quantity per Case/Pkg				Quantity per Case/Pkg	12/30 CS					Quantity per Case/Pkg	180			Quantity per Case/Pkg	180 PER CASE							

Non-Responsive:
 Syco - Could not bid a set price for the whole contract term
 ISI Commercial Refrigeration, Inc. - Bid did not include shipping pricing