
Total Price $1.58 Total Price $27.25 Total Price $66.97 Total Price $139.48 Total Price $766.58 Total Price $941.78 Total Price $1,122.10
Line # Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1
Section I - Medications and Vaccines - Canine Intranasal Bordatella - or Collin 
County Approved Equal Nobivac - Intra-trac 3 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.27 $2.27 $6.49 $6.49

2 Section I - Medications and Vaccines - Rabies Vaccine BIVI 1-year 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.78 $2.78
2 ALT1 NOBIVAC 1-RabiesFerret claim/indication Zoetis 065441 1 dose $0.97

3 Section I - Medications and Vaccines - Revolution 5-10 lbs Revolution 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $59.13 $59.13
3 ALT1 SENTINEL FLAVOR TABS, 2-10 LBS. Virbac AH, Inc. 339273 1 dose $5.01 Not to Spec

4 Section I - Medications and Vaccines: Revolution 11-20 lbs Revolution 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $60.96 $60.96
4 ALT1 SENTINEL FLAVOR TABS, 11-25 LBS. Virbac AH, Inc. 352038 1 dose $5.24 Not to Spec

5 Section I - Medications and Vaccines: Revolution 21-40 lbs. Revolution 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $64.13 $64.13
5 ALT1 SENTINEL FLAVOR TABS, 26-50 LBS. Virbac AH, Inc. 333731 1 dose $6.26 Not to Spec

6 Section I - Medications and Vaccines: Revolution 41-85 lbs. Revolution 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $64.38 $64.38
6 ALT1 SENTINEL FLAVOR TABS, 51-100 LBS. Virbac AH, Inc. 327553 1 dose $7.57 Not to Spec

7 Section I - Medications and Vaccines: Revolution 86-130 lbs. Revolution 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $82.21 $82.21

8
Section I - Medications and Vaccines: Equi-Phar Pro Tal, Anthelminic Suspension 
(Pyrantel Pamoate) Vedco 1 ounce No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.58 $0.58

9 Section I - Medications and Vaccines: Paste Wormer 1 ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.36 $0.36
10 Section I - Medications and Vaccines: Canine DeWormer 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.52 $8.52 $27.33 $27.33
11 Section I - Medications and Vaccines: Feline Tab 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 Section I - Medications and Vaccines: Virbantel- Canine 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.66 $2.66
13 Section I - Medications and Vaccines: Virbantel - Canine 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.76 $6.76
14 Section I - Medications and Vaccines: Fatal Plus 1 ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.33 $0.33
15 Section I - Medications and Vaccines: Xylazine - Canine and Feline 1 ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.41 $0.41
16 Section I - Medications and Vaccines: Ketamine Injection 1 ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.62 $0.62
17 Section I - Medications and Vaccines: AcePromazine Injectable 1 ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.42 $0.42
18 Section I: Medications and Vaccines: Uniprim Powder for Horses Macleod Uniprim 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.13 $0.13
19 Section I: Medications and Vaccines: Sodium Chloride 0.9% 1 ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.03 $0.03
20 Section I - Medications and Vaccines - Acepromazine Tablets 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.56 $0.56
21 Section I - Medications and Vaccines - Cephalexin Capsules 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.05 $0.05
22 Section I: Medications and Vaccines - Albon Oral Suspension 1 ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.16 $0.16
23 Section I: Medications and Vaccines: Bute Paste - Equine 1 ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.28 $1.28
24 Section I: Medications and Vaccines: Clavamox 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.91 $0.91

24 ALT1 1 DOSE PER DAY VS. CLAVAMOX 2 DOSES A DAYIMPORTANTWHEN COMPARING 
PRICE, 2X AS MUCHDetailer attached for proper dosing by weight Intervet, Inc., dba Merck Animal Health058811 1 dose $2.74

25 Section I: Medications and Vaccines: Clavamox Drops 1 ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.09 $1.09

25 ALT1 1 DOSE PER DAY VS. CLAVAMOX 2 DOSES A DAYIMPORTANTWHEN COMPARING 
PRICE, 2X AS MUCHDetailer attached for proper dosing by weight Intervet, Inc., dba Merck Animal Health055219 1 ml $1.43

26 Section I: Medications and Vaccines: Enisyl-f Oral Paste Feline 1 ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.25 $0.25
27 Section I: Medications and Vaccines: Bactrim 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
28 Section I: Medications and Vaccines: Penicillin Injectable 1 ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.03 $0.03
29 Section I: Medications and Vaccines: Triple Antibiotic Ointment 1 ounce No Bid No Bid $2.12 $2.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.99 $1.99
30 Section I: Medications and Vaccines: Isopropyl Alcohol 1 ounce No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.11 $0.11

30 ALT1 36700-1 - Isopropyl Alcohol 70% 1 gal SLMP, LLC 36700-1 1 ounce $0.125
31 Section I: Medications and Vaccines: Gentamicin Sulfate Solution Genta Ved 100 1 ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.21 $0.21

31 ALT1 GENTOCIN DURAFILM (GENTAMICIN SULFATE AND BETAMETHASONE) Intervet, Inc., dba Merck Animal Health055134 1 ml $2.10 Not to Spec
32 Section I: Medications and Vaccines: Hydrogen Peroxide 1 ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.001 $0.00
33 Section I: Medications and Vaccines: Farnam Swat 1 ounce No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
34 Section I: Medications and Vaccines: Isoflurane 1 ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.10 $0.10
35 Section I: Medications and Vaccines: Ketofen Sterile Solution 1 ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.71 $1.71

36
Section I: Medications and Vaccines: Atipamezole Hydrochoride - Sterile Injectable 
Solution 1 ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.20 $14.20

37 Section I: Medications and Vaccines: Yohimbine 1 ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
38 Section I: Medications and Vaccines: Aurocine Ear Cleanser with Aloe 1 ounce No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

38 ALT1 Ear Cleansing Sol 8oz Vetoquinol 411441 1 ounce $1.02
39 Section I: Medications and Vaccines: Dex SP Injectable Steriod Cefovecin 1 ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.05 $0.05
40 Section I: Medications and Vaccines: Convenia - Canine and Feline Cefovecin 1 ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.44 $32.44
41 Section I: Medications and Vaccines: B-12, Inj. 1 ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.03 $0.03
42 Section I: Medications and Vaccines: Neo Poly Dex Eye Drops 1 ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.15 $1.15
43 Section I: Medications and Vaccines: Chlorex Solution 1 ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.003 $0.00

43 ALT1 BRSPRAY/GAL-Bleach-Rite Disinfectant, 1 gallon- EPA Reg. No. 70590-2 Current Technologies, Inc.BRSPRAY/GAL 1 ml $0.0074
44 Section I: Medications and Vaccines: Polyflex 1 gram No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.52 $1.52

45
Section I: Medications and Vaccines - Feline- Rhinotrachetis-Calici-Panleukopenia-
Chlamydia Psittaci Nobivac - Feline - HCPCh 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.06 $2.06 $5.88 $5.88

46
Section I: Medications and Vaccines - Canine Distemper-Adenovirus Type 2-
Parainfluenza-Parvovirus Nobivac - Canine 1-DAPPv 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.27 $2.27 $6.48 $6.48

47 Section I - Medications and Vaccines: Drontal Plus 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

48
Section I - Medications and Vaccines - Bravecto (Fluralaner)Flea and Tick Protection 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $36.05 $36.05 $36.05 $36.05

49
Section I - Medications and Vaccines - Bravecto (Fluralaner)Flea and Tick Protection 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $36.05 $36.05 $36.05 $36.05

50
Section I - Medications and Vaccines - Bravecto (Fluralaner)Flea and Tick Protection 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $36.05 $36.05 $36.05 $36.05

51
Section I - Medications and Vaccines - Bravecto (Fluralaner)Flea and Tick Protection 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $36.05 $36.05 $36.05 $36.05
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52
Section I - Medications and Vaccines - Bravecto (Fluralaner)Flea and Tick Protection 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $36.05 $36.05 $36.05 $36.05

53
Section I - Medications and Vaccines - Bravecto (Fluralaner)Flea and Tick Protection 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.96 $32.96 No Bid

54
Section I - Medications and Vaccines - Bravecto (Fluralaner)Flea and Tick Protection 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.96 $32.96 No Bid

55
Section I - Medications and Vaccines - Bravecto (Fluralaner)Flea and Tick Protection 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.96 $32.96 No Bid

56
Section I - Medications and Vaccines - Bravecto (Fluralaner)Flea and Tick Protection 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $33.73 $33.73 $33.73 $33.73

57
Section I - Medications and Vaccines - Bravecto (Fluralaner)Flea and Tick Protection 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $33.73 $33.73 $33.73 $33.73

58
Section I - Medications and Vaccines - Bravecto (Fluralaner)Flea and Tick Protection 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $33.73 $33.73 $33.73 $33.73

59
Section I - Medications and Vaccines - Bravecto (Fluralaner)Flea and Tick Protection 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $33.73 $33.73 $33.73 $33.73

60
Section I - Medications and Vaccines - Bravecto (Fluralaner)Flea and Tick Protection 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.96 $32.96 $32.96 $32.96

61
Section I - Medications and Vaccines - Bravecto (Fluralaner)Flea and Tick Protection 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.96 $32.96 $32.96 $32.96

62
Section I - Medications and Vaccines - Bravecto (Fluralaner)Flea and Tick Protection 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.96 $32.96 $32.96 $32.96

63
Section I - Medications and Vaccines - Bravecto (Fluralaner)Flea and Tick Protection 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $33.73 $33.73 $33.73 $33.73

64 Section I: Medications and Vaccines - Discount Off Catalog Price List. 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

65 Section II: Testing Supplies: Canine Snap Heartworm Test Kit 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
66 Section II: Testing Supplies: Canine Heartworm Rapid Test Vetscan 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.50 $3.50
67 Section II: Testing Supplies: Dry Flotation Medium, Zinc Sulfate 1 ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.002 $0.00

68
Section II: Testing Supplies: Feline Snap Antibody/FELV Antigen Combo Test Idexx 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

69 Section II: Testing Supplies: Fecasol Solution Evsco 1 ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.01 $0.01
70 Section II: Testing Supplies: Canine Snap Parvo Test 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
71 Section II: Testing Supplies: Discount Off Catalog Price List. 1 No Bid 20.0% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

72 Section III: Flea Control: Canine Frontline Plus, 5-22lbs 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

72 ALT1
ACTIVYL Toy Dogs/Puppies 4-14LBS. is available too for the same price ($5.05) and 
sold the same way (6 x 6 x 0.51) as ACTIVYL Small Dogs/PuppiesProduct detailer 
attached of Frontline vs. Activyl Intervet Inc., dba Merck Animal Health112173 1 dose $5.05

73 Section III: Flea Control: Canine Frontline Plus, 23-44lbs 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

73 ALT1
ACTIVYL MEDIUM Dogs/Puppies, 22-44 lbs.Product detailer attached of Frontline 
vs. Activyl Intervet Inc., dba Merck Animal Health107502 1 dose $5.05

74 Section III: Flea Control: Canine Frontline Plus, 45-88 lbs 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

74 ALT1
ACTIVYL LARGE Dogs/Puppies, 44-88 lbs.Product detailer attached of Frontline vs. 
Activyl Intervet Inc., dba Merck Animal Health116338 1 dose $5.05

75 Section III: Flea Control: Canine Frontline Plus, 89-132 lbs 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

75 ALT1
ACTIVYL EXTRA LARGE Dogs/Puppies, 88-132 lbs.Product detailer attached of 
Frontline vs. Activyl Intervet Inc., dba Merck Animal Health115627 1 dose $5.05

76 Section III: Flea Control: Feline Frontline Plus 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
76 ALT1 ACTIVYL CATSProduct detailer attached of Frontline vs. Activyl Intervet Inc., dba Merck Animal Health118926 1 dose $5.08

77 Section III: Flea Control: Capstar - Canine and Feline Nitenpyram 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.79 $3.79
78 Section III: Flea Control: Capstar - Canine 1 dose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.94 $3.94
79 Section III: Flea Control: Discount Off Catalog Price List. 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

80 Section IV: Lab Supplies: Tourniquet Jorgensen Labs Item JO130 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.97 $21.97 No Bid No Bid $10.36 $10.36
81 Section IV: Lab Supplies: Sharps Container, Quart 1 each No Bid No Bid $1.88 $1.88 $3.49 $3.49 No Bid No Bid $6.37 $6.37

81 ALT1 SHRP-1.5qt-Sharps Non Mail-Back Traditional 1.5 qt StatLab SHRP-1.5QT 1 each $10.40
82 Section IV: Lab Supplies: Sharps Container, Gallon 1 each No Bid $13.00 $13.00 $2.80 $2.80 $2.28 $2.28 No Bid No Bid $2.76 $2.76
83 Section IV: Lab Supplies: Sharps Container, 2 Gallon 1 each No Bid $13.50 $13.50 $3.63 $3.63 $6.11 $6.11 No Bid No Bid $4.52 $4.52
84 Section IV: Lab Supplies: Cadaver Bags Vedco 1 bag $0.39 $0.39 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.69 $0.69
85 Section IV: Lab Supplies: Cadaver Bags Vet One 1 bag $0.15 $0.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.38 $0.38
86 Section IV: Lab Supplies: Cadaver Bags 1 bag $0.61 $0.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
87 Section IV: Lab Supplies: Zip Bags, Reclosable 1 bag No Bid No Bid $39.70 $39.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

87 ALT1 Zip-lock bags 12"x15" 100ct Xpedx 766292 1 bag $0.06
88 Section IV: Lab Supplies: Alcohol Prep Pads 1 each No Bid $0.65 $0.65 $1.52 $1.52 $0.007 $0.01 No Bid No Bid $0.01 $0.01
89 Section IV: Lab Supplies: Insulated Thermal Container 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
90 Section IV: Lab Supplies: Lockmed Small Combination Lock Box Prod ASA100 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
91 Section IV: Lab Supplies: Gauze Wrap(for instruments) 1 bag No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.15 $0.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid

91 ALT1 Sterilization Pouch 5.25"x10" 200ct National DistributionP015410 1 bag $0.05
92 Section IV: Lab Supplies: Tattoo Ink Ketch 1 ounce No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.22 $3.22
93 Section IV: Lab Supplies: Clipper Lube Oster 1 ounce No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.38 $0.38
94 Section IV: Lab Supplies: Rapid Stain Differential 1 ml No Bid $0.0506 $0.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.09 $0.09
95 Section IV: Lab Supplies: Cotton Tip Applicator 1 each No Bid $0.0096 $0.01 $11.16 $11.16 $0.005 $0.01 No Bid No Bid $0.004 $0.00
96 Section IV: Lab Supplies: Discount Off Catalog Price List. 1 No Bid 20.0% 15.0% No Bid No Bid No Bid

97 Section V: Surgical Supplies: Dissolvable Suture Ethic J460h 1 foot No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.12 $9.12 No Bid No Bid $3.17 $3.17
98 Section V: Surgical Supplies: Tissue Glue Vetbond 1 ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.02 $4.02
99 Section V: Surgical Supplies: Dissolvable Suture USSC 6641-41 1 foot No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.16 $10.16 No Bid No Bid $1.91 $1.91

100 Section V: Surgical Supplies: Surgery Drape 1 cubic yard No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.72 $0.72
101 Section V: Surgical Supplies: Allis Forcep 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.89 $9.89 $34.65 $34.65 No Bid $52.61 $52.61
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102 Section V: Surgical Supplies: Surgical Stapler Appose 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $43.30 $43.30 No Bid No Bid $10.76 $10.76
103 Section V: Surgical Supplies: Drain/Tube Penrose 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.23 $1.23 No Bid No Bid $0.57 $0.57
104 Section V: Surgical Supplies: Tissue Staple Remover 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.77 $2.77
105 Section V: Surgical Supplies: Needle Holder Olsen Hegar 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.48 $21.48 $125.00 $125.00 No Bid $58.00 $58.00
106 Section V: Surgical Supplies: Gauze Roll Jor Vet 1 foot No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.17 $0.17
107 Section V: Surgical Supplies: Exam Gloves 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.19 $0.19 No Bid No Bid No Bid

107 ALT1 mVet PF latex exam gloves. 100bx. All sizes are same price mVet 10741 ADI 1 each $0.14

107 ALT2
6005PFXS-6005PFXL - Glove SkinShield Powder Free Nitrile XS-XL 100/bx, As stock 
comes available SLMP, LLC 6005PFXS-6005PFXL1 each $0.25

107 ALT1
N191-N194 - Gloves Cobalt Nitrile Powder Free Exam XS-LG 10bxs/cs, As Stock 
comes available Ansell N190-N194 1 each $0.275

108 Section V: Surgical Supplies: Surgical Face Mask Dynarex Model#2203 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.17 $0.17 No Bid No Bid No Bid

108 ALT1
SFM-BFE95 - >95 BFE, 3-ply, disposable pleated ear loop face mask, 50 per box Intco Medical Technology Co., LTDSFM-BFE95 1 each $0.56

108 ALT2
SFM-N95 - N95 Particulate Respirator, NIOSH Certified, BFE > 95%, 20 per box Guangzhou Harley Commodity Comany LimitedL-188 1 each $6.75

108 ALT1 mVet procedure face mask, disposable 50ct mVet 000.01000.3 1 each $29.90
109 Section V: Surgical Supplies: Gloves 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.95 $1.95 No Bid No Bid $2.33 $2.33

109 ALT1
2375-(DS) Gloves Latex PF Surgical Sterile Size 7.5 200Pr/cs, Drop ship item, may 
have delay due to Covid Dynarex 2375 1 each $1.50

110 Section V: Surgical Supplies: Gauze Sponge 1 each No Bid $0.0375 $0.04 $4.16 $4.16 $0.028 $0.03 No Bid No Bid $0.02 $0.02
111 Section V: Surgical Supplies: Vet Wrap 3M 1 foot No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

111 ALT1 Vetrap 4" bright display pack 24ct 3M 1410BRT 1 foot $0.11
112 Section V: Surgical Supplies: Surgical Blade 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.13 $0.13 No Bid No Bid $0.30 $0.30
113 Section V: Surgical Supplies: Surgical Blade 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.13 $0.13 No Bid No Bid $0.30 $0.30
114 Section V: Surgical Supplies: Multidose Vial Access Spike Clave PM-24-2463 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.44 $2.44
115 Section V: Surgical Supplies: Microclose Multidose Vial Adapter Clave 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
116 Section V: Surgical Supplies: IV Administration Set Braun V1402 1 inch No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.29 $1.29 No Bid No Bid No Bid

116 ALT1 IV Set Primary 78", 15 Drops/mL 1 port LS Exel Int. Medical ProductsEXE 29081 1 inch $0.01
117 Section V - Surgical Supplies - Chlorhexidine Solution 2% 1 ounce No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.36 $4.36 No Bid No Bid $0.08 $0.08

118
Section V - Surgical Supplies -Concentrated Surgical Instrument Cleaner, Neutral pH 
Phosphate-Free 1 ounce No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.41 $0.41

119
Section V - Surgical Supplies - Polypropylene Autoclave Pouches (transparent) 1 bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

119 ALT1 Sterilization Pouch 7.5"x13", 200ct National DistributionP017513 1 bag $0.11
120 Section V - Surgical Supplies - Autoclave Instrument Wraps 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.35 $6.35
121 Section V - Surgical Supplies - 17 Piece Spay Packs 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $497.50 $497.50 No Bid No Bid

121 ALT1 Canine Spay Pack, no cassette 6810-NC *DS* Integra Lifesciences Corp.6810-NC 1 each $735.37
122 Section V: Surgical Supplies: Discount Off Catalog Price List 1 No Bid No Bid 15.0% No Bid No Bid No Bid

123
Section VI: Needles and Syringes: Monoject Luer Lock Syringe/Needle Combo 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.16 $0.16 No Bid No Bid $0.12 $0.12

124 Section VI: Needles and Syringes: Monoject Luer Lock Syringe/Needle 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.11 $0.11 No Bid No Bid $0.12 $0.12
125 Section VI: Needles and Syringes: Syringe/needle Combo 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.11 $0.11 No Bid No Bid $0.22 $0.22
126 Section VI: Needles and Syringes: Syringe/Needle Combo 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.11 $0.11 No Bid No Bid $0.22 $0.22
127 Section VI: Needles and Syringes: Monoject Luer Lock Syringe 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.083 $0.08 No Bid No Bid $0.31 $0.31
128 Section VI: Needles and Syringes: Monoject Luer Lock Syringe 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.06 $0.06 No Bid No Bid $0.11 $0.11
129 Section VI: Needles and Syringes: Monoject Luer Lock Syringe 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.14 $0.14 No Bid No Bid $0.18 $0.18
130 Section VI: Needles and Syringes: Monoject Luer Lock Syringe 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.06 $0.06 No Bid No Bid $0.24 $0.24
131 Section VI: Needles and Syringes: Monoject Luer Lock Needle 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.25 $0.25 No Bid No Bid $0.18 $0.18
132 Section VI: Needles and Syringes: Monoject Luer Lock Needle 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.11 $0.11 No Bid No Bid $0.08 $0.08
133 Section VI: Needles and Syringes: Monoject Luer Lock Needle 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.09 $0.09 No Bid No Bid $0.08 $0.08
134 Section VI: Needles and Syringes: Monoject Luer Lock Needle 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.09 $0.09 No Bid No Bid $0.08 $0.08
135 Section VI: Needles and Syringes: Monoject Luer Lock Needle 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.12 $0.12 No Bid No Bid $0.08 $0.08
136 Section VI: Needles and Syringes: Monoject Luer Lock Needle 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.11 $0.11 No Bid No Bid $0.08 $0.08
137 Section VI: Needles and Syringes: Monoject Luer Lock Needle 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.08 $0.08
138 Section VI: Needles and Syringes: Monoject Luer Lock Needle 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.11 $0.11 No Bid No Bid $0.08 $0.08
139 Section VI: Needles and Syringes: Monoject Luer Lock Needle 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.11 $0.11 No Bid No Bid $0.08 $0.08
140 Section VI: Needles and Syringes: Monoject Luer Lock Needle 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.11 $0.11 No Bid No Bid $0.08 $0.08
141 Section VI: Needles and Syringes: Monoject Luer Lock Needle 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.11 $0.11 No Bid No Bid $0.08 $0.08
142 Section VI: Needles and Syringes: Discount Off Catalog Price List. 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.0% No Bid No Bid No Bid

143 Section VII: Cleaning Supplies: Kennelsol Altec 1 ounce No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
143 ALT1 Rescue Concentrate 5 Gal Pail, formerly Accel Virox Technologies23309-005C 1 ounce $0.25

144 Section: VII: Cleaning Supplies: Trifectant 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.67 $0.67
145 Section VII: Cleaning Supplies: Disinfectant Virucide 1 ounce No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

145 ALT1 35910-32- SaniZide Pro 1 Surface Disinfectant, 32 oz. bottle w/ sprayer SaniZide 35910-32 1 ounce $0.625
146 Section VII: Cleaning Supplies: Discount Off Catalog Price List. 1 20.0% 20.0% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
147 Section VIII: Cage Supplies: Litter Pans Pactive CorporationY60245 1 each $0.406 $0.41 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.00 $23.00
148 Section VIII: Cage Supplies: Food Trays Jorg 1 each $0.0199 $0.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.90 $31.90 No Bid $0.05 $0.05
149 Section: VIII: Cage Supplies: Dog Bowl 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.78 $2.78 No Bid $5.50 $5.50
150 Section VIII: Cage Supplies: Dog Bowl 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.60 $1.60 No Bid $3.00 $3.00
151 Section VIII: Cage Supplies: Key Clips 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
152 Section VIII: Cage Supplies: Vinyl Envelope 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
153 Section VIII: Cage Supplies: Suction Cup 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
154 Section VIII: Cage Supplies: Cable Ties 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
155 Section VIII: Cage Supplies: Discount Off Catalog Price List. 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

156 Section IX: Handling and Capture Supplies: Dual Release Catch Pole ACES ADR-CP4 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
156 ALT1 Ketch-All Pole 4' Jorgensen LaboratoriesJ0915A 1 each $103.57
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157 Section IX: Handling and Capture Supplies: Dual Release Catch Pole ACES ADR-CP% 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
157 ALT1 Ketch-All Pole Adjustable 4-6' Jorgensen LaboratoriesJ0915B 1 each $142.86

158 Section IX: Handling and Capture Supplies: "Y" Restraint Pole 60" ACES AYP-60 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
159 Section IX: Handling and Capture Supplies: Super Snare 53" ACES FSS-1 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

159 ALT1 Snare 5' Pole *SO* KVP InternationalSEM5 1 each $53.26
160 Section IX: Handling and Capture Supplies: Cat Tongs 28" ACES WCG-28 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
161 Section IX: Handling and Capture Supplies: Cat Tongs 38" ACES WCG-38 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
162 Section IX: Handling and Capture Supplies: Bite Stick ACES BS-E 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
163 Section IX: Handling and Capture Supplies: Bite Stick ACES BS-E21 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
164 Section IX: Handling and Capture Supplies: Bite Stick Holster ACES BS-HN 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
165 Section IX: Handling and Capture Supplies: Snake Tongs ACES Super GripMW-G52 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
166 Section IX: Handling and Capture Supplies: Bat/Bird/Mammal Net ACES 3543 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
167 Section IX: Handling and Capture Supplies: Magnum Net ACES 3641-K 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
168 Section IX: Handling and Capture Supplies: Gauntlet Gloves ACES AGK-L 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

168 ALT1 Gauntlet Gloves 18" *SO* Jorgensen LaboratoriesJ0791 1 each $71.43
169 Section IX: Handling and Capture Supplies: Dog Muzzle ACES DMS-10 1 set No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $69.75 $69.75 No Bid No Bid

169 ALT1 Muzzle Nylon set/10 *SO* Jorgensen LaboratoriesJ0169T 1 set $5.50
170 Section IX: Handling and Capture Supplies: Feral Cat Den ACES M-FCD 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
171 Section IX: Handling and Capture Supplies: Den Front Door ACES M-DFD 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
172 Section IX: Handling and Capture Supplies: Universal Trap ACES SG-53 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
173 Section IX: Handling and Capture Supplies: Cage ACES SG-RC 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
174 Section IX: Handling and Capture Supplies: Carrier/Transfer Cage ACES SG-20CTEL 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
175 Section IX: Handling and Capture Supplies: Field Darts - 4cc ACES PD-5 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

175 ALT1 Maxi-ject Syringe Darts 2-5mL Addison Biological Labs2330-0 1 each $20.54 Not  to Spec
176 Section IX: Handling and Capture Supplies: Field Darts 5cc ACES PD-5 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

176 ALT1 Maxi-ject Syringe Darts 2-5mL Addison Biological Labs2330-0 1 each $20.54 Not  to Spec
177 Section IX: Handling and Capture Supplies: Field Darts 6cc ACES PD-6 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
178 Section IX: Handling and Capture Supplies: Field Darts - 7cc ACES PD-7 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
179 Section IX: Handling and Capture Supplies: Field Darts - 10cc ACES PD-10 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
180 Section IX: Handling and Capture Supplies: Pole Syringe - 3ml ACES ZPS-06 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
181 Section IX: Handling and Capture Supplies: Folding Large Animal Trap Tru-Catch 48F 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
182 Section IX: Handling and Capture Supplies: Heavy Duty Animal Trap Tru-Catch 30D 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
183 Section IX: Handling and Capture Supplies: Discount Off Catalog Price List. 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

184 Section X: Miscellaneous Supplies: Dog Leads Camp 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.60 $0.60 No Bid No Bid
184 ALT1 Nylon Lead w/ring flat 12ct, blue 54" Dee Veterinary Products3261 1 each $0.52

185 Section X: Miscellaneous Supplies: Dog Leads EYAY InternationalPEL-5R 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
185 ALT1 Nylon lead w/ring braided 12ct, blue 60" Dee Veterinary Products3251 1 each $0.56

186 Section X: Miscellaneous Supplies: Cardboard Pet Carrier VEDCO 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.80 $2.80 No Bid $2.73 $2.73
187 Section X: Miscellaneous Supplies: Waste Bags ULINE D98153 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

187 ALT1 Replacement bags 400ct, for poopy pouch waste station Crown ProductsSD-6-400-1 1 each $0.03 Not  to Spec

188 Section XI: Digital Animal Identification: Home Again Microchips 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.00 $5.00 No Bid
189 Section XI: Digital Animal Identification: Microchip Reader Intervet 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $375.00 $375.00 No Bid

189 ALT1 Scanfindr Compact Max Scanner Datamars 237.80205.2 1 each $249.00
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