Lipeng Xue DBA: Moonlight

Max, LLC DBA: Max Protection,

Ken Starr DBA: Stalwart Medical

Mingtel Inc DBA: Azpen

PYRAMID PAPER COMPANY DBA:

vastmed, llc Aviationy LLC DBA: My Medical | Medical Suppl:z &Equipment | PPE TRADE AND SUPPORT LLC Texas Medical Center Supply LLC Solutions LLC US Health Express Corp Innovation PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS
Total Price | $873.00 Total Price|_$34,410.00 Total Price| _$70,881.00 Total Price| $74,720.00 Total Price|  $119,394.00 Total Price| _$131,415.00 Total Price|  $133,995.00 Total Price|  $134,440.00 Total Price|  $195,130.00 Total Price [ $16,239,428.00
Line # _Description Mfgr Mfgno arv__uom Estimated Unit | Extended Unit Extended Unit | Extended Unit | Extended Unit | Extended Unit | Extended Unit | Extended | Extended Unit | Extended Unit | Extended
1 _Bound Seam EWA Hooded Coverall w/boots, 2500 _each No Bid No Bid No 8id No 8id No 8id No Bid. No Bid. No Bid. No Bid. $1,00000  $2,500,000.00
1ALT1 :Bound Seam EWA Hooded Coverall w/boots, CORDOVA___FRCA00-MED 2500 _each $5.1
2 Bound Seam EWA Hooded Coverall w/boots, 2500__each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,000.00  $2,500,000.00
2 ALTL {Bound Seam EWA Hooded Coverall w/boots, CORDOVA  FRCA001G 2500 _each $5.1
3 Bound Seam EWA Hooded Coverall w/boots, 2500_each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid. No Bid. No Bid. No Bid. $1,00000  $2,500,000.00
3ALT1 :Bound Seam EWA Hooded Coverall w/boots, CORDOVA _ FRCA00-XL 2500 each $5.1
4 Bound Seam EWA Hooded Coverall w/boots, 2500 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,000.00  $2,500,000.00
4ALTL {Bound Seam EWA Hooded Coverall w/boots, CORDOVA FRCA00XXL 2500 _each $5.19
4 ALT1 {HAZMAT WHITE FULL COVERALL SUITE A+ PR VASTMED.  VMHAZWFO1 2500 each $11.69
5 Collared Flap, Zip Closure, S No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,00000  $2,500,000.00
5 ALTL {Collared Coverall w/Storm Flap, Zip Closure, ¢ CORDOVA _RS456 $3.99  NottoSpec
5ALTL o s C VASTVI $885
6 Sleeve ProtectorKl d A70 or Collin Co No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,000.00  $2,500,000.00
6ALTL {sleeve Protector CORDOVA ~ CPS18 $0.26
8 Disposable Boot C or Collin € No Bid No Bid No Bid No id 5012 $300.00 [No Bid No 8id No 8id No Bid No Bid
8ALTL {ANTI SLIP NON WOVEN SHOE COVER PP VASTMED  VMSHOPP100 2500 _each $011
BALTL {Shoe Cover 25GR Laminated-White Texas Medical 2500 each 5054
10 Disposable Surgical Gown w/ Elastic Wrist, Le 5000_each No Bid $279  $13,950.00|No8id 5179 $8,950.00 $270  $13,50000 $1.95 $9,750.00 $295  $1475000 $345  $17,25000 $347  $17,350.00 No Bid
10 ALT1 DISP, GOWNS NO STERILE NON WOVEN PP Y VASTMED  VMISPP22GY1 5000 each $129  NottoSpec
10ALTL Model DIGO0AStandards: GB/T20097-2006h, Xiamen Colort 5000 each 5279
1 bl | Gown w/ Elastic Wrist, Le 5000 each No Bid $279  $13,950.00|NoBid 5179 $8,950.00 $270  $13,500.00No Bid 5295  $14750.00 $345  $17,250.00 $347  $17,350.00|NoBid
11 ALTL DISP. GOWNS NO STERILE NON WOVEN PP Y VASTMED _ VMISPP22GY1 5000 _each $129  NottoSpec
11 ALTL i Model; GB/120097-2006N, Xiamen Colort 5000, each $2.79
12 Disposable Surgical Gown w/ Elastic Wrist, Le each No Bid No Bid No 8id $1.89 $9,450.00 $365  $1825000 $3.20  $16,00000 $410  $20,50000 $350  $17,50000 $347  $17,350.00 No Bid
12 ALTL{DISP ISOLATION GOWN W/ELASTIC 29GM.LV VASTMED . VMIS3PE25GS. 5000 each
13 bl 1l // Elasti No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.89 $9,450.00 $3.65 $18,250.00 $3.20 $16,000.00 $4.10 $20,500.00 $3.50 $17,500.00 $3.47 $17,350.00 | No Bid
13 ALTLEDISP ISOLATION GOWN W/ELASTIC 29GM LV, VASTMED . VMIS3PE25GS 5000 each 5182
14 Disposable Surgical Gown w/Elastic Wrist, Le each No Bid No Bid No 8id $215  $10,750.00|NoBid $350  $17,500.00 [No Bid $380  $19,00000 $385  $19,250.00 No Bid
14 ALT1{DISPOSABLE ISOLATION GOWN W/ELASTIC, L VASTMED __ VMIS3PE25GS 5000 _each $2.56
15 Gown wiElastic Wrist, Le. 5000 _each No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.15 $10,750.00 | No Bid $3.50 $17,500.00 [ No Bid $3.80 $19,000.00 $3.85 $19,250.00 | No Bid
15 ALTL{DISPOSABLE ISOLATION GOWN W/ELASTIC, L VMIS3PE25GS 5000 each 5256
16 frared Forehead | Th No Bid $11.80 $4,720.00 $29.99 $11,996.00 $14.95 $5,980.00 $34.00 $13,600.00 $22.00 $8,800.00 $70.00 $28,000.00 $20.00 $8,000.00 $1850 $7,400.00 $36.95 $14,780.00
16 ALT1{INFRARED FORHEAD DIGITAL THERMOMETR VASTMED _ VMKY111 $16.35
17 Full Length Disposable Face Shield w. Foam P No Bid $111 $1,110.00 $2.99 $2,990.00 | No Bid 5098 $980.00 $1.99 $1,990.00 $235 $2,350.00 $700.00 | No Bid $1.99 $1,990.00
7 AT \CE SHIELD W/FC VASTMED.  VMTGRESARX] $097
18 Medical Cap/Bouffant, X -Large,McKesson or | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.12 $120.00 [No Bid 032 $320.00 [No Bid No Bid No Bid
18 ALT1 DisP, BOUFFANT CAP 21" VASTMED, VMHCBB100P. $041  NottoSpec
18 ALTL Bouffant, Non-woven Material Light weight E XIANTAO XINF. 205202 5018
18 ALTL | Medical Cap. Texas Medical COFO1 5030
19 Goggles No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $224 $448.00 | No Bid No Bid $120 $240.00 $4.50 $900.00 $2.69 $538.00,
INFECTION CONTROL GOGGLES TYPE BANTI| VASTMED  VMGGB0210 200 5187 Not to Spec
20 Safety Evewear,Verattilr) Tuff-Specir] 1400 S 200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5198 $396.00 [ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,00000  $200,00000
20 ALT1  Safety Evewear, Clear Frame, Clear Lens, Unc CORDOVA _EC105 200 5129
20 ALTL INFECTION CONTROL GLASSES /GOGGLES TYF VASTMED _ VMGLSAP10 200 $1.485
26 KN9S Masks 1000 No Bid 5068 $680.00 $110 $1,100.00 5049 $490.00 | No Bid 5080 $800.00 5095 $950.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 5048 $480.00 [ No Bid
27 Disposable Surgical Masks. 3-Ply (>98%) 10000 $0.0873 $873.00[No Bid No 8id $010 $1,000.00 $038 $3,800.00 $015 $1,500.00 $025 $2,500.00|No Bid $018 $1,80000 $0295 $2,95000
Mﬂ"“fmu""ls‘a"dﬂ"‘s53"325‘“0‘59X'ﬂme"DlM<3°15557°75 we Eoe
I 5012
Nitrile Gloves, Powder Free, Latex Free - Sma No Bid No Bid 5015 $3,750.00 | No id $0.095 $2,375.00 $0.109 $2,725.00|No 8id No 8id $0.16 $4,000.00 | No Bid
1118535 Criterion Exam Gloves Nitrile Latex. H.S.. 1118535 * see footnote
NITRILE GLOVE "PANTERA” SYNMAX 70% NIT VASTMED, $0.095  Not to Spec
Nitrile Gloves, Powder Free, Latex Free, Med] No Bid No Bid $0.15 $3,750.00 | No Bid $0.095 $2,375.00 $0.109 $2,725.00| No Bid No Bid $0.16. $4,000.00 | No Bid
111118536 Criterion Exam Gloves Nitrile Latex. H.s.l 1118536 * see footnote
$0095  NottoSpec
Nitrile Gloves, Powder Free, Latex Free, Large No Bid No Bid $015  $15,000.00No Bid $0.095 $9,500.00 $0109  $10,900.00|No Bid No 8id $0.16  $16,000.00 No Bid
1118537 Criterion Exam Gloves Nitrile Latex. H.S.. 1118537 * see footnote
NITRILE GLOVE "PANTERA” SYNMAX 70% NIT VASTMED, $0.095  Not to Spec
31 Nitrle Gloves, Powder Free, Latex Free. Extra No 8id No 8id $015  $15000.00No Bid $0.095 $9,500.00 $0109  $10,900.00No Bid No 8id $016  $16,000.00|No Bid
NITRILE GLOVE "PANTERA" SYNMAX 70% NIT VASTMED_ __ VMGLBSYN1O! $0095  NottoSpec * see footnote
32 Hand Sanitizer, >=60% Alcohol (ethanol), 8.0 No Bid No Bid 5490 $4,900.00 | No Bid No Bid 5195 $1,950.00 5185 $1,850.00 $2.00 $2,000.00 $2.97 $2,970.00 $3.39 $3,390.00
32 ALT1 {VASTMED HAND SANITIZER SCENT FREE 75% VASTMED _ VMHS 5187
Hand Sanitizer, >=60% Alcohol (ethanol), 16 No 8id No 8id $6.90 $6,900.00 | No Bid No Bid $310 $3,100.00 $270 $2,700.00 $2.50 $2,500.00 $538 $5,380.00 $429 $4,290.00
$2.65
34 and Sanitizer, >260% Alcohol (ethanol), 1 G 500 gallon No Bid No Bid $10.99 $5,495.00 | No Bid No Bid $18.55 $9,275.00 $12.15 $6,075.00 | No Bid $2690  $13,450.00 $2298  $11,490.00
34 ALT1{HAND SANITIZER 75% ALCOHOL, 1 GALLON VASTMED _ VMHS 500 galion $14.80

No Award Line 7,9, 21, 22, 23, 24, 25,35, 36, 37, 38
*Vendor could not honor price for contract term.
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