Vastmed, lic NI Capital Inc G inc. Gromedica LLC MAGTEC CORPORATION Jamestown Plastics INC Arbor Apothecary (Adaptive Uiberty Paper (01D Office | Modern Chemical (COMMERCIAL| _DLK Medical Technologies, Inc
Total Price $873.00Total Price $950.00 $1.250.00[  Total Price $1.970.00[  Total Price $2,300.00[  Total Price $2,430.00[  Total Price $4,180.00[  Total Price $5,990.00(  Total Price 56,000.00]  Total Price 57.600.00] _ Total Price $9.000.00(  Total Price| _ $11,750.00 Total Price| __ $12,605.00]
Line #__Description [ Mo arv_uom Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
1 Bound Seam EWA Hooded Coverall w/boot: 2500 _each No id No id No id No id No id No id No id No id No id No 8id No8id No8id No8id
1ALT1 / Bound Seam EWA Hooded Coverall w/boot, CORDOVA. FRC400:MED, 2500 _each
1AL dium  Texas Medical COV-BL.001 2500 box
1ALTL Coverall solation Clothes, white, with cap .2 Chenedu Giga CA-M 2500 each
1ALTL | HAZMAT WHITE FULL COVERALL SUITE A+ P VASTMED. _ VMHAZWFOL 2500 each 1169
2 _Bound Seam EWA Hooded Coverall w/baot 2500 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No id No id No id No8id
2ALTL / Bound Seam EWA Hooded Coverall w/boot: CORDOVA  FRCA00-LG. 2500 _each
2ALTLDisposable medical coverall - Large Texas Medical COV-BL001 2500 box
2ALTL Coverall solation Clothes, white, with cap 2 Chenedu Giga CA'L 2500 each
2ALT1 | HAZMAT WHITE FULL COVERALL SUITE A+ P VASTMED _VMHAZWFOL 2500 each 51169
3 Bound Seam EWA Hooded Coverall w/baot 2500 each No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No id No id No id Noid
3ALTL  Bound Seam EWA Hooded Coverall w/boot: CORDOVA. FRCA00XL 2500 each
3ATL ralarge . Texas Medical COV-BL001 2500 box
3ALTL Coverall solation Clothes, white, with cap a Chenedu Giga CA-XL 2500 each
3ALTL | HAZMAT WHITE FULL COVERALL SUITE A+ P VASTMED. _ VMHAZWFOL 2500 each 1169
4 _Bound Seam EWA Hooded Coverall w/baot 2500 each No Bid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No id No id No id No8id
4ALT1 | Bound Seam EWA Hooded Coverall w/boot, CORDOVA  FRCAO0XXL 2500 each
4ALTL Disposable medical coverall - 2-Extra Large, Texas Medical COV-BL-001 2500 box
4ALTL Coverallsolation Clothes, white, with cap a Chenedu Giga CAXXL 2500 _each
4 ALTL | HAZMAT WHITE FULL COVERALL SUITE A+ P VASTMED __ VMHAZWFOL 2500 each 1169
5 Flap, Zip Closure. 2500 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No id No id No id No8id
5 ALTL | Colared Coverall w/Storm Flap, Zip Closure. CORDOVA.  RS4SG 2500 each
SALTL | HAZMAT WHITE FULL COVERALL SUITE B PR VASTMED  VMHAZWFO2 2500, each 5885
6 Sleeve A70.0r Collin € 2500 each No gid No Bid No Bid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No sid Noid Noid Noid Noid
6ALT1 | sleeve Protector CORDOVA . cPs18 2500 each
6ALTL Armor Disposable PE Arm Sleeves, Clear, 30 Pac-Dent, Inc, DAS:30C 500 box
6ALTL Minimum order auantity for sleeve protect 50000, each

6 ALTL KCC23610 KIMIBERLY CLARKALO Breathable_Kimberly Clarl KCC3610

8 Disposable Soot Cover Kleenguard or Collin 251
8ALT1 | ANTI SLIP NON WOVEN SHOE COVER PP VASTMED  VMSHOPPL00 2500

8ALT1 Shoe Cover 25GR Laminated-White Texas Medical 2500, each
BALTL Nonskid boot covers: comes in 400pcs/case Tare Technolc T0021 2500 each
BALTL Nexvoo brand booties $1.50 each Nexvoo, 2500 each
8ALT1 Non-woven shoe cover, 100 pairs per box _Pac.Dent, Inc._SC-100 2500, box
8ALT1 Long Shoe Cover Rubie's Costu 2500 _each

10 pisposable Sursical Gown w/ Elastic Wrist |
10ALT1 DISP. GOWNS NO STERILE NON WOVEN PP_VASTMED  VMISPP22GY1 5000 each $129  NottoSpec
10ALTL Moge 6B/120057-20061 Yiamen Colerl 5000 each
10ALT1 One sizeitsmost isolation gown w/ elastic Auranaturale SciGO1 5000 each
10ALTL 1384742 Disposable 1so Gown AAMI L1 larat Pacent. ISG1541K 500, bag,
10 ALT1 100% Infused and TransformedPalvester Re MedTedhnolc 5000 each

un Elastc Wrist, | 5000 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11ALT1 DISP. GOWNS NO STERILE NON WOVEN PP_VASTMED. _ VMISPP22GY1 5000 _each $129  Nottospec
1AL Model 6B/120057-2006 Yiamen Colerl 5000 each
11ALTL One sizefits most isolation gown w/ elastic Auranaturale SscilGO1 5000 each
11ALTL 1384743 Disposable 1so Gown AAMI L1 10/t Pacbent. _ISG-1368 500 bag,
11ALTL 100% Infused and MedTednnolc 5000 each

12 pisposable Sursical Gown w/ Elastic Wrist, | 5000 _each NoBid NoBid NoBid No8id No8id No8id No8id No8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 ALT1 DISP ISOLATION GOWN W/ELAST! L VASTMED  VMIS3PE2SGE 5000 each s1m2
12 ALT1 One sigeits-most isolation gown w/ elastic Auranaturale. SscilGO1 5000 each
2AT ] Iphatec Protecty Gown VL2 lare Ansell Health CV19.8:55:21 500 bag
12 ALT1 100% Infused and TransformedPalvester Re MedTedhnolc 5000 each

13 Elastic Wrist | 5000 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid
13 ALT1 1106609 Gown Eclipse AAMI? 18/case Orde Medline __DYNIP2003 27 case
13ALTL DISP ISOLATION GOWN W/ELASTIC 29GM.L! VASTMED. __ VMIS3PE25GE 5000 _each s182
13 ALTL One sige-itsmost isolation gown w/ elastic Auranaturale. SscilGOT____ 5000 _each
13ALTL 100% Infused and Re MedTednnolc 5000 each

14 Disposable Sursical Gown w/Elastic Wist, 5000 _each NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid No8id No 8id No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 ALT1 DISPOSABLE ISOLATION GOWN W/ELASTIC, VASTMED.  VMIS3PE2SGE 5000 _each $256
14ALTL 5701665 Sure Gown AAMI 3 Non-Reinforced H.S.I s701665 166 case
14 ALT1 100% Infused and TransformedPalvester Re MedTedhnolc 5000 each

15 st Wrist, L, 5000 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
15 ALT1 DISPOSABLE ISOLATION GOWN W/ELASTIC, VMISIPE2SGS 5000 each $256
1571 AAMI3 Non-Reinforced H.S.. 570169 178 case
15 ALTL 100% Infused and Re MedTedhnolc 5000 _each

16 Infrared Forehead Digital Th ter. M 400 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No 8id No 8id No Bid
16 ALTL INFRARED FORHEAD DIGITAL THERMIOMETI VASTVED  VMKYI11 400 each 51635
16 ALT1 Samoles avallable on request. Rveom therm Rycom ___RYIB178 400 _each

17 Full Length Disposable Face Shield w, Foam 1000 each NoBid NoBid NoBid $197 5157000/ NoBid s085 $850.00|No 8id No Bid $600  $600000 090 $900.00No 8id No Bid No Bid
17 ALTL FULL LENGTH DISPOSABLE FACE SHIELD W/ VASTMED. _ VMTGRFSAFY. 1000 _each 5097
17ALTL. 1381301 Clear-Vu Face Shield SO/BOX_______Clear-Vu Med CMEA141:801 20 box

18 Medical Cap/Bouffant. X-Large.MeKesson of 1000 _each No Bid No Bid $125  $1250.00|No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No8id No 8id No 8id No 8id No Bid
18 ALTL DISP, BOUFFANT CAP 21" VASTMED  VMHCBE100P 1000 _each $011 NottoSpec
18 ALT1. 1084206 Boufant Can Blve XL 500/CS Orde. O & M Halvar, 69803 2. ease
18 ALT1. Bouffant Non-waven Material isht weisht_ XIANTAQ XINI 205:202 1000 _each
18ALTL Medical Cap. Texas Medical COFOL 1000 each
18 ALT1. Nexvoo head cap $2.00 Nexveo 1000 " each
18 ALT1 100% Infused and TransformedPalvester Re MedTednnolc 1000 " each
18 ALTL Bouffant Cap, 24", blue, 100/pack Pac Dent Inc, BCB24100 1000 _box
18 ALT1 Bar Can - Blue Clp Cap, 21", 12esm. DoubleRubie’s Costu 1000 each

Goggles each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
19 ALTA[INFECTION CONTROL GOGGLES TYPE BANT VASTMED _VMGGB0210 200 each s1.87
safety Toff Speclr) 1400 200__each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

20 ALT Pyramex Inteara Safety Glesses, MI-OTGGC. Pyramex  $B4105 200 each
20 ALT Sofety Evewear, Clear Frame, Clear Lens, Un CORDOVA _ EC105 200 each
20 ALT Radnor 1400 series very comparable to Ver: Rednor 1101 200 each
20 ALTL INFECTION CONTROL GLASSES /GOGGLES T VASTMED  VMGLSAPIO 200 each s1.485

20 ALTL 411806 200

WMaxi Aids

Clear Safety UV PPE Glasses for Infection Co
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KNS Masks

26ALT1 We offer KF94 masks that are made in Repy EDL Co, Ltd, R KF94 Mask 1000 _each
26ALT1 1381342 Powecome KN9S Respirator Mask  Guangzhou Pc GB2626:2006 100 bag
26 ALT1. KNS Fujian 3.50 each 1000, each
26 ALT1 please see price quote and safety data shee Cultiva MSK3L0003 1000 each
27 3.9y (>=98%) 10000 each
27am 126102016 Xiamen DL M 3016857075 10000 each
7M. 3Ply (>=95%),8r CHICJIAHUA 192:201 10000 each
27ALT1 3pLY Dispo: 10000, each
27T 1381 L250/bxblu BYD CARE  FE2311 200, box
7M1, data shee Cultive MSK3L0002 10000 each
27ALT1 100% Infused and MedTedhnolc 10000 each
27 ALT1 NC.3PDMASK:CS, Disposable Face Masks, 3. don Don ... NC:3PDMASK. 2000 case
28 Nitrile Gloves, Powder Free, Latex Free - Sm, 25000 each
28 ALT1! 1118535 Criterion Exam Gloves Nitrile Latex H.S.| 1118535 250 box
28 ALT1. NITRILE GLOVE "PANTERA" SYNMAX 70% NI VASTMED  VMGLBSYN10 25000 each
28ALT1 VGlove aka VRG Khai Hoan, Meet with the r VGlove aka Vf VGloveO1 25000 each
28ALT1 $14.40 per box of 100; $144.00 per case, FQ VRG Khai Hoa, 250 box
28 ALT1 30000 SERIES POWDER FREE NITRILE EXAM. Shamrock 30310 25000 each
28ALT1 Nitrle Examination Gloves with FDA ST0KCK Intce Medical NGPF7001 25000 each
28 ALT1 Super stretct ingertips 10 Purelife - NO\ 1060102 25000 box
29 Nitrile Gloves, Powder Free, Latex Free, Me, 25000 each
29 ALT1 1118536 Criterion Exam Gloves Nitrile Latex H.S.. 111853 250 box
29 ALT1. NITRILE GLOVE "PANTERA" SYNMAX 70% NI VASTMED  VMGLESYN10 25000 each
29ALT1 VGlove aka Meet with the r VGlove aka Vi VGlove0l 25000 each
29ALT1§14.40 per box of 100; $144.00 per case, FQ VRG Khai Hoa, 250 box
29 ALT1 30000 SERIES POWDER FREE NITRILE EXAM. Shamrock 30311 25000 each
29ALT1. Nitrle Examination Gloves with FDA S10KCK Intco Medical NGPF7002 25000 each
29 ALT1. MI-VGM:Cs, Vinyl Gloves, 2.7 mil, Powder £ Condor 38Ad5 1000 case
29ALT1 600SPFMD - Kinshield Powder Free | Top Glove 25000 each
30 Nitrile Gloves, Powder Free, Latex Free, Larg 16405 each
30ALT1] 1118537 Criterion Exam Gloves Nitrile Latex H.S.| 11185371000 box
30ALT1. NITRILE GLOVE "PANTERA" SYNMAX 70% NI VASTMED  VMGLESYN1O 1£:05 each
30ALT1 VGlove aka VRG Khai Hoan, Meet with the r VGlove aka VF VGloveO1 _ 1€:05 each
30 ALTL $14.40 per box of 100; $144.00 per case, FQ VRG Khai Hoa 1000 box
30 ALTL 30000 SERIES POWDER FREE NITRILE EXAM Shamrock 30313 16405 each
30 ALTL Nitrle Examination Gloves,with FDA S10KK Intco Medical NGPF7003 1405 each
30 ALTL MILVGLCs, Vinvl Gloves, 2.7 mil. Powder Fr, Condor a4 1000 case
30 ALTL 600SPFLG-Glove Skinshield Powder Free Nil TopGlove 16405 each
31 Nitrle Gloves, Powder Free, Latex Free, Extr 1E405 each
3LALT1 NITRILE GLOVE "PANTERA” SYNMAX 70% NI VASTMED  VMGLBSYN1O 1E:05 each
31ALT1| 1118539 Criterion Exam Gloves Nitrle Latex H.S.. 1118539 1111 box
31ALTI VGlove aka Meet with the r VGlove aka Vi VGlove0l  1€+05 each
31ALT1 $14.40 per box of 100; $144.00 per case, FQ VRG Khai Hoa, 1000 box
31ALT Nitrile Examination Gloves with FDA STOKCK Intce Medical NGPF7004 _1€105 each
31ALTL MI-VGHL:Cs, Vin| Gloves, 2.7 mil, Powder £ Condor 38443 1000 case
3LALT1 6005Pf Powder Free Nit TopGlove 16105 each
32 Hand Sanitizer, >=60% Alcohol (ethanoll, 8 ( 1000, each
32 ALTL ProGuard 70% Ethanol 100% made in Califo_Pac-Dent, Inc. 82012 1000 _each
32ALTL eluo hand sanitizer gel 8.0z bottle 75% Ethy eluo eluog 1000 each
32 ALTL VASTMED HAND SANITIZER SCENT FREE 75¢ VASTMED  VMHS. 1000 _each
32ALTL 5906751 Purell Instant Hand Sanitizer 8 oz Gojolnd 965212 1000 box
32 ALTL SBX77141CT SOAP itizer, 8oz F SOAPBOX  SBX77141CT 24 case
33 Wand Sanitizer, >=60% Alcohol (ethanoll, 16 1000 each
33ALT1] HAND SANITIZER 75% ALCOHOL 160Z PUMI VASTMED  VMHS 1000 each
33ALT1 elyo hand sanitizer gel 16.9 0z with pume 7. eluo. eluol6s 1000 each
33ALT1 proGuard 70% Ethanol 100% made in Califo_Pac-Dent, Inc, 82016 1000 each
33T 1 er 540 mL_Certus Medic: 6966M1PM 1000 bottle
33ALT1 ] Liquid Hand Sanitizer (12 Pack) FDA-approw: Nexvoo. 1000 _each
34 Hand Sanitizer, >=60% Alcohol (ethanoll, 1 500..._gallon
34 ALTL 1 Liter / 1000ML bottle with pume gel, 65% Guangzhou M HS10033 500 mi
34 ALTL HAND SANITIZER 75% ALCOHOL, 1 GALLON VASTMED __ VMHS 500, gallon
34 ALTL Proguard 70% Ethanol 100% made in Calfor Pac-Dent, Inc. 82128 500, gallon
34 ALT2 Quantities at pricing i either 432 or 576.dy 432 gallon
34 ALTL elyo hand sanitizer gel 8.0z bottle 75% Ethy eluo eluog 500 gallon
34 ALT2 elyo hand sanitizer gel 16,9 0z with pume 7. eluo eluol6s 500 gallon
34 ALTL Quantities at pricing s either 432 or 576.dy 576 gallon
34 ALTL Nexvoo 4 gallon hand sanitizer $70.00 each Nexvoo 500 callon

No Award Line 7.9, 21, 22, 23.24. 25.35.36.
#Vendor could not honor price for contract term.

2020289
Draft document until award
10/15/2020

37.38

500873

No Bid

50,095

No Bid

50,095

No Bid

50,095

No Bid
50,095

No Bid

$187

No Bid

$265

No Bid

1480

$873.00

Not to Spec

Not to Spec

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

50,095

$950.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No 8id

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

5023

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$2300.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

5012

5380.00

Not to Spec

$1,200.00

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No Bid

No 8id

No Bid

5269

$1,490.00

$2,690.00

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No Bid

No 8id

No 8id

$599

$5.990.00

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No 8id

No Bid

No Bid

NoBid

No Bid

No Bid

No 8id

No Bid

$11.00

$1,200.00

$5,500.00

No 8id

No 8id

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

No 8id

5425

5475

$4,250.00

$4750.00)

No 8id

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

5200

$3.00

$13.50

$2,000.00

$3,000.00

$6750.00

NoBid

NoBid

Noid

NoBid

NoBid

s214

$315

$14.63

$2140.00

$3150.00

$7315.00
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Line #

Tri-Tech Forensics Inc

Total Price

$12,950.00
Extended

Beacom Energy, Inc

Total Price

$13,680.00
Extended

Nine Band Brewing Co.

Total Price
Unit

516,775.00
Extended

Wedicaleshop Inc.

$16,800.00
Extended

Future Stitch Inc

$16,900.00
Extended

‘Amplify Americas LLC

Total price
Unit

$19,840.00
Extended

Frida

Total Price
Unit

$21,985.00
Extended

MROSupply.com (Los Angeles

Total Price
Unit

$24,840.00
Extended

Maxi Aids, Inc.

$25,192.00
Extended

Total Price|__$25,765.00
Unit Extended

Custom Chs d Coatings
$29,500.00

Extended

Zho

u
Total Price

uc
$30,200.00
Extended

Proworks
Total Price
Unit

$33,500.00
Extended

‘Aviationy LLC DBA: My Medical

Total Price

$34,410.00
Extended

IMAGINE MEDICAL
Total Price
Unit

$35,640.00
Extended

Henry Schein Inc

Total Price |

Unit

$37.428.00
Extended

JonD
Total Price |
Unit

1AM
1A
1A
1AM

MM
2MM1
2MM
2MT1

Es
3ATL
3ATL
3AT1

aam
s
aATL
4AUTL

SAUTL
SAUTL

6ALTL
6ALTL
6ALTL
6ALTL

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No Bid

No Bid

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No Bid

No Bid

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No Bid

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

NoBid

NoBid

No 8id

No Bid

No 8id

NoBid

NoBid

No 8id

No 8id

No Bid

No 8id

NoBid

No Bid

No 8id

No 8id

NoBid

No 8id

Noid

NoBid

No 8id

No 8id

NoBid

No 8id

Noid

NoBid

$34.83

BALTL
BALTL
BALTL
BALTL
BALTL
BALTL

10ALT1
10ALT1
10ALT1
10ALT1
10ALT1
n
1A
1A
1A
1A
1A
12
1211
1271
1271
1271
13
1BATL
1BATL
1BATL
1BATL

1811
1811
1811
15
15AT1
15AT1
15AT1
16
16ALT1
16ALT1
17
171
171
18
18ALTL
1BALTL
18ALTL
1BALTL
18ALTL
1BALTL
18ALTL
18ALT1

19AT1
2
20ALT1
20AT1
20AT1
20AT1
20 ALTL

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

52000

125

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$8,000.00

5125000

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$42.00

$42.00

$16,800.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$338

$16,900.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

1950

s125

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$7,800.00

$1,25000

No Bid

No Bid

$4043  $16172.00
5795 $7,950.00
535 $1,070.00

$5.35

No 8id

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No 8id

No Bid

No 8id

No Bid

No 8id

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No 8id

No Bid

No 8id

No Bid

No 8id

No Bid

No 8id

No Bid

No Bid

No 8id

No Bid

No 8id

No Bid

$48.00

$250

No 8id

No Bid

No 8id

519,200.00

$2,500.00

No Bid

NoBid

No 8id

NoBid

No 8id

No Bid

No 8id

No Bid

No 8id

$65.00

$3.00

526,000.00

$3,000.00

No 8id

NoBid

No 8id

No Bid

No 8id

No Bid

No 8id

5279

5279

5279

$11.80

s

$13950.00

$4,720.00

$1,110.00

No Bid

NoBid

No 8id

NoBid

No 8id

No Bid

No 8id

No Bid

No 8id

$33.00

5299

51320000

$2,990.00

No Bid

NoBid

No Bid

NoBid

$53.76

$5018

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$82.84

$13.72

$91.70

$67.83

$61.30

3.8

536,680.00

768,00

No Bid

NoBid
No Bid
NoBid
No Bid
No Bid
$55.55
s261
No Bid
099
No Bid
s125
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$790.00[No Bid $1,450.00[No 8id $990.00 [No 8id $1,500.00 [ No 8id $680.00 $1,950.00No 8id
26AT1 145
26ALT1 $2095
26ALT1
26ALT1

2 5037 $3,700.00 s012 $1,200.00 | No 8id No Bid No Bid No 8id No 8id 5028 $2,800.00| No 8id s0.12 $1,200.00[No 8id 5070 $7,000.00 5045 $4,500.00 [ No 8id Nosid No8id NoBid
27Am 50088
27Am
27Am
27Am $24.76
27Am
27Am
27Am s4aa.00

28 NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No 8id No8id No8id No8id Noid Nosid Nosid
28AT1 $9.09
28AT1
28AT1 501325
28AT1
28AT1 5016
28AT1
28AT1

NoBid NoBid NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No 8id No 8id NoBid NoBid NoBid Noid Noid
2911 $9.09 -
2911
29AT1 $0.1325
2911
2911 5016
2911
2911 $55.28
29AT1

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No 8id No 8id NoBid NoBid No Bid NoBid
30AT1 $9.09
30AT1
30AT1 501325
30ALT1
30ALT1 5016
30ALT1
30ALT1 $55.28
30ALT1

31 NoBid NoBid NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No8id No8id No8id Noid NoBid NoBid
311
311 $9.09 * see footnote
31Am $0.1325
31T
311
311 $s5.28
311

32 Nosid $250 5250000 $229 $2290.00 | No 8id No Bid No 8id .49 $4,490.00 $200 $2,000.00 | No 8id $215 $2,150.00 [ No 8id No 8id No8id No8id No8id No Bid No Bid
211
211
211
211 5275
3211 513333

33 NoBid $294 $2940.00 $399 $3,990.00 | No 8id No Bid $389 $3,890.00 | No 8id $3.00 $3,000.00| No 8id $317 $3,170.00| No 8id No Bid NoBid No8id No8id NoBid 488
33ALT1
33ALT1
33ALT1
33ALT1 $6.87
33ALT1

No 8id 51250 625000 52099 $10,495.00|No Bid No Bid No 8id $3499  $17.495.00 $14.00 $7,000.00 | No 8id $2995  $14975.00 $4500  $22,500.00|No 8id No 8id No 8id $35.00  $17,500.00| No Bid $1857
3aAT1
3aT1
3aT1
3812
3aT1
3am2
38T
34 ALT1

2020289 Addendum 1- Page 4



n,inc BSN Sports, LLC (Varsity Brands CCFace Shields Twin Hil (Twin Hil i Atex NG Titan safety Products interboro Packaging Corp. Apollo Med Health Fortes Health (Fortes Investment | ) Trading Group Inc, DBA We HUJAYA SUPPLY Lipeng Xue DBA: Moonlight Sun Scientific,inc Medco Supply Company | _PPE TRADE AND SUPPORT LLC
5$39193.00 Total Price| __ $40,000.00| Total Price| __$40,750.00 541.410.00] Total Price| __$42.713.00 e|  546,207.00]  TotalPrice|  $58.30000|  TotalPrice|  $59.150.00]  TotalPrice|  $60,000.00(  TotalPrice|  $64,150.00|  TotalPrice| _ $64.290.00] TotalPrice|  $67.500.00|  TotalPrice| _ $69,20000]  TotalPrice| _ $70.881.00|  TotalPrice| _ $71,700.00| Total Price| _ $74,269.00] Total Price| __$74.720.00]

Line# | Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1 No Bid No Bid No id No id No id No id No id No id No id No id No id No id No8id No8id No 8id No8id

1AL
1AL
1AL
1AL
2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No id No id No id No8id
2Mm1
2MT1
2MT1
2AT1
3 No Bid No Bid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No id No id No id Noid
3AT
3AT
3AT
3Am
4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No gid No Bid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No id No id Noid No8id
aam
s
s
a1
5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No id No id No id No8id
sATL
sATL
6 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No sid No sid Noid Noid Noid Noid
6T
6ATL
6ATL

6ALTL

BALTL
BALTL
BALTL
BALTL
BALTL
BALTL

$12,000.00 [ No 8id $15,750.00 [ No 8id $8950.00

10ALT1 $315

1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No 8id No 8id No8id No8id $240  $12,000.00|NoBid No8id $315  $15750.00|NoBid 5179 $8950.00

1A $315

2 No Bid $375  $18750.00|No Bid No Bid No 8id No 8id $339  $16950.00| No Bid No 8id $575  $28,750.00|NoBid No 8id No8id $315  $15750.00|NoBid 5189 $9,450.00

1271 $315

1B No Bid $375  $18750.00|NoBid No Bid No Bid No 8id $342  $17,100.00|NoBid No Bid No Bid No8id No8id No8id $315  $15750.00|NoBid 5189 $9,450.00

1BATL $315

1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No 8id No 8id No 8id No 8id No 8id No 8id No 8id 5215 $10750.00,

15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No 8id No 8id No 8id No Bid No8id No8id $215  $10750.00,

16 $22,22000 $10000  $40,000.00| No Bid $5140  $20560.00 s18.47 $7,388.00 $4843  $19,372.00|NoBid No 8id No Bid $3975  $15900.00|No 8id $4800  $19,20000|No 8id $2999  $11,996.00(No8id $8571  $34284.00 $14.95 $5,980.00
iy 52,610.00| No Bid $325 5325000 275 $2,750.00 | No Bid No Bid No 8id s185 $1,850.00| No Bid No 8id $225 $2,250.00 $4.00 $4,000.00 | No 8id 5299 $2,990.00 5255 $2,550.00 o Bid NoBid

18 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No 8id No 8id No 8id No 8id No 8id No8id

19 $198.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No 8id No Bid No 8id 5395 $790.00 [ No Bid No 8id No8id $4.00 $800.00 o 8id NoBid

1AL ot to Spe
20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No 8id No 8id No 8id No 8id No 8id No 8id 5135 5270.00 [ No 8id

20AT1 ot to Spe
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$4,750.00 | No 8id $4,280.00 No 8id $1,750.00[No 8id $225000 $2,250.00 [ No 8id $850.00No 8id $490.00

26AT1
26ALT1
26ALT1
26ALT1
27 NoBid NoBid 014 $1,400.00 | No 8id 5058 $5,800.00 5018 $1,800.00 5023 $2,300.00| No 8id 5035 $3,500.00 5060 $6,000.00 030 $3,000.00 5035 $3,500.00 [ No 8id 5045 $4,500.00 50575 $5750.00 s0.10 $1,000.00
27Am
27Am
27Am 5018
27Am
27Am
27Am
27Am
2 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1413 $3532.50 | No 8id 5017 $4,250.00 [ No 8id 5024 $6,000.00 017 $4,250.00 [ No 8id No8id No8id 015 $3,750.00 [ No 8id No8id Nosid
28AT1
28AT1
28AT1
28AT1
28AT1
28AT1
28AT1
2 NoBid NoBid No 8id 501413 $3532.50 | No 8id 5017 425000 No 8id 024 $6,000.00 5017 $4,250.00 [ No 8id Noid 5020 $5,000.00 5015 $3,750.00 [ No 8id Nosid Noid
2911
2911
2911
2911
2911
2911
2911
29AT1
30 No Bid No Bid No Bid 501413 $14,130.00|Nosid 5017 $17,000.00|No8id 5024 $2400000 5017 $17,000.00|NoBid No8id 5020 $20000.00] 5015 $15000.00NoBid No8id Nosid
30AT1
30AT1
30AT1
30ALT1
30ALT1
30ALT1
30ALT1
30ALT1
3 NoBid NoBid No Bid $01413  $14,130.00|NoBid $017  $17,000.00|No Bid 5024 $24,00000 $017  $17,000.00|NoBid No8id 5020 $20000.00] 015 $15000.00NoBid Noid NoBid
311
311
311
31T
311
311
311
2 No Bid No Bid No 8id No 8id 5423 $423000 5125 4125000 $695 $6,950.00 No 8id No 8id No Bid No 8id No 8id 5490 $4,900.00 [ No 8id No8id No Bid
211 Not to
211 5125
211
211
3211
3 $4,880.00 | No Bid NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid $275 $2,750.00 | No 8id No Bid No Bid No8id No8id No8id $6.90 $6900.00No 8id $531 $5310.00No 8id
33ALT1
33ALT1 $275
33ALT1
33ALT1
33ALT1
3 59,285.00 | No Bid No Bid No 8id No 8id 52505 $12,525.00 $2000  $10,000.00|No Bid No 8id No 8id No 8id $2600  $13,00000 $2090  $10450.00 $1099 $5,495.00 [ No 8id $1981 $9,905.00 | No 8id
3aAT1
3aT1
3aT1
3812 $18.50
3aT1 $2000
3am2 52083
38T $18.50
34 ALT1
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Line #

Pac-Dent, Inc.
$74,755.00
Extended

Mavich

$75,306.00

Unit Extended

Cartagena Sun DBA Be Ready

Total Price
Unit

578,205.00
Extended

Urban N:

Total Price
Unit

579,050.00
Extended

Total Price
Unit

$81,330.00
Extended

Total Price
Unit

$86,250.00
Extended

ity
$88,650.00
Extended

vevival new york

Total Price
Unit

$90,500.00
Extended

RM Medical Uniforms LLC

Total Price
Unit

$98,650.00
Extended

Hans Development Group, LLC

Total rice

$100,050.00
Extended

Tonized LLC

$100,699.00
Extended

Total Price

Aly Texas
$101,750.00
Extended

VASWANI INC
Total Price

$101,790.00

Unit Extended

SCHOOL HEALTH
$108,523.75
Extended

Total Price
Unit

Front Line Medical Supplies

Total Price
Unit

5108,208.00
Extended

CATALYST PR INC
Total Price |
Unit

JAB TRADING
Total Price |
Unit

5115,922.00
Extended

1AM
1A
1A
1AM

MM
2MM1
2MM
2MT1

Es
3ATL
3ATL
3AT1

aam
s
aATL
4AUTL

SAUTL
SAUTL

6ALTL
6ALTL
6ALTL
6ALTL

BALTL
BALTL
BALTL
BALTL
BALTL
BALTL

10ALT1
10ALT1
10ALT1
10ALT1
10ALT1

1A
1A
1A
1A
1A
12
1211
1271
1271
1271
13
1BATL
1BATL
1BATL
1BATL

1811
1811
1811
15
15AT1
15AT1
15AT1

16ALT1
16ALT1
17
171
171
18
18ALTL
1BALTL
18ALTL
1BALTL
18ALTL
1BALTL
18ALTL
18ALT1

19AT1
2
20ALT1
20AT1
20AT1
20AT1
20 ALTL

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$995

$249  $12,450.00

$249  $12.45000
$18,000.00

$139 5139000

$7.49

$5.95 $1,190.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$144.94

$5.60

$5.25

$57,976.00

$5,600.00

5105000

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$139

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

489

489

No Bid

$289

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$3475.00

$24,450.00

$24,450.00

$2,890.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$325

425

425

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$16250.00

$16,250.00

$21,250.00

$21,250.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$375

$375

No Bid

No Bid

125

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$18750.00

$18,750.00

$28900.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

5150

$89.00

$200

$375

$3,750.00

$35,600.00

$750.00

No Bid

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$290

$3.00

$3.00

$315

$315

$14,500.00

$14,500.00

$15,000.00

$15,000.00

$15,750.00

$15,750.00

No Bid

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No Bid

No Bid

$2.00
$3.00
$3.00
5425
425

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$10,000.00

510000.00

$15,000.00

$15,000.00

$21,250.00

$21,250.00

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

188

s198

s198

s19

s208

No 8id

No Bid

No 8id

No Bid

No 8id

$9,400.00

$9,400.00

$9,900.00

$9,900.00

$9,900.00
Not to Spec

$10,400.00
Not to 5p

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No 8id

No 8id

s199

5199

$9,950.00

$9,950.00

$9,950.00

Not to Spec

$17.99

099

$3.99

$7,196.00

$990.00

$798.00

No 8id

No Bid

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No Bid

No Bid

No 8id

No Bid

No 8id

No Bid

No 8id

No Bid

No 8id

No Bid

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

No 8id

NoBid

No 8id

No Bid

$55.00

5299

No 8id

No Bid

No 8id

522,000.00

$2,990.00

No 8id

No 8id

No Bid

No 8id

NoBid

NoBid

50.1077 $269.25

t to Spec

$8,900.00
Not to Spec

NoBid
$5.0731 52586550
NoBid
No 8id
No Bid
$85.00  $34,000.00
5186 $1860.00
No 8id
5167 $334.00
Not to Spec
No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

No Bid

No 8id

NoBid

No Bid

No Bid

5250
5360
5360
No 8id
No Bid
$3000
5083
No 8id
484
No 8id

No 8id

No 8id

NoBid

No 8id

Noid

NoBid

$12,500.00

$12,500.00

51800000

$18,000.00

512,000.00

830,00

5968.00

No Bid

$225

5249

5249

$3.10

$3.20

$34.78

s136

5025

285

No 8id

No 8id

NoBid

No 8id

Noid

NoBid

$1,250.00 [ No 8id

$11,250.00

$11,250.00 $390

$12,450.00 | No 8id

$12,450.00 | No 8id

515,500.00 | No 8id

516,000.00  No 8id

5$13912.00 $55.00

$1,360.00

350

525000 No 8id

$570.00 [ No 8id

No Bid
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5295000 No 8id $490.00 5125000 $3,02000 $3,500.00 $3,000.00No 8id $1,150.00[No 8id $990.00 $1,500.00 $1,785.00 $2750.00 $1130.00

26AT1
26ALT1
26ALT1 $350
26ALT1 350
2 5036 $3,600.00 5057 $5,700.00 5065 $6,500.00 5028 5280000 5042 $420000 $350  $3500000 $190  $19,000.00|NoBid 5050 $5,000.00 5025 $2,500.00No 8id 5035 $3,500.00 5025 $2,500.00 50357 $3570.00 5015 $1,500.00 021 $2100.00 5069
27Am
27Am
27Am
27Am
27Am $250
27Am
27Am
28 NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No 8id No 8id $0115 $2875.00 $0145 $3625.00 $0135 $3375.00 5016 $4,000.00 [ No 8id Noid Nosid 0.6
28AT1
28AT1
28AT1
28AT1 1440
28AT1
28AT1
28AT1 $1800
NoBid NoBid NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id $0115 $2875.00 $0145 $3,625.00 $0135 $3375.00 5016 $4,000.00No 8id NoBid Nosid 016

2911
2911
2911
2911 $14.40
2911
2911
2911
29AT1

No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No 8id No 8id No 8id No 8id No 8id $0115  $11,500.00 $0155  $15500.00 $0135  $13,500.00 016 $16000.00|NoBid Noid Nosid 0.6
30AT1
30AT1
30AT1
30ALT1 $14.0
30ALT1
30ALT1
30ALT1
30ALT1
31 NoBid NoBid NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No 8id $0115  $11,500.00 $0155  $15500.00 $0135  $13,50000 016 $16000.00NoBid Noid NoBid 5016
311
311
311
31T 1440
311
311
311
32 Nosid 498 $4,980.00 | No 8id No 8id $771 771000 $200 $2,000.00| No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id 5209 $2,090.00 [ No 8id 350 $3,500.00 5278 $2780.00 $4.00 $4,000.00 $3.42 $342000 5455
211 $098  NottosSpec
211
211
211
3211
33 NoBid NoBid NoBid No Bid No Bid $4.00 $4,000.00| No 8id No Bid No 8id No8id $3.09 $3,090.00| No 8id 5450 $4,500.00 $8.02 $8020.00 675 $6750.00 [ No 8id NoBid
33ALT1
33ALT1
33ATL $5.95
33ALT1
33ALT1 20000
3 s15.95 57,975.00 | No Bid No 8id No 8id No 8id 1350 $6,750.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id $14.99 $7,495.00 $2500  $12,500.00 $2400  $12,00000 $3028  $17,14000 $2000  $10,000.00|No 8id No Bid
3aAT1
3aT1
3aT1 1495
3812
3aT1
3am2
38T
34 ALT1 $70.00
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TINDUSTRIES | Max, LLC DBA: Max Protection, pany Frog Mask e P US Health Express Corp Think Uweport Lic Aiden inc. Unipak Corp. ‘Ace Uniforms Nationwide Medical Surgical Inc | Mingtel Inc DBA: Azpen Kryptek LEAF | PIONEER PRODUCTS INC
$118.450.00]  TotalPrice|  $119394.00(  Total Price|  $123,772.00| Total Price| _$124,100.00 $131,415.00 e[  $133.995.00]  TotalPrice| $134,44000  TotalPrice| $142,525.00]  TotalPrice|  $148,805.00(  Total Price| _ $156,406.00| Total Price| _ $168,110.00] TotalPrice| _$174,150.00| Total Price| _ $180,445.00] Total Price| _ $190,065.00| _Total Price| _$195,130.00| _Total Price| _ $197.012.00] _Total Price| _5205,211.00]

Line# | Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1 No Bid No Bid No id No id No id No id No id No id $770  $19,25000(NoBid No id No id No8id No8id No 8id No8id

1AL
1AL $7.00
1AL
1AL
2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No gid No gid No gid $770  $19,25000NoBid No gid No gid No id No id No id No8id
2Mm1
2MT1 $7.00
2MT1
2AT1
3 No Bid No Bid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid $770  $19,25000|NoBid No gid No gid No id No id No id Noid
3AT
3AT $7.00
3AT
3Am
4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No gid No Bid No gid No gid No gid $770  $19,25000NoBid No gid No gid No id No id Noid No8id
aam
s $7.00
s
a1
5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No id No id No id No8id
sATL
sATL
6 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No sid No sid Noid Noid Noid Noid
6T
6ATL
6ATL
6ALTL

$300.00[No Bid

BALTL
BALTL 054
BALTL
BALTL
BALTL
BALTL

$19,500.00 $13,500.00 | No Bid $30,000.00 5195 $9,750.00 $14,750.00 $17,250.00 $13,750.00 $11,250.00 $9,500.00 $10,000.00 $23,750.00 52000000 514,450.00 $17,350.00 516050.00 $17,750.00

1 $19,500.00 $270  $13500.00|No Bid $600  $30,000.00|No Bid $295  $14750.00 $345  $17,25000 275 $1375000 $225  $11,25000 5190 $9,500.00 $200  $10000.00 5475 $2375000 5400 $20000.00] 5289 $1445000, $347  $17.35000, $321  $16050.00, $355  $17,750.00,

2 $365  $18,250.00|NoBid $600  $30,000.00 $320  $16000.00 $410  $20500.00 $350  $17,500.00 275 $1375000 $225  $11,25000 5265 $1325000 $325  $1625000 $490  $24,50000 5425 $2125000 $318  $1590000 $347  $1735000 $321  $16050.00, 5365 $18250.00,

1B $365  $18,250.00|NoBid $600  $30,000.00 $320  $16000.00 $410  $20500.00 $350  $17,500.00 275 $1375000 $225  $11,25000 5265 $1325000 $325  $1625000 $490  $24,50000 5425 $2125000, $318  $15900.00, $347  $17.35000, $321  $16050.00, $365  $18250.00,

1 No Bid No 8id No 8id $350  $17,500.00|No Bid $380  $19,000.00|No Bid $225  $11,250.00| No Bid $460  $23,000.00 $550  $27,500.00 $475  $2375000 $392  $19600.00 5385  $1925000 5493 $2465000, $395  $19750.00,
15 No Bid No Bid No Bid $350  $17,500.00|No Bid $380  $19,000.00|NoBid $225  $11,250.00|NoBid $460  $2300000 $550  $27,500.00 $475  $23,75000, $392  $19,600.00, 5385 $1925000, 5493 2465000, $395  $1975000,

16 $22,000.00 $3400  $13600.00 52360 59,440.00 | No Bid $2200 $8,800.00 $7000  $28000.00 52000 $8,000.00 $3765  $15060.00|No Bid No 8id $15.00 $6,000.00 [ No Bid No 8id $3995  $15980.00 $18.50 $7,400.00 $2500  $10,000.00 $3999  $15996.00
iy 5350000 098 $980.00 $103 51,030.00 | No Bid $1.99 $1,990.00 $235 $2350.00 $0.70 $700.00 145 4145000 145 4145000 188 $1,880.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 5190 $1,900.00 | No 8id 5297 $2,970.00 [ No 8id s177 $1,770.00 $3.00 $3,000.00
18 s012 $12000 $0.10 $100.00 | No Bid No Bid 032 $320.00 [No Bid No 8id No 8id No 8id s011 $110.00 [ No Bid No 8id No 8id No 8id 50.40 400,00 No 8id

18ALTL Not to Spec Not to'sp

18ALTL 5018
1BALTL 030

19 $224 $a48.00 $224 $448.00 [ No Bid No Bid No Bid $120 $240.00No Bid No 8id $3.49 $698.00 o Bid No 8id No Bid No8id 5450 $900.00 5438 $876.00 [ No 8id
19AT1 Not to Spec
20 198 $39.00 s182 $364.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No 8id No 8id $329 $658.00No Bid No 8id No 8id No 8id No 8id $3.08 $616.00 [ No 8id
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52550000 No 8id $4,840.00 | No 8id $800.00 $950.00 $1,000.00 $700.00 $1,180.00 $1850.00 $1,750.00 [ No 8id $2890.00 $1,890.00 $480.00 $3420.00 $990.00

26ALT1
26ALT1
26ALT1
26ALT1
27 $6,900.00 5038 $3800.00 5085 $8,500.00 s041 $4,100.00 $015 $1,500.00 025 $2,500,00| No 8id 5017 $1,700.00 5029 $2,900.00 5025 $2,500.00 s015 $1,500.00 5035 $3,500.00No Bid 5019 $1,900.00 5018 $1,800.00 5045 $4,500.00 5030 $3,000.00
7M1
7M1 012
7M1
7M1
27Am1
27Am1
7M1
i 54,000.00 50095 $2375.00 013 53,250.00| No Bid 50109 52,725.00| No Bid No gid No gid 5012 $3,000.00 | No Bid 5007 $1,750.00 No 8id No sid Noid 5016 $4,000.00 5016 $4,000.00 No 8id
28ATL ee footn
28ATL
28ATL
28AUTL
28ATL
28ATL 5016
28AUTL
2 $4,000.00 50095 $2375.00 $013 $3,250,00| No Bid 50109 $2,725.00| No Bid No gid No gid 012 $3,000.00| No 8id s007 $1,750.00{No Bid No gid No id 5016 $4,000.00 5016 $4,000.00 No 8id
29AT1 ee footn e
29AT1
29AT1
29AT1
29AT1
29AT1 5016
29AT1
29AT1
30 $16,000.00 50095 $9,500.00 $013  $13,000.00|NoBid 50109 $10900.00|NoBid No gid No gid 5012 $12,00000NoBid 5007 $7,000.00 No 8id No sid Noid 5016 $1600000 5016 $1600000No 8id
30AUTL
30AUTL
30AUTL
30AUTL
30AUTL
30AUTL 5016
30AUTL
30ALTL
E $16,000.00 50095 $9,500.00 $013  $13,00000|NoBid 50109 $10900.00|NoBid No gid No gid $012  $12,00000|NoBid $007  $7,00000|NoBid No gid Noid 5016 $1600000 5016 $16000.00No Bid
31ATL * see footnote
31ATL
31ATL
31ATL
31ATL 5016
31ATL
31ATL
2 54,550.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid 195 51.950.00 185 51.850.00 5200 5$2,000.00 5499 $4.990.00 195 51.950.00 5229 $2,290.00 No Bid 5325 $3,250.00 5485 $4,850.00 5255 $2,550.00 5297 $297000 5463 $4,630.00 5450 $4,500.00
32ATL
32AUTL
32AUTL
32AUTL
32AUTL
33 NoBid NoBid No Bid $310 $3,100.00 270 $2,700.00 250 $250000 $6.65 $6.650.00 $285 $2850.00 $334 $3340.00 675 $6750.00 $5.50 $5,500.00 5696 $6,960.00 5390 $3,900.00 538 $5,380.00 56.06 $6,060.00 850 $8,500.00
33ATL
33ATL
33ATL
33AUTL
33ATL
u No Bid 53630 $18.150.00|NoBid 51855 $9275.00 s12.15 56,075.00| No 8id $2535  $12675.00 51675 58,375.00| No 8id No 8id $17.00 $8,500.00 $2999  $14995.00 $345  $11725.00 $690  $13450.00 $248  $1124000 $19.95 $9,975.00
3AUTL $499 Mot toSpec
3AUTL
38ALTL
38AT2
3ALTL
38AT2
3AUTL
34 ALTL

tnote

= see footnote

tnote
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Anixter Inc Premium Contractor Solution Aliron International, Inc Globaitek Performance Safety Group | Rubie’s Costume Company, nc Wooter Apparelnc. Ormnibus Trading Corp inc. dba Nextt GlobalGeeks Inc EDG Sales International, LLC | _Florida Imports Experts Inc Cintas First Aid and Safety VSRS, LLC iic [ VERTEX PAC) PUES | World OF |
Total Price | $209,090.00 __Total Price| _ $229.600.00| __Total Price| _ $232.700.00| _Total Price| _$235.425.00] __ Total Price | _ $244,666.00| Total Price| _ $246,590.00| Total Price| _$257.615.00] _Total Price| _ $286,780.00 $292.385.00]  TotalPrice|  $325,386.00(  Total Price| _ $326,180.00| Total Price| _ $335.790.00] __Total Price| _ $337.445.50| __Total Price| _ $358,340.00] _Total Price| _$443,350.00] __Total Price| _$460,550.00| __Total Price |
Line # Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended i Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit
$1042  $26050.00|NoBid No Bid No id No id No id No id 52600 $6500000 $950  $23,75000(NoBid No id No id No8id No8id $1100  $27,500.00 $500 51250000 $1550
1AL Not to Spec
1AL
1AL
1AL
2 51042 $26050.00|NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No gid $2600  $65000.00 $950  $23,75000(NoBid No gid No gid No id No id $1100  $27,500.00 $500 51250000 $15.50
2Mm1
2MT1
2MT1
2AT1
3 51042 $26050.00|NoBid No Bid No gid No gid No gid No gid $2600  $6500000 $950  $23,75000|NoBid No gid No gid No id No id $1100  $27,50000 $500  $12,50000 $15.50
3AT Not to Spec
3AT
3AT
3Am
4 51042 $26050.00|NoBid No Bid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid $950  $23,75000(NoBid No gid No gid No id No id $1100  $27,500.00 $55.00  $137,500.00 $15.50
aam
s
s
a1
5 Noid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No gid No gid No gid $799  $19,975.00|Noid No gid No id No id No id $500  $12,50000 $14.50
sATL Not to Spec Not to spec
sATL
6 5078 51,950.00| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No gid No gid No gid No gid No gid No sid 0051 512750 No 8id Noid 5012 5300.00 $3.00
6T Not to Spec Not to Spec
6ATL
6ATL
6ALTL

BALTL
BALTL
BALTL
BALTL
BALTL
BALTL

10ALT1
10ALT1
10ALT1
10ALT1
10ALT1
1 Nosid
1A
1A
1A
1A
1A
12 Nosid
1211
1271
1271
1271
1B NoBid
1BATL
1BATL
1BATL
1BATL

No Bid
1811
1811
1811

15 NoBid
15AT1
15AT1
15AT1

16ALT1
16ALT1

17 NoBid
171
171

18 NoBid
18ALTL
1BALTL
18ALTL
1BALTL
18ALTL
1BALTL
18ALTL
18ALT1

19AT1

20ALT1
20AT1
20AT1
20AT1
20 ALTL

$115.00

$305

$215

5135000

$46,000.00

$610.00

$430.00

No Bid

$19,250.00

$385  $19,250.00

$27,500.00

$550  $27,500.00

$750  $37,500.00

$750  $37,500.00

5200 59,600.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

375000

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

$7500  $30,000.00

$1950  $19,500.00

5075 $750.00

$150.00

Not to Spe

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$15,000.00

$300  $15000.00
$350  $17,500.00
$350  $17,500.00
$500  $25000.00
$500  $25000.00
$5000  $20,000.00
$175 5175000
$3.00 $600.00

$19,990.00

$3.998  $19,330.00

$4.298  $21,430.00

$4.208  $21,430.00

$5798  $28,980.00

$5798  $28,930.00

$7999  $31,996.00

$199 5199000
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

$3,000.00

No Response

$27,500.00

$550  $27,500.00
$650  $32,500.00
$650  $32,500.00
$750  $37,500.00
$750  $37,500.00
No Bid
No Bid
5024 $240.00
No Response
No Bid
No Bid

5250.00

Not to Spec

No Bid

No Bid
$650  $32,500.00
$650  $32,500.00
$700  $35000.00
$700  $35000.00

51600 $6,400.00
$1.70 $1,700.00
$9.09 $9,090.00
$5.50 $1,100.00

No Bid

No Bid

$3.00

$3.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$2800

$238

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$15,000.00

$15,000.00

$11,200.00

$2,380.00

No Bid

No Bid

$250

$290

$290

$4.20

$420

$35.00

$1.90

5027

5975.00

$12,500.00

$12,500.00

$14,500.00

$14,500.00

$21,000.00

$21,000.00

$14,000.00

$1,900.00

527000

No 8id

5875.00

$399  $19950.00
$399  $19950.00
s499  $24950.00
$499  $24,950.00
5499 $24,950.00
$4.99 $1,996.00

Not to Spec
$250 $2,500.00
5035 $350.00
$8.00 $1,600.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
$370  $18500.00
$370  $18500.00

No 8id

No Bid
$12.95 $5,180.00
5085 $850.00

No 8id

No Bid

No 8id

537,500.00

§750  $37,500.00]
$750  $37,50000
§750  $37,500.00]
§750  $37,500.00
$750  $37,500.00,
$3600  $14400.00
$170 $1,700.00)
No 8id
5385 $770.00
5385 577000

$860.00

51625000

$325  $16250.00]
$522 $26100.00
$522 $26100.00]
$921  $46050.00
$921  $46050.00]
$65.00  $26,000.00
5350 $3,500.00
S0.052 $52.00
Not to Spec

454 $908.00
$3.49 5698.00

No Bid

s485  $24,25000]

$585  $29250.00

$585  $29250.00]

S450  $22,500.00

$450  $22,500.00]

$5900  $23,600.00

480 $4,800.00)

s0.44 440,00
[ o 8ia
No 8id

$675

$7.00

$7.00

825

825

$42.00

5200

5030

No Bid

No 8id

533,750.00

$33,750.00 $3.00
$35,000.00 $4.00
$35,000.00 $4.00
5$41,250.00 $6.00
$41,250.00 $6.00
516800.00 $78.00
$2,000.00 5125
530000 No 8id
5350
5175

$15,000.00

$15,000.00

5$20000.00

$20000.00

530000.00

$30,000.00

$31,200.00

$1,250.00

70000

5385

5450

5450

$5.50

$5.50

$25.00

5195

5025

5250

$350.00 No 8id

2020289 Addendum 1- Page 11



$3,400.00 | No 8id 5255000 $1,500.00 | No 8id $950.00 $1,100.00 $2,000.00 $1,490.00 $4,500.00 $650.00 $1,250.00 $3,250.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00

26AT1
26ALT1
26ALT1
26ALT1
27 5080 $8,000.00 $0.125 $125000 5055 $5,500.00 017 $1,700.00 No 8id 024 $2,400.00 $0.08 $800.00 037 $3,700.00 5019 $1,900.00) 5020 $2,000.00 50,0975 $975.00 5085 $8,500.00 5024 $2,400.00 5075 $7,500.00 5020 $2,000.00 s0.10 $1,000.00 5030
27Am
27Am
27Am
27Am
27Am
27Am
27Am
2 019 $4,750.00 | No 8id 5020 $5,00000 5015 375000 50199 $4,975.00 | No 8id 500875 $2,187.50 | No 8id 5012 $3,000.00 50.1699 $4,247.50 $1050  $262,500.00 5018 $4,500.00 $0133 $3325.00 5017 $4,250.00 015 $3750.00 014 $3,500.00 0.6
28AT1 e
28AT1
28AT1
28AT1
28AT1
28AT1
28AT1
2 s012 $3,000.00 | No 8id 5020 $5,00000 5015 $3,750.00 $0.199 $4975.00 | No 8id 50,0875 $2,187.50| No 8id s012 $3,000.00) $0.1699 $4,247.50 [ No 8id 018 $4,500.00 $0133 $3325.00 5017 $4250.00 5015 $3,750.00 s0.14 $3,500.00 016
2911 e
2911
2911
2911
2911
2911
2911
29AT1
30 $012 $12,000.00|NoBid 5020 $20,000.00 5015 $15000.00 50199 $19,900.00|No Bid 500875 $8,750.00 [ No 8id 5012 $1200000 501699 $16990.00( NoBid 5018 $18,000.00] 50133 $13300.00 5017 $17,000.00] 5015 $15000.00, 014 $14000.00, 0.6
30AT1 e
30AT1
30AT1
30ALT1
30ALT1
30ALT1
30ALT1
30ALT1
£ $009 $9,000.00 | No 8id $020  $20,000.00 5015 $15000.00 50199 $19,300.00|No Bid 500875 $8,750.00| No 8id 5012 $12,00000] 501699 $16990.00| NoBid 5018 $18,000.00, $0133  $13300.00 5017 $17,000.00, 5015 $15000.00, $014  $14000.00, 5016
311 * see footnote
311
311
31T
311
311
311
32 $390 $3,900.00 | No 8id $850 5850000 $350 $3,500.00 | No 8id $275 $2,750.00 | No 8id No 8id $390 $3,900.00 5499 $4,990.00 [ No 8id 5295 $2950.00 585 $5,850.00 $5.00 $5,000.00 [ No 8id $3.00 $3,000.00 5450
211
211
211
211
3211
33 $625 $6,250.00 | No 8id $1250  $12,500.00 $5.50 $5,500.00 | No 8id $375 375000 $630 $6,300.00 | No 8id 5495 $4.950.00 $699 $6.990.00 $315 $3,150.00 495 $4,950.00 [ No 8id $1200  $12,000.00|No8id $350 $3,500.00 $7.50
33ALT1
33ALT1
33ALT1
33ALT1
33ALT1
4 $850 54,250.00 | No Bid $6000  $30,000.00 $2800  $14,000.00(No Bid $2200  $11,000.00|No 8id No Bid $19.00 $9,500.00 $3499  $17,495.00 $1375 $6875.00 $2200  $11,00000 $35.00  $17,500.00 $4200  $21,000.00|No 8id $15.00 $7,500.00 $35.00
3aAT1 Not to Spec
3aT1
3aT1
3812
3aT1
3am2
38T
34 ALT1
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romations TD&C US LLC Promo Solutions Hinson & Hale Medical ‘Atlas Supply USA, llc ai services Black Knight Medical LLC NAO Global Health LLC Sterlington Medical StatLab Medical Products (SLMP, | _PYRAMID PAPER COMPANY
$479,700.00] Total rice| _ $587,113.00] _Total Price| _$968,705.00 $1,253,500.00 $2,756,000.00 $2.949,740.00] _ Total Price| 53,020,711.00] Total Prce|_53,499,824.00] _Total Price | $4,295,646.00| _Total Price | $8,898,250.00| __Total Price | 16,239,428.00
Line# | Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Extended Extended Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
1 $38,750.00 $1799  $#4975.00 $3625  $90,625.00|NoBid $53,875.00| No Bid $1695  $42375.00| NoBid No Bid $1,00000 5250000000
1Am1 $5.19
1Am1
1Am1
1AT1
2 $38,750.00 $1799  $44975.00 $3625  $90,625.00| NoBid No Bid $2155  $53875.00 | NoBid $1695  $42,375.00|NoBid No Bid $1,00000 5250000000
2am $5.19
2am
2am
2Am1
3 $38,750.00 $1799  $44975.00 $37.25  $93125.00|NoBid No Bid $2155  $53875.00 NoBid $1538  $38450.00 | NoBid No Bid $1,00000 5250000000
3AT1 $5.19
3T
3T
3T
4 $38,750.00 S17.99  sa4975.00 $3825  $95625.00|NoBid No Bid $2155  $53875.00 | NoBid $949  $23,725.00[NoBid No Bid $1,00000 5250000000
aam $5.19
s
s
a1
5 $36,250.00 $2050  $5125000 $155.00  $387,500.00No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1417  $35425.00|NoBid No Bid $1,00000  $2500,000.00
sam $399 ot tospec
sATL
6 $7,500.00| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 134 $3,350.00No Bid $7500  $187,500.00 $1,00000 5250000000
6ALTL 026
6ATL
6ATL 50139
6ALTL

BALTL
BALTL
BALTL
BALTL
BALTL
BALTL

10ALT1
10ALT1
10ALT1
10ALT1
10ALT1

1A
1A
1A
1A
1A

1211
1271
1271
1271

1BATL
1BATL
1BATL
1BATL

1811
1811
1811

15AT1
15AT1
15AT1

16ALT1
16ALT1
17
171
171
18
18ALTL
1BALTL
18ALTL
1BALTL
18ALTL
1BALTL
18ALTL
18ALT1

19AT1

20ALT1
20AT1
20AT1
20AT1
20 ALTL

5375000

$19,250.00

$19,250.00

$22,500.00

$22,500.00

$27,500.00

$27,500.00

$10000.00

5195000

$250.00

$500.00

$299

$5.50

$5.50

$899

$899

51999

$199

$199

$925

$9.99

$2475.00

$14,950.00

$14,950.00

$27,500.00

$27,500.00

$44,950.00

$44,950.00

$7,996.00

5199000

5199000

5185000

51,998.00

$275

$285

$305

$315

$35.00

$185

5032

$395

$135

$5625.00

475000

Not to Spec

$525000

Not to Spec

$13,750.00

$14,250.00

$15,250.00

$15,750.00

$14,000.00

5185000

$32000

$790.00

$270.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

53895
53895

53895
53895

53895
53895

53895
53895

53895
53895

53895

450

$194,750.00

$194,750.00

$194,750.00

$194,750.00

$194,750.00

$194,750.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$175 5175000

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

439

$525

$525

$5.60

$5.60

$3050

$250

075

$5.60

$21,950.00

$21,950.00

$26250.00

$26250.00

$28,000.00

$28,000.00

$12,200.00

52550000

$750.00

$1,12000

No Bid

$5.00

$525

$525

$575

$575

54865

185

5028

5098

$625.00

$6,250.00

Not to Spec

$25,000.00

$26250.00

$26250.00

$28750.00

$28750.00

$19,460.00

$1,850.00

$280.00

$196.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$7083

$5.96

689

$305

5462

$6,500.00

$28332.00

$5.960.00

$6,890.00

$610.00

$924.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$49.00

$595

148

148

$19,600.00

$5.950.00

$296.00

No Bid

$212.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$79.00

No Bid

No Bid

No 8id

$1,060,000.00

$79,000.00)

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No 8id
No Bid
$36.95
5199
No 8id
5269
$1,000.00
5129

$14,780.00

$1990.00

$538.00

$200,000.00
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$1,550.00 | No 8id 5225000 420000 $2,950.00 $4,280.00 $2,950.00 [ No 8id

26AT1
26ALT1
26ALT1
26ALT1

27 $3,000.00 $029 $2900.00 5035 5350000 $850  $85000.00 5020 $2,00000 5039 $3900.00 5056 $5,600.00 5042 $4200.00 5049 $4900.00 $2000  $200,000.00 $0295 $2,950.00
27Am
27Am
27Am
27Am
27Am
27Am $850
27Am

2 54,000.00 503299 $8247.50 5018 $4,500.00 | No 8id $1100  $275000.00 $1000  $250000.00 $1275  $31875000 $1286  $321,50000 $1695  $423750.00 | No8id No8id
28AT1
28AT1
28AT1
28AT1
28AT1
28AT1
28AT1

2 $4,00000 503299 $8247.50 $018 $4,500.00 | No 8id $1100  $275000.00 $1000  $250000.00 $1275  $318750.00 $1286  $321,500.00 $1695  $423,750.00| No Bid No 8id
2911
2911
2911
2911
2911
2911
2911
29AT1 $25.00

30 $16,000.00 503299 $32990.00 5018 $18,000.00|NoBid $1100  $1100,000.00 $1000  $1,000,000.00 $1275  $1,275,00000 $1661  $1,661,00000 $1695  $1,695,000.00 $25.00  $2,500,000.00 | No 8id
30AT1
30AT1
30AT1
30ALT1
30ALT1
30ALT1
30ALT1
30ALT1 $25.00

£ $16,000.00 503299 $32990.00 018 $18,000.00|NoBid $1100  $12100,000.00 $1000  $1,000,000.00 $1285  $1285000.00 $919  $919,000.00 $1695  $1695,000.00 $25.00  $2,5500,000.00| No Bid
311
311
311
31T
311
311
311 $25.00

2 5450000 499 499000 435 $4,350.00 | No 8id No 8id $353 353000 $398 $3,980.00 | No 8id No Bid $1000  $10,00000 $339 $3390.00
211
211
211
211
3211

33 $7,50000 $699 $6990.00 $695 $6950.00 | No 8id No Bid 405 $4,050.00 $5.00 $5,000.00 $77 $7,17000 $995 $9,.950.00 $1300  $13,000.00] $429 $4290.00
33ALT1
33ALT1
33ALT1
33ALT1
33ALT1

4 $17,500.00 $2499  $12,495.00 $2900  $14,500.00|No Bid No Bid No 8id $2374 $11,870.00|NoBid $2900  $14,500.00 $17.50 $8750.00 $2298  $11,49000
3aAT1
3aT1
3aT1
3812
3aT1
3am2
38T
34 ALT1
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