
DRAFT ONLY UNTIL AWARD

IFB 2018-260 Signs, Sign Materials, & Barriers

Line # Description QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
20 SECTION 3 - SIGN FACES: S.D.H.P.T., 30 in. x 30 in. 200 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.63 $1,726.00 $9.25 $1,850.00 $64.80 $12,960.00
21 SECTION 3 - SIGN FACES: S.D.H.P.T., 24 in. x 48 in. 50 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.04 $552.00 $11.84 $592.00 $135.65 $6,782.50
22 SECTION 3 - SIGN FACES: S.D.H.P.T., 18 in. x 24 in. 50 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.14 $207.00 $4.44 $222.00 $28.38 $1,419.00
23 SECTION 3 - SIGN FACES: S.D.H.P.T., 18 in. x 18 in. 50 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.11 $155.50 $3.33 $166.50 $28.38 $1,419.00

24
SECTION 3 - SIGN FACES: Black border, 30 in. x 30 in. 
(Blank Face) 50 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.63 $431.50 $9.25 $462.50 $64.80 $3,240.00

25
SECTION 3 - SIGN FACES: Percentage off on any 
similar items required by Collin County not 
specifically addressed in SECTION 3 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid 0 No Bid 0

Line # Description QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

43 SECTION 8 - REFLECTIVE COLLIN COUNTY ROAD SIGN 
FACES: Collin County Road Sign Face 9 in. x 30 in. 600 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.59 $1,554.00 $6.21 $3,726.00 $64.80 $38,880.00

44 SECTION 8 - REFLECTIVE COLLIN COUNTY ROAD SIGN 
FACES: Collin County Road Sign Face 9 in. x 36 in. 50 each No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.11 $155.50 $7.43 $371.50 $71.99 $3,599.50

45

SECTION 8 - REFLECTIVE COLLIN COUNTY ROAD SIGN 
FACES: Percentage off on any similar items required 
by Collin County not specifically addressed in 
SECTION 8 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid 0 No Bid 0

Osburn Associates, Inc. chose not to renew Section 3 & 8 award during 1st Renewal period because of no purchase orders that timeframe. 
New award to Vulcan, Inc. dba Vulcan Signs, the next apparent low bidder.
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