
PRICE CHANGE PROPOSAL - WRIGHT ASPHALT PRODUCTS COMPANY

IFB 2019-114 LIQUID ASPHALTS

PRIMARY
SECONDARY

Wright Asphalt Products 
Company (Wright Asphalt 

Products Company LLC)
$0.25 INCREASE

Line # Description CURRENT PRICE REQUESTED PRICE % increase
1 CRS-1 --- Delivered No Bid
2 CRS-1P --- Delivered No Bid
3 CRS-2P --- Delivered $2.415 $2.665 9.84%
4 CSS-1 --- Delivered No Bid
5 MC-250 --- Delivered No Bid
6 MC-30 --- Delivered $3.365 $3.615 7.16%
7 MC-3000 --- Delivered $3.234 $3.484 7.44%
8 MC-800 --- Delivered $3.04 $3.29 7.90%
9 RC-250 --- Delivered $3.629 $3.879 6.66%

10 RC-3000 --- Delivered No Bid
11 RC-800 --- Delivered No Bid
13 CRS-1 --- Pick-Up No Bid
14 CRS-1P --- Pick-Up No Bid
15 CRS-2P --- Pick-Up $2.13 $2.38 11.09%
16 CSS-1 --- Pick-Up No Bid
17 MC-250 --- Pick-Up No Bid
18 MC-30 --- Pick-Up $3.10 $3.35 7.75%
19 MC-3000 --- Pick-Up $2.95 $3.20 8.13%
20 MC-800 --- Pick-Up $2.75 $3.00 8.70%
21 RC-250 --- Pick-Up $3.35 $3.60 7.19%
22 RC-3000 --- Pick-Up No Bid
23 RC-800 --- Pick-Up No Bid
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