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COLLIN COUNTY, TEXAS 

 
ADDENDUM No. Four (4)        IFB No. 2021-202 
 
  

INVITATION FOR BID 
 

FOR 
 

CONSTRUCTION, ROOF REPLACEMENT, COLLIN COUNTY 900 BUILDING 
 
 
 

DATE:  MAY 26, 2021 
 
NOTICE TO ALL PROSPECTIVE BIDDERS: 
 
 
PLEASE MAKE THE FOLLOWING CHANGES TO THE INVITATION FOR BID: 
 
 
CHANGE BID DUE DATE: FROM: MAY 27, 2021 AT 2:00 PM 
    TO:   JUNE 3, 2021 AT 2:00 PM 
 
DELETE DOCUMENT: SECTION 05 30 00 
 
REPLACE WITH:  SECTION 05 30 00 REV. 1 
 
ADD DOCUMENT:  ARCHITECT’S ADDENDUM NO. TWO 
 
ADD ATTRIBUTE:  #23-ADDENDUM NO. 4 ACKNOWLEDGEMENT 
 
DELETE DOCUMENT: SECTION 004100-BID FORM ADDENDUM 3 
 
REPLACE WITH:  SECTION 004100-BID FORM ADDENDUM 4 
 
 
 
ALL OTHER TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE BID AND SPECIFICATIONS REMAIN THE SAME. 
 

     SINCERELY, 
      MICHELLE CHARNOSKI, CPPB 
      PURCHASING AGENT 
JDG 



DryTec Moisture Protection Technology Consultants    
8750 N Central Expressway, Suite 725   Dallas, TX 75231  Tel. 214.363.2192   Fax  214.818.0567 

 

 
May 26, 2021 
 
Roof Replacement 
900 Building 
900 E. Park 
Plano, Texas 
 
ADDENDUM NUMBER TWO 
 

This addendum forms a part of the Contract Documents and modifies the original Bid Documents 
for the 900 Building Roof Replacement Project for Collin County, Plano, Texas, as noted below.  
Please acknowledge receipt of this Addendum at the time of the Proposal. Failure to do so may 
subject the Proposer to disqualification. 
 
This Addendum consists of 

1) 1 page of written text. 
a. Delete warranty requirement for LoadMaster Deck. Refer to attached 

Specification. 
 
 
END OF ADDENDUM NUMBER TWO 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
   Date of signing:  05-26-2021 
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SECTION 05 30 00 

LOADMASTER ROOF DECK RETROFIT 

PART 1 - GENERAL 

1.01 SECTION INCLUDES: 

A. Work required to remove existing perlite roof insulation down to existing Loadmaster Duraflex
Mineral Board.

B. Replacement of any damaged Duraflex Mineral Board to remain.

C. Installation of Loadmaster Integral Roof Deck Assembly components as indicated and detailed.

1.02 RELATED SECTIONS: 

A. Section 01 27 00 - Unit Prices

B. Section 07 52 00 - Modified Bituminous Membrane Roofing

C. Section 07 56 50 - Minor Roof Renovation Work.

1.03 SUBMITTALS: 

A. Refer to Section 01 33 00 for submittal procedures.

B. Product Data for each component.

C. Gravity Load Requirements: Submit manufacturer's certification of the load carrying capacity of
the specified integral assembly.

D. Diaphragm Load Requirements: Submit manufacturer's certification of shear strength and
shear stiffness of the specified integral assembly.

E. Wind Uplift Requirements: Submit manufacturer's certification of the wind uplift performance of
the specified integral assembly.

F. Thermal Requirements: Submit manufacturer's certification of the integral assembly thermal
resistance values.

G. Fire Resistance Requirements: Submit manufacturer's certification of the integral assembly's
fire acceptability, hourly resistance rating and building code compliance.

H. Manufacturer’s Application Instructions to include fastening patterns for field, perimeters and
corners as defined by FM standards for this specific roof.

I. Material Safety Data Sheets for each product.

1.04 QUALITY ASSURANCE: 

A. Installer Qualifications: Contractor shall be licensed by Loadmaster Systems.

B. Preinstallation Conference: Refer to Section 07 52 00.

1.05 DELIVERY, STORAGE, AND HANDLING: 

A. Delivery: Deliver materials to the job site in manufacturer's labeled packaging and store above
grade covered with tarps secured in place to sustain displacement by wind forces.

1.06 WARRANTY: 

A. Manufacturer's Warranty: 10 Year Loadmaster Suitability Warranty, executed jointly by
Loadmaster, Inc. and the Loadmaster Certified contractor. This warranty coverage shall include 
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the suitability of this assembly to act as a roofing substrate. 

B. Upon completion of the work, provide Owner representative manual describing the Loadmaster 
roof deck assembly for this specific project. Manual shall be stored adjacent to roof warranties 
that will be mounted near the roof access point as specified in Section 07 52 00. 

 

PART 2 - PRODUCTS 
 

2.01 MANUFACTURER: 

A. Acceptable Manufacturer: Loadmaster Systems, Inc., P.O. Box 2169, Duluth, Georgia 30136, 
800-527-4035. No substitutions. 

 

2.02 COMPONENTS: 

A. Metal Decking (For use in locations where existing metal decking is deteriorated and in need of 
replacement prior to the installation of the new roof system assembly): Loadmaster Steel 
Section to match existing. 

B. High-Density Loadmaster Duraflex Mineral Board: Fire resistant, weather resistant, fiberglass 
reinforced mineral core board with a minimum density of 48 lbs./cf. and a minimum compressive 
strength of 400 psi. Dimensions shall be 1/2 inch thick x 4 ft x 12'-6 in. The long edges of the 
board shall have a V-Type tongue and groove configuration with the ends being square cut. 
Guide markings shall be clearly printed on the top surface of each board to facilitate the proper 
location of spacing of the screw fasteners along with the Loadmaster label. 

C. Rigid Insulation: U.L Rated, Isocyanurate foam-type rigid plastic insulation, having an 
Underwriters Laboratories Flame Spread Rating of 25 or less, 4 ft. x 8 ft. is size. Provide two 
separate layers with joints staggered in accordance with Loadmaster requirements. 

 

2.03 ACCESSORIES: 

A. Fasteners for Metal Decking: 12-24 x 7/8 inch HWH Traxx 4 Loadmaster Screw Fasteners. 
Side lap connectors shall be Loadmaster Diaphragm Side Fasters Screw Fasteners. 

B. Fasteners for Loadmaster Duraflex Mineral Board: Corrosion resistant, Phillips bugle-head, 
self-driving, case-hardened screws with vibration resistant threads. 

C. Compression Discs: 1-1/2 inch hexagonal-shaped discs formed from G-90 galvanized steel. 

D Joint Reinforcement Tape: Weather-resistant, pressure-sensitive tape as approved by 

Loadmaster. 
 

PART 3 - EXECUTION 
 

3.01 EXAMINATION: 

A. Examine Duraflex Mineral Board for damage after existing roof membrane and underlying 
perlite insulation have been removed. Replace any damaged materials in accordance with 
Loadmaster requirements. Base Bid will include the replacement of 2,000 s.f. of existing 
Duraflex Mineral Roof Board with the actual cost of such being adjusted in accordance with 
Section 01 27 00. 

B. Visually examine and confirm that the existing steel sections have not been damaged or rusted. 
The cost of having a licensed structural engineer examine the existing roof framing should rust 
formations be observed shall be completed on the basis of a change order. 

C. Replace or renovate deteriorated or damaged metal decking as specified in Section 07 56 50 
and in accordance with Loadmaster's requirements. Base Bid will include the replacement of 
1,000 sf. of existing metal decking being replaced with the actual cost of such being adjusted in 
accordance with Section 01 27 00. 
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3.02 INSTALLATION: 

A. Gang fasten two layers of rigid insulation and Duraflex Mineral Board in accordance with 
Loadmaster's requirements with mechanical fasteners penetrating the metal decking a 
minimum of 3/4 inch. 

B. Install joint reinforcement tape over all joints in the Duraflex Mineral Board in accordance 
with Loadmaster's requirements. 

 

3.03 INSPECTION: 

A. Inspect installation and correct any deficiencies prior to the installation of the roof membrane. 
 

END OF SECTION 



2021-202 Addendum 4

Construction, Roof Replacement, Collin County 900 Building

Issue Date: 4/27/2021

Questions Deadline: 5/21/2021 12:00 PM (CT)

Response Deadline: 6/3/2021 02:00 PM (CT)

Collin County Purchasing

Contact Information

Contact: JD Griffin, CPPB Senior Buyer
Address: Purchasing

Admin. Building
Ste. 3160
2300 Bloomdale Rd.
Ste. 3160
McKinney, TX 75071

Phone: (972) 548-4116
Fax: (972) 548-4694
Email: jgriffin@co.collin.tx.us

2021-202 Addendum 4

Section 004100-Bid Form Addendum 4



Event Information

Number: 2021-202 Addendum 4
Title: Construction, Roof Replacement, Collin County 900 Building
Type: Invitation for Bid - Construction
Issue Date: 4/27/2021
Question Deadline: 5/21/2021 12:00 PM (CT)
Response Deadline: 6/3/2021 02:00 PM (CT)
Notes: Please log in to view bid specifications.

SCOPE OF WORK INCLUDES all materials, labor, equipment and services to
produce or be incorporated in such construction. Contract will be a general contract
for the replacement of an existing modified bituminous roof at the Collin County 900
Building located at 900 E. Park Blvd., Plano, Texas 75074.

Ship To Information

Address: 900 Building
900 E. Park Blvd.
Plano, TX 75074

Billing Information

Address: Auditor
Admin. Building
Ste. 3100
2300 Bloomdale Rd.
Ste. 3100
McKinney, TX 75071

Bid Activities

Pre-Bid Conference (RSVP Required) 5/13/2021

A PRE-BID CONFERENCE will be held by Collin County at the Collin County Sub-Courthouse, 900 Park Blvd., Plano,
TX 75074 (meet on the South side of the building) on Thursday, May 13, 2021 at 9:00 AM and 10:00 AM in order for
bidders to ask questions regarding the proposed work. It is the bidder’s responsibility to review the site and
documents to gain a full understanding of the requirements of the bid.
Bidders interested in attending the pre-bid conference shall RSVP to purchasing@co.collin.tx.us with “2021-202, Roof
Replacement, Collin County 900 Building” in the subject line, no later than Wednesday, May 12, 2021 at 3:00 PM.
RSVP response shall include company name, name of individual(s) that will be attending and the preferred session
time.

Site-Walk 5/17/2021 2:00:00 PM (CT)

A Site-Walk will be held by Collin County at the Collin County Sub-Courthouse, 900 Park Blvd., Plano, TX 75074 (meet
on the South side of the building) on Monday, May 17, 2021 at 2:00 PM in order for bidders to view the jobsite.

Bid Attachments
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Addendum 4

Architect's Addendum Two_5-26-21.pdf View Online

Architect's Addendum Two
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Section 05 30 00 Rev. 1
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Legal Notice

900 E Park Specs 20210330.pdf View Online

Specifications

Drawings.pdf View Online

Drawings

Requested Attachments

Bid Bond
(Attachment required)

BID SECURITY: All Bidders must submit, prior to the bid opening time, a Certified Check, Cashier’s Check or
acceptable Bid Bond payable without recourse to Collin County in the amount of not less than five percent (5%) of the
total bid plus alternates as submitted. 

1. Bid Bond, certified check or Cashier’s Check may be mailed or hand delivered to the Office of the Collin County
Purchasing Agent, Collin County Administration Building, 2300 Bloomdale Road, Ste 3160, McKinney, TX 75071 and
shall be delivered in an envelope, marked plainly on the outside with the Bid Name and Number.
2. Bidders submitting a bid via Collin County eBid shall upload a Bid Bond at https://collincountytx.ionwave.net

Regardless of delivery method, all Bid Bonds shall be received prior to the bid opening time to be considered. Failure
to submit a copy of bid security prior to bid opening shall be cause for rejection of bid.

The original Bid Bond shall be received in the Collin County Purchasing Department no later than close of business
on the third working day after the bid opening. Late receipt of or failure to submit original Bid Bond shall be cause for
rejection of bid.

Loadmaster Systems Installer Qualifications
(Attachment required)

Refer to Section 05 30 00, 1.04, A.

Roofing System Manufacturer Certification
(Attachment required)

Refer to Section 075419, 1.8, B.

2021-202 Addendum 4

https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=6!P!Ju)A$Ip)L8cw$N3(M$B5_!T(Og(Mjh_s5(P08fz!Hc$Ufdvx!X(Tn!F(Sxazy$F$F(Sq6u)Fwy!C!Z3$B1a(W7!W$Gourl$No$K0w)I$Bhz_y!J)A1chxs)Q(Lm0(S(J!G(G!Vspj(Ew0z$L_(Yx0)Cj!T$H0rez$Q
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=!Zrpwy_or!C6)H$Rc)C39$Il(N$D-k!Am2b03(Vt_nb(W(Q!A7hf$T!Ag(Ca!Gyd(H$J$R2(G8nf-)Xbyzkapt0!T!Atxh$G(Yz!G$A9v$X3$Rn)Jysl$B!Fzt)Luk)O(K(Gab_(Za!Pec(Rwk5y!Y(W$W(Ja)K!Zl$I$Q
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=2!R!C)Avz$Ktz)Aak$B(I1$O!T(Zry(V0(D!D$Syw4!Z(Jk3x!M1(Tb$Uh$F(S3b1f)Tb6vz!R!C$Nz(H!Xu$Xy8ahh$G$B5)G$Vt!V)U)Q1(D(J(Ct!M(Bg_!F(O$I(Nw)D_hj!Fqyfz$Y$Jop!W)F2$B(Kl-$Un(Qwnoou!Fp$W!A
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=y!L!J-)S95px2-$G)Wr$H(Pbb7$W7-!X(Bm8ls(Of(N9sxm!Zi8$Fpy!Fyz(I4!L1g55y(Dq$F7t6$Sm4(Q)Ldvbn!E!Z$F(C!R$Tlg$Hu$L_q4)C4nnl$F7ze!K70hfqvhjgg1)F)P(O9u(Zbh7b4(F!R(H9!Q
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=0!Y!Ip)W$U0)Mg$Pdnmcy-whk(Wlg$L39!N(Ke2(V(Z4!Yd$Bd!Pw(O!Rgy(Qz$N2z6dbk$Y(R)Ia!Pt!Jf6$F(Q!My$Gxcp-$I$J_)Le3$P2!V)Pe)L(X5w(T46lvgg(Tnbt!Pgc32g(Vv!X7n(F$Uvoxs2(B)Xi!P$A
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=l_0kotn!W!Nln6o)Sv$Sud0)V$Tjg(S0his-$Pv!Ma(V(P(Q!Wn$Mtf!F(Jgu!U(J$T9$Qx0(A48d-)Xqm!A!Ttg4$O791(Zyb!R$I-9x$Tx0ms$Mdxcc)Db$Yc!Sd_9)Go)Y(T(Q0(G!A(Ol!E(N$Benid(F2)Fl!Ww
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=rocb2!L!U)Wm$T)C12$Ahyp(E$N!Wyun6(G-(Dhvk(Ui9xew!Ebhft$Zwe!Kku(Kwgh!Roh(C$Gpk8zu$I(Q)G!Vl!Y$Doo(Tw!O$Y$Pxv0f8dmkrpxs$Zcf)Yx$Lq01!Go_g)Xn)N8(Z8(V70awe(Qba6v!Q
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=4)Schdkag(Hgo(Tf)Kf(U5j$Fq$A$Mtc6!S5)K)Seqn!W!K)Fo)L(Cf$A(K!K$Si$D)E$Mvm9ed53f$L)Axj--fbi2$Ri$At4se$D4ngz5yfndv7)Obzev7(Jbd95)B!M(H5r$N$V!Hfq$Brm(H_e7$U6(B-qg
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/extract.aspx?file=output%5Ccollincountytx%5C2021_4%5C81f3da03-33f1-4c05-a400-2b12a224f1a1.doc&name=LEGAL+NOTICE_2021-202.doc
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=7dob)Qf(W6wbr(Ib)Cv(L$I6$B$Z!U)H3)H!Eh3w!Zx42)Bn)B(B-$M(Ll!N-6$S$Cn)Oe_$Lu$Zmd)Peb$Am$Sm$Xb)Kn(Hp)F1!K(Cp3$Z7$Zy!Shy$D4h1(Ij$T4a(G)U!Vh4-$R0)C29dh1$B!Xvd)Lt6!P(V(Zt(J$Dag
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=d)Aiz(Kiu(E)Zlnjrt(Kh$X2q$U$Yc!Q)Ck)Qi0!Zg!W6fe)R7w-w)C(X9$G(K!Zcy$F5$P)R$L467$Q)Hctm$S$Ky8$Jz)Kontpm(Qmc)Ulu!H(X5$Wd-l9_$On49w!F4$I_(I$A8-(Ms)C!U_a7_$Gu)F$Ov!I)A7g!Q


W-9
(Attachment required)

Conflict of Interest Questionnaire

Bid Attributes

1 eBid Notice

Collin County exclusively uses IonWave Technologies, Inc. (Collin County eBid) for the notification and
dissemination of all solicitations. The receipt of solicitations through any other means may result in your receipt of
incomplete specifications and/or addendums which could ultimately render your bid/proposal non-compliant. Collin
County accepts no responsibility for the receipt and/or notification of solicitations through any other means. Please
initial.

(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

2 Contact Information

List the contact name, email address and phone number of the main person(s) Collin County should contact in
reference to this solicitation. Contact(s) shall be duly authorized by the company, corporation, firm, partnership or
individual to respond to any questions, clarification, and or offers in response to this solicitation.

(Required: Maximum 4000 characters allowed)

3 Calendar Days Bid

Please state the consecutive calendar days bid from notice to proceed through completion of project.

(Required: Numbers only)

4 Exceptions

Do you take exception to the specifications? If so, by separate attachment, please state your exceptions.

 Yes    No
(Required: Check only one)

5 Bonding Requirement Acknowledgement

I understand that the bonding requirements of this solicitation are required and are included in the submitted
pricing. A bond certificate (payment, performance, and/or maintenance) as stated in the specification document
shall be submitted to the Purchasing department if I am awarded all or a portion of the resulting contract. Please
initial.

(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)
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6 Insurance Acknowledgement – Construction/Public Works

I understand that the insurance requirements of this solicitation are required and are included in the submitted
pricing. The Contractor shall furnish certificates of insurance for both the Contractor and any subcontractor to the
Purchasing department if awarded all or a portion of the resulting contract. Please initial.

(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

7 Subcontractors

State the business name of all subcontractors and the type of work they will be performing under this contract. If
you are fully qualified to self-perform the entire contract, please respond with "Not Applicable-Self Perform".

(Required: Maximum 4000 characters allowed)

8 Reference No. 1

List a company or governmental agency, other than Collin County, where these same/like products/services, as
stated herein, have been provided. Texas references preferred. Include the following: Company/Entity, Contact,
Address, City/State/Zip, Phone, and E-Mail.

(Required: Maximum 4000 characters allowed)

9 Reference No. 2

List a company or governmental agency, other than Collin County, where these same/like products/services, as
stated herein, have been provided. Texas references preferred. Include the following: Company/Entity, Contact,
Address, City/State/Zip, Phone, and E-Mail.

(Required: Maximum 4000 characters allowed)
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Reference No. 3

List a company or governmental agency, other than Collin County, where these same/like products/services, as
stated herein, have been provided. Texas references preferred. Include the following: Company/Entity, Contact,
Address, City/State/Zip, Phone, and E-Mail.

(Required: Maximum 4000 characters allowed)

1
1

Preferential Treatment

The County of Collin, as a governmental agency of the State of Texas, may not award a contract to a nonresident
bidder unless the nonresident's bid is lower than the lowest bid submitted by a responsible Texas resident bidder by
the same amount that a Texas resident bidder would be required to underbid a nonresident bidder to obtain a
comparable contract in the state in which the nonresident's principal place of business is located (Government
Code, Title 10, V.T.C.A., Chapter 2252, Subchapter A).

1. Is your principal place of business in the State of Texas?
2. If your principal place of business is not in Texas, in which State is your principal place of business?
3. If your principal place of business is not in Texas, does your state favor resident bidders (bidders in your state)
by some dollar increment or percentage?
4. If your state favors resident bidders, state by what dollar amount or percentage.

(Required: Maximum 4000 characters allowed)

1
2

Debarment Certification

I certify that neither my company nor an owner or principal of my company has been debarred, suspended or
otherwise made ineligible for participation in Federal Assistance programs under Executive Order 12549,
“Debarment and Suspension,” as described in the Federal Register and Rules and Regulations. Please initial.

(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

1
3

Immigration and Reform Act

I declare and affirm that my company is in compliance with the Immigration and Reform Act of 1986 and all
employees are legally eligible to work in the United States of America. I further understand and acknowledge that
any non-compliance with the Immigration and Reform Act of 1986 at any time during the term of this contract will
render the contract voidable by Collin County. Please initial.

(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)
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1
4

Disclosure of Certain Relationships

Chapter 176 of the Texas Local Government Code requires that any vendor considering doing business with a local
government entity disclose the vendor’s affiliation or business relationship that might cause a conflict of interest with
a local government entity. Subchapter 6 of the code requires a vendor to file a conflict of interest questionnaire
(CIQ) if a conflict exists. By law this questionnaire must be filed with the records administrator of Collin County no
later than the 7th business day after the date the vendor becomes aware of an event that requires the statement to
be filed. A vendor commits an offense if the vendor knowingly violates the code. An offense under this section is a
misdemeanor. By submitting a response to this request, the vendor represents that it is in compliance with the
requirements of Chapter 176 of the Texas Local Government Code. Please send completed forms to the Collin
County County Clerk's Office located at 2300 Bloomdale Rd., Suite 2104, McKinney, TX 75071. Please initial.

(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

1
5

Anti-Collusion Statement

Bidder certifies that its Bid/Proposal is made without prior understanding, agreement, or connection with any
corporation, firm, or person submitting a Bid/Proposal for the same materials, services, supplies, or equipment and
is in all respects fair and without collusion or fraud. No premiums, rebates or gratuities permitted; either with, prior
to, or after any delivery of material or provision of services. Any such violation may result in Agreement cancellation,
return of materials or discontinuation of services and the possible removal from bidders list. Please initial.

(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

1
6

Disclosure of Interested Parties

Section 2252.908 of the Texas Government Code requires a business entity entering into certain contracts with a
governmental entity to file with the governmental entity a disclosure of interested parties at the time the business
entity submits the signed contract to the governmental entity. Section 2252.908 requires the disclosure form (Form
1295) to be signed by the authorized agent of the contracting business entity, acknowledging that the disclosure is
made under oath and under penalty of perjury. Section 2252.908 applies only to a contract that requires an action
or vote by the governing body of the governmental entity before the contract may be signed or has a value of at
least $1 million. Section 2252.908 provides definitions of certain terms occurring in the section. Section 2252.908
applies only to a contract entered into on or after January 1, 2016. Please initial.

(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

1
7

Notification Survey

In order to better serve our offerors, the Collin County Purchasing Department is conducting the following survey.
We appreciate your time and effort expended to submit your bid. Should you have any questions or require more
information please call (972) 548-4165. How did you receive notice of this request?

 Plano Star Courier  Plan Room  Collin County eBid Notification  Collin County Website

 Other
(Required: Check only one)
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8

Bid Bond Acknowledgement

I understand that accompanying this bid, is a certified check, cashier’s check or Bid Bond in the amount of five
percent (5%) of the total amount bid. Bidders submitting a bid via Collin County eBid shall upload a Bid Bond at
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net. Regardless of delivery method, all Bid Bonds shall be received prior to the bid
opening time to be considered.
I understand that the original Bid Bond shall be received in the Collin County Purchasing Department no later than
close of business on the third working day after the bid opening. Late receipt of original Bid Bond shall be
cause for rejection of bid. Please initial.

(Required: Maximum 4000 characters allowed)

1
9

Construction Acknowledgement

Bidder, declares that the only person or parties interested in this bid are those principals named herein, that his/her
bid is made without collusion with any other person, firm or corporation, that he/she has carefully examined the
Contract Documents including the Advertisement for Bids, Instruction to Bidders, Construction Agreement,
Specifications and the Drawings, therein referred to and has carefully examined the locations, conditions and
classes of materials for the proposed work, and agrees that he/she will provide all the necessary labor, machinery,
tools, equipment, apparatus and other items incidental to construction and will do all the work and furnish all the
materials called for in the Contract Documents in the manner prescribed therein. Bidder hereby declares that
he/she has visited the site of the Work and has carefully examined the Contract Documents pertaining to the Work
covered by the above Bid, and he/she further agrees to commence work within ten (10) consecutive calendar days
after date of written Notice to Proceed and to substantially complete the work on which he/she has bid within the
number of days specified subject to such extensions of time allowed by Specifications. Bidder certifies that the bid
prices contained in this bid have been carefully checked and are submitted as correct and final. The prices have
been shown in words and figures for each item listed in this bid and it is understood that in the event of a
discrepancy, the words shall govern. Please initial.

(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

2
0

Addendum No. 1 Acknowledgement

Please initial to verify your receipt of the addendum.

(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

2
1

Addendum No. 2 Acknowledgement

Please initial to verify your receipt of the addendum.

(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)
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2

Addendum No. 3 Acknowledgement

Please initial to verify your receipt of the addendum.

(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

2
3

Addendum No. 4 Acknowledgement

Please initial to verify your receipt of the addendum.

(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

Bid Lines

1 Package Header

Base Bid Grand Total

Quantity: 1 UOM: lump sum Total: $

Item Notes: Total Material Cost (Line 1.1) and Total Labor Cost (Line 1.2) must add
up to the Base Bid Grand Total

Supplier Notes:

No bid

Alternate specification
(Attach separate sheet)

Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

Package Items

1.1 Total Materials Cost Incorporated in Project
(Response required)

Quantity: 1 UOM: lump sum Price: $ Total: $

Supplier Notes:  
No bid

Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

1.2 Total Labor Cost Incorporated in Project
(Response required)

Quantity: 1 UOM: lump sum Price: $ Total: $

Supplier Notes:  
No bid

Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

2 Unit Prices
(Line excluded from response total)

Supplier Notes: Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)
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Item Attributes

1. State Unit price (per square foot) for replacement of existing ½” thick Loadmaster Duraflex Roof
Board

Refer to Section 01 27 00, 1.03, A.

$
(Required: Numbers only)

2. State Unit price (per square foot) for renovating existing metal decking

Refer to Section 01 27 00, 1.03, B.

$
(Required: Numbers only)

3. State Unit price (per square foot) for replacing existing metal decking

Refer to Section 01 27 00, 1.03, C.

$
(Required: Numbers only)

4. State Unit price (per square foot) for adding base ply to areas that pond water (Unsurfaced Modified
Bitumen Base Ply)

Refer to Section 01 27 00, 1.03, D.

$
(Required: Numbers only)

5. State Unit Price (Per Lineal Foot) for replacing deteriorated 2 x 4 wood nailer including all fastening.

Refer to Section 01 27 00, 1.03, E., 1.

$
(Required: Numbers only)

6. State Unit Price (Per Lineal Foot) for replacing deteriorated 2 x 6 wood nailer including all fastening.

Refer to Section 01 27 00, 1.03, E., 2.

$
(Required: Numbers only)

7. State Unit Price (Per Lineal Foot) for replacing deteriorated 2 x 8 wood nailer including all fastening.

Refer to Section 01 27 00, 1.03, E., 3.

$
(Required: Numbers only)

8. State Unit Price (Per Lineal Foot) for replacing deteriorated 2 x 10 wood nailer including all
fastening.

Refer to Section 01 27 00, 1.03, E., 4.

$
(Required: Numbers only)
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3 Alternate No. One: PVC membrane fully adhered over 1/4" DensDeck Prime, mechanically attached (gang
fastened) through both layers of rigid insulation to LoadMaster Deck. Rigid insulation thickness is 4.5 inches
(Response required)

Quantity: 1 UOM: lump sum Price: $ Total: $

Item Notes: Refer to Bid Addendum Three, Architects Addendum One, Item 1) dated
May 20, 2021.
Price shall include all labor and materials. Alternate bid amount shall not
include the base bid amount.
If bidder determines that Alternate No. One is to be a deductive
amount from the base bid, please enter a negative dollar amount
for this line item.

Supplier Notes:

No bid

Alternate specification
(Attach separate sheet)

Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)
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Supplier Information

Company Name:

Contact Name:

Address:

Phone:

Fax:

Email:

Supplier Notes

The undersigned hereby certifies the foregoing bid submitted by the company listed below hereinafter called “bidder” is
the duly authorized agent of said company and the person signing said bid has been duly authorized to execute same.
Bidder affirms that they are duly authorized to execute this contract; this company; corporation, firm, partnership or
individual has not prepared this bid in collusion with any other bidder or other person or persons engaged in the same
line of business; and that the contents of this bid as to prices, terms and conditions of said bid have not been
communicated by the undersigned nor by any employee or agent to any other person engaged in this type of business
prior to the official opening of this bid.

Print Name Signature
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