

| Line # | Description   | Original Awarded Contract Price                          | Quotes Received         |                                   |                        |            |  |   | % Increase | Comments   |
|--------|---|--|-------------------------|-----------------------------------|------------------------|------------|--|---|------------|--|
|        |   |  | Tabb Textiles Co., Inc. | Amercare Products, Inc. (Phoenix) | JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES | Mavich llc | Victory Supply                                 | Bob Barker Company Inc  |            |  |
| 1      | BEDDING AND TOWELS: TOWELS: BATH TURKISH, WHITE, 20" X 40"<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg                    | \$ 0.65<br>Tabb<br>BT120<br>300 ea<br>\$ 195.00          | \$ 0.75                 |                                   |                        |            | \$ 0.74<br>VSI<br>BTWH2040<br>12.00<br>\$ 8.88 | \$ 0.9533<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>L015-BALE<br>300.00<br>\$ 286.00    | 15%        | Victory Supply's item did not meet the departments specs during evaluation |
| 2      | BEDDING AND TOWELS: WASH CLOTHS: WHITE, 12" x 12"<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg                             | \$ 0.14<br>Tabb<br>WC110<br>1200 ea<br>\$ 168.00         | \$ 0.16                 |                                   |                        |            | \$ 0.17<br>VSI<br>WCWHECO<br>12.00<br>\$ 2.04  | \$ 0.2325<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>L0172-BALE<br>1200.00<br>\$ 279.00  | 14%        |  |
| 3      | BEDDING AND TOWELS: PILLOW CASES: WHITE STANDARD SIZE, POLYESTER COTTON BLEND<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg | \$ 0.62<br>Tabb<br>PC100<br>144 ea<br>\$ 89.28           | \$ 0.71                 |                                   |                        |            | \$ 0.81<br>VSI<br>PCWH4234<br>12.00<br>\$ 9.72 | \$ 1.1583<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>L022-DZ<br>12.00<br>\$ 13.90        | 15%        |  |
| 6      | BEDDING AND TOWELS: BLANKET: BED 62" x 80" WHITE OR GRAY<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg                      | \$ 5.47<br>VSI<br>BLW628070<br>20.00<br>\$ 109.40        |                         |                                   |                        | \$ 6.24    |  | \$ 9.58<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>L010-EA<br>1.00<br>\$ 9.58            | 14%        |  |
| 7      | BEDDING AND TOWELS: BLANKET: BED, 66" x 90" WHITE<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg                             | \$ 4.54<br>VSI<br>LNBLSPWHEC<br>20.00<br>\$ 90.80        |                         |                                   |                        | \$ 4.74    |  | \$ 8.35<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>L027-EA<br>1.00<br>\$ 8.35            | 4%         |  |
| 8      | BEDDING AND TOWELS: SUICIDE BLANKET: 54" X 80"<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg                                | \$ 57.11<br>VSI<br>SPBL<br>1.00<br>\$ 57.11              |                         |                                   |                        | \$ 62.82   |  | \$ 62.52<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>ICS-SBB-10054-GR<br>1.00<br>\$ 62.52 | 10%        | ICS's item did not meet the departments specs during evaluation            |
| 10     | INMATE CLOTHING: SUICIDE SUIT-ADJUSTABLE SMOCK, 44"-56" CHEST<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg                 | \$ 53.41<br>VSI<br>SPBL-44-56<br>1.00<br>\$ 53.41        |                         |                                   |                        | \$ 58.75   |  | \$ 159.00<br>HUMANE RESTRAINT<br>HSS-100-2X-EA<br>1.00<br>\$ 159.00         | 10%        |  |
| 11     | INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg  | \$ 11.99<br>VSI<br>UNJS(color)-(\$Z)<br>1.00<br>\$ 11.99 |                         |                                   |                        | \$ 13.19   |  | \$ 22.79<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>C030<br>1.00<br>\$ 22.79             | 10%        |  |
| 12     | INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg  | \$ 11.99<br>VSI<br>UNJS(color)-(\$Z)<br>1.00<br>\$ 11.99 |                         |                                   |                        | \$ 13.19   |  | \$ 22.79<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>C030<br>1.00<br>\$ 22.79             | 10%        |  |
| 13     | INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg   | \$ 11.99<br>VSI<br>UNJS(color)-(\$Z)<br>1.00<br>\$ 11.99 |                         |                                   |                        | \$ 13.19   |  | \$ 25.28<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>C030<br>1.00<br>\$ 25.28             | 10%        |  |

| Line # | Description   | Original Awarded Contract Price                                | Quotes Received         |                                   |                        |            |   | % Increase   | Comments |                        |
|--------|---|--|-------------------------|-----------------------------------|------------------------|------------|---|--|----------|------------------------|
|        |   |  | Tabb Textiles Co., Inc. | Amercare Products, Inc. (Phoenix) | JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES | Mavich llc | Victory Supply  |  |          | Bob Barker Company Inc |
| 14     | INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg   | \$ 12.99<br>VSI<br>UNJS(color)-(SZ)<br>1.00<br>\$ 12.99        |                         |                                   |                        |            | \$ 14.29  | \$ 25.28<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>C030<br>1.00<br>\$ 25.28  | 10%      |                        |
| 15     | INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg   | \$ 12.99<br>VSI<br>UNJS(color)-(SZ)<br>1.00<br>\$ 12.99        |                         |                                   |                        |            | \$ 14.29  | \$ 25.28<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>C030<br>1.00<br>\$ 25.28  | 10%      |                        |
| 16     | INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg   | \$ 13.99<br>VSI<br>UNJS(color)-(SZ)<br>1.00<br>\$ 13.99        |                         |                                   |                        |            | \$ 14.69  | \$ 27.99<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>C030<br>1.00<br>\$ 27.99  | 5%       |                        |
| 17     | INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg   | \$ 14.99<br>VSI<br>UNJS(color)-(SZ)<br>1.00<br>\$ 14.99        |                         |                                   |                        |            | \$ 15.24  | \$ 27.99<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>C030<br>1.00<br>\$ 27.99  | 2%       |                        |
| 18     | INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg   | \$ 15.99<br>VSI<br>UNJS(color)-(SZ)<br>1.00<br>\$ 15.99        |                         |                                   |                        |            | \$ 16.24  | \$ 27.99<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>C030<br>1.00<br>\$ 27.99  | 2%       |                        |
| 27     | INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT PANTS<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg | \$ 4.50<br>JAB Trading<br>TR-B-(S-XL)<br>24.00<br>\$ 108.00    |                         |                                   | \$ 5.40                |            | \$ 5.74<br>VSI<br>UNTR(COLOR)-(SZ)<br>1.00<br>\$ 5.74 | \$ 12.95<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>CP005<br>1.00<br>\$ 12.95 | 20%      |                        |
| 28     | INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT PANTS<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg | \$ 4.50<br>JAB Trading<br>TR-B-2XL<br>24.00<br>\$ 108.00       |                         |                                   | \$ 5.40                |            | \$ 5.74<br>VSI<br>UNTR(COLOR)-(SZ)<br>1.00<br>\$ 5.74 | \$ 12.95<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>CP005<br>1.00<br>\$ 12.95 | 20%      |                        |
| 29     | INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT PANTS<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg | \$ 4.80<br>JAB Trading<br>TR-B-3XL<br>24.00<br>\$ 115.20       |                         |                                   | \$ 5.76                |            | \$ 5.89<br>VSI<br>UNTR(COLOR)-(SZ)<br>1.00<br>\$ 5.89 | \$ 14.48<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>CP005<br>1.00<br>\$ 14.48 | 20%      |                        |
| 30     | INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT PANTS<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg | \$ 5.20<br>JAB Trading<br>TR-B-4XL<br>24.00<br>\$ 124.80       |                         |                                   | \$ 6.24                |            | \$ 6.12<br>VSI<br>UNTR(COLOR)-(SZ)<br>1.00<br>\$ 6.12 | \$ 14.48<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>CP005<br>1.00<br>\$ 14.48 | 20%      |                        |
| 31     | INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg | \$ 4.90<br>JAB Trading<br>VNECK-B-(S-XL)<br>24.00<br>\$ 117.60 |                         |                                   | \$ 5.88                |            | \$ 5.50<br>VSI<br>UNSH(COLOR)-(SZ)<br>1.00<br>\$ 5.50 | \$ 11.00<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>CS005<br>1.00<br>\$ 11.00 | 12%      |                        |
| 32     | INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg | \$ 4.90<br>JAB Trading<br>VNECK-B-2XL<br>24.00<br>\$ 117.60    |                         |                                   | \$ 5.88                |            | \$ 5.57<br>VSI<br>UNSH(COLOR)-(SZ)<br>1.00<br>\$ 5.57 | \$ 11.00<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>CS005<br>1.00<br>\$ 11.00 | 14%      |                        |
| 33     | INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg | \$ 5.15<br>JAB Trading<br>VNECK-B-3XL<br>24.00<br>\$ 123.60    |                         |                                   | \$ 6.18                |            | \$ 5.57<br>VSI<br>UNSH(COLOR)-(SZ)<br>1.00<br>\$ 5.57 | \$ 12.32<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>CS005<br>1.00<br>\$ 12.32 | 8%       |                        |

| Line # | Description   | Original Awarded Contract Price                                 | Quotes Received         |                                   |                        |            |   |                        | % Increase   | Comments |                       |
|--------|---|---|-------------------------|-----------------------------------|------------------------|------------|---|------------------------|--|----------|-----------------------|
|        |   |   | Tabb Textiles Co., Inc. | Amercare Products, Inc. (Phoenix) | JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES | Mavich llc | Victory Supply  | Bob Barker Company Inc |  |          | ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC |
| 34     | INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg   | \$ 5.45<br>JAB Trading<br>VNECK-B-4XL<br>24.00<br>\$ 130.80     |                         |                                   | \$ 6.54                |            | \$ 5.99<br>VSI<br>UNSH(COLOR)-(SZ)<br>1.00<br>\$ 5.99 |                        | \$ 12.32<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>CS005<br>1.00<br>\$ 12.32 | 10%      |                       |
| 35     | INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg   | \$ 5.70<br>JAB Trading<br>VNECK-B-5XL<br>24.00<br>\$ 136.80     |                         |                                   | \$ 6.84                |            | \$ 6.31<br>VSI<br>UNSH(COLOR)-(SZ)<br>1.00<br>\$ 6.31 |                        | \$ 12.32<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>CS005<br>1.00<br>\$ 12.32 | 11%      |                       |
| 36     | INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg   | \$ 6.00<br>JAB Trading<br>VNECK-B-6XL<br>24.00<br>\$ 144.00     |                         |                                   | \$ 6.84                |            | \$ 6.64<br>VSI<br>UNSH(COLOR)-(SZ)<br>1.00<br>\$ 6.64 |                        | \$ 13.74<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>CS005<br>1.00<br>\$ 13.74 | 11%      |                       |
| 37     | INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg   | \$ 6.00<br>JAB Trading<br>VNECK-B-7XL<br>24.00<br>\$ 144.00     |                         |                                   | \$ 7.20                |            | \$ 6.64<br>VSI<br>UNSH(COLOR)-(SZ)<br>1.00<br>\$ 6.64 |                        | \$ 13.74<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>CS005<br>1.00<br>\$ 13.74 | 11%      |                       |
| 38     | INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT PANTS<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg   | \$ 4.50<br>JAB Trading<br>TR-SB-(S-XL)<br>24.00<br>\$ 108.00    |                         |                                   | \$ 5.40                |            | \$ 5.74<br>VSI<br>UNTR(COLOR)-(SZ)<br>1.00<br>\$ 5.74 |                        | \$ 12.95<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>CP005<br>1.00<br>\$ 12.95 | 28%      |                       |
| 39     | INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT PANTS<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg   | \$ 4.50<br>JAB Trading<br>TR-SB-2XL<br>24.00<br>\$ 108.00       |                         |                                   | \$ 5.40                |            | \$ 5.74<br>VSI<br>UNTR(COLOR)-(SZ)<br>1.00<br>\$ 5.74 |                        | \$ 12.95<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>CP005<br>1.00<br>\$ 12.95 | 28%      |                       |
| 40     | INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT PANTS<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg   | \$ 4.80<br>JAB Trading<br>TR-SB-3XL<br>24.00<br>\$ 115.20       |                         |                                   | \$ 5.76                |            | \$ 5.89<br>VSI<br>UNTR(COLOR)-(SZ)<br>1.00<br>\$ 5.89 |                        | \$ 14.48<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>CP005<br>1.00<br>\$ 14.48 | 23%      |                       |
| 41     | INMATE CLOTHING: SUIT PANT:BLUE STRIPED<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg | \$ 5.20<br>JAB Trading<br>TR-SB-4XL<br>24.00<br>\$ 124.80       |                         |                                   | \$ 6.24                |            | \$ 6.12<br>VSI<br>UNTR(COLOR)-(SZ)<br>1.00<br>\$ 6.12 |                        | \$ 14.48<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>CP005<br>1.00<br>\$ 14.48 | 18%      |                       |
| 42     | INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT PANTS<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg   | \$ 5.40<br>JAB Trading<br>TR-SB-5XL<br>24.00<br>\$ 129.60       |                         |                                   | \$ 6.48                |            | \$ 6.61<br>VSI<br>UNTR(COLOR)-(SZ)<br>1.00<br>\$ 6.61 |                        | \$ 14.48<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>CP005<br>1.00<br>\$ 14.48 | 22%      |                       |
| 43     | INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT PANTS<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg   | \$ 5.80<br>JAB Trading<br>TR-SB-6XL<br>24.00<br>\$ 139.20       |                         |                                   | \$ 6.96                |            | \$ 6.61<br>VSI<br>UNTR(COLOR)-(SZ)<br>1.00<br>\$ 6.61 |                        | \$ 16.10<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>CP005<br>1.00<br>\$ 16.10 | 14%      |                       |
| 44     | INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT PANTS<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg   | \$ 5.80<br>JAB Trading<br>TR-SB-7XL<br>24.00<br>\$ 139.20       |                         |                                   | \$ 6.96                |            | \$ 6.61<br>VSI<br>UNTR(COLOR)-(SZ)<br>1.00<br>\$ 6.61 |                        | \$ 16.10<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>CP005<br>1.00<br>\$ 16.10 | 14%      |                       |
| 45     | INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg   | \$ 4.90<br>JAB Trading<br>VNECK-SB-(S-XL)<br>24.00<br>\$ 117.60 |                         |                                   | \$ 5.88                |            | \$ 5.50<br>VSI<br>UNSH(COLOR)-(SZ)<br>1.00<br>\$ 5.50 |                        |  | 12%      |                       |

| Line # | Description  | Original Awarded Contract Price                              | Quotes Received         |                                   |                        |            |   |                        | % Increase | Comments |
|--------|--|--|-------------------------|-----------------------------------|------------------------|------------|---|------------------------|------------|----------|
|        |  |  | Tabb Textiles Co., Inc. | Amercare Products, Inc. (Phoenix) | JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES | Mavich llc | Victory Supply  | Bob Barker Company Inc |            |          |
| 46     | INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIR<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg | \$ 4.90<br>JAB Trading<br>VNECK-SB-2XL<br>24.00<br>\$ 117.60 |                         |                                   | \$ 5.88                |            | \$ 5.57<br>VSI<br>UNSH(COLOR)-(SZ)<br>1.00<br>\$ 5.57                           |                        | 14%        |          |
| 47     | INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIR<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg | \$ 5.15<br>JAB Trading<br>VNECK-SB-3XL<br>24.00<br>\$ 123.60 |                         |                                   | \$ 6.18                |            | \$ 5.57<br>VSI<br>UNSH(COLOR)-(SZ)<br>1.00<br>\$ 5.57                           |                        | 8%         |          |
| 48     | INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIR<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg | \$ 5.45<br>JAB Trading<br>VNECK-SB-4XL<br>24.00<br>\$ 130.80 |                         |                                   | \$ 6.54                |            | \$ 5.99<br>VSI<br>UNSH(COLOR)-(SZ)<br>1.00<br>\$ 5.99                           |                        | 10%        |          |
| 49     | INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIR<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg | \$ 5.70<br>JAB Trading<br>VNECK-SB-5XL<br>24.00<br>\$ 136.80 |                         |                                   | \$ 6.84                |            | \$ 6.31<br>VSI<br>UNSH(COLOR)-(SZ)<br>1.00<br>\$ 6.31                           |                        | 11%        |          |
| 50     | INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIR<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg | \$ 6.00<br>JAB Trading<br>VNECK-SB-6XL<br>24.00<br>\$ 144.00 |                         |                                   | \$ 7.20                |            | \$ 6.64<br>VSI<br>UNSH(COLOR)-(SZ)<br>1.00<br>\$ 6.64                           |                        | 11%        |          |
| 51     | INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIR<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg | \$ 6.00<br>JAB Trading<br>VNECK-SB-7XL<br>24.00<br>\$ 144.00 |                         |                                   | \$ 7.20                |            | \$ 6.64<br>VSI<br>UNSH(COLOR)-(SZ)<br>1.00<br>\$ 6.64                           |                        | 11%        |          |
| 52     | INMATE CLOTHING: MEN'S COTTON T-SH<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg   | \$ 1.65<br>JAB Trading<br>G500W<br>72.00<br>\$ 118.80        |                         |                                   | \$ 1.75                |            | \$ 1.72<br>VSI<br>TSWHBSC-(SZ)<br>12.00<br>\$ 20.64                             |                        | 4%         |          |
| 53     | INMATE CLOTHING: MEN'S COTTON T-SH<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg   | \$ 1.65<br>JAB Trading<br>G500W<br>72.00<br>\$ 118.80        |                         |                                   | \$ 2.50                |            | \$ 1.72<br>VSI<br>TSWHBSC-(SZ)<br>12.00<br>\$ 20.64                             |                        | 4%         |          |
| 54     | INMATE CLOTHING: MEN'S COTTON T-SH<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg   | \$ 1.65<br>JAB Trading<br>G500W<br>72.00<br>\$ 118.80        |                         |                                   | \$ 2.75                |            | \$ 1.72<br>VSI<br>TSWHBSC-(SZ)<br>12.00<br>\$ 20.64                             |                        | 4%         |          |
| 55     | INMATE CLOTHING: SWEATSHIRT-ORANG<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg    | \$ 6.03<br>VSI<br>SSOR-S<br>12.00<br>\$ 72.36                |                         |                                   |                        |            | \$ 6.63<br>VSI<br>GILDAN/HANES/FRUIT OF THE LOOM<br>C045-OR<br>1.00<br>\$ 13.64 |                        | 10%        |          |
| 56     | INMATE CLOTHING: SWEATSHIRT-ORANG<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg    | \$ 6.03<br>VSI<br>SSOR-M<br>12.00<br>\$ 72.36                |                         |                                   |                        |            | \$ 6.63<br>VSI<br>GILDAN/HANES/FRUIT OF THE LOOM<br>C045-OR<br>1.00<br>\$ 13.64 |                        | 10%        |          |
| 57     | INMATE CLOTHING: SWEATSHIRT-ORANG<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg    | \$ 6.03<br>VSI<br>SSOR-L<br>12.00<br>\$ 72.36                |                         |                                   |                        |            | \$ 6.63<br>VSI<br>GILDAN/HANES/FRUIT OF THE LOOM<br>C045-OR<br>1.00<br>\$ 13.64 |                        | 10%        |          |

| Line # | Description  | Original Awarded Contract Price                                       | Quotes Received         |                                    |                        |            |   |                        | % Increase  | Comments |                       |
|--------|--|---|-------------------------|------------------------------------|------------------------|------------|---|------------------------|---|----------|-----------------------|
|        |  |   | Tabb Textiles Co., Inc. | Americare Products, Inc. (Phoenix) | JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES | Mavich llc | Victory Supply                                    | Bob Barker Company Inc |   |          | ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC |
| 58     | INMATE CLOTHING: SWEATSHIRT:ORANG<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg    | \$ 6.03<br>VSI<br>SSOR-XL<br>12.00<br>\$ 72.36                        |                         |                                    |                        |            | \$ 6.63   |                        | \$ 13.64<br>GILDAN/HANES/FRUIT OF THE LOOM<br>C045-OR<br>1.00<br>\$ 13.64 | 10%      |                       |
| 59     | INMATE CLOTHING: SWEATSHIRT:ORANG<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg    | \$ 7.67<br>VSI<br>SSOR-2XL<br>12.00<br>\$ 92.04                       |                         |                                    |                        |            | \$ 7.77   |                        | \$ 17.33<br>GILDAN/HANES/FRUIT OF THE LOOM<br>C045-OR<br>1.00<br>\$ 17.33 | 1%       |                       |
| 60     | INMATE CLOTHING: SWEATSHIRT:ORANG<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg    | \$ 7.67<br>VSI<br>SSOR-3XL<br>12.00<br>\$ 92.04                       |                         |                                    |                        |            | \$ 7.77   |                        | \$ 19.24<br>GILDAN/HANES/FRUIT OF THE LOOM<br>C045-OR<br>1.00<br>\$ 19.24 | 1%       |                       |
| 61     | INMATE CLOTHING: MEN'S COTTON BRIEF<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg  | \$ 0.70<br>JAB Trading<br>MW3401-(S-XL)<br>24 dozen/case<br>\$ 201.60 | \$ 0.84                 |                                    |                        |            | \$ 0.74<br>VSI<br>BRWHEC<br>12.00<br>\$ 8.88      |                        |   | 6%       |                       |
| 62     | INMATE CLOTHING: MEN'S COTTON BRIEF<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg  | \$ 0.75<br>JAB Trading<br>MW3401-2XL<br>24 dozen/case<br>\$ 216.00    | \$ 0.90                 |                                    |                        |            | \$ 0.78<br>VSI<br>BRWHEC<br>12.00<br>\$ 9.36      |                        |   | 4%       |                       |
| 63     | INMATE CLOTHING: MEN'S COTTON BRIEF<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg  | \$ 0.79<br>JAB Trading<br>MW3401-3XL<br>24 dozen/case<br>\$ 228.00    | \$ 0.95                 |                                    |                        |            | \$ 0.78<br>VSI<br>BRWHEC<br>12.00<br>\$ 9.36      |                        |   | -1%      |                       |
| 64     | INMATE CLOTHING: BOY'S COTTON BRIEF<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg  | \$ 0.72<br>VSI<br>BRWHB-(SZ)<br>12.00<br>\$ 8.64                      |                         |                                    |                        |            | \$ 0.77   |                        | \$ 2.0733<br>FRUIT OF THE LOOM<br>CY8010AB-DZ<br>12.00<br>\$ 24.88        | 7%       |                       |
| 65     | INMATE CLOTHING: BOY'S COTTON BRIEF<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg  | \$ 0.72<br>VSI<br>BRWHB-2XL<br>12.00<br>\$ 8.64                       |                         |                                    |                        |            | \$ 0.77   |                        | \$ 1.4333<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>C051-WH-M-DZ<br>12.00<br>\$ 17.20 | 7%       |                       |
| 66     | INMATE CLOTHING: GIRL'S COTTON BRIEF<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg | \$ 0.56<br>BBC<br>ELBLCTN-Size<br>12.00<br>\$ 6.75                    |                         |                                    |                        |            | \$ 0.73<br>VSI<br>PNTYGH-(SZ)<br>12.00<br>\$ 8.76 |                        | \$ 1.5933<br>FRUIT OF THE LOOM<br>CY6GRBR1WI-DZ<br>12.00<br>\$ 19.12      | 30%      |                       |
| 67     | INMATE CLOTHING: WOMEN'S COTTON B<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg    | \$ 0.47<br>VSI<br>PNTYWH-(SZ)<br>12.00<br>\$ 5.64                     |                         |                                    |                        |            | \$ 0.66   |                        | \$ 1.2625<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>C062-WH<br>12.00<br>\$ 15.15      | 40%      |                       |
| 68     | INMATE CLOTHING: WOMEN'S COTTON B<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg    | \$ 0.51<br>VSI<br>PNTYWH-(SZ)<br>12.00<br>\$ 6.12                     |                         |                                    |                        |            | \$ 0.70   |                        | \$ 1.3658<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>C063-WH<br>12.00<br>\$ 16.39      | 37%      |                       |
| 69     | INMATE CLOTHING: WOMEN'S COTTON B<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg    | \$ 0.59<br>VSI<br>PNTYWH-(SZ)<br>12.00<br>\$ 7.08                     |                         |                                    |                        |            | \$ 0.70   |                        | \$ 1.4700<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>C063-WH<br>12.00<br>\$ 17.64      | 19%      |                       |

| Line # | Description   | Original Awarded Contract Price                                     | Quotes Received         |                                   |                        |            |   |                        | % Increase   | Comments |                       |
|--------|---|---|-------------------------|-----------------------------------|------------------------|------------|---|------------------------|--|----------|-----------------------|
|        |   |   | Tabb Textiles Co., Inc. | Amercare Products, Inc. (Phoenix) | JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES | Mavich llc | Victory Supply                                    | Bob Barker Company Inc |  |          | ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC |
| 70     | INMATE CLOTHING: WOMEN'S COTTON B<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg     | \$ 0.60<br>VSI<br>PNTYWH-(SZ)<br>12.00<br>\$ 7.20                   |                         |                                   |                        |            | \$ 0.70   |                        | \$ 1.6100<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>C063-WH<br>12.00<br>\$ 19.32     | 17%      |                       |
| 75     | INMATE CLOTHING: WOMEN'S BRA: WHIT<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg    | \$ 1.83<br>JAB Trading<br>CC-(34-44)E<br>15 dozen/case<br>\$ 330.00 |                         | \$ 2.20                           |                        |            | \$ 1.59<br>VSI<br>SBWH-SZ<br>12.00<br>\$ 23.00    |                        |  | -13%     |                       |
| 76     | INMATE CLOTHING: SPORTSBRA - GRAY; S<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg  | \$ 1.53<br>VSI<br>SBGY-(SZ)<br>12.00<br>\$ 18.36                    |                         |                                   |                        |            | \$ 1.55   |                        | \$ 3.8316<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>C1910-GY<br>12.00<br>\$ 45.98    | 1%       |                       |
| 77     | INMATE CLOTHING: SPORTSBRA - GRAY; S<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg  | \$ 1.62<br>VSI<br>SBGY-(SZ)<br>12.00<br>\$ 19.44                    |                         |                                   |                        |            | \$ 1.78   |                        | \$ 4.5258<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>C1910-GY<br>12.00<br>\$ 54.31    | 10%      |                       |
| 78     | INMATE CLOTHING: SPORTS BRA - GRAY; S<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg | \$ 1.62<br>VSI<br>SBGY-(SZ)<br>12.00<br>\$ 19.44                    |                         |                                   |                        |            | \$ 1.78   |                        | \$ 4.8041<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>C1910-GY<br>12.00<br>\$ 57.65    | 10%      |                       |
| 79     | INMATE CLOTHING: SPORTS BRA - WHITE;<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg  | \$ 1.31<br>VSI<br>SBWH-SZ<br>12.00<br>\$ 15.72                      |                         |                                   |                        |            | \$ 1.44   |                        | \$ 2.72<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>C1910-WH<br>12.00<br>\$ 32.64      | 10%      |                       |
| 80     | INMATE CLOTHING: SPORTSBRA - WHITE;<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg   | \$ 1.35<br>JAB Trading<br>15-(40-48)<br>10 dozen/case<br>\$ 162.50  |                         | \$ 1.62                           |                        |            | \$ 1.59<br>VSI<br>SBWH-SZ<br>12.00<br>\$ 19.08    |                        |  | 18%      |                       |
| 81     | INMATE CLOTHING: SPORTSBRA - WHITE;<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg   | \$ 1.35<br>JAB Trading<br>15-(50-54)<br>12.00<br>\$ 16.25           |                         | \$ 1.62                           |                        |            | \$ 1.59<br>VSI<br>SBWH-SZ<br>12.00<br>\$ 19.08    |                        |  | 18%      |                       |
| 82     | INMATE CLOTHING: SOCKS:CREW, CALF LE<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg  | \$ 0.39<br>VSI<br>SKCRWH<br>12.00<br>\$ 4.62                        |                         |                                   |                        |            | \$ 0.42   |                        | \$ 0.7258<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>C06810-WH-DZ<br>12.00<br>\$ 8.71 | 9%       |                       |
| 83     | INMATE CLOTHING: SOCKS: SPORT, WHITE;<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg | \$ 0.39<br>VSI<br>SKWHNS<br>12.00<br>\$ 4.62                        |                         |                                   |                        |            | \$ 0.42   |                        | \$ 8.61<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>C4581M-WH-DZ<br>12.00<br>\$ 8.61   | 9%       |                       |
| 85     | INMATE CLOTHING: CANVAS TENNIS SHOES<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg  | \$ 4.69<br>VSI<br>SHCVLT(B/W)-(SZ)<br>1.00<br>\$ 4.69               |                         |                                   |                        |            | \$ 5.49   |                        | \$ 10.00<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>SC1011<br>1.00<br>\$ 10.00        | 17%      |                       |
| 87     | INMATE CLOTHING: SHOES - EVA SNEAKER<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg  | \$ 2.85<br>JAB Trading<br>EVA-STEPIN-O-(S-L)<br>24.00<br>\$ 68.40   |                         | \$ 2.85                           |                        |            | \$ 3.77<br>VSI<br>SHEVDSO-(SZ)<br>1.00<br>\$ 3.77 |                        | \$ 3.63<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>SC70774-OR<br>12.00<br>\$ 43.56    | 0%       |                       |

| Line # | Description  | Original Awarded Contract Price   | Quotes Received         |                                    |                        |            |  |   | % Increase | Comments |
|--------|--|---|-------------------------|------------------------------------|------------------------|------------|--|---|------------|----------|
|        |  |   | Tabb Textiles Co., Inc. | Americare Products, Inc. (Phoenix) | JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES | Mavich llc | Victory Supply                                     | Bob Barker Company Inc  |            |          |
| 88     | INMATE CLOTHING: SHOES - EVA SNEAKER<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg | \$ 2.85<br>JAB Trading<br>EVA-STEPIN-O-XL<br>24.00<br>\$ 68.40            |                         |                                    | \$ 2.85                |            | \$ 3.77<br>VSI<br>SHEVDSDO-(SZ)<br>1.00<br>\$ 3.77 | \$ 3.63<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>SC70774-OR<br>12.00<br>\$ 43.56   | 0%         |          |
| 89     | INMATE CLOTHING: SHOES - EVA SNEAKER<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg | \$ 2.85<br>JAB Trading<br>EVA-STEPIN-O-2XL<br>24.00<br>\$ 68.40           |                         |                                    | \$ 2.85                |            | \$ 3.77<br>VSI<br>SHEVDSDO-(SZ)<br>1.00<br>\$ 3.77 | \$ 3.63<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>SC70774-OR<br>12.00<br>\$ 43.56   | 0%         |          |
| 90     | INMATE CLOTHING: SHOES - EVA SNEAKER<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg | \$ 2.85<br>JAB Trading<br>EVA-STEPIN-O-3XL<br>24.00<br>\$ 68.40           |                         |                                    | \$ 2.85                |            | \$ 3.77<br>VSI<br>SHEVDSDO-(SZ)<br>1.00<br>\$ 3.77 | \$ 3.63<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>SC70774-OR<br>12.00<br>\$ 43.56   | 0%         |          |
| 92     | MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: INDIGENT HYGIE<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg  | \$ 0.49<br>ICS<br>KIT-COL5<br>150 KITS PER CASE<br>\$73.50 PER CASE       |                         |                                    |                        |            | \$ 0.71<br>VSI<br>KITCOLLIN<br>50.00<br>\$ 35.50   | \$ 0.68   | 39%        |          |
| 93     | MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: COMB: 5" PLAST<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg  | \$ 0.02<br>ICS<br>T123<br>2160 PER CASE<br>\$35.64 PER CASE               |                         |                                    |                        |            | No Bid<br>No Bid<br>No Bid<br>No Bid<br>No Bid     | \$ 0.0205   | 24%        |          |
| 94     | MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: DEODORANT - M<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg   | \$ 0.21<br>VSI<br>SUSD05<br>576.00<br>\$ 120.96                           |                         |                                    |                        |            | \$ 0.23<br>No Bid                                  | \$ 0.2899<br>FRESHSCRENT/DAWNMIST<br>T063-CS<br>576.00<br>\$ 166.9824   | 10%        |          |
| 95     | MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: DEODORANT - S<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg   | \$ 0.32<br>Freshscent<br>STD5<br>180.00<br>\$ 57.60                       |                         |                                    | \$ 0.38                |            | \$ 0.97<br>VSI<br>SUDEDECR5<br>36.00<br>\$ 34.92   | \$ 49.40<br>DEGREE<br>TS02827-CS<br>36.00                               | 19%        |          |
| 97     | MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: LIQUID TWO-IN-<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg  | \$ 9.62<br>FRESHSCENT<br>TMS128<br>4 GALLONS PER CASE<br>\$38.48 PER CASE |                         |                                    |                        |            | \$ 11.22<br>VSI<br>SUSBW128<br>4.00<br>\$ 44.91    | \$ 13.81  | 17%        |          |
| 101    | MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: SHORTY TOOTH<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg    | \$ 0.03<br>ICS<br>TB5H<br>1440 PER CASE<br>\$45.50 PER CASE               |                         |                                    |                        |            | \$ 0.04<br>VSI<br>SUTB20I<br>144.00                | \$ 0.0479   | 27%        |          |
| 104    | MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: NET LAUNDRY BA<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg  | \$ 2.42<br>VSI<br>LB2436DC-WH<br>12.00<br>\$ 29.04                        |                         |                                    |                        |            | \$ 2.66<br>No Bid                                  | \$ 4.7475<br>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>L055-36-DZ<br>12.00<br>\$ 56.97 | 10%        |          |
| 110    | MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: TAMPONS: REGU<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg   | \$ 0.09<br>ICS<br>T067<br>500 PER CASE<br>\$43.80 PER CASE                |                         |                                    |                        |            | \$ 0.13<br>VSI<br>SUTMPR<br>500.00<br>\$ 65.00     | \$ 0.1100   | 26%        |          |
| 111    | MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: TAMPONS: SUPE<br>Brand Bid<br>Product Number<br>Quantity per Case/Pkg<br>Price Per Case/Pkg   | \$ 0.09<br>ICS<br>T067S<br>480 PER CASE<br>\$44.35 PER CASE               |                         |                                    |                        |            | \$ 0.13<br>VSI<br>SUTMPS<br>500.00<br>\$ 65.00     | \$ 0.1200   | 30%        |          |

| Line # | Description   | Original Awarded<br>Contract Price | Quotes Received            |                                      |                           |            |                |                           | % Increase                                   | Comments |                       |
|--------|---|------------------------------------|----------------------------|--------------------------------------|---------------------------|------------|----------------|---------------------------|--|----------|-----------------------|
|        |   |                                    | Tabb Textiles Co.,<br>Inc. | Amercare Products,<br>Inc. (Phoenix) | JAB TRADING<br>INDUSTRIES | Mavich llc | Victory Supply | Bob Barker<br>Company Inc |  |          | ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC |
| 112    | Juvenile Pillow - #L03PC GREEN POLY-FILL<br>Brand Bid | \$ 6.24                            |                            |                                      |                           |            |                |                           | \$ 10.15                                     | 63%      |                       |
|        | Product Number  |                                    |                            |                                      |                           |            |                |                           | ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.<br>L03PC-EA<br>25.00 |          |                       |
|        | Quantity per Case/Pkg                                 | 1.00                               |                            |                                      |                           |            |                |                           | \$ 253.75                                    |          |                       |
|        | Price Per Case/Pkg                                    | \$ 6.24                            |                            |                                      |                           |            |                |                           |  |          |                       |
| 120    | Chicago Model A600 72" Restraint Chain<br>Brand Bid   | \$ 13.24                           |                            |                                      |                           |            | \$ 19.99       |                           | \$ 27.98                                     | 51%      |                       |
|        | Product Number  |                                    |                            |                                      |                           |            |                |                           | CHICAGO<br>A600<br>1.00                      |          |                       |
|        | Quantity per Case/Pkg                                 | 1.00                               |                            |                                      |                           |            |                |                           | \$ 27.98                                     |          |                       |
|        | Price Per Case/Pkg                                    | \$ 13.24                           |                            |                                      |                           |            |                |                           |  |          |                       |
| 121    | Chicago Model 2200 Leg Irons<br>Brand Bid             | \$ 30.44                           |                            |                                      |                           |            | \$ 29.49       |                           | \$ 42.64                                     | -3%      |                       |
|        | Product Number  |                                    |                            |                                      |                           |            |                |                           | CHICAGO<br>2,200.00                          |          |                       |
|        | Quantity per Case/Pkg                                 | 1.00                               |                            |                                      |                           |            |                |                           | \$ 1.00                                      |          |                       |
|        | Price Per Case/Pkg                                    | \$ 30.44                           |                            |                                      |                           |            |                |                           | \$ 42.64                                     |          |                       |
| 122    | Chicago Model 1000 Nickel Finish Handcu<br>Brand Bid  | \$ 16.00                           |                            |                                      |                           |            | \$ 17.49       |                           | \$ 27.98                                     | 9%       |                       |
|        | Product Number  |                                    |                            |                                      |                           |            |                |                           | CHICAGO<br>1,000.00                          |          |                       |
|        | Quantity per Case/Pkg                                 | 1.00                               |                            |                                      |                           |            |                |                           | \$ 1.00                                      |          |                       |
|        | Price Per Case/Pkg                                    | \$ 16.00                           |                            |                                      |                           |            |                |                           | \$ 27.98                                     |          |                       |