2020-186 Safety Wear

s""w:":"'l':' & First Mavich llc Nardis Public Safety AARDVARK M"";:':::Ie:‘"w GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC GALLS, LLC General Notes
Total Price | $ 863.76 | Total Price | $6,150.00 | Total Price [ $  9,068.00 | Total Price [ $ 13,140.00 | Total Price [ $  73,868.70 Total Price | $ 175,415.08 | Total Price [ $ 211,265.00
[Line # Mfgr Mfgno QrY_uoM unit | Unit | unit | unit | unit | Unit [ unit |
First Spear or
2 Collin County
approved
Helmet Hut, Black equal 17738 $ 2,128.56 | No Bid

Discontinued - see line
replacement at the bottom of
the tabulation.

Safariland or
Collin County
PROTECH FAST ATTACK VEST - ADVANCED  approved

\WEBLESS SYSTEM, Black equal 460.96 $  5,531.52 1,644.00

52"”553“3 $ 2500
TYR Tactical
or Collin
8 County
approved
Gas Mask Drop Leg/Pouch equal TYR-OD730-CAN 12 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oakley or
10 Collin County
approved
Standard Issue Ballistic M Frame Alpha equal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Discontinued - see line
replacement at the bottom of
the tabulation.

North
American
6 Rescue or
Collin County
COMBAT APPLICATION TOURNIQUET (C-A- approved
m equal $ 3599 $ 863.76 | NoBid
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2020-186 Safety Wear

Sunset Survival & First Mavich llc Nardis Public Safety AARDVARK Municipal Emergency GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC GALLS, LLC
Aid, Inc. Services, Inc
Total Price | $ 863.76 | Total Price | $6,150.00 | Total Price [ $  9,068.00 | Total Price [ $ 13,140.00 | Total Price [ $  73,868.70 Total Price | $ 175,415.08 | Total Price [ $ 211,265.00
[Line # Mfgr Mfgno QrY_uoM unit | Unit | unit | unit | unit__ | Unit [ unit |
Point Blank or
14 Collin County
FLXINIA-1 w/2 Hi Lite Carriers and Soft approved
Trauma Insert equal each No Bid No Bid $ 749.00 S 2,247.00 | No Bid S 812.79 S 2,438.37 | No Bid S 810.00 $ 2,430.00

_M

Armor

Express or
Collin County
Ballistic Vest with Revolution Carrier / Level approved

i equal 1 each No Bid No Bid S 612.00 $ 612.00 | No Bid S 852.84 S 852.84 | No Bid s

800.00 $

800.00

16ALT2 POINT BLANK BC3A WITH HILITE CARRER  POINT BLANK HILITE BC3A each

_

1,315.79
Safariland or
Collin County
PROTECH Collar - Hardwire 68 Level IlIA, approved PTA CLR-HW68-
Black equal each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 157.89 S 1,894.68 | No Bid

Safariland or

Collin County
PROTECH Structured Upper Arms - approved PTA-SBCP-HW68-
Hardwire 68 Level IIIA, Black equal 3A 12 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 447.37 $  5,368.44 | NoBid

Safariland or
Collin County
PROTECH Enhanced Groin AWS - Hardwire approved

68 Level llIA, Black equal

PTA-ERGN-AWS-

HW68-3A 12 each 4,331.40 | No Bid

General Notes

2020-186 Addendum 1 - Page 2
Change Order #2



2020-186 Safety Wear

Sunset Survival & First Mavich lic Nardis Public Safety AARDVARK Municipal Emergency GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC GALLS, LLC
Aid, Inc. Services, Inc
Total Price | $ 863.76 | Total Price | $6,150.00 | Total Price [ $  9,068.00 | Total Price [ $ 13,140.00 | Total Price [ $  73,868.70 Total Price | $ 175,415.08 | Total Price [ $ 211,265.00
[Line # Mfgr Mfgno QrY_uoM unit | Unit | unit | unit | unit__ | Unit | unit |
Safariland or
24 Collin County
approved
PROTECH Small ID Panel 6"x2", Black equal PTA--POL-SM 12 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 595 $ 71.40 | No Bid

PROTECH X CAL DTC1 Type IIl ICW 10X12
Multi-Curve, Black

28

XPRT Tactical Pant, Green

30

XPRT Waterproof Jacket, Black

32

Quest 4D GTX Forces Boots, Black

34

P7 Integrated Helmet System

Safariland or
Collin County
approved

equal PTA-1345363 12 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid . 2,843.40 6,420.00

5.11 or Collin
County
approved
equal $ 12833 § 1,539.96 1,540.56 138.00 $ 1,656.00

5.11 or Collin
County
approved
equal $ 30109 $ 3,613.08 30119 $ 361428 |S 33000 $ 3,960.00

Salomon or
Collin County

approved

equal 373478 12 each
ARRADVARK

or Collin

County

approved ATHQP7IHS-LT-XX-
equal 00 12 each $ 1,095.00 $  13,140.00 | No Bid

17875 $ 2,145.00 | § 85.00 $ 1,020.00

General Notes

2020-186 Addendum 1 - Page 3
Change Order #2



2020-186 Safety Wear

Sunset Survival & First Mavich lic Nardis Public Safety AARDVARK Municipal Emergency GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC GALLS, LLC
Aid, Inc. Services, Inc
Total Price | $ 863.76 | Total Price | $6,150.00 | Total Price [ $  9,068.00 | Total Price [ $ 13,140.00 | Total Price [ $  73,868.70 Total Price | $ 175,415.08 | Total Price [ $ 211,265.00
[Line # Mfgr Mfgno QrY_UoMm Unit | Unit | Unit Unit unit | Unit unit |
Silynx or
36 Collin County
approved
Clarus Systems Headset Kit equal CLAR-T-N-002 4 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 895.00 $ 3,580.00
$  156.00
Silynx or
38 Collin County
approved
Dual Comms Splitter equal CA0175-01 4 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 22500 S 900.00

Clarus XPR

Antenna Relocation Kit x 2 for Dual Comms
TCIM.AS.T.

Ballistic Shield Phalanx Level 1A+

Silynx or
Collin County
approved
equal

Safariland or

Collin County
approved
equal

Point Blank
Enterprises
or Collin
County
approved
equal

CXPRQH-D-002

8

each

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 3689.00 $ 3,689.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 416122 S 4,161.22

No Bid

$ 83.96 $ 1,343.36

No Bid

$ 430000 $

5,200.00

4,300.00

General Notes

2020-186 Addendum 1 - Page 4
Change Order #2



2020-186 Safety Wear

Sunset Survival & First

Municipal Emergency

. Mavich lic Nardis Public Safety AARDVARK . GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC GALLS, LLC
Aid, Inc. Services, Inc
Total Price | $ 863.76 | Total Price | $6,150.00 | Total Price | $ 9,068.00 | Total Price | $ 13,140.00 | Total Price | $ 73,868.70 Total Price | $ 175,415.08 | Total Price | $ 211,265.00
Line# D Mfgr Mfgno Qry_uom Unit | Unit | Unit Unit Unit___| Unit unit |
Avon
Protection
47 Systems or
Collin County
approved
CTCF50Riot Agent Filter 4 Pack equal AVON-72606-3 10 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 151.53 S 151530 | $ 175.00 S 1,750.00 | $ 160.00 S 1,600.00
United Shield
48 or Collin
County
United Shield Riot Face Shield with Rail approved
Adapter equal SOD-RFS-RAIL 50 each No Bid $ 123.00 $6,150.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 112.80 S 5,640.00 | No Bid s 120.00 $ 6,000.00
Safariland or
49 Collin County
approved
Ballistic Panel SX Level IlIA, A7 equal 50 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 868.42 $  43,421.00 $  37,000.00
Safariland or
50 Collin County
approved
M1 Black Concealable Carrier equal 50 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 82.95 $ 4,147.50 $ 4,600.00
Safariland or
51 Collin County
approved
2.0 Soft Trauma Plate 5 x 8 equal 50 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 24.95 S 1,247.50 $ 1,750.00
Safariland or
52 Collin County
Model X CAL DTC1 Type IIl ICW 10X12 approved
Multi Curve Plate equal 1166518 50 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 11111 $ 5,555.50 $ 9,000.00
Safariland or
53 Collin County
approved
PROTECH 2.0 Oregon City Carrier equal DN6566 50 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 159.95 S 7,997.50 | S 280.00 $  14,000.00
54  Ballistic Vest $  769.83 $ 88713
POINT BLANK AX3A LEVEL3A WITH HILITE
CARRIER, BLACK
55 Ballistic Vest $ 180.33 $ 115.44
POINT BLANK SPEED PLATE, 8 X 10 MULTI
CURVE SHOOTER'S CUT
56  Ballistic Vest $ 604.38 $ 622.09
POINT BLANK BCIIIA (LEVEL 3A) w/(2) Hilite
Carriers
57  Ballistic Vest $  662.58 $ 81593
POINT BLANK BCIIIA (LEVEL 3A) w/(2)
HILITE CARRIERS, SOFT TRAUMA PLATE
AND ARMORVENT
58  Helmet $  526.00 $ 67191
POINT BLANK HELMET LEVEL 3A, HIGH,
MID OR LOW CUT WITH STANDARD
HARNESS
SIDE RAILS & FRONT MOUNT
SAFARILAND BODY ARMOR U1 FRONT
59  OPENING UNIFORM ITEM# SBA-UL-FRNT-
DN6701 COLOR: DARK NAVY each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 232.66 $ 25915
2ALT1
VIPER HELMET BAG POINT BLANK HLMH870000 12 each $ 42.88
each DOES NOT MEET SPECS
2ALTL .
bag- helment and plate carrierBG1473 POINT BLANK BAGN00130D 12 each $ 69.00
each DOES NOT MEET SPECS
60 SBAM2CARRIER each $ 100.13 $ 12375
BOTHELL PD CARRIER W/ PEN POCKETS
61 AND NAPOLEON POCKETS each $ 232.66 s 296.25

General Notes
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2020-186 Safety Wear

Sunset Survival & First

Municipal Emergency

. Mavich lic Nardis Public Safety AARDVARK . GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC GALLS, LLC
Aid, Inc. Services, Inc
TotaIPrice| $ 863.76 TotaIPrice| $6,150.00 | Total Price |$ 9,068.00 TotaIPrice| $  13,140.00 TotaIPrice| $ 73,868.70 Total Price| $ 175,415.08 | Total Price| $ 211,265.00
Line# D Mfgr Mfgno Qry_uom Unit | Unit | Unit Unit unit | Unit unit |
Blue Force
Gear or Collin
3 County
approved BT-TKN-Filled-003-
Micro Trauma Kit NOW!, Black equal BK 12 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $  169.96
Blue Force
Gear or Collin
5 County
approved
Tourniquet NOW! Strap Tourniquet Holder equal M-TNS-BK 24 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1050

General Notes

Line #3's replacement

Line #5's replacement
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